
Q-25-799 Aggregates/Emulsions Materials

Line # Description QTY UOM

1
#57- Stone (1/2” – 1-1/2”) AASHTO 
57*Quoter shall attach a haul/delivery rate 
schedule

1 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

2
#67 – Stone (3/4” or smaller) AASHTO 
67*Quoter shall attach a haul/delivery rate 
schedule

1 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

3
#1 Rip Rap (9” – 18”) R5*Quoter shall 
attach a haul/delivery rate schedule

1 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

4
#2 Rip Rap (12” – 24”) R6*Quoter shall 
attach a haul/delivery rate schedule

1 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

5
B-10 Stone  B10*Quoter shall attach a 
haul/delivery rate schedule

1 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 CCR 3/4” Clean Crusher Run 3/4”*Quoter 
shall attach a haul/delivery rate schedule

1 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

7
CCR 3-1/2” Clean Crusher Run 3-
1/2”*Quoter shall attach a haul/delivery 
rate schedule

1 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 DCR / RC6 Dirty Crusher Run*Quoter shall 
attach a haul/delivery rate schedule

1 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

9
CR6M Clean Crusher Run*Quoter shall 
attach a haul/delivery rate schedule

1 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 Gabion Stone (4” – 7”) AASHTO 89*Quoter 
shall attach a haul/delivery rate schedule

1 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

11 MD 1 - Stone (2” – 4”) AASHTO 1*Quoter 
shall attach a haul/delivery rate schedule

1 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total PriceUnit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price

Specialty Emulsions, 
Inc.                                                

York, PA

Russell Standard  
Pittsburg, PA

Seaboard Asphalt 
Products Company  

Baltimore, MD

1 Quotes Opened: June 11, 2025



Q-25-799 Aggregates/Emulsions Materials

Line # Description QTY UOM

12
Dust AASHTO 10*Quoter shall attach a 
haul/delivery rate schedule

1 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

13 MD 2 Stone (1” – 3”) AASHTO 2*Quoter 
shall attach a haul/delivery rate schedule

1 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

14 MD 4 Stone (1/4” – 3/4”) AASHTO 7*Quoter 
shall attach a haul/delivery rate schedule

1 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

15 25.0 mm Base Mix – Course*Quoter shall 
attach a haul/delivery rate schedule

1 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

16
19.0 mm Base Mix – Fine*Quoter shall 
attach a haul/delivery rate schedule

1 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

17
Cold Mix  Year-Round Application 
Use*Quoter shall attach a haul/delivery 
rate schedule

1 Ton No Bid No Bid $168.00 $168.00

18
CRS 2 Emulsion*Quoter shall attach a 
haul/delivery rate schedule

1 Gallon $3.35 $3.35 $2.75 $2.75 No Bid

19 CSS - 1H Tack Oil (5 Gallon Pail)*Quoter 
shall attach a haul/delivery rate schedule

1 Pail No Bid $65.00 $65.00 No Bid

20 SS - 1H Tack Oil (5 Gallon Pail)*Quoter shall 
attach a haul/delivery rate schedule

1 Pail No Bid No Bid $58.00 $58.00

21
CSS - 1H Tack Oil*Quoter shall attach a 
haul/delivery rate schedule

1 Gallon $3.25 $3.25 $2.99 $2.99 No Bid

22 DW 9.5 mm Driveway Mix*Quoter shall 
attach a haul/delivery rate schedule

1 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

Specialty Emulsions, 
Inc.                                             

York, PA

Russell Standard  
Pittsburg, PA

Seaboard Asphalt 
Products Company   

Baltimore, MD

2 Quotes Opened: June 11, 2025



Q-25-799 Aggregates/Emulsions Materials

Line # Description QTY UOM

23 PF - 14.75 mm Surface Fine (Dust)*Quoter 
shall attach a haul/delivery rate schedule

1 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

24 4.75 mm Sand Mix / Surface Top*Quoter 
shall attach a haul/delivery rate schedule

1 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

25 SC 12.5 mm Surface Mix Course*Quoter 
shall attach a haul/delivery rate schedule

1 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

26
9.5 mm Surface Mix Fine*Quoter shall 
attach a haul/delivery rate schedule

1 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

27
Anti-SkidLicking Creek (Western 
Section)9659 National PikeBig Pool, MD 
21711

1 Ton/Delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid

28
Anti-SkidScenic Route #40(Salt Dome West 
of Hancock)2801 National PikeHancock, MD 
21750

1 Ton/Delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid

29
Anti-SkidNorthern Avenue (Central 
Section)601 Northern AvenueHagerstown, 
MD 21742

1 Ton/Delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid

30
Anti-SkidKeedysville (Southern 
Section)6223 Coffman Farm 
RoadKeedysville, MD 21756

1 Ton/Delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid

31
Anti-SkidGreensburg (Eastern 
Section)13230 Greensburg RoadSmithsburg, 
MD 21783

1 Ton/Delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid

32
Anti-SkidSolid Waste (Forty West 
Landfill)12630 Earth Care RoadHagerstown, 
MD 21740

1 Ton/Delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total PriceUnit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price

Specialty Emulsions, 
Inc.                                                 

York, PA

Russell Standard  
Pittsburg, PA

Seaboard Asphalt 
Products Company   

Baltimore, MD

3 Quotes Opened: June 11, 2025



Q-25-799 Aggregates/Emulsions Materials

Line #

1 $18.25 $18.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 $18.35 $18.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 $29.00 $29.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 $28.50 $28.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 $18.95 $18.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 $11.50 $11.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 $11.45 $11.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 $8.10 $8.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 $10.90 $10.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 $24.00 $24.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

11 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total PriceUnit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

Craig Paving, Inc.  
Hagerstown, MD

Martin Marietta  
Raleigh, NC

P & W Excavating Inc  
McConnellsburg, PA

C. William Hetzer, Inc.                                 
Hagerstown, MD

4 Quotes Opened: June 11, 2025



Q-25-799 Aggregates/Emulsions Materials

Line #

12 $17.00 $17.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

13 $18.25 $18.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid

14 $18.90 $18.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid

15 No Bid $74.75 $74.75 $52.25 $52.25 $60.00 $60.00

16 No Bid $73.00 $73.00 $54.25 $54.25 $65.00 $65.00

17 No Bid No Bid $140.00 $140.00 $175.00 $175.00

18 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

19 No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00 $25.00

20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

21 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.00 $5.00

22 No Bid $81.00 $81.00 $70.00 $70.00 $66.00 $66.00

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

C. William Hetzer, Inc.                            
Hagerstown, MD

Craig Paving, Inc.  
Hagerstown, MD

Unit Price Total Price

Martin Marietta  
Raleigh, NC

P & W Excavating Inc  
McConnellsburg, PA

5 Quotes Opened: June 11, 2025



Q-25-799 Aggregates/Emulsions Materials

Line #

23 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

24 No Bid No Bid $75.00 $75.00 $95.00 $95.00

25 No Bid $79.50 $79.50 $59.25 $59.25 $62.00 $62.00

26 No Bid $82.50 $82.50 $61.00 $61.00 $66.00 $66.00

27 $24.55 $24.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid

28 $24.55 $24.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid

29 $24.55 $24.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid

30 $25.35 $25.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid

31 $25.35 $25.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid

32 $24.55 $24.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total PriceUnit Price Total Price Total PriceUnit Price

Martin Marietta  
Raleigh, NC

P & W Excavating Inc  
McConnellsburg, PA

C. William Hetzer, Inc.                                     
Hagerstown, MD

Craig Paving, Inc.  
Hagerstown, MD

6 Quotes Opened: June 11, 2025



Line Responding Supplier Supplier Notes
17 Seaboard Asphalt Products 

Company
Bidding Bond-X Green High Performance Cold Mix which is compliant with MDE Regulations for year round application 
and use.  Pricing includes delivery.

20 Seaboard Asphalt Products 
Company

Pricing includes delivery

27 Martin Marietta Pinesburg Quarry
28 Martin Marietta Pinesburg Quarry
29 Martin Marietta Pinesburg Quarry
30 Martin Marietta Pinesburg Quarry
31 Martin Marietta Pinesburg Quarry
32 Martin Marietta Pinesburg Quarry

Craig Paving, Inc. All prices FOB from plant.  No delivery.

Q-25-799 Aggregates/Emulsions Materials

7 Quotes Opened: June 11, 2025
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