Q-25-798
Fertilizer for Black Rock Golf Course

Q-25-798 Fertilizer for Black Rock Golf Course awarded to: Nutrien Ag Solutions SiteOne Landscape Supply
*Genesis Turfgrass - Awarded Item Nos. 2, 3, & 4 Rosedale, MD Cleveland, OH
*Humana Chemicals - Awarded Item Nos. 1, 5, 6, & 8 $12.918.50
*Nutrien Ag - Awarded Item Nos. 7 & 9 Total Price $11,211.75 Total Price o
Line # |Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended
Ten (10) Tons -30-0-15, Nitrogen Source
1 - 50% Sulfur Coated Urea, 1 Ton No Bid No Bid $1,093.20 $1,093.20
Potassium Source - Potassium Sulfate K2S04
Two (2) Tons -0-0-50 Fairway size,
2 1 T 1,062.50 1,062.50 1,200.00 1,200.00
Sulfate of Potash K2S04 on 31, 1, 1, 31,
One (1) Ton -Verde - Cal G by Aqua Aid, . .
3 1 T No Bid No Bid
50 Ib. bag, 0-0-50 with 17% Sulfur on oP oP No Bid No Bid
One (1) Ton -Sulfate of Potash, Greens Grade,
4 1 T 1,118.75 1,118.75 1,315.20 1,315.20
50 Ib. bag, 0-0-50 with 17% Sulfur on 81, 81, 81, 81,
One (1) Ton -Nature Safe 8-3-5, Fine Grade,
50 Ib. bag, 0.2% Ammoniacal Nitrogen, . . . .
5 1 T No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7.2% Water Insoluble Nitrogen, on oB 0Bt OB oB
0.6% Water Soluble Nitrogen
6 One (1) Ton - Prilled Urea, 50 Ib. bag, 46-0-0 1 Ton $862.50 $862.50 $756.00 $756.00
One (1) Ton - Contec DG, 40 1b. bag,
7 12-24-8 SGN75, 6.0% Ammoniacal Nitrogen, 1 Ton $3,220.00 $3,220.00 $3,445.50 $3,445.50
0.9% Urea Nitrogen, 2.1% Water Soluble Nitrogen
One (1) Ton - Contec DG, 40 1b. bag,
-0- 0
g | 18-0-18 SGNTS18% Soluble Potash, 1 Ton $3,425.00 $3,425.00 $3,465.00 $3,465.00
10.2% Sulfur,
0.28% Iron, 0.14% Manganese
One (1) Ton - Amp ProMag 36,
9 1 T 1,523.00 1,523.00 1,643.60 1,643.60
50 Ib. bag, 36% Magnesium, 6% Sulfur on 81, 81, 81, 81,
Remarks and Exceptions: Remarks and Exceptions:
Line # Site One Landscape Supply Line # Site One Landscape Supply
1 Growstar 30-0-15 50% SOP 50lbag 7 Andersons Contec 12-24-8 401b Bag
2 Lesco 0-0-50 501b bag 8 Andersons Fertilizers 10-0-18 401Ib bag
4 Lesco Elite 0-0-50 501b bag 9 AMP Promag 365E 501b.
6 Lesco 46-0-0 50Ib bag

Quotes Due: April 30, 2025




Genesis Turgrass

Humana Chemicals, Inc

Glen Rock, PA Potomac, MD
Total Price $15,417.80 Total Price| $15,685.90
Line # |Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended
Ten (10) Tons -30-0-15, Nitrogen Source
1 - 50% Sulfur Coated Urea, 1 Ton $1,080.00 $1,080.00 $990.00 $990.00
Potassium Source - Potassium Sulfate K2504
Two (2) Tons -0-0-50 Fairway size,
2 1 T 1 . 1 . 1,254.4 1,254.4
Sulfate of Potash K2SO4 on $1,038.00 $1,038.00 $1,254.40 $1,254.40
One (1) Ton -Verde - Cal G by Aqua Aid,
3 1 T 1,120.00 1,120.00
50 Ib. bag, 0-0-50 with 17% Sulfur on ; i $1,604.80 $1,604.80
One (1) Ton -Sulfate of Potash, Greens Grade,
4 1 T 1 . 1 . 1,462.4 1,462.4
50 Ib. bag, 0-0-50 with 17% Sulfur on $1,098.00 $1,098.00 $1,462.40 $1,462.40
One (1) Ton -Nature Safe 8-3-5, Fine Grade,
50 1b. bag, 0.2% Ammoniacal Nitrogen,
5 7.2% Water Insoluble Nitrogen, 1 Ton $1,940.00 $1,940.00 $1,444.00 $1,444.00
0.6% Water Soluble Nitrogen
6 One (1) Ton - Prilled Urea, 50 Ib. bag, 46-0-0 1 Ton $846.00 $846.00 $795.60 $795.60
One (1) Ton - Contec DG, 40 1b. bag,
7 12-24-8 SGN75, 6.0% Ammoniacal Nitrogen, 1 Ton $3,260.00 $3,260.00 $3,638.50 $3,638.50
0.9% Urea Nitrogen, 2.1% Water Soluble Nitrogen
One (1) Ton - Contec DG, 40 Ib. bag,
-0- 0
g | 18-0-18 SGNTS18% Soluble Potash, 1 Ton $3.,465.00 $3,465.00 $2,627.00 $2,627.00
10.2% Sulfur,
0.28% Iron, 0.14% Manganese
One (1) Ton - Amp ProMag 36,
9 1 T 1,570.80 1,570.80 1,869.20 1,869.20
50 Ib. bag, 36% Magnesium, 6% Sulfur on s $ $ s

Nutrien Ag Solutions - No Delivery/Service date provided

SiteOne Landscape Supply - No Delivery/Service date provided

Genesis Turfgrass - Delivery/Service can be perfomed no later than 2-3 calendar days from receipt of order
Humana Chemicals, Inc. - No Delivery/Service date provided

Quotes Due: April 30, 2025
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