
Q-23-758
VMware/ Infrastructure 

Production Support and Subscription Renewal

Item 
No.  Item Description Unit of 

Measure Qty. Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1

VMware Support and Subscription Production - 8 
Processors, Technical support - for VMware Infrastructure 
Acceleration Kit VI-AK-P-SSSC, 
Lic# 5019209 
(Term dates: 7/16/23 - 7/19/24) Contract #30118503

Ea. 1 $7,283.99 $7,283.99 $6,243.56 $6,243.56 No Bid No Bid

2

VMware Support and Subscription Production - 8 
Processors, Technical support - for VMware 
Infrastructure Acceleration Kit VI-AK-P-SSSC, 
Lic# 10066142
(Term dates: 7/16/23 - 7/19/24) Contract #30118503

Ea. 1 $7,183.99 $7,183.99 $6,243.56 $6,243.56 No Bid No Bid

3

VMware Support and Subscription Production
Technical support – VS7-ENT-PSSS-C
Lic #0M41K-0Q3EH-180GN-0P984-89MMJ
(Term dates: 7/16/23 - 7/19/24) Contract #30118503

Ea. 8 $75.00 $600.00 * $713.08 $5,704.64 No Bid No Bid

4

VMware vSphere Enterprise Plus
VS7-ENT-EPL-UG-C
Lic# MN281-8T345-N81G0-06CK2-81AMJ
(Term dates: 7/16/23 - 7/19/24) Contract #387956304

Ea. 8 $1,084.99 $8,679.92 * $950.78 $7,606.24 No Bid No Bid

* No Bid No Bid

Remarks/Exceptions:

GHA Technologies, Inc. Non-Responsive, No Revised Form of Proposal sent with the Bid Package.

BIITECH, LLC - Non-Responsive, did not use the Revised Form of Proposal

EN Net
Frederick, MD 

GHA Technology, Inc.
Scottsdale, AZ

TOTAL LUMP SUM (Item Nos. 1 through 4 above)

*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing

$23,747.90 $25,798.00

BIITECH, LLC
Germantown, MD

Q-23-758 VMware Infrastructure Production 
Support & Subscription Renewal

Awarded to: EN Net Services

Quotes Opened:  June 22, 2023
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