
Q-23-752
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

1

Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

1 Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, size Large, 4 mil.
Or County approved equal 2 162300 $6.93 10 SVBE10006 $9.38 10

2 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size Small,      
5 mil.  Or County approved equal 2 SU-690-S $12.39 10 10419101 $24.38 10

3 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size Medium,   
5 mil.  Or County approved equal 3 SU-690-M $12.39 10 10420101 $24.38 10

4 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size Large,  5 
mil.  Or County approved equal 3 SU-690-L $12.39 10 10421101 $24.38 10

5 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size X-Large,  
5 mil.  Or County approved equal 40 SU-690-XL $12.39 10 10422101 $24.38 10

6 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size XX-
Large, 5 mil. Or County approved equal 2 SEC-375-XXL $12.39 10 10423101 $24.38 10

7 UL315S - Exam Glove, size Small, Microflex Ultra One 
#UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" 158 UL-315-S $12.39 10 UL-315-S $16.41 10

8
UL315M, Exam glove, size Medium, Microflex Ultra One 
#UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no 
substitutions

46 UL-315-M $12.39 10 UL-315-M $16.41 10

Barupon, LLC
Irvine, CA

ActOne Government Solutions
Las Vegas, NV

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023



Q-23-752
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

2

Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Barupon, LLC
Irvine, CA

ActOne Government Solutions
Las Vegas, NV

9
UL315L, Exam glove, size Large, Microflex Ultra One 
#UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no 
substitutions

110 UL-315-L $12.39 10 UL-315-L $16.41 10

10
UL315XL, Exam glove, size X- Large, Microflex Ultra  
One #UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, 
no substitutions

126 UL-315-XL $12.39 10 UL-315-XL $16.41 10

11
Exam glove, size 2X- Large, comparable to Microflex 
Ultra One #UL315 or 14 mil glove, Powder Free, Textured 
Fingers, 12" Length.   Or County approved equal.

6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12
Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, size Medium, 
Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 
beaded cuff, no substitutions

161 No Bid No Bid 6602-20 $18.29 10

13
Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, size Large, Powder-
Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, 
no substitutions

375 No Bid No Bid 6603-20 $18.29 10

14
Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, size X-Large, 
Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 
beaded cuff, no substitutions

425 No Bid No Bid 6604-20 $17.38 10

15
Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove,size 2X-Large, 
Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 
beaded cuff 

250 No Bid No Bid 6604-20 $18.29 10

16

MK296S-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size Small, length 245 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 
16, no substitutions

74 MK-296-S $12.39 10 MK-296-S $14.93 10

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Barupon, LLC
Irvine, CA

ActOne Government Solutions
Las Vegas, NV

17

MK296M-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size Medium, length 245 
mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile 
strength 16, no substitutions

334 No Info $12.39 10 MK-296-M $14.93 10

18

MK296L-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size Large, length 245 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 
16, no substitutions

638 MK-296-L $12.39 10 MK-296-L $14.93 10

19

MK296XL-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size X-Large, length 245 
mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile 
strength 16, no substitutions

708 MK-296-XL $12.39 10 MK-296-XL $14.93 10

20

Micorflex Midknight - MK296 Black, Powder-Free Nitrile 
Standard Exam Glove, size 2X-Large,  length 245 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 
16.

170 MK-296-XXL $12.39 10 MK-296-2XL $14.93 12

21
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size Small- length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil. 

15 MK-296-S $12.39 10 1015-62070 $29.99 10

22
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size Medium- length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7mil, finger 6.3 mil. 

25 MK-296-M $12.39 10 1015-62080 $29.99 10

23
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size Large, length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil

50 MK-296-L $12.39 10 1015-62090 $29.99 10

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Barupon, LLC
Irvine, CA

ActOne Government Solutions
Las Vegas, NV

24
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size X-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil

45 MK-296-XL $12.39 10 1015-62100 $29.99 10

25
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size XX-Large, length 300 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil

25 MK-296-XXL $12.39 10 1015-62110 $29.99 10

26 Nickelback, 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, size       
X-Large. 15 No Bid No Bid D07-08-011-050 $27.96 10

27 Nickelback, 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, size     
XX-Large.  2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

1 Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, Large, 4 mil.
Or County approved equal 2 No Bid No Bid 11419 3.05 10

2 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Small,  5 mil.
Or County approved equal 2 No Bid No Bid 295201 10.13 10

3 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Medium, 5 
mil.  Or County approved equal 3 No Bid No Bid 295202 10.13 10

4 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Large,  5 mil.
Or County approved equal 3 No Bid No Bid 295203 10.13 10

5 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, X-Large, 5 
mil.  Or County approved equal 40 No Bid No Bid 295204 10.13 10

6 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size XX-
Large, 5 mil. Or County approved equal 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10

7 UL315S - Exam Glove, Small, Microflex Ultra One 
#UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" 158 UL-315 $13.09 10 290315 $11.10 10

8
UL315M, Exam glove, Medium, Microflex Ultra One 
#UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no 
substitutions

46 UL-315 $13.09 10 290316 $11.10 10

Bisonte Industrial USA
Baltimore, MD

Bound Tree Medical, LLC
Dublin, OH

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Bisonte Industrial USA
Baltimore, MD

Bound Tree Medical, LLC
Dublin, OH

9
UL315L, Exam glove, Large, Microflex Ultra One 
#UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no 
substitutions

110 UL-315 $13.09 10 290317 $11.10 10

10
UL315XL, Exam glove, X- Large, Microflex Ultra One 
#UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no 
substitutions

126 UL-315 $13.09 10 290318 $11.10 10

11
Exam glove, 2X- Large, comparable to Microflex Ultra 
One #UL315 or 14 mil glove, Powder Free, Textured 
Fingers, 12" Length.   Or County approved equal.

6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

12
Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, Medium, Powder-
Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, 
no substitutions

161 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

13
Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, Large, Powder-Free, 
Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 
substitutions

375 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

14
Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, X-Large, Powder-
Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, 
no substitutions

425 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

15 Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, 2X-Large, Powder-
Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff 250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

16

MK296S-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, Small, length 245 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 
no substitutions

74 MK296 $12.49 10 1015-29601 $10.35 10

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023



Q-23-752
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

7

Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Bisonte Industrial USA
Baltimore, MD

Bound Tree Medical, LLC
Dublin, OH

17

MK296M-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, Medium, length 245 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 
16, no substitutions

334 MK296 $12.49 10 1015-29602 $10.35 10

18

MK296L-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, Large, length 245 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 
no substitutions

638 MK296 $12.49 10 1015-29603 $10.35 10

19

MK296XL-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, X-Large, length 245 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 
16, no substitutions

708 MK296 $12.49 10 1015-29604 $10.35 10

20

Powder-Free, Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, comparable to 
Micorflex Midknight - MK296 Black, 2X-Large,  length 
245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile 
strength 16.

170 MK296 $12.49 1015-29605 $10.35 10

21
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) Small- length 300mm, cuff 3.1 
mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil. 

15 No Bid No Bid 1015-62070 $16.84 10

22
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) Medium- length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 
mil, palm 4.7mil, finger 6.3 mil. 

25 No Bid No Bid 1015-62080 $16.84 10

23
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 
mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil

50 No Bid No Bid 1015-62090 $16.84 10

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Bisonte Industrial USA
Baltimore, MD

Bound Tree Medical, LLC
Dublin, OH

24
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) X-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 
mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil

45 No Bid No Bid 1015-62100 $16.84 10

25
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) XX-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil

25 No Bid No Bid 1015-62110 $16.84 10

26 Nickelback, 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, X-
Large. 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

27 Nickelback, 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, XX-
Large.  2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023



Q-23-752
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments
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Item
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

1 Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, size Large, 4 mil.
Or County approved equal 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size Small,      
5 mil.  Or County approved equal 2 7003623 6.86 10 No Bid No Bid

3 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size Medium,   
5 mil.  Or County approved equal 3 7003624 6.86 10 No Bid No Bid

4 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size Large,  5 
mil.  Or County approved equal 3 7003625 6.86 10 No Bid No Bid

5 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size X-Large,  
5 mil.  Or County approved equal 40 7003626 6.86 10 No Bid No Bid

6 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size XX-
Large, 5 mil. Or County approved equal 2 7003627 6.86 10 No Bid No Bid

7 UL315S - Exam Glove, size Small, Microflex Ultra One 
#UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" 158 UL315S $11.20 10 No Bid No Bid

8
UL315M, Exam glove, size Medium, Microflex Ultra One 
#UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no 
substitutions

46 5653125 $11.20 10 No Bid No Bid

Henry Schein, Inc.
Melville, NY

Maadho Disbributors, Inc.
Mount Kisco, NY

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Henry Schein, Inc.
Melville, NY

Maadho Disbributors, Inc.
Mount Kisco, NY

9
UL315L, Exam glove, size Large, Microflex Ultra One 
#UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no 
substitutions

110 5653153 $11.20 10 No Bid No Bid

10
UL315XL, Exam glove, size X- Large, Microflex Ultra  
One #UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, 
no substitutions

126 5653154 $11.20 10 No Bid No Bid

11
Exam glove, size 2X- Large, comparable to Microflex 
Ultra One #UL315 or 14 mil glove, Powder Free, Textured 
Fingers, 12" Length.   Or County approved equal.

6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12
Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, size Medium, 
Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 
beaded cuff, no substitutions

161 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

13
Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, size Large, Powder-
Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, 
no substitutions

375 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

14
Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, size X-Large, 
Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 
beaded cuff, no substitutions

425 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

15
Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove,size 2X-Large, 
Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 
beaded cuff 

250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

16

MK296S-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size Small, length 245 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 
16, no substitutions

74 5655752 $9.10 10 MDO502 $3.03 10

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Henry Schein, Inc.
Melville, NY

Maadho Disbributors, Inc.
Mount Kisco, NY

17

MK296M-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size Medium, length 245 
mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile 
strength 16, no substitutions

334 5657365 $9.10 10 MDO503 $3.03 10

18

MK296L-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size Large, length 245 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 
16, no substitutions

638 5651031 $9.10 10 MDO504 $3.03 10

19

MK296XL-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size X-Large, length 245 
mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile 
strength 16, no substitutions

708 5650811 $9.10 10 MDO505 $3.03 10

20

Micorflex Midknight - MK296 Black, Powder-Free Nitrile 
Standard Exam Glove, size 2X-Large,  length 245 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 
16.

170 5654216 $9.10 10 MDO506 $3.03 10

21
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size Small- length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil. 

15 7003982 $17.05 10 No Bid No Bid

22
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size Medium- length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7mil, finger 6.3 mil. 

25 7003983 $17.05 10 No Bid No Bid

23
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size Large, length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil

50 7003984 $17.05 10 No Bid No Bid

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Henry Schein, Inc.
Melville, NY

Maadho Disbributors, Inc.
Mount Kisco, NY

24
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size X-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil

45 7003985 $17.05 10 No Bid No Bid

25
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size XX-Large, length 300 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil

25 7003986 $17.05 10 No Bid No Bid

26 Nickelback, 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, size       
X-Large. 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

27 Nickelback, 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, size     
XX-Large.  2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

1 Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, size Large, 4 mil.
Or County approved equal 2 CUR9226 $5.45 10 Diamond IF 48 $59.99 10

2 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size Small,      
5 mil.  Or County approved equal 2 MDS192084 $5.30 10 Diamond 

IF-52-S $69.99 10

3 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size Medium,   
5 mil.  Or County approved equal 3 MDS192085 $5.30 10 Diamond 

IF-52-M $69.99 10

4 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size Large,  5 
mil.  Or County approved equal 3 MDS192086 $5.30 10 Diamond 

IF-52-L $69.99 10

5 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size X-Large,  
5 mil.  Or County approved equal 40 MDS192087 $5.30 10 Diamond 

IF-52-XL $69.99 10

6 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size XX-
Large, 5 mil. Or County approved equal 2 484805 $5.45 Diamond 

IF-52-2XL $69.99 10

7 UL315S - Exam Glove, size Small, Microflex Ultra One 
#UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" 158 485601 $8.20 10 UL315S $128.89 10

8
UL315M, Exam glove, size Medium, Microflex Ultra One 
#UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no 
substitutions

46 No Bid No Bid UL315M $128.89 10

Medline Industries, LP
Northfield, IL

Mini Wing USA
Palos Verdes Estates, CA

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Medline Industries, LP
Northfield, IL

Mini Wing USA
Palos Verdes Estates, CA

9
UL315L, Exam glove, size Large, Microflex Ultra One 
#UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no 
substitutions

110 No Bid No Bid UL315L $128.89 10

10
UL315XL, Exam glove, size X- Large, Microflex Ultra  
One #UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, 
no substitutions

126 No Bid No Bid UL315XL $128.89 10

11
Exam glove, size 2X- Large, comparable to Microflex 
Ultra One #UL315 or 14 mil glove, Powder Free, Textured 
Fingers, 12" Length.   Or County approved equal.

6 No Bid No Bid UL3152XL $128.89 10

12
Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, size Medium, 
Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 
beaded cuff, no substitutions

161 No Bid No Bid 6602-20 $139.59 10

13
Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, size Large, Powder-
Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, 
no substitutions

375 No Bid No Bid 6603-20 $139.59 10

14
Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, size X-Large, 
Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 
beaded cuff, no substitutions

425 No Bid No Bid 6604-20 $139.59 10

15
Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove,size 2X-Large, 
Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 
beaded cuff 

250 No Bid No Bid 6604-20 $139.59 10

16

MK296S-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size Small, length 245 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 
16, no substitutions

74 No Bid No Bid MK296-S $126.39 10

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Medline Industries, LP
Northfield, IL

Mini Wing USA
Palos Verdes Estates, CA

17

MK296M-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size Medium, length 245 
mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile 
strength 16, no substitutions

334 No Bid No Bid MK296-M $126.39 10

18

MK296L-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size Large, length 245 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 
16, no substitutions

638 No Bid No Bid MK296-L $126.39 10

19

MK296XL-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size X-Large, length 245 
mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile 
strength 16, no substitutions

708 No Bid No Bid MK296-XL $126.39 10

20

Micorflex Midknight - MK296 Black, Powder-Free Nitrile 
Standard Exam Glove, size 2X-Large,  length 245 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 
16.

170 No Bid No Bid MK296-2XL $126.39 10

21
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size Small- length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil. 

15 No Bid No Bid XTRA93-862-S $204.69 10

22
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size Medium- length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7mil, finger 6.3 mil. 

25 No Bid No Bid XTRA93-862-M $204.69 10

23
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size Large, length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil

50 No Bid No Bid XTRA93-862-L $204.69 10

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Medline Industries, LP
Northfield, IL

Mini Wing USA
Palos Verdes Estates, CA

24
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size X-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil

45 No Bid No Bid XTRA93-862-XL $204.69 10

25
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size XX-Large, length 300 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil

25 No Bid No Bid XTRA93-862-2XL $204.69 10

26 Nickelback, 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, size       
X-Large. 15 No Bid No Bid Mechamix

Nickleback $279.99 10

27 Nickelback, 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, size     
XX-Large.  2 No Bid No Bid Mechamix

Nickleback $279.99 10

*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

1 Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, size Large, 4 mil.
Or County approved equal 2 IF-48-L $29.95 10 1040768 $5.72 10

2 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size Small,      
5 mil.  Or County approved equal 2 IF51-S $60.00 1040736 $7.04 10

3 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size Medium,   
5 mil.  Or County approved equal 3 IF51-M $60.00 10 1040737 $7.04 10

4 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size Large,  5 
mil.  Or County approved equal 3 IF51-L $60.00 10 1040738 $7.04 10

5 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size X-Large,  
5 mil.  Or County approved equal 40 IF51-XL $60.00 10 1040739 $7.04 10

6 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size XX-
Large, 5 mil. Or County approved equal 2 IF51-XXL $65.00 10 No Bid No Bid

7 UL315S - Exam Glove, size Small, Microflex Ultra One 
#UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" 158 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8
UL315M, Exam glove, size Medium, Microflex Ultra One 
#UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no 
substitutions

46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

School Health Corporation
Rolling Meadows, IL

Pristine Dental Supplies, Inc.
Riverside, CA

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

School Health Corporation
Rolling Meadows, IL

Pristine Dental Supplies, Inc.
Riverside, CA

9
UL315L, Exam glove, size Large, Microflex Ultra One 
#UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no 
substitutions

110 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10
UL315XL, Exam glove, size X- Large, Microflex Ultra  
One #UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, 
no substitutions

126 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11
Exam glove, size 2X- Large, comparable to Microflex 
Ultra One #UL315 or 14 mil glove, Powder Free, Textured 
Fingers, 12" Length.   Or County approved equal.

6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12
Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, size Medium, 
Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 
beaded cuff, no substitutions

161 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

13
Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, size Large, Powder-
Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, 
no substitutions

375 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

14
Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, size X-Large, 
Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 
beaded cuff, no substitutions

425 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

15
Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove,size 2X-Large, 
Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 
beaded cuff 

250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

16

MK296S-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size Small, length 245 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 
16, no substitutions

74 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

School Health Corporation
Rolling Meadows, IL

Pristine Dental Supplies, Inc.
Riverside, CA

17

MK296M-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size Medium, length 245 
mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile 
strength 16, no substitutions

334 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

18

MK296L-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size Large, length 245 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 
16, no substitutions

638 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

19

MK296XL-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size X-Large, length 245 
mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile 
strength 16, no substitutions

708 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

20

Micorflex Midknight - MK296 Black, Powder-Free Nitrile 
Standard Exam Glove, size 2X-Large,  length 245 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 
16.

170 KG-1303 $65.00 10 No Bid No Bid

21
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size Small- length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil. 

15 DIA-G03 $85.00 10 No Bid No Bid

22
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size Medium- length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7mil, finger 6.3 mil. 

25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

23
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size Large, length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil

50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

School Health Corporation
Rolling Meadows, IL

Pristine Dental Supplies, Inc.
Riverside, CA

24
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size X-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil

45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

25
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size XX-Large, length 300 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil

25 KG-1303-XXL $90.00 10 No Bid No Bid

26 Nickelback, 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, size       
X-Large. 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

27 Nickelback, 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, size     
XX-Large.  2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

1 Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, size Large, 4 mil.
Or County approved equal 2 2300 3.27 10 DF-850-L $5.90 10

2 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size Small,      
5 mil.  Or County approved equal 2 6302 3.83 10 FFS-700-S $10.29 10

3 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size Medium,   
5 mil.  Or County approved equal 3 6303 3.87 10 FFS-700-M $10.29 10

4 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size Large,  5 
mil.  Or County approved equal 3 6304 3.83 10 FFS-700-L $10.29 10

5 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size X-Large,  
5 mil.  Or County approved equal 40 6305 3.83 10 FFS-700-XL $10.29 10

6 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size XX-
Large, 5 mil. Or County approved equal 2 6346 4.93 10 FFS-700-XL $10.29 10

7 UL315S - Exam Glove, size Small, Microflex Ultra One 
#UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" 158 No Bid No Bid UL315S $13.05 10

8
UL315M, Exam glove, size Medium, Microflex Ultra One 
#UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no 
substitutions

46 No Bid No Bid UL315M $13.05 10

The Glove Box
Long Beach, CA

Universal Home Health and
Industrial Supplies, Inc.

Tampa, FL

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

The Glove Box
Long Beach, CA

Universal Home Health and
Industrial Supplies, Inc.

Tampa, FL

9
UL315L, Exam glove, size Large, Microflex Ultra One 
#UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no 
substitutions

110 No Bid No Bid UL315L $13.05 10

10
UL315XL, Exam glove, size X- Large, Microflex Ultra  
One #UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, 
no substitutions

126 No Bid No Bid UL315XL $13.05 10

11
Exam glove, size 2X- Large, comparable to Microflex 
Ultra One #UL315 or 14 mil glove, Powder Free, Textured 
Fingers, 12" Length.   Or County approved equal.

6 015-0 $12.35 10 UL315XXL $13.05 10

12
Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, size Medium, 
Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 
beaded cuff, no substitutions

161 No Bid No Bid 6602-20 $10.55 10

13
Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, size Large, Powder-
Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, 
no substitutions

375 No Bid No Bid 6603-20 $10.55 10

14
Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, size X-Large, 
Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 
beaded cuff, no substitutions

425 No Bid No Bid 6604-20 $10.55 10

15
Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove,size 2X-Large, 
Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 
beaded cuff 

250 015-0 $12.35 50 6604.2 $10.55 10

16

MK296S-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size Small, length 245 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 
16, no substitutions

74 No Bid No Bid MK296S $13.11 10

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

The Glove Box
Long Beach, CA

Universal Home Health and
Industrial Supplies, Inc.

Tampa, FL

17

MK296M-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size Medium, length 245 
mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile 
strength 16, no substitutions

334 No Bid No Bid MK296M $13.11 10

18

MK296L-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size Large, length 245 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 
16, no substitutions

638 No Bid No Bid MK296L $13.11 10

19

MK296XL-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size X-Large, length 245 
mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile 
strength 16, no substitutions

708 No Bid No Bid MK296XL $13.11 10

20

Micorflex Midknight - MK296 Black, Powder-Free Nitrile 
Standard Exam Glove, size 2X-Large,  length 245 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 
16.

170 777-0 6.97 10 MK296XXL $13.11 10

21
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size Small- length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil. 

15 777-6 6.97 10 SEC-375S $11.60 10

22
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size Medium- length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7mil, finger 6.3 mil. 

25 777-7 6.97 10 SEC-375M $11.60 10

23
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size Large, length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil

50 777-8 6.97 10 SEC-375L $11.60 10

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

The Glove Box
Long Beach, CA

Universal Home Health and
Industrial Supplies, Inc.

Tampa, FL

24
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size X-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil

45 777-9 6.79 10 SEC-375XL $11.60 10

25
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size XX-Large, length 300 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil

25 777-0 $6.97 10 SEC-3752XL $11.62 10

26 Nickelback, 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, size       
X-Large. 15 No Bid No Bid NickelBack $21.42 10

27 Nickelback, 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, size     
XX-Large.  2 No Bid No Bid NickelBack $21.42 10

*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

1 Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, size Large, 4 mil.
Or County approved equal 2 No Bid No Bid

2 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size Small,      
5 mil.  Or County approved equal 2 No Info $6.50 10

3 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size Medium,   
5 mil.  Or County approved equal 3 No Info $6.50 10

4 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size Large,  5 
mil.  Or County approved equal 3 No Info $6.50 10

5 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size X-Large,  
5 mil.  Or County approved equal 40 No Info $6.50 10

6 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size XX-
Large, 5 mil. Or County approved equal 2 No Bid No Bid

7 UL315S - Exam Glove, size Small, Microflex Ultra One 
#UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" 158 No Bid No Bid

8
UL315M, Exam glove, size Medium, Microflex Ultra One 
#UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no 
substitutions

46 No Bid No Bid

WKH Consulting, LLC
Richmond, VA

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

WKH Consulting, LLC
Richmond, VA

9
UL315L, Exam glove, size Large, Microflex Ultra One 
#UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no 
substitutions

110 No Bid No Bid

10
UL315XL, Exam glove, size X- Large, Microflex Ultra  
One #UL315, Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, 
no substitutions

126 No Bid No Bid

11
Exam glove, size 2X- Large, comparable to Microflex 
Ultra One #UL315 or 14 mil glove, Powder Free, Textured 
Fingers, 12" Length.   Or County approved equal.

6 No Bid No Bid

12
Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, size Medium, 
Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 
beaded cuff, no substitutions

161 No Bid No Bid

13
Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, size Large, Powder-
Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, 
no substitutions

375 No Bid No Bid

14
Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, size X-Large, 
Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 
beaded cuff, no substitutions

425 No Bid No Bid

15
Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove,size 2X-Large, 
Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 
beaded cuff 

250 No Bid No Bid

16

MK296S-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size Small, length 245 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 
16, no substitutions

74 No Bid No Bid

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

WKH Consulting, LLC
Richmond, VA

17

MK296M-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size Medium, length 245 
mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile 
strength 16, no substitutions

334 No Bid No Bid

18

MK296L-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size Large, length 245 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 
16, no substitutions

638 No Bid No Bid

19

MK296XL-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, 
Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, size X-Large, length 245 
mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile 
strength 16, no substitutions

708 No Bid No Bid

20

Micorflex Midknight - MK296 Black, Powder-Free Nitrile 
Standard Exam Glove, size 2X-Large,  length 245 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 
16.

170 No Bid No Bid

21
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size Small- length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil. 

15 No Bid No Bid

22
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size Medium- length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7mil, finger 6.3 mil. 

25 No Bid No Bid

23
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size Large, length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil

50 No Bid No Bid

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023
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Item Description
Appx.
Usage

(Boxes)

Product                        
Item #

Unit
Price

Boxes 
Per 

Case

WKH Consulting, LLC
Richmond, VA

24
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size X-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 
3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil

45 No Bid No Bid

25
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 
93-862 (elongated cuff) size XX-Large, length 300 mm, 
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 6.3 mil

25 No Bid No Bid

26 Nickelback, 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, size       
X-Large. 15 No Bid No Bid

27 Nickelback, 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, size     
XX-Large.  2 No Bid No Bid

*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing

Quotes Opened: 7-26-2023



ActOne government Solutions, Inc.
Delivery/Service can be performed no later than 10-12 business days from receipt of order
barring manufacturer backorder.

Item #1 - Innovative Healthcare - Dermassist

Item #7 Ansell - Microflex

Items  #16, 17, 18, 19, 20 Ansell - Midknight
Items  #21, 22, 23, 24, 25 Ansell - Midnight XTRA 93-862 glove line is in the process of being

discontinued & is no longer available for purchase.
longer available for purchase

Barupon, LLC
Delivery/Service can be performed no later than 7 calendar days from receipt of order

Bisonte Industrial
Delivery/Service can be performed no later than 7 calendar days from receipt of order

Items #7, 8, 9, 10 Box of 50
Items  #16, 17, 18, 19, 20 Box of 100

The enclosed bid proposal includes all price information, all inclusive, including the cost of
delivery to the addresses listed on the documentation.

Bound Tree Medical, LLC
2-3 ARO calendar days from receipt of order *if item is in stock

Henry Schein, Inc.
Delivery/Service can be performed no later than 2-7 calendar days from receipt of order

Item #2 Sempermed Semper Shield SSSC 102
Item #3 Sempermed Semper Shield SSSC 103
Item #4 Sempermed Semper Shield SSSC 104
Item #5 Sempermed Semper Shield SSSC 105
Item #6 Sempermed Semper Shield SSSC 106
Item #16 MicroFlex Midknight
Item #17 MicroFlex Midknight
Item #18 MicroFlex Midknight

Maadho Districutors, Inc.
Delivery/Service can be performed no later than 7 calendar days from receipt of order

Remarks & Exceptions:

Items  #2, 3, 4, 5, 6  Ansell- Microflex Supreno

Items  #8, 9, 10  Ansell -Microflex Ultra One



Medline industries, LP
Delivery/Service can be performed no later than 2 calendar days from receipt of order

Mini Wing USA
Delivery/Service can be performed no later than 15 calendar days from receipt of order

Item #15 50/Box
Item #26 Pack of 50
Item #27 Pack of 50

Pristine Dental Supplies, Inc.
Delivery/Service can be performed no later than 15 calendar days from receipt of order

Item #20 6 Mil
Item #21 6.3 Mil
Item #25 8 Mil

School Health Corporation
Delivery/Service can be performed no later than 30 calendar days from receipt of order

The Glove Box
Delivery/Service can be performed no later than 30 calendar days from receipt of order

Item #1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6  100/BX, 10/BX/CS
Items #11 & 15   50/BX, 10/BX/CS
Item #20 90/BX, 10/BX/CS
Items # 21, 22, 23  100/BX, 10/BX/CS
Item #25 90/BX, 10/BX/CS

Universal Home Health and Industrial Supplies, Inc.
Delivery/Service can be performed no later than 7 calendar days from receipt of order

Item #4 One Hundred Five Dollars and Fifty Cen
Item #21 93-862 small is discontinued, replaced with Microflex SEC-375-S
Item #22 93-862 Medium is discontinued, replaced with Microflex SEC-375-M
Item #23 93-862 Large is discontinued, replaced with Microflex SEC-375-L
Item #24 93-862XL is discontinued, replaced with Microflex SEC-375-XL
Item #25 93-862XXL is discontinued by Microflex, replaced with SEC-375-XXL

WKH Consulting, LLC
Delivery/Service can be performed no later than 5-7 calendar days from receipt of order

Items #2, 3, 4, 5 10 Boxes per Case Total $65.00 per Case
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