
Q-23-751
Fertilizer for Black Rock Golf Course

Genesis Turfgrass
Glen Rock, PA

Nutrien Ag Solutions
Rosedale, MD

SiteOne Landscaping Supply
Cleveland, OH

Item No. Product Description Ton(s) Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton

1
30-0-15, Nitrogen Source - 50% Sulfur 
Coated Urea, Potassium Source - Potassium 
Sufate K2SO4

10 $1,110.00 $1,080.00 $1,255.60

2 0-0-50 Fairway size, Sulfate of Potash K2SO4 2 $1,358.00 $1,265.00 $1,604.80 

3 Verde - Cal G by Aqua Aid, 50lb. Bag, 0-0-50 
with 17% Sulfur 1 $998.00 No Bid No Bid

4 Sulfate of Potash, Greens Grade, 50 lb. bag, 0-
0-50 with 17% Sulfur 1 $1,384.00 $1,289.00 $1,795.60 

5

Nature Safe 8-3-5, Fine Grade, 50 lb. bag,
0.2% Ammoniacal Nitrogen, 7.2% Water
Insoluble Nitrogen, 0.6% Water Soluble
Nitrogen

1 $1,710.00 No Bid No Bid

Quotes Opened: May 24, 2023
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6 Prilled Urea, 50 lb. bag, 46-0-0 1 $1,237.60 $1,118.75 $920.00 

7
Contec DG, 40 lb. bag, 12-24-8 SGN75, 6.0%
Ammoniacal Nitrogen, 0.9% Urea Nitrogen,
2.1% Water Soluble Nitrogen

1 $3,210.00 $3,210.00 $2,400.00 

8
Contec DG, 40 lb. bag, 18-0-18 SGN75, 18%
Total Nitrogen, 18% Soluble Potash, 10.2%
Sulfur, .28% Iron, .14% Manganese

1 $3,350.00 $3,350.00 $2,490.00 

9 Amp ProMag36, 50 lb. bag, 36% Magnesium,
6% Sulfur 1 $1,695.20 $1,589.00 $1,600.00 

Remarks/Exceptions:

*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing
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