Q-23-750

Mechanical Systems - Water Quality Assurance Program for Washington County, Maryland

Nile WaterTech Inc. WaterPro Inc.
Severn, MD Sykesville, MD

W?shlngton County Administration Complex (Annual $1.296.00 $1,440.00
1A [Price)

Was'hlngton County Administration Complex No Bid No Bid
1B |Equipment Cost
2A |Washington County Office Building (Annual Price) $396.00 $260.00

Washington County Office Building Equi t Cost

ashington County Office Building Equipment Cos No Bid No Bid

2B
3A [Washinton County Court House Annex (Annual Price) $1,620.00 $1,440.00

Washington County Court House Annex Equipment No Bid No Bid
3B |Cost
4A |Willima J. Dwyer Memorial Center (Annual Price) $219.60 $260.00
4B |William J. Dwyer Memorial Center Equipment Cost No Bid No Bid
SA |Martin Luther King Center (Annual Price) $696.00 $720.00
5B |Martin Luther King Center Equipment Cost No Bid No Bid
6A |Agricultural Education Center (Annual Price) $219.60 $260.00

Agricultural Education Center ) )
6B |Equipment Cost No Bid No Bid
7A [Boonsboro Library (Annual Price) $219.60 $260.00

Boonsboro Library ) )
7B |Equipment Cost No Bid No Bid
8A |Clear Spring Library (Annual Price) $219.60 $260.00

Clear Spring Library , .
8B |Equipment Cost No Bid No Bid
9A |Smithsburg Library (Annual Price) $219.60 $260.00

Quotes Opened: 5/31/2023



Q-23-750

Mechanical Systems - Water Quality Assurance Program for Washington County, Maryland

Nile WaterTech Inc. WaterPro Inc.
Severn, MD Sykesville, MD
Smithsburg Library . .
9B |Equipment Cost No Bid No Bid
W'ashington County Administrative Annex (Annual $219.60 $260.00
10A [Price)
hi Admini e A Eaui
Washinton County Administrative Annex Equipment No Bid No Bid
10B |Cost
Washington County Transportation Department
11A|(Annual Price) $696.00 $720.00
hi T ion D
Was' ington County Transportation Department No Bid No Bid
11B [Equipment Cost
Washington County Sheriff's Department - Detention
12A |Center (Annual Price) $396.00 $440.00
Washington County Sheriff's Department - Detention ) )
12B |Center Equipment Cost No Bid No Bid
Washington County Sheriff's Department - Detention
13A |Center (Minimum Security Wing) (Annual Price) $198.00 $260.00
Washington County Sheriff's Department - Detention ) )
13B |Center (Minimum Security Wing) Equipment Cost No Bid No Bid
14A |Washington County Health Department (Annual Price) $396.00 $440.00
hi Health D Equi
Washington County Health Department Equipment No Bid No Bid
14B |Cost
15A |Washington County Free Library (Annual Price) $1,720.40 $2,100.00
15B |Washington County Free Library Equipment Cost No Bid No Bid
TOTAL SUM ion for I 1A th h 15B f
(0} SuU Quotatlon' or Items 1A through 15B (Sum o $8.732.00 §9.380.00
all items above)

*Corrected prices based on unit prices

Remarks/Exceptions: None

Q-23-750 Water Quality Assurance Program awarded to: Nile WateTech Inc. of Severn, MD

Quotes Opened: 5/31/2023
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