
Q-23-747 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

Central Poly-Bag Corp.
Linden, NJ

Dispose N' Save
Monroe, NY

Toilet Tissue, minimum dimension of (WxL) 4.5”x 4.05” not to exceed 
4.5”x 4.5” shall be acceptable, 2 Ply White, 500 sheets per roll, 80 
rolls/case. Tork Advanced or County approved equal.  Approximate usage: 
nine hundred seven (907) cases.

$48.70 No Bid

Product Item #235 (Quoters shall provide
quantity [rolls] per case. 96 rolls per case) * Product Item # (Quoters shall provide quanity 

[rolls] per case.  # rolls per case)

Hand Towels, Multifold, natural, approximately 9.25”x 9.5”, 250 
towels/pkg, 16 pkgs/case, total of 4,000 sheets per case. Marcal PRO 
P200N or County approved equal. Approximate usage: eight hundred fifty 
(850) cases.

$26.70 No Bid

Product Item #P200N (Quoters shall provide 
quantity [sheets] 4,000 per case)

Product Item # (Quoters shall provide quantity 
[sheets] # per case)

Roll Towels, 100% Recycled hard wound paper towels, natural, 7.85” w x 
350 linear ft., 12 rolls/case. Marcal PRO P720N or County approved equal. 
Approximate usage: thirty (30) cases.

$27.60 No Bid

Product Item #P720N (Quoters shall provide 
quanity [rolls] per case. 12 rolls per case)

Product Item # (Quoters shall provide quanity 
[rolls] per case. # rolls per case)

Roll Towel, white, 800’ rolls, 10" Length, 6 rolls per case. 
Enmotion/Georgia-Pacific . No substitutions.  Approximate usage: One 
hundred thirteen (113) cases.

$83.99 No Bid

Product Item #6 (Price per case of six [6] rolls) * Product Item # (Price per case of six [6] rolls)

GOJO  Luxury Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills for FMX-12 Dispensing 
Systems - 1250 ml/per each refill - 3 per case. No substitutions. 
Approximate usage: two hundred eighteen (218) cases

No Bid No Bid

Product Item # (Price per case of three [3] 
refills)

Product Item # (Price per case of three [3] 
refills)

GOJO Premium Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills for TFX Touch-Free 
Dispensing Systems - 1200 ml/per each refill - 2 per case. No Substitutions. 
Approximate usage: sixty-four (64) cases

No Bid No Bid

Product Item # (Price per case of two [2] 
refills)

Product Item # (Price per case of two [2] 
refills)

Item No. / Description
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Quotes Opened:  5/31/23



Q-23-747 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

Central Poly-Bag Corp.                          
Linden, NJ

Dispose N' Save                                                                  
Monroe, NY

GoJo Pomeberry Foam Handwash refills for LTX-12 Dispenser-1200 ml per 
each refill - 2 per case. No substitutions. Approximate usage: fifteen (15) 
cases.

No Bid No Bid

Product Item # (Price per case of two [2] 
refills)

Product Item # (Price per case of two [2] 
refills)

Antibacterial Hand Soap Refill - 1 gal/per each refill - 4 per case. Dial 
Professional or County Approved equal. Approximate usage: fifty-nine (59) 
cases.

No Bid No Bid

Product Item # (Price per case of four [4] 
refills)

Product Item # (Price per case of four [4] 
refills)

Tork Universal Tissue Roll (T22) – two (2) ply, 3.5” x 8.8” diameter, core 
3.3”, twelve (12) rolls per case. No substitutions. Approximate usage: one 
hundred fifty (150) cases.

No Bid No Bid

Product Item # (Price per case of twelve [12] 
rolls

Product Item # (Price per case of twelve [12] 
rolls

Waxed Paper Liner – 9” x 10” x 3.25”, 250/case. Hospeco (HS6141) or 
County approved equal. Approximate usage: five (5) cases. No Bid No Bid

Product Item # (Price per case of two hundred 
fifty [250] per case)

Product Item # (Price per case of Two hundred 
fifty [250] per case)

Tork Advanced Hand Towel Roll – 450' x 7.5”, roll diameter 5.9”, core 
inside diameter 1.9", one ply, white towel, 12 rolls/case. For H76 -  Mini 
mechanical hand towel system, Article 7674540. No substitutions. 
Approximate usage: twenty-four (24) cases.

No Bid No Bid

Product Item # (Price per case of twelve [12] 
per case)

Product Item # (Price per case of twelve [12] 
per case)

Non-Skid Disposable Urinal Floor Mats, rubber - approximately 17  1/2" 
Width x 20" Length, six (6) per case. Boardwalk Product (Item No. 
BWKUMBB) or County approved equal. Approximate usage: thirty-seven 
(37) cases.

No Bid No Bid

Product Item # (Price per case) Product Item # (Price per case)
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Quotes Opened:  5/31/23



Q-23-747 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

Central Poly-Bag Corp.                          
Linden, NJ

Dispose N' Save                                                                                                       
Monroe, NY

Cloths X60, Jumbo Roll - approximately 12 1/2" Width x 13 2/5" Length, 
1100 per roll. WypAll (34965) or County approved equal. Approximate 
usage: eight (8) rolls. 

No Bid No Bid

Product Item # (Price per each) Product Item # (Price per each)

Cloths X50, Jumbo Roll - approximately 9 4/5" Width x 13 2/5" Length, 
1100 per roll. WypAll (35015) or County approved equal. Approximate 
usage: twenty (20) rolls.

No Bid No Bid

Product Item # (Price per each) Product Item # (Price per each)

Trash Liners, Black, 43" x 47", 2.0 mil., 56-gallon capacity, 10 bags per roll, 
10 rolls per case for a total of 100. No substitutions. Approximate usage: two 
hundred fifty-nine (259) cases.

$28.00 $28.34

 Product Item #CP4347K2 (Price per case of 
ten [10] rolls) 

 Product Item #DPS4347-2 (Price per case of 
ten [10] rolls) *

Trash Liners, Natural, 24" x 33", 12 mic, 12-16 gallon capacity, 20 bags per 
roll, 25 rolls per case for a total of 500. No substitutions. Approximate 
usage: twenty-four (24) cases.

$21.00 $19.82

Product Item #CP2433N12 (Price per case of 
twenty-five [25] rolls)

Product Item #DPS2433-12 (Price per case of 
twenty-five [25] rolls) *

Trash Liners, Clear, 38" x 65", 3.0 mil, 55-gallon capacity, 10 rolls per case 
for a total of 100. No substitutions. Approximate usage: three hundred four 
(304) cases.

$58.00 $62.82 

Product Item #CP3865N3 (Price per case of ten 
[10] rolls)

Product Item #DPS3865-3 (Price per case of 
ten [10] rolls) *

Hand Sanitizer, alcohol based, greater than 60% ethanol or 70% 
isopropanol, 12-ounce pump bottles, 12 bottles per case. Approximate 
usage: unknown.

No Bid No Bid

Product Item # (Price per case of twelve [12] 
bottles)

Product Item # (Price per case of twelve [12] 
bottles)
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*Corrected Calculations based on Unit Pricing and/or Remarks/Exceptions

Quotes Opened:  5/31/23



Q-23-747 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

FPC Holdings                                    
Elkridge, MD

Imperial Bag & Paper Co. LLC                    
Jessup, MD

Toilet Tissue, minimum dimension of (WxL) 4.5”x 4.05” not to exceed 
4.5”x 4.5” shall be acceptable, 2 Ply White, 500 sheets per roll, 80 
rolls/case. Tork Advanced or County approved equal.  Approximate usage: 
nine hundred seven (907) cases.

$47.11 $46.59

Product Item #2461200 (Quoters shall provide 
quanity [rolls] per case. 80/500 rolls per case)

Product Item #TM1616S (Quoters shall provide 
quanity [rolls] per case.  96 rolls per case)

Hand Towels, Multifold, natural, approximately 9.25”x 9.5”, 250 
towels/pkg, 16 pkgs/case, total of 4,000 sheets per case. Marcal PRO 
P200N or County approved equal. Approximate usage: eight hundred fifty 
(850) cases.

$20.60 $22.69

Product Item Nova #MK250 (Quoters shall 
provide quantity [sheets] 16/250 per case) * Product Item #MK530A (Quoters shall provide 

quantity [sheets] 4,000 per case) *

Roll Towels, 100% Recycled hard wound paper towels, natural, 7.85” w x 
350 linear ft., 12 rolls/case. Marcal PRO P720N or County approved equal. 
Approximate usage: thirty (30) cases.

$23.12 No Bid

Product Item Simple Earth #S1080 (Quoters 
shall provide quanity [rolls] per case. 12/350 

rolls per case)
*

Product Item # (Quoters shall provide quanity 
[rolls] per case. # rolls 

per case)
Roll Towel, white, 800’ rolls, 10" Length, 6 rolls per case. 
Enmotion/Georgia-Pacific .  No substitutions.  Approximate usage: One 
hundred thirteen (113) cases.

$69.10 $69.94

Product Item #13507 (Price per case of six [6] 
rolls)

Product Item #89460 (Price per case of six [6] 
rolls)

GOJO  Luxury Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills for FMX-12 Dispensing 
Systems -1250 ml/per each refill - 3 per case. No substitutions.  Approximate 
usage: two hundred eighteen (218) cases

$67.40 $64.14

Product Item #5162-04 (Price per case of three 
[3] refills)

Product Item #5157-30 (Price per case of three 
[3] refills)

GOJO Premium Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills for TFX Touch-Free 
Dispensing Systems - 1200 ml/per each refill - 2 per case.  No Substitutions. 
Approximate usage: sixty-four (64) cases

$50.70 $44.77

Product Item #5362-02 (Price per case of two 
[2] refills)

Product Item #05362-02 (Price per case of two 
[2] refills)
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Quotes Opened:  5/31/23



Q-23-747 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

FPC Holdings                                    
Elkridge, MD

Imperial Bag & Paper Co. LLC                 
Jessup, MD

GoJo Pomeberry Foam Handwash refills for LTX-12 Dispenser-1200 ml per 
each refill - 2 per case. No substitutions. Approximate usage: fifteen (15) 
cases.

$46.70 No Bid

Product Item #1916-02 (Price per case of two 
[2] refills)

Product Item # (Price per case of two [2] 
refills)

Antibacterial Hand Soap Refill - 1 gal/per each refill - 4 per case. Dial 
Professional or County Approved equal. Approximate usage: fifty-nine (59) 
cases.

$38.72 $35.73

Product Item #5031-420-02 (Price per case of 
four [4] refills) * Product Item #1LIQDIAL (Price per case of 

four [4] refills)

Tork Universal Tissue Roll (T22) – two (2) ply, 3.5” x 8.8” diameter, core 
3.3”, twelve (12) rolls per case. No substitutions. Approximate usage: one 
hundred fifty (150) cases.

$38.44 $33.29

Product Item #TJ0922A (Price per case of 
twelve [12] rolls

Product Item #TJ0922A (Price per case of 
twelve [12] rolls

Waxed Paper Liner – 9” x 10” x 3.25”, 250/case. Hospeco (HS6141) or 
County approved equal. Approximate usage: five (5) cases. $20.41 No Bid

Product Item #HS6141 (Price per case of two 
hundred fifty [250] per case)

Product Item # (Price per case of two hundred 
fifty [250] per case)

Tork Advanced Hand Towel Roll – 450' x 7.5”, roll diameter 5.9”, core 
inside diameter 1.9", one ply, white towel, 12 rolls/case. For H76 -  Mini 
mechanical hand towel system, Article 7674540. No substitutions. 
Approximate usage: twenty-four (24) cases.

$56.74 No Bid

Product Item #7674540 (Price per case of 
twelve [12] per case)

Product Item # (Price per case of twelve [12] 
per case)

Non-Skid Disposable Urinal Floor Mats, rubber - approximately 17  1/2" 
Width x 20" Length, six (6) per case. Boardwalk Product (Item No. 
BWKUMBB) or County approved equal. Approximate usage: thirty-seven 
(37) cases.

$37.95 No Bid

Product Item #1525 (Price per case) * Product Item # (Price per case)

Item No. / Description
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Q-23-747 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

FPC Holdings                                    
Elkridge, MD

Imperial Bag & Paper Co. LLC                       
Jessup, MD

Cloths X60, Jumbo Roll - approximately 12 1/2" Width x 13 2/5" Length, 
1100 per roll. WypAll (34965) or County approved equal. Approximate 
usage: eight (8) rolls. 

$63.00 No Bid

Product Item #N-P060JPB (Price per each) * Product Item # (Price per each)

Cloths X50, Jumbo Roll - approximately 9 4/5" Width x 13 2/5" Length, 
1100 per roll. WypAll (35015) or County approved equal. Approximate 
usage: twenty (20) rolls.

$44.93 No Bid

Product Item #N-P050JPW (Price per each) * Product Item # (Price per each)

Trash Liners, Black, 43" x 47", 2.0 mil., 56-gallon capacity, 10 bags per roll, 
10 rolls per case for a total of 100. No substitutions. Approximate usage: two 
hundred fifty-nine (259) cases.

$28.86 $32.17

 Product Item #PL434720B (Price per case of 
ten [10] rolls) *  Product Item #PP061304 (Price per case of ten 

[10] rolls) *

Trash Liners, Natural, 24" x 33", 12 mic, 12-16 gallon capacity, 20 bags per 
roll, 25 rolls per case for a total of 500. No substitutions. Approximate 
usage: twenty-four (24) cases.

$19.26 No Bid

Product Item #PLR243313N (Price per case of 
twenty-five [25] rolls) * Product Item # (Price per case of twenty-five 

[25] rolls)

Trash Liners, Clear, 38" x 65", 3.0 mil, 55-gallon capacity, 10 rolls per case 
for a total of 100. No substitutions. Approximate usage: three hundred four 
(304) cases.

$37.92 No Bid

Product Item #K7663WC (Price per case of ten 
[10] rolls) * Product Item #  (Price per case of ten [10] 

rolls)

Hand Sanitizer, alcohol based, greater than 60% ethanol or 70% 
isopropanol, 12-ounce pump bottles, 12 bottles per case. Approximate 
usage: unknown.

$57.54 $66.69 

Product Item #3659-12 (Price per case of 
twelve [12] bottles)

Product Item #3659-12 (Price per case of 
twelve [12] bottles) *

*Corrected Calculations based on Unit Pricing and/or Remarks/Exceptions
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Q-23-747 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

Kane Enterprises                                         
Baltimore, MD

Unipak Corp.                                                    
West Long Branch, NJ

Toilet Tissue, minimum dimension of (WxL) 4.5”x 4.05” not to exceed 4.5”x 
4.5” shall be acceptable, 2 Ply White, 500 sheets per roll, 80 rolls/case. Tork 
Advanced or County approved equal.  Approximate usage: nine hundred seven 
(907) cases.

$81.20 No Bid

Product Item #GPC19880-01 (Quoters shall 
provide quantity [rolls] per case. 80 rolls per 

case)

Product Item # (Quoters shall provide quanity 
[rolls] per case.  # rolls per case)

Hand Towels, Multifold, natural, approximately 9.25”x 9.5”, 250 towels/pkg, 16 
pkgs/case, total of 4,000 sheets per case. Marcal PRO P200N or County 
approved equal. Approximate usage: eight hundred fifty (850) cases.

$50.13 No Bid

Product Item #G4059962 (Quoters shall provide 
quantity [sheets] 4,000 per case)

Product Item # (Quoters shall provide quantity 
[sheets] # per case)

Roll Towels, 100% Recycled hard wound paper towels, natural, 7.85” w x 350 
linear ft., 12 rolls/case. Marcal PRO P720N or County approved equal. 
Approximate usage: thirty (30) cases.

$134.43 No Bid

Product Item #CIO-MA-P720N (Quoters shall 
provide quanity [rolls] per case. 12 rolls per 

case)

Product Item # (Quoters shall provide quanity 
[rolls] per case. # rolls per case)

Roll Towel, white, 800’ rolls, 10" Length, 6 rolls per case. Enmotion/Georgia-
Pacific . No substitutions.  Approximate usage: One hundred thirteen (113) 
cases.

$142.07 No Bid

Product Item #89460 (Price per case of six [6] 
rolls) Product Item # (Price per case of six [6] rolls)

GOJO  Luxury Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills for FMX-12 Dispensing 
Systems -1250 ml/per each refill - 3 per case. No substitutions.  Approximate 
usage: two hundred eighteen (218) cases

$82.41 No Bid

Product Item #5162-03 (Price per case of three 
[3] refills)

Product Item # (Price per case of three [3] 
refills)

GOJO Premium Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills for TFX Touch-Free 
Dispensing Systems - 1200 ml/per each refill - 2 per case. No Substitutions. 
Approximate usage: sixty-four (64) cases

$104.87 * No Bid

Product Item #5362-02 (Price per case of two 
[2] refills) Product Item # (Price per case of two [2] refills)

Item No. / Description
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Quotes Opened:  5/31/23



Q-23-747 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

Kane Enterprises                                         
Baltimore, MD

Unipak Corp.                                                    
West Long Branch, NJ

GoJo Pomeberry Foam Handwash refills for LTX-12 Dispenser-1200 ml per 
each refill - 2 per case. No substitutions. Approximate usage: fifteen (15) cases. $60.30 No Bid

Product Item #1916-02 (Price per case of two 
[2] refills) Product Item # (Price per case of two [2] refills)

Antibacterial Hand Soap Refill - 1 gal/per each refill - 4 per case. Dial 
Professional or County Approved equal. Approximate usage: fifty-nine (59) 
cases.

$93.18 No Bid

Product Item #DIA82383(Price per case of four 
[4] refills) Product Item # (Price per case of four [4] refills)

Tork Universal Tissue Roll (T22) – two (2) ply, 3.5” x 8.8” diameter, core 3.3”, 
twelve (12) rolls per case. No substitutions. Approximate usage: one hundred 
fifty (150) cases.

$96.48 No Bid

Product Item #TRKTJ0922A (Price per case of 
twelve [12] rolls

Product Item # (Price per case of twelve [12] 
rolls

Waxed Paper Liner – 9” x 10” x 3.25”, 250/case. Hospeco (HS6141) or County 
approved equal. Approximate usage: five (5) cases. $27.33 No Bid

Product Item #HS6141 (Price per case of two 
hundred fifty [250] per case)

Product Item # (Price per case of two hundred 
fifty [250] per case)

Tork Advanced Hand Towel Roll – 450' x 7.5”, roll diameter 5.9”, core inside 
diameter 1.9", one ply, white towel, 12 rolls/case. For H76 -  Mini mechanical 
hand towel system, Article 7674540. No substitutions. Approximate usage: 
twenty-four (24) cases.

$93.13 No Bid

Product Item #7674540 (Price per case of twelve 
[12] per case)

Product Item # (Price per case of twelve [12] per 
case)

Non-Skid Disposable Urinal Floor Mats, rubber - approximately 17  1/2" Width 
x 20" Length, six (6) per case. Boardwalk Product (Item No. BWKUMBB) or 
County approved equal. Approximate usage: thirty-seven (37) cases.

$67.15 No Bid

Product Item #BWKOMBB (Price per case) Product Item # (Price per case)

Item No. / Description
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Q-23-747 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

Kane Enterprises                                         
Baltimore, MD

Unipak Corp.                                                    
West Long Branch, NJ

Cloths X60, Jumbo Roll - approximately 12 1/2" Width x 13 2/5" Length, 1100 
per roll. WypAll (34965) or County approved equal. Approximate usage: eight 
(8) rolls. 

$145.50 No Bid

Product Item #34965 (Price per each) Product Item # (Price per each)

Cloths X50, Jumbo Roll - approximately 9 4/5" Width x 13 2/5" Length, 1100 
per roll. WypAll (35015) or County approved equal. Approximate usage: twenty 
(20) rolls.

$145.50 No Bid

Product Item #KCC35015 (Price per each) Product Item # (Price per each)

Trash Liners, Black, 43" x 47", 2.0 mil., 56-gallon capacity, 10 bags per roll, 10 
rolls per case for a total of 100. No substitutions. Approximate usage: two 
hundred fifty-nine (259) cases.

$0.00 * $31.50

 Product Item # (Price per case of ten [10] rolls)  Product Item #4347C2 (Price per case of ten 
[10] rolls) 

Trash Liners, Natural, 24" x 33", 12 mic, 12-16 gallon capacity, 20 bags per roll, 
25 rolls per case for a total of 500. No substitutions. Approximate usage: twenty-
four (24) cases.

$0.00 * $19.50

Product Item # (Price per case of twenty-five 
[25] rolls)

Product Item #3312 (Price per case of twenty-
five [25] rolls)

Trash Liners, Clear, 38" x 65", 3.0 mil, 55-gallon capacity, 10 rolls per case for 
a total of 100. No substitutions. Approximate usage: three hundred four (304) 
cases.

$0.00 * $58.90 

Product Item # (Price per case of ten [10] rolls) Product Item #653 (Price per case of ten [10] 
rolls)

Hand Sanitizer, alcohol based, greater than 60% ethanol or 70% isopropanol, 12-
ounce pump bottles, 12 bottles per case. Approximate usage: unknown. $0.00 * No Bid

Product Item # (Price per case of twelve [12] 
bottles)

Product Item #  (Price per case of twelve [12] 
bottles)

Item No. / Description
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*Corrected Calculations based on Unit Pricing and/or Remarks/Exceptions 
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Q-23-747 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

United Sales USA Corp.                                
Brooklyn, NY

Weiss Bros.                                            
Hagerstown, MD

Toilet Tissue, minimum dimension of (WxL) 4.5”x 4.05” not to exceed 4.5”x 
4.5” shall be acceptable, 2 Ply White, 500 sheets per roll, 80 rolls/case. Tork 
Advanced or County approved equal.  Approximate usage: nine hundred seven 
(907) cases.

$40.43 $46.56

Product Item #58596U (Quoters shall provide 
quanity [rolls] per case. 96 rolls per case)

Product Item #SCA-2461200 (Quoters shall 
provide quanity [rolls] per case. 80 rolls per 

case)

Hand Towels, Multifold, natural, approximately 9.25”x 9.5”, 250 towels/pkg, 16 
pkgs/case, total of 4,000 sheets per case. Marcal PRO P200N or County 
approved equal. Approximate usage: eight hundred fifty (850) cases.

$17.34 $23.28

Product Item #MFN4000 (Quoters shall provide 
quantity [sheets] 4,000 per case)

Product Item #SCA-MK520A (Quoters shall 
provide quantity [sheets] 4,000 per case)

Roll Towels, 100% Recycled hard wound paper towels, natural, 7.85” w x 350 
linear ft., 12 rolls/case. Marcal PRO P720N or County approved equal. 
Approximate usage: thirty (30) cases.

$21.35 No Bid

Product Item #8350N (Quoters shall provide 
quanity [rolls] per case. 12 rolls per case)

Product Item # (Quoters shall provide quanity 
[rolls] per case. # rolls per case)

Roll Towel, white, 800’ rolls, 10" Length, 6 rolls per case. Enmotion/Georgia-
Pacific . No substitutions. Approximate usage: One hundred thirteen (113) 
cases.

$49.87 $67.59

Product Item #NP-680010 EWP (Price per case 
of six [6] rolls) * Product Item #GP-89460 (Price per case of six 

[6] rolls)

GOJO  Luxury Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills for FMX-12 Dispensing 
Systems -1250 ml/per each refill - 3 per case. No substitutions.  Approximate 
usage: two hundred eighteen (218) cases

$75.63 $66.03

Product Item #5162-04 (Price per case of three 
[3] refills) * Product Item #5162-04 (Price per case of three 

[3] refills) *

GOJO Premium Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills for TFX Touch-Free 
Dispensing Systems - 1200 ml/per each refill - 2 per case. No Substitutions. 
Approximate usage: sixty-four (64) cases

$56.16 $50.15

Product Item #5362-02 (Price per case of two 
[2] refills)

Product Item #5362-02 (Price per case of two 
[2] refills)
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Item No. / Description

Quotes Opened:  5/31/23



Q-23-747 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

United Sales USA Corp.                                
Brooklyn, NY

Weiss Bros.                                            
Hagerstown, MD

GoJo Pomeberry Foam Handwash refills for LTX-12 Dispenser-1200 ml per 
each refill - 2 per case. No substitutions. Approximate usage: fifteen (15) cases. $48.58 $45.80

Product Item #1916-02 (Price per case of two 
[2] refills)

Product Item #1916-02 (Price per case of two 
[2] refills)

Antibacterial Hand Soap Refill - 1 gal/per each refill - 4 per case. Dial 
Professional or County Approved equal. Approximate usage: fifty-nine (54) 
cases.

$35.85 No Bid

Product Item #BWK430CT (Price per case of 
four [4] refills) Product Item # (Price per case of four [4] refills)

Tork Universal Tissue Roll (T22) – two (2) ply, 3.5” x 8.8” diameter, core 3.3”, 
twelve (12) rolls per case. No substitutions. Approximate usage: one hundred 
fifty (150) cases.

$21.55 $38.00

Product Item #800APM (Price per case of twelve 
[12] rolls

Product Item #SCA-TJ0922A (Price per case of 
twelve [12] rolls

Waxed Paper Liner – 9” x 10” x 3.25”, 250/case. Hospeco (HS6141) or County 
approved equal. Approximate usage: five (5) cases. $25.33 $16.20

Product Item #HO6141 (Price per case of two 
hundred fifty [250] per case)

Product Item #HS6141 (Price per case of two 
hundred fifty [250] per case)

Tork Advanced Hand Towel Roll – 450' x 7.5”, roll diameter 5.9”, core inside 
diameter 1.9", one ply, white towel, 12 rolls/case. For H76 -  Mini mechanical 
hand towel system, Article 7674540. No substitutions. Approximate usage: 
twenty-four (24) cases.

No Bid $58.05 

Product Item # (Price per case of twelve [12] per 
case)

Product Item #SCA-7674550 (Price per case of 
twelve [12] per case)

Non-Skid Disposable Urinal Floor Mats, rubber - approximately 17  1/2" Width 
x 20" Length, six (6) per case. Boardwalk Product (Item No. BWKUMBB) or 
County approved equal. Approximate usage: thirty-seven (37) cases.

$39.00 No Bid

Product Item #BWKUMBB (Price per case) Product Item # (Price per case)
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Quotes Opened:  5/31/23



Q-23-747 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

United Sales USA Corp.                                
Brooklyn, NY

Weiss Bros.                                            
Hagerstown, MD

Cloths X60, Jumbo Roll - approximately 12 1/2" Width x 13 2/5" Length, 1100 
per roll. WypAll (34965) or County approved equal. Approximate usage: eight 
(8) rolls. 

$97.05 $94.94

Product Item #34965 (Price per each) Product Item #KC-34965 (Price per each)

Cloths X50, Jumbo Roll - approximately 9 4/5" Width x 13 2/5" Length, 1100 
per roll. WypAll (35015) or County approved equal. Approximate usage: twenty 
(20) rolls.

$56.65 $45.43

Product Item #35015 (Price per each) Product Item #KC-35015 (Price per each)

Trash Liners, Black, 43" x 47", 2.0 mil., 56-gallon capacity, 10 bags per roll, 10 
rolls per case for a total of 100. No substitutions. Approximate usage: two 
hundred fifty-nine (259) cases.

$20.25 $37.35

 Product Item #US4046B2 (Price per case of ten 
[10] rolls) 

 Product Item #X8647QK (Price per case of ten 
[10] rolls) 

Trash Liners, Natural, 24" x 33", 12 mic, 12-16 gallon capacity, 20 bags per roll, 
25 rolls per case for a total of 500. No substitutions. Approximate usage: twenty-
four (24) cases.

No Bid $24.99

Product Item # (Price per case of twenty-five 
[25] rolls)

Product Item #NR-243312N (Price per case of 
twenty-five [25] rolls)

Trash Liners, Clear, 38" x 65", 3.0 mil, 55-gallon capacity, 10 rolls per case for 
a total of 100. No substitutions. Approximate usage: three hundred four (304) 
cases.

$42.00 No Bid

Product Item #US553C2 (Price per case of ten 
[10] rolls) Product Item # (Price per case of ten [10] rolls)

Hand Sanitizer, alcohol based, greater than 60% ethanol or 70% isopropanol, 12-
ounce pump bottles, 12 bottles per case. Approximate usage: unknown. $58.50 $57.84 

Product Item #GOJO 3659-12 (Price per case of 
twelve [12] bottles)

Product Item #SCA400018 (Price per case of 
twelve [12] bottles)

*Corrected Calculations based on Unit Pricing and/or Remarks/Exceptions 
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Q-23-747 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

Q-23-747 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap Awarded to:

United Sales USA Corporation
1 Toilet Tissue Item No. 58596U
2 Hand Towels, Multifold Item No MFN4000
3 Roll Towels Item No. 8350N
9 Tork Universal Tissue Rool Product Istem No. 800APM
12 Non-Skid Disposable Urinal Floor Mats, rubber Product Item No. BWKUMBB
15 Trash Liners, Natural Product Item No. US4046B2

Weiss Brothers
4 Roll Towel, White Item No. GP-89460
7 GOJO Pomeberry Foam Handwash Refills Item No. 1916-02
10 Waxed Paper Liner Item No. HS6141
13 Cloths X60, Jumbo Roll Item No. KC-34965
14 Cloths X50, Jumbo Roll Item No. KC-36015

FPC Holdings
 11	Tork Advanced Hand Towel Roll	Item No. 7674540
16	Trash Liners, Natural	Product Item No. PLR243313N
17	Trash Liners, Clear	Product Item No. K7663WC
18	Hand Sanitizer, 12 oz. Pump Bottles	Product Item No. 3659-12

Imperial Bag & Papr Co. LLC
5 GOJO Luxury Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills Item No. 5157-30
6 GOJO Premium Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills Intem No. 05362-02
8 Antibacterial Hand Soap Refill Product Item No. 1LIQDIAL

Quotes Opened:  5/31/23
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