Q-22-723 1
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

AlphaProMed, LLC Bisonte Industrial USA, LLC Bound Tree Medical, LL.C
Tampa, FL Baltimore, MD Dublin, OH
. Approx. Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes
Item Description Usage . Per . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes) Case Case Case

j |Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, Large, 4 mil. 2 No Bid MSV503 $3.62 10 111419 $3.35 10
Or County approved equal

o |Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Small, 5 mil. 50 APM401A $4.60 10 CUR9314 $12.56 15 295201 $13.19 10
Or County approved equal

3 [Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Medium, 5 mil. 118 APM401B $4.60 10 CUR9315 $12.56 15 295202 $13.19 10
Or County approved equal

4 |Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Large, 5 mil. 203 APM401C $4.60 CUR9316 $12.56 15 295203 $13.19 10
Or County approved equal

5 |Nitrle Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, X-Large, 5 mil. 305 APM401D $4.60 CUR9317 $14.49 13 295204 $13.19 10
Or County approved equal

6 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size XX-Large, 5 mil. ) No Bid 484805 $16.76 2 No Bid
Or County approved equal

7 UL315S - Exam Glove, Small, Microflex Ultra One #UL315, ) No Bid UL315S $18.23 10 290315 $13.19 10
Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12"
UL315M, Exam glove, Medium, Microflex Ultra One #UL315, .

8 Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions 180 No Bid UL3ISM $18.23 10 290316 $13.19 10
UL315L, Exam glove, Large, Microflex Ultra One #UL315, .

? Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions 106 No Bid UL3I5L $18.23 10 290317 $13.19 10
UL315XL, Exam glove, X- Large, Microflex Ultra One #UL315, .

10 Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions 200 No Bid UL3ISXL $18.23 10 290318 $13.19 10
Exam glove, 2X- Large, comparable to Microflex Ultra One

11 [#UL315 or 14 mil glove, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12" 200 No Bid UL315XXL $18.23 10 No Bid
Length. Or County approved equal.
Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, Medium, Powder-Free,

12 |Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 50 No Bid 6602-20 $19.98 10 No Bid
substitutions

Quotes Opened: 7-20-2022



Q-22-723 2
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

AlphaProMed, LLC Bisonte Industrial USA, LLC Bound Tree Medical, LLC
Tampa, FL Baltimore, MD Dublin, OH
. L. Approx. Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes
Item Description Usage . Per . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes) Case Case Case
Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, Large, Powder-Free,
13 |Textured Fingers, 12 Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 641 No Bid 6603-20 $19.98 10 No Bid
substitutions
Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, X-Large, Powder-Free,
14 |Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 181 No Bid 6604-20 $19.98 10 No Bid
substitutions
15 Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, 2X-Large, Powder-Free, ) No Bid 6604-20 $19.98 10 No Bid

Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff

MK?296S-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile
16 |Standard Exam Glove, Small, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4 No Bid MK?296S $18.35 10 1015-29601 $15.36 10
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions

MK296M-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile
17 |Standard Exam Glove, Medium, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 84 No Bid MK296M $18.35 10 1015-29602 $15.36 10
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions

MK?296L-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile
18 |Standard Exam Glove, Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 248 No Bid MK?296L $18.35 10 1015-29603 $15.36 10
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions

MK296XL-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile
19 |Standard Exam Glove, X-Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 568 No Bid MK296XL $18.35 10 1015-29604 $15.36 10
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions

Powder-Free, Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, comparable to
20 [Micorflex Midknight - MK296 Black, 2X-Large, length 245 mm, 304 No Bid MK296XXL $18.35 10 1015-29605 $15.36 10
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16.

Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
21 |(elongated cuff) Small- length 300mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, 15 No Bid 93-862S $36.17 10 1015-62070 $21.88 10
finger 6.3 mil.

Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
22 |(elongated cuff) Medium- length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 25 No Bid 93-862M $36.17 10 1015-62080 $21.88 10
4.7mil, finger 6.3 mil.

Quotes Opened: 7-20-2022



Q-22-723

Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

AlphaProMed, LLC Bisonte Industrial USA, LLC Bound Tree Medical, LLC
Tampa, FL Baltimore, MD Dublin, OH
. L. Approx. Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes
Item Description Usage . Per . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes) Case Case Case
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
23 |(elongated cuff) Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, 50 No Bid 93-862L $36.17 10 1015-62090 $21.88 10
finger 6.3 mil
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
24 |(elongated cuff) X-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 45 No Bid 93-862XL $39.78 10 1015-62100 $21.88 10
mil, finger 6.3 mil
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
25 |(elongated cuff) XX-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 25 No Bid 93-862XXL $37.91 10 1015-62110 $21.88 10
mil, finger 6.3 mil
26 [Nickelback, 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, X-Large. 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid
27 [Nickelback, 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, XX-Large. 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing

*Notes:

AlphaProMed, LLC - Addenda not acknowledged. Delivery/Service: ? Calendar days.

Bisonte Industrial USA, LLC - Delivery/Service: 7 calendar days. Item Nos. 7-15 Box of 50 gloves.

Bound Tree Medical, LLC - Delivery/Service: 2-3 ARO* (¥If in stock when ordered). Item Nos. 1-5 and 16-25, 100/bx. Item Nos. 7-10, 50/Bx.

Quotes Opened: 7-20-2022



Q-22-723 4
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

Digital Ally, Inc. Henry Schein, Inc. Maadho Distributors, Inc.
Lenexa, KS Melville, NY Mount Kisco, NY
. Approx. Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes
Item Description Usage . Per . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes) Case Case Case
1 Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, Large, 4 mil. ) No Bid 3605432 $3.90 10 No Bid
Or County approved equal
, [Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Small, 5 mil. 50 007-00018-10 $118.10 10 7003623 $7.07 10 MDG351 $6.50 10
Or County approved equal
3 [Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Medium, 5 mil. 118 | 007-00019-10 $118.10 10 7003624 $7.07 10 MDG352 $6.50 10
Or County approved equal
4 |Niwile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Large, 5 mil. 203 007-00020-10 $118.10 10 7003625 $7.07 10 MDG353 $6.50 10
Or County approved equal
s [Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, X-Large, 5 mil. 305 007-00021-10 $118.10 10 7003626 $7.07 10 MDG354 $6.50 10
Or County approved equal
6 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size XX-Large, 5 mil. 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Or County approved equal
7 UL315S - Exam Glove, Small, Microflex Ultra One #UL315, ) No Bid 5653151 $13.87 10 No Bid
Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12"
UL315M, Exam glove, Medium, Microflex Ultra One #UL315, . .
8 Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions 180 No Bid 5653125 $13.87 10 No Bid
UL315L, Exam glove, Large, Microflex Ultra One #UL315, . .
? Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions 106 No Bid 5633133 $13.87 10 No Bid
UL315XL, Exam glove, X- Large, Microflex Ultra One #UL315, . .
10 Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions 200 No Bid 3633154 $13.87 10 No Bid
Exam glove, 2X- Large, comparable to Microflex Ultra One
11 [#UL315 or 14 mil glove, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12" 200 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Length. Or County approved equal.
Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, Medium, Powder-Free,
12 |Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
substitutions

Quotes Opened: 7-20-2022



Q-22-723

Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

Digital Ally, Inc. Henry Schein, Inc. Maadho Distributors, Inc.
Lenexa, KS Melville, NY Mount Kisco, NY
. L. APpprox. Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes
Item Description Usage . Per . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes) Case Case Case
Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, Large, Powder-Free,
13 [Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 641 No Bid No Bid No Bid
substitutions
Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, X-Large, Powder-Free,
14 |Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 181 No Bid No Bid No Bid
substitutions
Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, 2X-Large, Powder-Free, ) ) .
15 Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
MK296S-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile
16 [Standard Exam Glove, Small, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4 No Bid New $13.09 10 No Bid
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions
MK296M-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile
17 [Standard Exam Glove, Medium, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 84 No Bid 5657365 $13.09 10 No Bid
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions
MK296L-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile
18 [Standard Exam Glove, Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 248 No Bid 5651031 $13.09 10 No Bid
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions
MK296XL-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile
19 ([Standard Exam Glove, X-Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 568 No Bid 5650811 $13.09 10 No Bid
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions
Powder-Free, Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, comparable to
20 |Micorflex Midknight - MK296 Black, 2X-Large, length 245 mm, 304 No Bid New $13.09 10 No Bid
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16.
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
21 |(elongated cuff) Small- length 300mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, 15 No Bid 7003982 $22.16 10 No Bid
finger 6.3 mil.
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
22 |(elongated cuff) Medium- length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 25 No Bid 7003983 $22.16 10 No Bid
4.7mil, finger 6.3 mil.

Quotes Opened: 7-20-2022



Q-22-723 6
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

Digital Ally, Inc. Henry Schein, Inc. Maadho Distributors, Inc.
Lenexa, KS Melville, NY Mount Kisco, NY
. Approx. Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes
Item Description Usage . Per . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes) Case Case Case

Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
23 |(elongated cuff) Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, 50 No Bid 7003984 $22.16 10 No Bid
finger 6.3 mil

Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
24 |(elongated cuff) X-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 45 No Bid 7003985 $22.16 10 No Bid
mil, finger 6.3 mil

Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
25 |(elongated cuff) XX-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 25 No Bid 7003986 $22.16 10 No Bid
mil, finger 6.3 mil

26  |Nickelback, 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, X-Large. 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid

27 |Nickelback, 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, XX-Large. 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing

*Notes:
Digital Ally, Inc. - Addenda Nos. 4 & 5 not acknowledged. Delivery/Service: 10 calendar days.

Henry Schein, Inc. - Delivery/Service: 3-7 calendar days. Item No. 1, Sempermed SemperCare Vinyl EVNP104. Item No. 2, Sempermed SemperShield SSSC102. Item No. 3, Sempermed SemperShield SSSC103. Item No. 4, Sempermed
SemperShield SSSC104. Item No. 5, Sempermed SemperShield SSSC105.

Maadho Distributors, Inc. - Addenda Nos. 2 & 4 not acknowledged. Delivery/Service: 4-7 calendar days.

Quotes Opened: 7-20-2022



Q-22-723 7
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

Malor & Company, Inc. MD 1 Care, LLC Mexpo International, LTD.
New York, NY Atlanta, GA Union City, CA
. e Approx. Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes
Item Description Usage . Per . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes) Case Case Case
;| Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, Large, 4 mil. 2 FF3131 $5.00 10 No Bid BM 9228-V-PF $2.50 10
Or County approved equal
) Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Small, 5 mil. 50 FF3131 $6.00 10 $8.00 10 BM 45226-N-PF $6.50 10
Or County approved equal
3 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Medium, 5 mil. 118 FF3131 $6.00 10 $8.00 10 BM 452267-N- $6.50 10
Or County approved equal PF
4 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Large, 5 mil. 203 FF3131 $6.00 10 $8.00 10 BM 452268-N- $6.50 10
Or County approved equal PF
5 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, X-Large, 5 mil. 305 FF3131 $6.00 10 $8.00 10 BM 452269-N- $6.50 10
Or County approved equal PF
6 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size XX-Large, 5 mil. ) FF3131 $6.00 10 No Bid No Bid
Or County approved equal
7 UL315S - Exam Glove, Small, Microflex Ultra One #UL315, ) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12"
UL315M, Exam glove, Medium, Microflex Ultra One #UL315, . ) .
8 Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions 180 No Bid No Bid No Bid
UL315L, Exam glove, Large, Microflex Ultra One #UL315, . . .
? Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions 106 No Bid No Bid No Bid
UL315XL, Exam glove, X- Large, Microflex Ultra One #UL315, . . .
10 Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions 200 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Exam glove, 2X- Large, comparable to Microflex Ultra One
11 |#UL315 or 14 mil glove, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12" 200 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Length. Or County approved equal.
Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, Medium, Powder-Free,
12 |Textured Fingers, 12 Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
substitutions

Quotes Opened: 7-20-2022




Q-22-723

Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

Malor & Company, Inc. MD 1 Care, LLC Mexpo International, LTD.
New York, NY Atlanta, GA Union City, CA
. L. APpprox. Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes
Item Description Usage . Per . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes) Case Case Case
Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, Large, Powder-Free,
13 [Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 641 No Bid No Bid No Bid
substitutions
Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, X-Large, Powder-Free,
14 |Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 181 No Bid No Bid No Bid
substitutions
Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, 2X-Large, Powder-Free, . . .
13 Textured Fingers, 12 Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
MK?296S-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile SFR 87526-B-N
16 |Standard Exam Glove, Small, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4 No Bid No Bid PF $5.50 10
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions
MK296M-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile SFR 87527-B-N
17 |Standard Exam Glove, Medium, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 84 No Bid No Bid $5.50 10
. . . . PF
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions
MK?2961L-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile SFR 87528-B-N
18 |Standard Exam Glove, Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 248 No Bid No Bid PF $5.50 10
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions
MK296XL-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile SFR 87529-B-N
19 [Standard Exam Glove, X-Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 568 No Bid No Bid $5.50 10
. : . . PF
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions
Powder-Free, Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, comparable to
20  |Micorflex Midknight - MK296 Black, 2X-Large, length 245 mm, 304 FF13 $7.00 10 No Bid No Bid
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16.
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
21 |(elongated cuff) Small- length 300mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, 15 FF3131 $7.00 10 No Bid No Bid
finger 6.3 mil.
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
22 |(elongated cuff) Medium- length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 25 FF113 $7.00 20 No Bid No Bid
4.7mil, finger 6.3 mil.

Quotes Opened: 7-20-2022




Q-22-723
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

Malor & Company, Inc. MD 1 Care, LLC Mexpo International, LTD.
New York, NY Atlanta, GA Union City, CA
. L. APpprox. Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes
Item Description Usage . Per . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes) Case Case Case
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
23 |(elongated cuff) Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, 50 FF113 $7.00 10 No Bid No Bid
finger 6.3 mil
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
24 |(elongated cuff) X-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 45 FFF3113 $7.00 10 No Bid No Bid
mil, finger 6.3 mil
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
25 [(elongated cuff) XX-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 25 FF3131 $7.00 10 No Bid No Bid
mil, finger 6.3 mil
26  |Nickelback, 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, X-Large. 5 FF3131 $7.00 10 No Bid No Bid
27 |Nickelback, 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, XX-Large. 2 FF3131 $7.00 10 No Bid No Bid

*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing

*Notes:

Malor & Company, Inc. - Addenda Nos. 2-5 not acknowledged. Delivery/Service: 30 calendar days from receipt of order.

MD 1 Care, LLC - Addenda Nos. 3-5 not acknowledged. Delivery/Service: 7 calendar days.

Mexpo International, LTD. - Addenda Acknowledged? Delivery/Service: 5 calendar days.

Quotes Opened: 7-20-2022




Q-22-723
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

SanitizeNow, Inc. The Glove Box, Inc. Uweport
Houston, TX Charlotte, NC Charlotte, NC
. Approx. Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes
Item Description Usage . Per . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes) Case Case Case
| Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, Large, 4 mil. ) McKesson #25- $7.79 10 SVF6C4 $2.83 10 No Bid
Or County approved equal 96
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Small, 5 mil. VersaFlex
2 Or County approved equal 50 HVF500 $9.53 10 6302 $43.37 10 NB202101 $9.00 10
3 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Medium, 5 mil. 118 VersaFlex $9.53 10 6303 $43.37 10 NB202102 $9.00 10
Or County approved equal #VF501
4 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Large, 5 mil. 203 VersaFlex $9.53 10 6304 $43.37 10 NB202103 $9.00 10
Or County approved equal #VF502
5 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, X-Large, 5 mil. 305 VersaFlex $9.53 10 6305 $43.37 10 NB202104 $9.00 10
Or County approved equal #VF503
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, size XX-Large, 5 mil. VersaFlex . .
’ ’ ’ ’ 2 10. 1 B B
6 Or County approved equal #VF504 $10.59 0 No Bid No Bid
UL315S - Exam Glove, Small, Microflex Ultra One #UL315, 2 (box of . .
7 Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" 50) UL-315-8 $15.58 10 No Bid No Bid
UL315M, Exam glove, Medium, Microflex Ultra One #UL315, 180 (box of . .
8 Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions 50) UL-315-M $15.58 10 No Bid No Bid
UL315L, Exam glove, Large, Microflex Ultra One #UL315, 106 (box of . .
? Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions 50) UL-315-L $15.58 10 No Bid No Bid
UL315XL, Exam glove, X- Large, Microflex Ultra One #UL315, |200 (box of ) .
10 Powder-Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions 50) UL-315-XL $15.58 10 No Bid No Bid
Exam glove, 2X- Large, comparable to Microflex Ultra One 200 (box of Liberty Gloves
11 [#UL315 or 14 mil glove, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12" 50) & Safety #IM- $26.39 10 No Bid No Bid
Length. Or County approved equal. 2846HR-2X-CS
Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, Medium, Powder-Free, 50 (box of
12 |Textured Fingers, 12 Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 50) 6602-20 $17.08 10 No Bid No Bid
substitutions

10

Quotes Opened: 7-20-2022



Q-22-723

Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

SanitizeNow, Inc. The Glove Box, Inc. Uweport
Houston, TX Charlotte, NC Charlotte, NC
. L. Approx. Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes
Item Description Usage . Per . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes) Case Case Case

Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, Large, Powder-Free, 641 (box of

13 [Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 50) 6603-20 $17.07 10 No Bid No Bid
substitutions
Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, X-Large, Powder-Free, 181 (box of

14 |Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 50) 6604-20 $12.82 10 No Bid No Bid
substitutions
Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, 2X-Large, Powder-Free, 2 (box of .

15 Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff 50) 6605-20 $16.50 10 015-0 $14.20 10 No Bid
MK?296S-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile

16 [Standard Exam Glove, Small, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4 MK296-S $15.97 10 No Bid No Bid
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions
MK296M-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile

17 [Standard Exam Glove, Medium, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 84 MK296-M $15.97 10 No Bid No Bid
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions
MK296L-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile

18 [Standard Exam Glove, Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 248 MK296-L $15.97 10 No Bid No Bid
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions
MK296XL-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile

19 [Standard Exam Glove, X-Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 568 MK?296-XL $15.97 10 No Bid No Bid
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions
Powder-Free, Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, comparable to

20  |Micorflex Midknight - MK296 Black, 2X-Large, length 245 mm, 304 MK296-XXL $15.97 10 No Bid No Bid
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16.
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862

21 |(elongated cuff) Small- length 300mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, 15 93862070 $362.71 10 No Bid No Bid
finger 6.3 mil.
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862

22 |(elongated cuff) Medium- length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 25 93862080 $36.27 10 No Bid No Bid
4.7mil, finger 6.3 mil.

11

Quotes Opened: 7-20-2022



Q-22-723

Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

SanitizeNow, Inc. The Glove Box, Inc. Uweport
Houston, TX Charlotte, NC Charlotte, NC
. . Approx. Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes Product Unit Boxes
Item Description Usage . Per . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes) Case Case Case
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
23 |(elongated cuff) Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, 50 93862090 $36.27 10 No Bid No Bid
finger 6.3 mil
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
24 |(elongated cuff) X-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 45 93862100 $36.27 10 No Bid No Bid
mil, finger 6.3 mil
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
25 |(elongated cuff) XX-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 25 93862110 $36.27 10 No Bid No Bid
mil, finger 6.3 mil
. . . i D07-08-011- . .
26  |Nickelback, 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, X-Large. 5 050 $49.68 10 No Bid No Bid
27 |Nickelback, 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, XX-Large. 2 S\:Nzgggg 6an $37.62 10 No Bid No Bid

12

*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing

*Notes:
SanitizeNow, Inc. - Addenda Nos. 4 & 5 not acknowledged. Delivery/Service:

The Glove Box, Inc. - Delivery/Service: 5 calendar days.

Uweport - Addenda not acknowledged. Delivery/Service: 365 calendar days.

3-25 calendar days.
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Q-22-723 Examination Gloves

Awarded
Price per box of
. . . 100 .
Description — Examination Supplier Size (unless Awarded Supplier & Oracle
Gloves Item # . Supplier #
otherwise
noted)

1 Vinyl, Non-Sterile, Large , minimum of 4 mil. SVF6C4 L $2.83 The Glove Box

2 |Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip Small, 5 mil. 7003623 S $7.07 Henry Schein, Inc

3 [Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip Medium , 5 mil. 7003624 M $7.07 Henry Schein, Inc

4 |Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip Large, 5 mil. 7003625 L $7.07 Henry Schein, Inc

5 [Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip X-Large, 5 mil. 7003626 XL $7.07 Henry Schein, Inc

6 [Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, XX-Large, 5 mil VF504 XXL $10.59 SanitizeNow Inc

7 UL315S - Exam Glove, S.'mall, Ml’c,roflex Ultra One #UL315, 590315 S $13.19 Bound Tree Medical, LLC
Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12

2 UL315M, Exam glove, Medmm , N’I’lcroﬂex Ultra Ope #UL315, 290316 M $13.19 Bound Tree Medical, LLC
Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, no substitutions

9 UL315L, Exam glove, Lqrge , Mlcioflex Ultra One #UIQIS, 590317 L $13.19 Bound Tree Medical, LLC
Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, no substitutions

10 UL315XL, Exam glove, XLarge , 1,\’/Ilcr0ﬂex Ultra O'ne.#UL315, 290318 XL $13.19 Bound Tree Medical, LLC
Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12 Length, no substitutions
Exam glove, 2X- Large , comparable to Microflex Ultra One

11 |#UL315 or 14 mil glove, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12 UL315XXL XXL $18.23 Bisonte Industrial USA LLC
Length
Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, Medium , Powder Free .

12 ’ ’ ’ - M 10. N |
Textured Fingers, 12 Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no substitutions 6602-20 »10.59 SanitizeNow Inc
Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, Large, Powder Free, .

1 . . .. - L 17.07 SanitizeN |

3 Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no substitutions 6603-20 2 anttizefow Inc
Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, X-Large , Powder Free, .
- XL 12.82 tizeN |

14 Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no substitutions 6604-20 2128 >anitizeNow Inc

15 Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, 2X-Large , Powder-Free, 015-0 XL $14.20 The Glove Box

Textured Fingers, 12 Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff
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Q-22-723 Examination Gloves

Awarded
Price per box of
— N . 100 )
Description — Examination Supplier ] Awarded Supplier & Oracle
Gloves Item # Size (unles.s Supplier #
otherwise
noted)
Microflex Midknight - MK296S, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile
16 [Standard Exam Glove Small - length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 New S $13.09 Henry Schein, Inc
mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions
Microflex Midknight - MK296M, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile
17 [Standard Exam Glove Medium - length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 5657365 M $13.09 Henry Schein, Inc
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions
Microflex Midknight - MK296L, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile
18 [Standard Exam Glove Large - length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 561031 L $13.09 Henry Schein, Inc
mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions
Microflex Midknight - MK296XL, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile
19 ([Standard Exam Glove X Large - length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 5650811 XL $13.09 Henry Schein, Inc
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions
Powder-Free, Nitrile Standard Exam Glove comparable to Microflex
20 |Midknight - MK296, Black, 2X Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 New XXL $13.09 Henry Schein, Inc
mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
21 |(elongated cuff) small, - length 300mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, 1015-62070 S $21.88 Bound Tree Medical, LLC
finger 6.3 mil
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
22 |(elongated cuff) Medium, - length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 1015-62080 M $21.88 Bound Tree Medical, LLC
mil, finger 6.3 mil
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
23 |(elongated cuff) Large, - length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, 1015-62080 L $21.88 Bound Tree Medical, LLC
finger 6.3 mil
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
24 |(elongated cuff) X-Large, - length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 1015-62090 XL $21.88 Bound Tree Medical, LLC
mil, finger 6.3mil
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
25 |(elongated cuff) XX-Large, - length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 1015-62110 XXL $21.88 Bound Tree Medical, LLC
mil, finger 6.3 mil
26 |Nickelbacks - 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, X-Large DO07-08-011-050 XL $49.68 SanitizeNow Inc
27 |Nickelbacks - 6 mil, Sweat Absorbing Nitrile Gloves, XX-Large SW MegaMan #N260886 | XXL $37.62 SanitizeNow Inc
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