Q-22-712 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

- Bisonte Industrial USA, LLC Dade Paper & Bag, LLC
Item No. / Description R DBA Imperial Dade
Baltimore, MD
Jessup, MD
Toilet Tissue, minimum dimension of (WxL) 4.5”’x 4.05” not to exceed
4.57x 4.5” shall be acceptable, 2 Ply White, 500 sheets per roll, 80 No Bid $56.60

rolls/case. Tork Advanced or County approved equal. Approximate usage:
eight hundred seventy-seven (877) cases.

Product Item # (Quoters shall provide quantity
[rolls] per case. # rolls per case)

Product Item # TM1616S (Quoters shall
provide quanity [rolls] per case. # 96 rolls per
case)

Hand Towels, Multifold, natural, approximately 9.25”x 9.5, 250
towels/pkg, 16 pkgs/case, total of 4,000 sheets per case. Marcal PRO
P200N or County approved equal. Approximate usage: eight hundred fifty
(850) cases.

$46.32

$22.95

Product Item # MRCP200N (Quoters shall
provide quantity [sheets] # 4,000 per case)

Product Item # 999JR (Quoters shall provide
quantity [sheets] # 4,000 per case)

Roll Towels, 100% Recycled hard wound paper towels, natural, 7.85” w x
350 linear ft., 12 rolls/case. Marcal PRO P720N or County approved
equal. Approximate usage: thirty (30) cases.

$43.96

$35.90

Product Item # MRCP720N (Quoters shall
provide quanity [rolls] per case. # 12 rolls per
case)

Product Item # 1809 (Quoters shall provide
quanity [rolls] per case. # 12 rolls per case)

Roll Towel, white, 800’ rolls, 10" Length, 6 rolls per case.
Enmotion/Georgia-Pacific. No substitutions. Approximate usage: One
hundred thirteen (113) cases.

No Bid

$88.57

Product Item # (Price per case of six [6] rolls)

Product Item # 89460 (Price per case of six [6]
rolls)

GOJO Luxury Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills for FMX-12
Dispensing Systems -1250 ml/per each refill - 3 per case. No substitutions.
Approximate usage: two hundred eighteen (218) cases

No Bid

$76.06

Product Item # (Price per case of three [3]
refills)

Product Item # 515730 (Price per case of three
[3] refills)

GOJO Premium Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills for TFX Touch-Free
Dispensing Systems - 1200 ml/per each refill - 2 per case. No
Substitutions. Approximate usage: sixty-four (64) cases

$107.11

$63.74

Product Item # GOJ536202 (Price per case of
two [2] refills)

Product Item # GOJ0O536202 (Price per case of
two [2] refills)

Quotes Opened: 5/25/22




Q-22-712 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

o Bisonte Industrial USA LLC Dade Paper & Bag LLC
Item No. / Description . DBA Imperial Dade
Baltimore, MD
Jessup, MD
GoJo Pomeberry Foam Handwash refills for LTX-12 Dispenser-1200 mlper
each refill - 2 per case. No substitutions. Approximate usage: fifteen (15) No Bid $103.93

Cascs.

7
Product Item # (Price per case of Product Item # 190802LTXE3 (Price per case
two [2] refills) of two [2] refills)
Antibacterial Hand Soap Refill - 1 gal/per each refill - 4 per case. Dial
Professional or County Approved equal. Approximate usage: fifty-four $112.78 $32.08
3 (54) cases.
Product Item # DIA15926 (Price per case of Product Item # 1LIQDIAL (Price per case of
four [4] refills) four [4] refills)
Tork Universal Tissue Roll (T22) — two (2) ply, 3.5” x 8.8” diameter, core
3.3”, twelve (12) rolls per case. No substitutions. Approximate usage: one $58.85 $49.82
9 |hundred fifty (150) cases.
Product Item # TRKTJ0928(Price per case of Product Item # TJ0922A(Price per case of
twelve [12] rolls twelve [12] rolls
Waxed Paper Liner — 9” x 10” x 3.25 , 250/case. Hospeco (HS6141) or No Bid No Bid
County approved equal. Approximate usage: five (5) cases.
10
Product Item # (Price per case of Product Item # (Price per case of
two hundred fifty [250] per case) two hundred fifty [250] per case)
Tork Advanced Hand Towel Roll — 450' x 7.5”, roll diameter 5.9”, core
inside dllameter 1.9", one ply, whlte. towel, 12 rolls/case. Eor {-176 - Mini No Bid $89.65
11 mechanical hand towel system, Article 7674540. No substitutions.
Approximate usage: twenty-four (24) cases.
Product Item # (Price per case of Product Item # 7674540 (Price per case of
twelve [12] per case) twelve [12] per case)
Non-Skid Disposable Urinal Floor Mats, rubber - approximately 17 1/2"
Width x 20" Length, six (6) per case. Boardwalk Product (Item No. $61.04 $46.82
12 BWKUMBB) or County approved equal. Approximate usage: thirty- ’ '

seven (37) cases.

Product Item # BWKUMBB (Price per case)

Product Item # BIGD6669 (Price per case)

Quotes Opened: 5/25/22




Q-22-712 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

13

o Bisonte Industrial USA LLC Dade Paper & Bag LLC
Item No. / Description . DBA Imperial Dade
Baltimore, MD
Jessup, MD
Cloths X60, Jumbo Roll - approximately 12 1/2" Width x 13 2/5" Length,
1100 per roll. WypAll (34965) or County approved equal. Approximate $115.83 No Bid

usage: eight (8) rolls.

Product Item # KCC34965 (Price per each)

Product Item # 34965 (Price per each)

Cloths X50, Jumbo Roll - approximately 9 4/5" Width x 13 2/5" Length,

1100 per roll. WypAll (35015) or County approved equal. Approximate $75.84 $63.70
14 |usage: twenty (20) rolls.
Product Item # KCC35015 (Price per each) Product Item # KCC35015 (Price per each)
Trash Liners, Black, 43" x 47", 2.0 mil., 56- gallon capacity, 10 bags per
roll, 10 rolls per case for a total of 100. No substitutions. Approximate No Bid $51.42
15 |usage: two hundred fifty-nine (259) cases.
Product Item # (Price per case of ten [10] Product Item # PP061304 (Price per case
rolls) of ten [10] rolls)
Trash Liners, Natural, 24" x 33", 12 mic, 12-16 gallon capacity, 20 bags per
roll, 25 rolls per case for a total of 500. No substitutions. Approximate No Bid $39.34
16 |usage: twenty-four (24) cases.
Product Item # (Price per case of twenty-five Product Item # R2433N12 (Price per case
[25] rolls) of twenty-five [25] rolls)
Trash Liners, Clear, 38" x 65", 3.0 mil, 55-gallon capacity, 10 rolls per case
for a total of 100. No substitutions. Approximate usage: three hundred No Bid $119.33
17 |four (304) cases.
Product Item # (Price per case of Product Item # PB3865 (Price per case of
ten [10] rolls) ten [10] rolls)
Hand Sanitizer, alcohol based, greater than 60% ethanol or 70%
isopropanol, 12-ounce pump bottles, 12 bottles per case. Approximate No Bid $165.92
18 |usage: unknown.

Product Item # (Price per case of
twelve [12] bottles)

Product Item # 6030370 (Price per case of
twelve [12] bottles)

*Corrected Calculations based on Unit Pricing and/or Remarks/Exceptions

Q-22-712 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap awarded to:

Bag LLC DBA Imperial Dade - Item No. 8; Dispose N' Save - Iltem No. 15, 16, 17; FPC Holdings - Item No. 1, 2, 3,4, 5,6, 7, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14;

Inc. - ltem No. 9, 18

Dade Paper &
W.B. Mason Company,

Quotes Opened: 5/25/22




Q-22-712 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

. . Dispose N' Save FPC Holdings
Item No. /D t
em No. / Description Monroe, NY Elkridge, MD
Toilet Tissue, minimum dimension of (WxL) 4.5”x 4.05” not to exceed
4.5”x 4.5” shall be acceptable, 2 Ply White, 500 sheets per roll, 80 No Bid $38.87

rolls/case. Tork Advanced or County approved equal. Approximate usage:
eight hundred seventy-seven (877) cases.

Product Item # (Quoters shall provide quanity
[rolls] per case. # rolls per case)

Product Item # 24612N (Quoters shall provide
quanity [rolls] per case. # rolls per case)

Hand Towels, Multifold, natural, approximately 9.25”x 9.5”, 250
towels/pkg, 16 pkgs/case, total of 4,000 sheets per case. Marcal PRO
P200N or County approved equal. Approximate usage: eight hundred fifty
(850) cases.

No Bid

$16.78

Product Item # (Quoters shall
provide quantity [sheets] # per case)

Product Item # MK530A4 (Quoters shall
provide quantity [sheets] # per case)

Roll Towels, 100% Recycled hard wound paper towels, natural, 7.85” w x
350 linear ft., 12 rolls/case. Marcal PRO P720N or County approved
equal. Approximate usage: thirty (30) cases.

No Bid

$21.68

Product Item # (Quoters shall provide quanity
[rolls] per case. # rolls
per case)

Product Item # RK350A4 (Quoters shall provide
quanity [rolls] per case. # rolls
per case)

Roll Towel, white, 800’ rolls, 10" Length, 6 rolls per case.
Enmotion/Georgia-Pacific. No substitutions. Approximate usage: One
hundred thirteen (113) cases.

No Bid

$72.38

Product Item # (Price per case of six [6] rolls)

Product Item # 89460 (Price per case of six [6]
rolls)

GOJO Luxury Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills for FMX-12
Dispensing Systems -1250 ml/per each refill - 3 per case. No substitutions.
Approximate usage: two hundred eighteen (218) cases

No Bid

$63.10

Product Item # (Price per case of three [3]
refills)

Product Item # 5162-04 (Price per case of
three [3] refills)

GOJO Premium Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills for TFX Touch-Free
Dispensing Systems - 1200 ml/per each refill - 2 per case. No
Substitutions. Approximate usage: sixty-four (64) cases

No Bid

$46.15

Product Item # (Price per case of two [2]
refills)

Product Item # 5362-02(Price per case of two
[2] refills)

Quotes Opened: 5/25/22




Q-22-712 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

o e Dispose N' Save FPC Holdings
Item No. / Description
'ph Monroe, NY Elkridge, MD
GoJo Pomeberry Foam Handwash refills for LTX-12 Dispenser-1200 mlper
each refill - 2 per case. No substitutions. Approximate usage: fifteen (15) No Bid 844.45

cases.

7
Product Item # (Price per case of Product Item # 1916-02 (Price per case of
two [2] refills) two [2] refills)
Antibacterial Hand Soap Refill - 1 gal/per each refill - 4 per case. Dial
Professional or County Approved equal. Approximate usage: fifty-four No Bid 851.35
3 (54) cases.
Product Item # (Price per case of Product Item # 88047 (Price per case of
four [4] refills) four [4] refills)
Tork Universal Tissue Roll (T22) — two (2) ply, 3.5” x 8.8” diameter, core
3.3”, twelve (12) rolls per case. No substitutions. Approximate usage: one No Bid 330.89
9 |hundred fifty (150) cases.
Product Item # (Price per case of Product Item # TJ0922A (Price per case of
twelve [12] rolls twelve [12] rolls
Waxed Paper Liner — 9” x 10” x 3t.25 , 250/case. Hospeco (HS6141) or No Bid $18.25
County approved equal. Approximate usage: five (5) cases.
10
Product Item # (Price per case of Product Item # HS6141 (Price per case of
two hundred fifty [250] per case) two hundred fifty [250] per case)
Tork Advanced Hand Towel Roll —450' x 7.5, roll diameter 5.9”, core
inside d{ameter 1.9", one ply, whlte. towel, 12 rolls/case. Fgr H76 - Mini No Bid $57.06
11 mechanical hand towel system, Article 7674540. No substitutions.
Approximate usage: twenty-four (24) cases.
Product Item # (Price per case of Product Item # 7674540 (Price per case of
twelve [12] per case) twelve [12] per case)
Non-Skid Disposable Urinal Floor Mats, rubber - approximately 17 1/2"
Width x 20" Length, six (6) per case. Boardwalk Product (Item No. No Bid $39.27
12 BWKUMBB) or County approved equal. Approximate usage: thirty- '

seven (37) cases.

Product Item # (Price per case)

Product Item # 15820 (Price per case)

Quotes Opened: 5/25/22




Q-22-712 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

13

o Dispose N' Save FPC Holdings
Item No. /D t
em No./ Lescription Monroe, NY Elkridge, MD
Cloths X60, Jumbo Roll - approximately 12 1/2" Width x 13 2/5" Length,
1100 per roll. WypAll (34965) or County approved equal. Approximate No Bid $68.00

usage: eight (8) rolls.

Product Item # (Price per each)

Product Item # NPO60JPB (Price per each)

Cloths X50, Jumbo Roll - approximately 9 4/5" Width x 13 2/5" Length,
1100 per roll. WypAll (35015) or County approved equal. Approximate

No Bid

$42.00

14 [usage: twenty (20) rolls.
Product Item # (Price per each) Product Item # N-PO50JPW (Price per each)

Trash Liners, Black, 43" x 47", 2.0 mil., 56- gallon capacity, 10 bags per

roll, 10 rolls per case for a total of 100. No substitutions. Approximate $20.82 $38.24
15 |usage: two hundred fifty-nine (259) cases.

Product Item # DPS4347-2 (Price per case Product Item # 93422 (Price per case
of ten [10] rolls) of ten [10] rolls)

Trash Liners, Natural, 24" x 33", 12 mic, 12-16 gallon capacity, 20 bags per

roll, 25 rolls per case for a total of 500. No substitutions. Approximate $18.48 $27.80
le |usage: twenty-four (24) cases.

Product Item # DP52433-12 (Price per case | Product ltem # PLR243312 (Price per case
of twenty-five [25] rolls) of twenty-five [25] rolls)

Trash Liners, Clear, 38" x 65", 3.0 mil, 55-gallon capacity, 10 rolls per case

for a total of 100. No substitutions. Approximate usage: three hundred $53.24 No Bid
17 |four (304) cases.

Product Item # DPS3865-3 (Price per case of Product Item # (Price per case of
ten [10] rolls) ten [10] rolls)

Hand Sanitizer, alcohol based, greater than 60% ethanol or 70%

isopropanol, 12-ounce pump bottles, 12 bottles per case. Approximate No Bid No Bid
18 |usage: unknown.

Product Item # (Price per case of
twelve [12] bottles)

Product Item # (Price per case of
twelve [12] bottles)

*Corrected Calculations based on Unit Pricing and/or Remarks/Exceptions

Quotes Opened: 5/25/22



Q-22-712 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

Item No. / Description

ODP Business Solutions, LLC
Boca Raton, FL.

Veritiv Operating Company
Mechanicsburg, PA

Toilet Tissue, minimum dimension of (WxL) 4.5”’x 4.05” not to exceed 4.5”x
4.5” shall be acceptable, 2 Ply White, 500 sheets per roll, 80 rolls/case. Tork
Advanced or County approved equal. Approximate usage: eight hundred
seventy-seven (877) cases.

$47.99

$54.58

Product Item # 9016616 (Quoters shall provide
quantity [rolls] per case. # 80 rolls per case)

Product Item # 10445161 (Quoters shall provide
quanity [rolls] per case. # 96 rolls per case)

Hand Towels, Multifold, natural, approximately 9.25”x 9.5”, 250 towels/pkg,
16 pkgs/case, total of 4,000 sheets per case. Marcal PRO P200N or County
approved equal. Approximate usage: eight hundred fifty (850) cases.

$23.59

No Bid

Product Item # 468770 (Quoters shall provide
quantity [sheets] # 4,000 per case)

ES

Product Item # (Quoters shall provide quantity
[sheets] # per case)

Roll Towels, 100% Recycled hard wound paper towels, natural, 7.85” w x 350
linear ft., 12 rolls/case. Marcal PRO P720N or County approved equal.
Approximate usage: thirty (30) cases.

$26.99

No Bid

Product Item # 468815 (Quoters shall provide
quanity [rolls] per case. # 12 rolls per case)

E3

Product Item # (Quoters shall provide quanity
[rolls] per case. # rolls per case)

Roll Towel, white, 800’ rolls, 10" Length, 6 rolls per case. Enmotion/Georgia-
Pacific. No substitutions. Approximate usage: One hundred thirteen (113)
cases.

$83.99

$94.12

Product Item # 202809 (Price per case of six [6]
rolls)

Product Item # 10265893 (Price per case of six
/6] rolls)

GOJO Luxury Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills for FMX-12 Dispensing
Systems -1250 ml/per each refill - 3 per case. No substitutions. Approximate
usage: two hundred eighteen (218) cases

$80.48

$76.94

Product Item # 7241423 (Price per case of three
[3] refills)

*

Product Item # 11160268 (Price per case of
three [3] refills)

GOJO Premium Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills for TFX Touch-Free
Dispensing Systems - 1200 ml/per each refill - 2 per case. No Substitutions.
Approximate usage: sixty-four (64) cases

$59.99

$59.30

Product Item # 536202 (Price per case of two
/2] refills)

Product Item # 10346499 (Price per case of two
[2] refills)

Quotes Opened: 5/25/22




Q-22-712 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

Item No. / Description

ODP Business Solutions, LLC
Boca Raton, FL.

Veritiv Operating Company
Mechanicsburg, PA

GoJo Pomeberry Foam Handwash refills for LTX-12 Dispenser-1200 mlper
each refill - 2 per case. No substitutions. Approximate usage: fifteen (15)
cases.

$52.99

No Bid

7
Product Item # 500466 (Price per case of Product Item # (Price per case of
two [2] refills) two [2] refills)
Antibacterial Hand Soap Refill - 1 gal/per each refill - 4 per case. Dial
Professional or County Approved equal. Approximate usage: fifty-four (54) $13.99 No Bid
g |cases.
Product Item # 890471 (Price per case of Product Item # (Price per case of
four [4] refills) four [4] refills)
Tork Universal Tissue Roll (T22) — two (2) ply, 3.5” x 8.8” diameter, core 3.3,
twelve (12) rolls per case. No substitutions. Approximate usage: one hundred $52.00 $54.58
9 |fifty (150) cases.
Product Item # 1697248 (Price per case of Product Item # 10445161 (Price per case of
twelve [12] rolls twelve [12] rolls
Waxed Paper Liner — 9” x 10” x 3.25”, 250/case. Hospeco (HS6141) or
. $24.99 $26.89
County approved equal. Approximate usage: five (5) cases.
10 Product Item # 767169 (Price per case of Product Item # 10033417 (Price per case of
two hundred fifty [250] per case) two hundred fifty [250] per case)
Tork Advanced Hand Towel Roll — 450' x 7.5”, roll diameter 5.9”, core inside
diameter 1.9", one ply, .whlte towel, 12 rolls/ca§e. .For H76 - Mmz mechanical No Bid No Bid
11 hand towel system, Article 7674540. No substitutions. Approximate usage:
twenty-four (24) cases.
Product Item # (Price per case of Product Item # (Price per case of twelve [12]
twelve [12] per case) per case)
Non-Skid Disposable Urinal Floor Mats, rubber - approximately 17 1/2" Width
x 20" Length, six (6) per case. Boardwalk Product (Item No. BWKUMBB) or $55.99 No Bid
12 |County approved equal. Approximate usage: thirty-seven (37) cases.

Product Item # 306734 (Price per case)

Product Item # (Price per case)

Quotes Opened: 5/25/22



Q-22-712 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

Item No. / Description

ODP Business Solutions, LLC
Boca Raton, FL.

Veritiv Operating Company
Mechanicsburg, PA

13

Cloths X60, Jumbo Roll - approximately 12 1/2" Width x 13 2/5" Length, 1100
per roll. WypAll (34965) or County approved equal. Approximate usage:
eight (8) rolls.

$83.99

No Bid

Product Item # 892494 (Price per each)

Product Item # (Price per each)

Cloths X50, Jumbo Roll - approximately 9 4/5" Width x 13 2/5" Length, 1100

per roll. WypAll (35015) or County approved equal. Approximate usage: No Bid No Bid

14 [twenty (20) rolls.
Product Item # (Price per each) Product Item # (Price per each)

Trash Liners, Black, 43" x 47", 2.0 mil., 56- gallon capacity, 10 bags per roll,

10 rolls per case for a total of 100. No substitutions. Approximate usage: two $23.99 $37.54
15 hundred fifty-nine (259) cases.

Product Item # 792095 (Price per case of ten Product Item # 11050753 (Price per case
[10] rolls) of ten [10] rolls)

Trash Liners, Natural, 24" x 33", 12 mic, 12-16 gallon capacity, 20 bags per

roll, 25 rolls per case for a total of 500. No substitutions. Approximate usage: $27.86 $31.36
16 twenty-four (24) cases.

Product Item # 408134 (Price per case of twenty- Product Item # 10957707 (Price per case
five [25] rolls) of twenty-five [25] rolls)

Trash Liners, Clear, 38" x 65", 3.0 mil, 55-gallon capacity, 10 rolls per case for

a total of 100. No substitutions. Approximate usage: three hundred four (304) $44.99 $54.35
17 |cases.

Product Item # 792219 (Price per case of «| Product Item # 10805437 (Price per case of
ten [10] rolls) ten [10] rolls)
Hand Sanitizer, alcohol based, greater than 60% ethanol or 70% isopropanol,
. $72.00 $68.87

18 12-ounce pump bottles, 12 bottles per case. Approximate usage: unknown.

Product Item # 754965 (Price per case of
twelve [12] bottles)

Product Item # 10499244 (Price per case of
twelve [12] bottles)

*Corrected Calculations based on Unit Pricing and/or Remarks/Exceptions

Quotes Opened: 5/25/22




Q-22-712 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

W.B. Mason
Item No./D ipti
em o escription Winchester, VA
Toilet Tissue, minimum dimension of (WxL) 4.5”’x 4.05” not to exceed 4.5”x
4.5” shall be acceptable, 2 Ply White, 500 sheets per roll, 80 rolls/case. Tork $83.66

Advanced or County approved equal. Approximate usage: eight hundred
seventy-seven (877) cases.

Product Item # GPCI1988001 (Quoters shall
provide quanity [rolls] per case. # 80 rolls per
case)

Hand Towels, Multifold, natural, approximately 9.25”x 9.5”, 250 towels/pkg,
16 pkgs/case, total of 4,000 sheets per case. Marcal PRO P200N or County
approved equal. Approximate usage: eight hundred fifty (850) cases.

$30.21

Product Item # MRCP200N (Quoters shall
provide quantity [sheets] # 4,000 per case)

Roll Towels, 100% Recycled hard wound paper towels, natural, 7.85” w x 350
linear ft., 12 rolls/case. Marcal PRO P720N or County approved equal.
Approximate usage: thirty (30) cases.

$22.29

Product Item # MRCP720N (Quoters shall
provide quanity [rolls] per case. # 12 rolls
per case)

Roll Towel, white, 800’ rolls, 10" Length, 6 rolls per case. Enmotion/Georgia-
Pacific. No substitutions. Approximate usage: One hundred thirteen (113)
cases.

$81.18

Product Item # GPC89460 (Price per case of six
[6] rolls)

GOJO Luxury Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills for FMX-12 Dispensing
Systems -1250 ml/per each refill - 3 per case. No substitutions. Approximate
usage: two hundred eighteen (218) cases

No Bid

Product Item # (Price per case of three [3]
refills)

GOJO Premium Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills for TFX Touch-Free
Dispensing Systems - 1200 ml/per each refill - 2 per case. No Substitutions.
Approximate usage: sixty-four (64) cases

$58.60

Product Item # Goj536202 (Price per case of
two [2] refills)

Quotes Opened: 5/25/22



Q-22-712 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

W.B. Mason
Item No. / Descripti
em o escription Winchester, VA
GoJo Pomeberry Foam Handwash refills for LTX-12 Dispenser-1200 mlper
each refill - 2 per case. No substitutions. Approximate usage: fifteen (15) $50.06

Cascs.

7
Product Item # Goj191602CT (Price per case of
two [2] refills)

Antibacterial Hand Soap Refill - 1 gal/per each refill - 4 per case. Dial

Professional or County Approved equal. Approximate usage: fifty-four (54) 359.68
g |cases.

Product Item # DIA88047CT(Price per case of
four [4] refills)

Tork Universal Tissue Roll (T22) — two (2) ply, 3.5” x 8.8” diameter, core 3.3,

twelve (12) rolls per case. No substitutions. Approximate usage: one hundred 330.65
9 |fifty (150) cases.

Product Item # ALM700 (Price per case of
twelve [12] rolls
Waxed Paper Liner — 9” x 10” x 3.25”, 250/case. Hospeco (HS6141) or
. $23.36

County approved equal. Approximate usage: five (5) cases.

10 Product Item # HOS6141 (Price per case of
two hundred fifty [250] per case)

Tork Advanced Hand Towel Roll — 450' x 7.5”, roll diameter 5.9”, core inside

diameter 1.9", one ply, white towel, 12 rolls/case. For H76 - Mini mechanical No Bid
11 hand towel system, Article 7674540. No substitutions. Approximate usage:

twenty-four (24) cases.

Product Item # (Price per case of
twelve [12] per case)

Non-Skid Disposable Urinal Floor Mats, rubber - approximately 17 1/2" Width

x 20" Length, six (6) per case. Boardwalk Product (Item No. BWKUMBB) or $53.08
12 |County approved equal. Approximate usage: thirty-seven (37) cases.

Product Item # BWKUMRBB (Price per case)

Quotes Opened: 5/25/22



Q-22-712 Custodial Paper and Hand Soap

13

W.B. Mason
Item No. / Descripti
em o eseription Winchester, VA
Cloths X60, Jumbo Roll - approximately 12 1/2" Width x 13 2/5" Length, 1100
per roll. WypAll (34965) or County approved equal. Approximate usage: $99.39

eight (8) rolls.

Product Item # KCC34965 (Price per each)

Cloths X50, Jumbo Roll - approximately 9 4/5" Width x 13 2/5" Length, 1100

per roll. WypAll (35015) or County approved equal. Approximate usage: $51.34

14 [twenty (20) rolls.
Product Item # KCC35015 (Price per each)

Trash Liners, Black, 43" x 47", 2.0 mil., 56- gallon capacity, 10 bags per roll,

10 rolls per case for a total of 100. No substitutions. Approximate usage: two $138.99
15 hundred fifty-nine (259) cases.

Product Item #WBIRNW4320 (Price per case
of ten [10] rolls)

Trash Liners, Natural, 24" x 33", 12 mic, 12-16 gallon capacity, 20 bags per

roll, 25 rolls per case for a total of 500. No substitutions. Approximate usage: No Bid
16 twenty-four (24) cases.

Product Item # (Price per case
of twenty-five [25] rolls)

Trash Liners, Clear, 38" x 65", 3.0 mil, 55-gallon capacity, 10 rolls per case for

a total of 100. No substitutions. Approximate usage: three hundred four (304) No Bid
17 |cases.

Product Item # (Price per case of
ten [10] rolls)

Hand Sanitizer, alcohol based, greater than 60% ethanol or 70% isopropanol, $58.96

18 12-ounce pump bottles, 12 bottles per case. Approximate usage: unknown. ’

Product Item # GOJ365912CT (Price per case
of twelve [12] bottles)

*Corrected Calculations based on Unit Pricing and/or Remarks/Exceptions

Quotes Opened: 5/25/22
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