Q-20-685
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

Items 1 & 13 awarded to Vertex Packaging Supplies
Items 2, 3,4, 5 & 6 awarded to BIITECH LLC Aliron International Inc. Ashberry Funding
Items 7, 8,9,10, 11, 12, 14, 15,16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24 & 25 awarded South Plainfiled, NJ Calabasas, CA
to Asberry Services Inc.
. Approx. Vendor Unit Boxes Vendor Unit Boxes
Item Description Usage . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes) Case Case
| Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, Large minimum of 4 mil. 25 N/A $1.700.00 10 | $12.10 25
Or County approved equal
) Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Small, 5 mil. 37 N/A $740.00 10 ) $12.10 37
Or County approved equal
3 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Medium, 5 mil. 123 N/A $2.460.00 10 3 $12.10 123
Or County approved equal
4 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Large, 5 mil. 180 N/A $3.600.00 10 4 $12.10 130
Or County approved equal
5 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, X-Large, 5 mil. 245 N/A $6.125.00 10 5 $12.10 245
Or County approved equal
6 UL315M, Exam glove, Medlum, Microflex Ultra Qne #UL315, 190 No Bid No Bid No Bid 6 $12.10 190
Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions
UL315L, Exam glove, Large, Microflex Ultra One #UL315, ) . .
’ Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid ’ $12.10 16
3 UL315XL, Exam glove, ?(— Large, 'Mlcroﬂex Ultra .Om.e #UL315, 110 No Bid No Bid No Bid 3 $12.10 110
Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions

Quotes Opened: 7-22-2020



Q-20-685
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

Items 1 & 13 awarded to Vertex Packaging Supplies
Items 2, 3,4, 5 & 6 awarded to BIITECH LLC Aliron International Inc. Ashberry Funding
Items 7, 8,9, 10, 11, 12, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24 & 25 awarded South Plainfiled, NJ Calabasas, CA

to Asberry Services Inc.

Approx. . Boxes . Boxes
. L. PP Vendor Unit Vendor Unit

Item Description Usage . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price

(Boxes) Case Case

Exam glove, 2X- Large, comparable to Microflex Ultra One
9 [#UL315 or 14 mil glove, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12" 200 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9 $12.10 200
Length. Or County approved equal

Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, Medium, Powder Free,
10 |Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 616 N/A $21,560.00 10 10 $12.10 616
substitutions

Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, Large, Powder Free,
11 |Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 171 N/A $5,985.00 10 11 $12.10 171

substitutions

Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, X-Large, Powder Free,
12 |Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 608 N/A $21,280.00 10 12 $12.10 608
substitutions

Exam glove, 2X-Large, comparable to Thickster Latex 6604-20,

Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff 0 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

13

MK296S-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-free Nitrile
14  [Standard Exam Glove, Small, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 14 $12.10 25
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions

Quotes Opened: 7-22-2020



Q-20-685
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

Items 1 & 13 awarded to Vertex Packaging Supplies
Items 2, 3,4, 5 & 6 awarded to BIITECH LLC Aliron International Inc. Ashberry Funding
Items 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24 & 25 awarded South Plainfiled, NJ Calabasas, CA

to Asberry Services Inc.

Approx. . Boxes . Boxes
. L. PP Vendor Unit Vendor Unit

Item Description Usage . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price

(Boxes) Case Case

MK296M-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-free Nitrile
15 [Standard Exam Glove, Medium, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 70 No Bid No Bid No Bid 15 $12.10 70
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions

MK296L-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-free Nitrile
16 [Standard Exam Glove, Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 270 No Bid No Bid No Bid 16 $12.10 270
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions

MK296XL-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-free Nitrile
17 [Standard Exam Glove, X-Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 385 No Bid No Bid No Bid 17 $12.10 385
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions

Black, Powder-free, Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, comparable to
18 [Microflex Midknight MK296, 2X Large, length 245 mm, 175 N/A $5,250.00 10 18 $12.10 175
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16

19 |Nitrile Glove, Powder Free, Textrured Grip, 5 mil XXL 30 N/A $900.00 10 19 $12.10 30

UL315S - Exam Glove, Small, Microflex Ultra One #UL315,

20 Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12"

10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 20 $12.10 10

Quotes Opened: 7-22-2020



Q-20-685
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

Items 1 & 13 awarded to Vertex Packaging Supplies
Items 2, 3,4, 5 & 6 awarded to BIITECH LLC Aliron International Inc. Ashberry Funding
Items 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24 & 25 awarded South Plainfiled, NJ Calabasas, CA

to Asberry Services Inc.

Approx. . Boxes . Boxes
. L. PP Vendor Unit Vendor Unit

Item Description Usage . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price

(Boxes) Case Case

Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
21 |(elongated cuff) small, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 21 $12.10 20
finger 6.3 mil

Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
22 |(elongated cuff) Medium, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 22 $12.10 20
mil, finger 6.3 mil

Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
23 |(elongated cuff) Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 23 $12.10 20
finger 6.3 mil

Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
24 |(elongated cuff) X-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 24 $12.10 20
mil, finger 6.3 mil

Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
25 |(elongated cuff) XX-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 25 $12.10 10
mil, finger 6.3 mil

*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing

Quotes Opened: 7-22-2020



Q-20-685
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

Items 1 & 13 awarded to Vertex Packaging Supplies
Items 2, 3, 4,5 & 6 awarded to BIITECH LLC Biitech, LLC GlobalGeeks, Inc.
Items 7, 8,9, 10, 11, 12, 14, 15, 16,17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24 & 25 awarded Germantown, MD Moorestown, NJ
to Asberry Services Inc.
- APprox. Vendor Unit Boxes Vendor Unit Boxes
Item Description Usage . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes) Case Case
| Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, Large minimum of 4 mil. 25 ’ $11.00 10 NGPPFGL $1.275.00 10
Or County approved equal
) Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Small, 5 mil. 37 ) $11.00 10 NGPPFGS $740.00 10
Or County approved equal
3 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Medium, 5 mil. 123 5 $11.00 10 NGPPFGM §2,091.00 10
Or County approved equal
4 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Large, 5 mil. 130 4 $11.00 10 NGPPFGL $3,060.00 10
Or County approved equal
5 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, X-Large, 5 mil. 245 4 $11.00 10 NGPPFGXL $4.900.00 10
Or County approved equal
UL315M, Exam glove, Medium, Microflex Ultra One #UL315,
6 Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions 190 6 $10.50 10 NGPPFGM $3,230.00 10
7 [UL315L, Exam glove, Large, Microflex Ultra One #UL3I5, 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid NGPPFGL $320.00 10
Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions
g |UL31SXL, Exam glove, X- Large, Microflex Ultra One #UL31S, 110 No Bid No Bid NoBid | NGPPFGXL $2,200.00 10
Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions

Quotes Opened: 7-22-2020



Q-20-685
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

Items 1 & 13 awarded to Vertex Packaging Supplies
Items 2, 3, 4,5 & 6 awarded to BIITECH LLC Biitech, LLC GlobalGeeks, Inc.
Items 7, 8,9, 10, 11, 12, 14, 15, 16,17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24 & 25 awarded Germantown, MD Moorestown, NJ
to Asberry Services Inc.

Approx. . Boxes . Boxes
. L. PP Vendor Unit Vendor Unit

Item Description Usage . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price

(Boxes) Case Case

Exam glove, 2X- Large, comparable to Microflex Ultra One
9 #UL315 or 14 mil glove, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12" 200 No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A
Length. Or County approved equal

Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, Medium, Powder Free,
10 [Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 616 No Bid No Bid No Bid NGPPFGM $16,016.00 10
substitutions

Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, Large, Powder Free,
11 |Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 171 No Bid No Bid No Bid NGPPFGL $3,762.00 10
substitutions

Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, X-Large, Powder Free,
12 |Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 608 No Bid No Bid No Bid NGPPFGXL $13,376.00 10
substitutions

Exam glove, 2X-Large, comparable to Thickster Latex 6604-20,

13 Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff

0 No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A

MK296S-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-free Nitrile
14 |Standard Exam Glove, Small, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid NGPPFGS $550.00 10
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions

Quotes Opened: 7-22-2020



Q-20-685
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

Items 1 & 13 awarded to Vertex Packaging Supplies
Items 2, 3, 4,5 & 6 awarded to BIITECH LLC Biitech, LLC GlobalGeeks, Inc.
Items 7, 8,9, 10, 11, 12, 14, 15, 16,17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24 & 25 awarded Germantown, MD Moorestown, NJ
to Asberry Services Inc.

Approx. . Boxes . Boxes
. L. PP Vendor Unit Vendor Unit

Item Description Usage . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price

(Boxes) Case Case

MK296M-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-free Nitrile
15 |Standard Exam Glove, Medium, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 70 No Bid No Bid No Bid NGPPFGM $1,610.00 10
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions

MK296L-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-free Nitrile
16 |Standard Exam Glove, Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 270 No Bid No Bid No Bid NGPPFGL $5,940.00 10
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions

MK296XL-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-free Nitrile
17 [Standard Exam Glove, X-Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 385 No Bid No Bid No Bid NGPPFGXL $8,470.00 10
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions

Black, Powder-free, Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, comparable to
18 |Microflex Midknight MK296, 2X Large, length 245 mm, 175 No Bid No Bid No Bid NGPPFGL $3,850.00 10
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16

19  |Nitrile Glove, Powder Free, Textrured Grip, 5 mil XXL 30 No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A

UL315S - Exam Glove, Small, Microflex Ultra One #UL315,

20 Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12"

10 No Bid No Bid No Bid NGPPFGS $200.00 10

Quotes Opened: 7-22-2020



Q-20-685
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

Items 1 & 13 awarded to Vertex Packaging Supplies
Items 2, 3, 4,5 & 6 awarded to BIITECH LLC Biitech, LLC GlobalGeeks, Inc.
Items 7, 8,9, 10, 11, 12, 14, 15, 16,17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24 & 25 awarded Germantown, MD Moorestown, NJ
to Asberry Services Inc.

Approx. . Boxes . Boxes
. L. PP Vendor Unit Vendor Unit

Item Description Usage . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price

(Boxes) Case Case

Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
21 |(elongated cuff) small, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid NGPPFGS $440.00 10
finger 6.3 mil

Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
22 |(elongated cuff) Medium, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid NGPPFGM $440.00 10
mil, finger 6.3 mil

Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
23 |(elongated cuff) Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid NGPPFGL $440.00 ?
finger 6.3 mil

Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
24 |(elongated cuff) X-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid NGPPFGXL $440.00 10
mil, finger 6.3 mil

Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
25 |(elongated cuff) XX-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A N/A N/A
mil, finger 6.3 mil

Notes:

Aliron International Inc. GlobalGeeks, Inc.

Delivery/Service no later than 10 calendar days from receipt of order Delivery/Service no later than 4 calendar days from receipt of order
Biitech Solutions Sure Promotional Products

Delivery/Service no later than 3 calendar days from receipt of order Delivery/Service no later than 35 calendar days from receipt of order

Quotes Opened: 7-22-2020



Q-20-685
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

Items 1 & 13 awarded to Vertex Packaging Supplies
Items 2, 3,4, 5 & 6 awarded to BIITECH LLC Sure Promotional Products Texas Medical Center Supply
Items 7, 8,9, 10, 11, 12, 14, 15,16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24 & 25 awarded Clarksburg, MD Houston, TX
to Asberry Services Inc.
. APProx. Vendor Unit Boxes Vendor Unit Boxes
Item Description Usage . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes) Case Case
p | Yinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, Large minimum of 4 mil. 85 USXCX001 $935.00 20 NIT-BL-001 $100.00 10
Or County approved equal
) Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Small, 5 mil. 37 USXCX002 $591.63 20 NIT-BL-001 $100.00 10
Or County approved equal
3 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Medium, 5 mil. 123 USXCX002 $1.966.77 20 NIT-BL-001 $100.00 10
Or County approved equal
4 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Large, 5 mil. 130 USXCX002 $2.878.20 20 NIT-BL-001 $100.00 10
Or County approved equal
5 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, X-Large, 5 mil. 245 USXCX002 $3.917.55 20 NIT-BL-001 $100.00 10
Or County approved equal
6 UL315M, Exam glove, Medlum, Microflex Ultra On§ #UL3 15, 190 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions
7 UL315L, Exam glove, Latrge, Microflex Ultra One #[.JL?T 15, 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions
2 UL315XL, Exam glove, X— Large, Microflex Ultra Qne #UL315, 110 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions

Quotes Opened: 7-22-2020




Q-20-685

Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

Items 1 & 13 awarded to Vertex Packaging Supplies
Items 2, 3,4, 5 & 6 awarded to BIITECH LLC Sure Promotional Products Texas Medical Center Supply
Items 7, 8,9, 10, 11, 12, 14, 15,16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24 & 25 awarded Clarksburg, MD Houston, TX
to Asberry Services Inc.
. APProx. Vendor Unit Boxes Vendor Unit Boxes
Item Description Usage . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes) Case Case
Exam glove, 2X- Large, comparable to Microflex Ultra One
9 #UL315 or 14 mil glove, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12" 200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Length. Or County approved equal
Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, Medium, Powder Free,
10 [Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 616 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
substitutions
Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, Large, Powder Free,
11 |Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 171 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
substitutions
Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, X-Large, Powder Free,
12 |Textured Fingers, 12 Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 608 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
substitutions
Exam glove, 2X-Large, comparable to Thickster Latex 6604-20, . . . . . .
13 Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff 0 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
MK296S-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-free Nitrile
14 |Standard Exam Glove, Small, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions
Quotes Opened: 7-22-2020




Q-20-685
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

Items 1 & 13 awarded to Vertex Packaging Supplies
Items 2, 3,4, 5 & 6 awarded to BIITECH LLC Sure Promotional Products Texas Medical Center Supply
Items 7, 8,9, 10, 11, 12, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24 & 25 awarded Clarksburg, MD Houston, TX

to Asberry Services Inc.

Approx. . Boxes . Boxes
. L. PP Vendor Unit Vendor Unit
Item Description Usage . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes) Case Case

MK296M-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-free Nitrile
15 |Standard Exam Glove, Medium, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions

MK296L-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-free Nitrile
16 |Standard Exam Glove, Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 270 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions

MK296XL-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-free Nitrile
17 [Standard Exam Glove, X-Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 385 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions

Black, Powder-free, Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, comparable to
18 |Microflex Midknight MK296, 2X Large, length 245 mm, 175 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16

19 |Nitrile Glove, Powder Free, Textrured Grip, 5 mil XXL 30 No Bid No Bid No Bid NIT-BL-001 $100.00 10

UL315S - Exam Glove, Small, Microflex Ultra One #UL315,

20 Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12"

10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Quotes Opened: 7-22-2020




Q-20-685
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

Items 1 & 13 awarded to Vertex Packaging Supplies
Items 2, 3,4, 5 & 6 awarded to BIITECH LLC Sure Promotional Products Texas Medical Center Supply
Items 7, 8,9, 10, 11, 12, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24 & 25 awarded Clarksburg, MD Houston, TX

to Asberry Services Inc.

Approx. . Boxes . Boxes
. L. PP Vendor Unit Vendor Unit
Item Description Usage . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes) Case Case

Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
21 |(elongated cuff) small, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
finger 6.3 mil

Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
22 |(elongated cuff) Medium, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
mil, finger 6.3 mil

Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
23 |(elongated cuff) Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
finger 6.3 mil

Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
24 |(elongated cuff) X-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
mil, finger 6.3 mil

Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
25 |(elongated cuff) XX-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
mil, finger 6.3 mil

Notes:

Sure Promotional Products Notes:

In response to your invitation for bids, please find enclosed our quotation for the supply Texas Medical Center Supply

of 58,500 pieces of Vinyl non Sterile and Nitrile Gloves powder free gloves in their Delivery/Service no later than telephone 3 calendar days from
required sizes at the total cost of $10,289.15 (Ten Thousand two hundred and eighty nine receipt of order

dollars fifteen cents) only.

Quotes Opened: 7-22-2020




Q-20-685
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

Items 1 & 13 awarded to Vertex Packaging Supplies
Items 2, 3,4, 5 & 6 awarded to BIITECH LLC Tray, Inc. Vertex Packaging Supplies
Items 7, 8,9,10, 11, 12, 14, 15,16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24 & 25 awarded Glen Burnie, MD Sante Fe, CA
to Asberry Services Inc.
. Approx. Vendor Unit Boxes Vendor Unit Boxes
Item Description Usage . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes) Case Case
| Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, Large minimum of 4 mil. 25 VGNS-LARGE $288.00 25 VNL-EX $9.50 10
Or County approved equal
) Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Small, 5 mil. 37 NGPFTG-SMALL $30.00 160 NIT-4B $15.00 10
Or County approved equal
3 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Medium, 5 mil. 123 NGPFTG-MED $30.00 160 NIT-4B $15.00 10
Or County approved equal
4 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, Large, 5 mil. 130 No Bid No Bid No Bid NIT-4B $15.00 10
Or County approved equal
5 Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, Textured Grip, X-Large, 5 mil. 245 No Bid No Bid No Bid NIT-4B $15.00 10
Or County approved equal
6 UL315M, Exam glove, Medlum, Microflex Ultra On§ #UL3 15, 190 No Bid No Bid No Bid LAT-16N * $15.00 10
Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions
7 UL315L, Exam glove, Lz%rge, Microflex Ultra One #[.JL?a- 15, 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid LAT-16N * $15.00 10
Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions
2 UL315XL, Exam glove, ?(— Large, Microflex Ultra Ope #UL315, 110 No Bid No Bid No Bid LAT-16N * $15.00 10
Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length, no substitutions

Quotes Opened: 7-22-2020



Q-20-685

Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

Items 1 & 13 awarded to Vertex Packaging Supplies
Items 2, 3,4, 5 & 6 awarded to BIITECH LLC Tray, Inc. Vertex Packaging Supplies
Items 7, 8,9,10, 11, 12, 14, 15,16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24 & 25 awarded Glen Burnie, MD Sante Fe, CA
to Asberry Services Inc.
. Approx. Vendor Unit Boxes Vendor Unit Boxes
Item Description Usage . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes) Case Case
Exam glove, 2X- Large, comparable to Microflex Ultra One
9 #UL315 or 14 mil glove, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12" 200 No Bid No Bid No Bid LAT-16N * $15.00 10
Length. Or County approved equal
Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, Medium, Powder Free,
10  |Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 616 No Bid No Bid No Bid LAT-16N * $15.00 10
substitutions
Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, Large, Powder Free,
11 Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 171 No Bid No Bid No Bid LAT-16N * $15.00 10
substitutions
Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, X-Large, Powder Free,
12 |Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff, no 608 No Bid No Bid No Bid LAT-16N * $15.00 10
substitutions
Exam glove, 2X-Large, comparable to Thickster Latex 6604-20, . . . %
13 Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff 0 No Bid No Bid No Bid LAT-16N $15.00 10
MK296S-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-free Nitrile
14  |Standard Exam Glove, Small, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions

Quotes Opened: 7-22-2020




Q-20-685
Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

Items 1 & 13 awarded to Vertex Packaging Supplies
Items 2, 3,4, 5 & 6 awarded to BIITECH LLC Tray, Inc. Vertex Packaging Supplies
Items 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24 & 25 awarded Glen Burnie, MD Sante Fe, CA

to Asberry Services Inc.

Approx. ) Boxes ) Boxes
. L. PP Vendor Unit Vendor Unit
Item Description Usage . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes) Case Case

MK296M-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-free Nitrile
15 |[Standard Exam Glove, Medium, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions

MK296L-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-free Nitrile
16 |Standard Exam Glove, Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 270 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions

MK296XL-Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-free Nitrile
17 |Standard Exam Glove, X-Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 385 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, no substitutions

Black, Powder-free, Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, comparable to
18  [Microflex Midknight MK296, 2X Large, length 245 mm, 175 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16

19  [Nitrile Glove, Powder Free, Textrured Grip, 5 mil XXL 30 No Bid No Bid No Bid NIT-4B $15.00 10

UL3158S - Exam Glove, Small, Microflex Ultra One #UL315,

20 Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12"

10 No Bid No Bid No Bid LAT-16N * $15.00 10

Quotes Opened: 7-22-2020



Examination Gloves for Various County Departments

Q-20-685

Items 1 & 13 awarded to Vertex Packaging Supplies
Items 2, 3,4, 5 & 6 awarded to BIITECH LLC Tray, Inc. Vertex Packaging Supplies
Items 7, 8,9, 10, 11, 12, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24 & 25 awarded Glen Burnie, MD Sante Fe, CA
to Asberry Services Inc.
. Approx. Vendor Unit Boxes Vendor Unit Boxes
Item Description Usage . Per . Per
Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes) Case Case
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
21 (elongated cuff) small, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid NIT-6BL $21.00 10
finger 6.3 mil
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
22 |(elongated cuff) Medium, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid NIT-6BL $21.00 10
mil, finger 6.3 mil
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
23 |(elongated cuff) Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 mil, 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid NIT-6BL $21.00 10
finger 6.3 mil
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
24 |(elongated cuff) X-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid NIT-6BL $21.00 10
mil, finger 6.3 mil
Microflex Midknight, Black, Powder-Free, Nitrile XTRA 93-862
25 |(elongated cuff) XX-Large, length 300 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 4.7 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid NIT-6BL $21.00 10
mil, finger 6.3 mil

Notes:
Vertex packaging Supplies
Delivery/Service no later than 30 calendar days from receipt of order

Item #6, #7, #8, #9, #10, #11, #12, #13 & #20
16MIL NFPA Exam Latex Substitute

Quotes Opened: 7-22-2020
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