Q-19-679
Examination Gloves

Item 1 - Awarded to Concordance Healthcare Solutions

Item 2-5, 10-13, 14-18 - Awarded to The Glove Box *

’ ' . . Concordance Health Care
Item 6-8 - Awarded to Airgas USA, LLC Airgas USA, LLC Bound Tree Medical, LLC Solutions
Item 9 - No Award: no responsive, responsible quotations were Allentown, PA Dublin. Ohio

received for this item. New Rochelle, NY

Approx.

ltem Description Usage Vendor Unit Vendor Unit Vendor Unit
P 9 Item # Price Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes)
1 ;/f'zyrlnﬁlove’ Non-Sterile, Large minimum 36 RADB405707 $3.00 101210008 $2.62 240030 $2.41
,  [Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, 30 RADB4056426 $6.73 47139 $5.21 191473 $8.00
Textured Grip, Small, 5 mil.
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,
3 rextured Grip, Mediom 5 mil. 60 RADB4056427 $6.73 47140 $5.21 191476 $8.00
4  |Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, 205 | RAD64056428 $6.73 47141 $5.21 191479 $8.00
Textured Grip, Large, 5 mil.
g5  [|Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, 252 | RADB4056429 $6.73 47142 $5.21 191481 $8.00

Textured Grip, X-Large, 5 mil.

UL315M, Exam glove, Medium, Microflex
6 Ultra One #UL315, Powder Free, Textured 170 MCRUL-315-M $10.07 UL-315-M $9.89 777439 $11.39
Fingers, 12" Length no substitutions

UL315L, Exam glove, Large, Microflex
7 Ultra One #UL315, Powder Free, Textured 20 MCRUL-315-L $10.07 UL-315-L $9.89 777436 $11.39
Fingers, 12" Length no substitutions

UL315XL, Exam glove, X- Large,
Microflex Ultra One #UL315, Powder
Free, Textured Fingers, 12" Length no
substitutions

170 MCRUL-315-XL $10.07 UL-315-XL $9.89 630231 $11.39

Quotes Opened: 8-29-2019



Q-19-679
Examination Gloves

Item Description ALFJ)EarO;. Vendor Unit Vendor Unit Vendor Unit
P g Item # Price Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes)

Exam glove, 2X- Large, Microflex Ultra
9 One #UL315 or 14 mil glove, Powder Free, 230 MCRLSE-104-XXL $15.01 DCER-4B $9.89 No Bid
Textured Fingers, 12" Length

Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove,
10 Medium, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 50 5636602-20 $9.76 SY-911-M $10.15 No Bid
12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff

Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove,
11 Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” 103 $636603-20 $9.76 SY-911-L $10.15 No Bid
Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff

Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, X-
12 Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” 608 $636604-20 $9.76 SY-911-XL $10.15 No Bid
Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff

Thickster Latex 6605-20, Exam glove, 2X-
13 Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” 150 $636605-20 $9.76 SY-911-XXL $10.15 No Bid
Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,

Microflex Midknight MK296S, Black,
Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove,
Small, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16

14 20 MCRMK-296-S $9.63 MK-296-S $7.25 148927 $8.92

Microflex Midknight MK296M, Black,
Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove,
Medium, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16

15 20 MCRMK-296-M $9.63 MK-296-M $7.25 148928 $8.92

Microflex Midknight MK296L, Black,
Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove,
Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16

16 250 MCRMK-296-L $9.63 MK-296-L $7.25 148930 $8.92

Quotes Opened: 8-29-2019



Q-19-679
Examination Gloves

ltem Description ASEJO;' Vendor Unit Vendor Unit Vendor Unit
P g Item # Price Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes)
Microflex Midknight MK296XL, Black,
Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove
) ' MCRMK-296-XL . * ML-296-XL 7.25 148931 8.92
17 X-Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 274 ¢ % $9.63 % 3 893 3
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16
Microflex Midknight, MK296XXL, Black,
Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove,
18 XX- Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, 100 MCRMK-296-XXL $9.63 * | BMN100-XL $7.15 148935 $10.20
palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength
16
*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing
Notes: Notes:
Airgas USA, LLC * Bound Tree Medical
Item: Notes: Item: Notes:
#17 * #2to#5 $5.21/Bx of 50
#18 * #6to#9 9.89/Bxof50
#6 to #8 50 Gloves per box #10to #13 10.15/Bx of 50

#10 to 13 50 Gloves per box

* Deemed Non-Responsive - do to submitting improper Form of Proposal
Bound Tree Medical

Estime' Enterprises

The Home Depot

* Deemed Non-Responsive - Not registered with MD Dept. of Assesment & Taxation
Unipak Corporation

Quotes Opened: 8-29-2019



Q-19-679
Examination Gloves

Item 1 - Awarded to Concordance Healthcare Solutions
Item 2-5, 10-13, 14-18 - Awarded to The Glove Box * *
Item 6-8 - Awarded to Airgas USA, LLC _ ) The Glove Box
Item 9 - No Award: no responsive, responsible quotations were | Estime’ Enterprises, Inc. Charlotte, NC The Home Depot
received for this item. Lanham, MD Jacksonwlle, FL
ltem Description ASEJO;' Vendor Unit Vendor Unit Vendor Unit
P g Item # Price Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes)
p  |Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, Large minimum 36 3RRJ5 $303.84 | MPR-50905 $2.57 No Bid
of 4 mil.
o |Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, 30 1XKJ9 $576.00 6302 $3.93 TRANSM5201 $4.15
Textured Grip, Small, 5 mil.
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free, TRANMD5201
3 Textured Grip, Medium, 5 mil. 60 1XKK1 $1,152.00 6303 $3.93 BLU $4.15
4 |Nitile Glove, Powder-Free, 205 1XKK2 $3,936.00 6304 $3.93 No Bid
Textured Grip, Large, 5 mil.
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free .
! " 4,838.40 3.93 No Bid
S Textured Grip, X-Large, 5 mil. 252 IXKK3 3 6305 3 0Bl
UL315M, Exam glove, Medium, Microflex
6 Ultra One #UL315, Powder Free, Textured 170 2TEL4 $2,776.10 No Bid No Bid
Fingers, 12" Length no substitutions
UL315L, Exam glove, Large, Microflex
7 Ultra One #UL315, Powder Free, Textured 20 2TEL5 $327.80 No Bid No Bid
Fingers, 12" Length no substitutions
UL315XL, Exam glove, X- Large,
3 Microflex L_Jltra Onel#'#UL315, Powder Free, 170 STELG $2.782.90 No Bid No Bid
Textured Fingers, 12" Length no
substitutions

Quotes Opened: 8-29-2019



Q-19-679
Examination Gloves

ltem

Description

Approx.

Usage
(Boxes)

Vendor
Item #

Unit
Price

Vendor
ltem #

Unit
Price

Vendor
ltem #

Unit
Price

Exam glove, 2X- Large, Microflex Ultra
One #UL315 or 14 mil glove, Powder Free,
Textured Fingers, 12" Length

230

464D75

$3,976.70

No Bid

No Bid

10

Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove,
Medium, Powder Free, Textured Fingers,
12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff

50

6602-20

$613.50

1243

$6.41

2479356

$10.71

11

Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove,
Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 127
Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff

103

6603-20

$1,063.81 *

1244

$6.41

757497

$10.71

12

Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, X-
Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 127
Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff

608

6604-20

$7,460.16

1245

$6.41

2479357

$10.71

13

Thickster Latex 6605-20, Exam glove, 2X-
Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 127
Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,

150

6604-20

$1,840.50

015-0

$7.63

No Bid

14

Microflex Midknight MK296S, Black,
Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove,
Small, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16

20

3NEZ3

$248.00

777-6

$5.76

No Bid

15

Microflex Midknight MK296M, Black,
Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove,
Medium, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16

20

3NEZ2

$247.20

777-7

$5.76

No Bid

16

Microflex Midknight MK296L, Black,
Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove,
Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16

250

3NEZ1

$3,100.00

777-8

$5.76

No Bid

Quotes Opened: 8-29-2019




Q-19-679
Examination Gloves

ltemn Description ASE;;;' Vendor Ur_1it Vendor Ur_1it Vendor Ur_1it
Item # Price Item # Price Item # Price
(Boxes)
Microflex Midknight MK296 XL, Black,
Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, .
17 X-Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 274 3NEZ4 $3,403.08 777-9 $5.76 No Bid
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16
Microflex Midknight, MK296XXL, Black,
Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove,
18 XX- Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, 100 3NEZ6 $1,243.00 777-0 $5.76 No Bid
palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength
16
Notes: Notes:
The Glove Box * The Home Depot
Iltem:  Notes: Item: Notes:
068-6 to 068-9 $3.83 (100/Bx, 10Bx/Case) #2 Ambitex 5 mil Small blue Nitril Gloves
Rescind "068 Series" glove quotes per vendor's request. Only #3 Ambitex 5 mil Medium blue Nitril Gloves
consider "6300 Series" for items 2-5 #10  SAS Safety Thickster Medim Powder Free
#10 to #13 50 /Bx, 10 Bx/Case #11 SAS Safety Thickster Large Powder Free
#18 90 /Bx, 10 Bx / Case #12 SAS Safety Thickster X-Large Powder Free
Notes:
* Estime' Enterprises
ltem:  Notes:
#11*

Quotes Opened: 8-29-2019



Q-19-679

Examination Gloves

Item 1 - Awarded to Concordance Healthcare Solutions
Item 2-5, 10-13, 14-18 - Awarded to The Glove Box
Item 6-8 - Awarded to Airgas USA, LLC

Item 9 - No Award: no responsive, responsible quotations were

Unipak Corporation

received for this item. Brooklyn, NY
- Approx. Vendor Unit
Item Description Usage .
Item # Price
(Boxes)
1 Vinyl _Glove, Non-Sterile, Large minimum 36 UPE $2.25
of 4 mil.
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,
2 Textured Grip, Small, 5 mil. 30 5800 $3.40
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,
3 Textured Grip, Medium, 5 mil. 60 5800 $3.40
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free
L o 3.40
4 Textured Grip, Large, 5 mil. 205 5800 $
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free
L " 3.40
S Textured Grip, X-Large, 5 mil. 252 5800 $
UL315M, Exam glove, Medium, Microflex
6 Ultra One #UL315, Powder Free, Textured 170 UL315M $9.25
Fingers, 12" Length no substitutions
UL315L, Exam glove, Large, Microflex
7 Ultra One #UL315, Powder Free, Textured 20 UL315L $9.20
Fingers, 12" Length no substitutions
UL315XL, Exam glove, X- Large,
Microflex Ultra One #UL315, Powder Free
) ' ' 9.25
8 Textured Fingers, 12" Length no 170 uLsts XL $
substitutions

Quotes Opened: 8-29-2019



Q-19-679

Examination Gloves

ltem

Description

Approx.
Usage
(Boxes)

Vendor
ltem #

Unit
Price

Exam glove, 2X- Large, Microflex Ultra
One #UL315 or 14 mil glove, Powder Free,
Textured Fingers, 12" Length

230

UL315 2XL

$9.25

10

Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove,
Medium, Powder Free, Textured Fingers,
12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff

50

No Bid

11

Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove,
Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 127
Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff

103

No Bid

12

Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, X-
Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 127
Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff

608

No Bid

13

Thickster Latex 6605-20, Exam glove, 2X-
Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 127
Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,

150

No Bid

14

Microflex Midknight MK296S, Black,
Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove,
Small, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16

20

No Bid

15

Microflex Midknight MK296M, Black,
Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove,
Medium, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16

20

MK 296 M

$9.50

16

Microflex Midknight MK296L, Black,
Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove,
Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16

250

MK296 L

$9.50

Quotes Opened: 8-29-2019



Q-19-679

Examination Gloves

Approx.

Item Description Usage Vendor Ur_ut
Item # Price
(Boxes)
Microflex Midknight MK296 XL, Black,
Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove,
17 X-Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 214 MK 296 XL $9.50
4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16
Microflex Midknight, MK296XXL, Black,
Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove,
18 XX- Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, 100 MK 296 XXL $9.50
palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength
16
Notes:
Unipak Corporation
Item: Notes:
#T *

#6t0#9 10/50 ($92.50)

Quotes Opened: 8-29-2019



