ATTACHMENT D

(a) Agreed, conspired, connived, or colluded to produce a deceptive show of competition in the
compilation of the accompanying bid or offer that is being submitted;

(b) In any manner, directly or indirectly, entered into any agreement of any kind to fix the bid price or
price proposal of the Bidder or Offeror or of any competitor, or otherwise taken any action in
restraint of free competitive bidding in connection with the contract for which the accompanying
bid or offer is submitted.

AFFIRMATION REGARDING BRIBERY CONVICTIONS

I FURTHER AFFIRM:

Neither I nor, to the best of my knowledge, information, and belief, the below business (as is defined in
Section 16-101 (b) of the State Finance and Procurement Article of the Annotated Code of Maryland), or
any of its officers, directors, partners, or any of its employees directly involved in obtaining or performing
contracts with public bodies (as is defined in Section 16-101(f) of the State Finance and Procurement
Article of the Annotated Code of Maryland), has been convicted of, or has had probation before judgment
imposed pursuant to Criminal Procedure Article, Section 6-220 of the Annotated Code of Maryland, or
has pleaded nolo contendere to a charge of, bribery, attempted bribery, or conspiracy to bribe in violation
of Maryland law, or of the law of any other State or federal law, except as follows (indicate the reasons
why the affirmation cannot be given and list any conviction, plea, or imposition of probation before
judgment with the date, court, official or administrative body, the sentence or disposition, the name(s) of
person(s) involved, and their current positions and responsibilities with the business):

BIDDER’S COMPANY/FIRM: Petroleum Traders Corporation
ADDRESS: PO Box 2357 Fort Wayne, IN 46801-2357
AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE: ,,Z,OA ,(,;/ g

[V / > 7’ =
NAME AND TITLE PRINTED: Linda Stephens - Vice President

TELEPHONE & FAX NUMBER: ph: 888-637-7661 fax: 260-203-3820

E-MAIL ADDRESS: jvanderpool@petroleumtraders.com

DATE: October 24, 2022 FEDERAL EMPLOYER’SIDENTIFICATIONNO. 35-1462227

For Informational Purposes Only: Has your company/firm been certified by the State of Maryland as a
Minority Business Enterprise? (Please check below.)

Yes X No

Signature to Bids
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PUR-1578

GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL

FORM OF PROPOSAL

USE OPIS RACK PRICE AVERAGE (STATED BELOW) PUBLISHED ON SEPTEMBER 23, 2022

OPTION NO. 1 - SEPARATELY AWARDED CONTRACTS

A B C D E
OPIS Price
Ttem et Bidd ' A
Newsletter lader Pprox. ]
. : Net Delivered
Price - Bidder Factor Gallon
as of Factor (A+B) Usage (CxD)
09-23-22
Per Gallon
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane . . .
No Bid No Bid No Bid
CBOB Ethanol (10%) Tank-wagon | 29385 |3 $ 65,120 o Bi
Section
Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane . . .
No Bid No Bid No Bid
[ | CBOB Ethanol (10%) Tank-wagon | 31212 805 $ 6,000 oBi
Total Sum Gasoline Tank-wagon Deliveries as Described in Section I (Option No. 1) No Bid
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
Section | CBOB Ethanol (10%) Transport $2.7069 | $_ +0.0550 $_ 27619 197,000 544,094.30
Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
1I CBOB Ethanol (10%) Transport $2.8369 $ +0.0275 $ 28644 145,000 415,338.00
959,432.30

Total Sum Gasoline Transport Deliveries as Described in Section II (Option No. 1)

Form of Proposal — Option 1

Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries
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Petroleum Traders Corporation

Bidder’s Name




OPTION NO. 1 - SEPARATELY AWARDED CONTRACTS

A B C D E
OPIS OPIS Price
Newsletter Bidder * Approx. .
Item Price . Bidder Factor Gallon Net(]:)ell\]')ered
as of Factor (A +B) Usage (CxD)
09-23-22 Per Gallon
. Total Sum Diesel Tank-wagon
Section Deliveries as Described in Section
No Bid i No Bid
[ | T No.2D Diesel Ultra Low Sulfur | 336691 | 822 §__ NoBid 61,647 | 3
Total Sum Gasoline Tank-wagon Deliveries as Described in Section III (Option No. 1) $ No Bid
Section Total Sum Diesel Transport
e;V Deliveries as Described in Section $3.4799 | $ +0.1130 $ 3.5929 719,000 | $ 2583,295.10
IV No. 2-D Diesel Ultra Low Sulfur
Total Sum Gasoline XXBRX®OQEHX Deliveries as Described in Section IV (Option No. 1) $ 2,583,295.10

Transport

Winter Chemical Additive Protection (cost per gallon): $

Winter Chemical Additive Protection Product Name:

Manufacturer’s Name:

Form of Proposal — Option 1

Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries
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Erasures or changes in bid must be initialed.

+0.0400

Diesel Treat 2000 Ultra Low Sulfur Winter Premium (#137ULSW)

Schaeffer Manufacturing Company

Petroleum Traders Corporation

Bidder’s Name




PUR-1578
GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL

FORM OF PROPOSAL

USE OPIS RACK PRICE AVERAGE (STATED BELOW) PUBLISHED ON SEPTEMBER 23, 2022

OPTION NO. 2 - ONE AWARDED CONTRACT

A B C D E
OPIS Price
Item OPIS Bidd ' A
News.l etter e Bidder Factor Pprox. Net Delivered
Price +/- Gallon
as of Factor (A+B) Usage (CxD)
09-23-22
Per Gallon

Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane . . )
No Bid No Bid No Bid

CBOB Ethanol (10%) Tank-wagon | 29385 |$__To5 $ 65,120 | § 0 Bi

Section 3

Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane . . .

No Bid No Bid
I CBOB Ethanol (10%) Tank-wagon $3.1212 $ o= $ No Bid 6,000 $

Total Sum Gasoline Tank-wagon Deliveries as Described in Section I (Option No. 2) $ No Bid

Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane . . .
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Section | CBOB Ethanol (10%) Transport $2.7069 |$__ NoBi $ 0 Bi 197,000 | $

Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane . . ]
N No Bid No Bid

I | CBOB Ethanol (10%) Transport $2.8369 | §__ NoBid $ o5 145,000 | $ oBi
Total Sum Gasoline Transport Deliveries as Described in Section II (Option No. 2) $ No Bid

Form of Proposal — Option 2

Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries
PUR-1578

Page 43

Petroleum Traders Corporation

Bidder’s Name




OPTION NO. 2 - ONE AWARDED CONTRACT

A B C D E
OPIS OPIS Price
Newsletter Bidder + Approx. .
Item Price . Bidder Factor Gallon Net(l:)ell\ll)ered
as of Factor (A+B) Usage (CxD)
09-23-22 Per Gallon
Section Total Sum Diesel Tank-wagon _ _ .
s Deliveries as Described in Section $3.6691 No Bid $ No Bid 61,467 |$ No Bid
III No. 2-D Diesel Ultra Low Sulfur
Section Total Sum Diesel Transport _
v Deliveries as Described in Section $3.4799 No Bid $ No Bid 719,000 | $ No Bid
IV No. 2-D Diesel Ultra Low Sulfur
TOTAL SUM BID OF ALL SECTIONS TOTALS (SECTIONS I-IV) (Option No. 2):
Bi
No .t;d Dollars S No Bid
(written) (figures)
No Bid Cents
(written)

Winter Chemical Additive Protection (cost per gallon): $

Winter Chemical Additive Protection Product Name:

Manufacturer’s Name:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Erasures or changes in bid must be initialed.

Form of Proposal — Option 2
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Petroleum Traders Corporation

Bidder’s Name




