
PUR-1602
Grinder Pumps

Item 
No. Item Description Unit of 

Measure Qty
 

Unit Price 
 

Total Price 
 

Unit Price 
 

Total Price 

1
Liberty Model LSG202-RE E/ONE 
Grinder 2 HP, 208/230V, 1 PH 
60HZ 3450 RPM Retro-Fit System

Ea. 15 No Bid No Bid $2,386.84 $35,802.60

2

Liberty LSG202M Omnivore Grinder 
2 HP, 208/230V, 1PH 60HZ 
3450RPM  1-¼ in. Discharge, 
15 AMPS

Ea. 20 No Bid No Bid $1,320.52 $26,410.40

3

Liberty FL102M-2 1HP Effluent Pump 
1PH, 208-230V, 25' CORD, 1.5"/2" 
Dual Sized Discharge, 
9 AMPS.

Ea. 15 No Bid No Bid $753.15 $11,297.25

4 Liberty FL52M Effluent Pump ½ HP, 
208-230V, 1PH Ea. 20 No Bid No Bid $551.57 $11,031.40

5
Liberty SXH24=3 Simplex Control 
Panel, 15-20 FLA, NEMA 4X, 
120/208/240, 1 PH, 3 Float, 20' Cords

Ea. 20 No Bid No Bid $476.31 $9,526.20

BT Plumbing Supply, Inc.
Finksburg, MD

No Bid 94,067.85

Aquaflow Pump & Supply
Hagerstown, MD

TOTAL LUMP SUM (Item Nos. 1 thru 5 above)

* Corrected calculations based on unit pricing 

Aquaflow Pump & Suppy NON-RESPONSIVE (used the wrong bid documents)
Remarks / Exceptions:

1 Bids Opened: 3/08/23



PUR-1602
Grinder Pumps

Item 
No. Item Description Unit of 

Measure Qty
 

Unit Price 
 

Total Price 
 

Unit Price 
 

Total Price 

1
Liberty Model LSG202-RE E/ONE 
Grinder 2 HP, 208/230V, 1 PH 60HZ 
3450 RPM Retro-Fit System

Ea. 15 $3,149.31 $47,239.65 $3,100.00 $46,500.00

2

Liberty LSG202M Omnivore Grinder 
2 HP, 208/230V, 1PH 60HZ 
3450RPM  1-¼ in. Discharge, 15 
AMPS

Ea. 20 $1,742.37 $34,847.40 $1,700.00 $34,000.00

3
Liberty FL102M-2 1HP Effluent Pump 
1PH, 208-230V, 25' CORD, 1.5"/2" 
Dual Sized Discharge, 9 Amps.

Ea. 15 $993.75 $14,906.25 $960.00 $14,400.00

4 Liberty FL52M Effluent Pump ½HP, 
208-230V, 1PH Ea. 20 $727.78 $14,555.60 $700.00 $14,000.00

5
Liberty SXH24=3 Simplex Control 
Panel, 15-20 FLA, NEMA 4X, 
120/208/240, 1 PH, 3 Float, 20' Cords

Ea. 20 $628.48 $12,569.60 $600.00 $12,000.00

*

* Corrected calculations based on unit pricing 

Ferguson Enterprises LLC dba
Pollardwater

Newport News, VA

Technology International, Inc.
Lake Mary, FL

TOTAL LUMP SUM (Item Nos. 1 thru 5 above) $124,118.50 $120,000.00

2 Bids Opened: 3/08/23



PUR-1602
Grinder Pumps

Remarks / Exceptions:

Estimated delivery is 16 weeks after receipt of order and approved submittal.

Technology International, Inc. -  
Warranty:  Manufacturer's standard warranty applies.

Notes:  Quoted price is not available on a line item basis. This is an offer for a lump sum contract.

Customer to provide equipment and personnel to unload

Please note, due to Covid-19 there may be unanticipated disruptions and delays in the supply chains globally, for parts, components, equipment and 
internal manufacturing services such as engineering, production allocation, and logistics.  This may result in manufacturing & delivery delays out of
our control.  We will do our best to communicate all such impacts and reduce the effects of any such delays.

All delivery dates quoted are subject to manufacturer's confirmation at time of order.

Submittal data will be provided for approval after receipt of order (if applicable)

3 Bids Opened: 3/08/23
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