

**PUR 1561**  
**Fire Service Performance Testing / Inspection**

<b>OPTION NO. 1 (Award for All Services):</b>				<b>Diversified Inspections / Independent Testing Labs, Inc. Manalapan, NJ</b>	
<b>Item No.</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Unit of Measure</b>	<b>Quantity</b>	<b>Unit Price/Each</b>	<b>Total Price</b>
1	Fire Pump Testing	EA	55	NO BID	NO BID
2	Hose Testing – Diameter 1-1/2 – 2”	LF	73,000	NO BID	NO BID
3	Hose Testing – Diameter 2-1/2 – 3”	LF	41,000	NO BID	NO BID
4	Hose Testing – Diameter 4 – 5”	LF	77,000	NO BID	NO BID
5	Hose Testing – Hard Suction	EA	100	NO BID	NO BID
6	Ground Ladder Testing – 10’ Folding (Attic)	EA	52	NO BID	NO BID
7	Straight Ladders Testing – (12’ – 20’)	EA	68	NO BID	NO BID
8	Extension Ladders Testing – (16’ – 28’)	EA	57	NO BID	NO BID
9	Extension Ladders – (30’ – 45’)	EA	24	NO BID	NO BID
<b>TOTAL SUM BID PRICE</b> (for Item Nos. 1 through 9)				NO BID	

**PUR 1561**  
**Fire Service Performance Testing / Inspection**

<b>OPTION NO. 2 (Individual Awards for Each Service):</b>				<b>Diversified Inspections / Independent Testing Labs, Inc. Manalapan, NJ</b>	
<b>Item No.</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Unit of Measure</b>	<b>Quantity</b>	<b>Unit Price/Each</b>	<b>Total Price</b>
Group A1	Fire Pump Testing	EA	55	NO BID	NO BID
<b>TOTAL SUM BID PRICE FOR GROUP A</b> (for Item No A1)				NO BID	
Group B2	Hose Testing – Diameter 1-1/2 – 2”	LF	73,000	\$0.31	\$22,630.00
Group B3	Hose Testing – Diameter 2-1/2 – 3”	LF	41,000	\$0.31	\$12,710.00
Group B4	Hose Testing – Diameter 4 – 5”	LF	77,000	\$0.31	\$23,870.00
Group B5	Hose Testing - Hard Suction	EA	100	\$30.00	\$3,000.00
<b>TOTAL SUM BID PRICE FOR GROUP B</b> (for Item No B2 through B5)				\$62,210.00	

**PUR 1561**  
**Fire Service Performance Testing / Inspection**

<b>OPTION NO. 2 (Individual Awards for Each Service):</b>				<b>Diversified Inspections / Independent Testing Labs, Inc. Manalapan, NJ</b>	
<b>Item No.</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Unit of Measure</b>	<b>Quantity</b>	<b>Unit Price/Each</b>	<b>Total Price</b>
Group C6	Ground Ladder Testing – 10' Folding (Attic)	EA	52	\$2.50 / foot	\$1,300
Group C7	Straight Ladders Testing – (12' – 20')	EA	68	\$2.50 / foot	\$2,040 - \$3,400
Group C8	Extension Ladders Testing – (16' – 28')	EA	57	\$2.50 / foot	\$2,280 - \$3,990
Group C9	Extension Ladders – (30' – 45')	EA	24	\$2.50 / foot	\$1,800 - \$2,700
<b>TOTAL SUM BID PRICE FOR GROUP C</b> (for Item No C6 through C9)				\$7,420 - \$11,390	

**Remarks / Exceptions:**

**Diversified Inspections / Independent Testing Labs, Inc.**

Bid requested that ladders be quoted per foot but total footage was not provided so I provided a range based on the footage in each group. All ladder prices are bid at \$2.50/foot. If you would like us to replace heat sensor labels on the ladders as needed we can do that for \$2.50/label, it was not requested in bid.