PUR-1560

Recycling Drop-Off Center Services

Apple Valley Waste

Kearneysville,

WV

BFI Waste Services, LLC DBA
Republic Services of Hagerstown,

MD

OPTION NO. 1 - HAULING OF SINGLE STREAM RECYCLABLES

Item Unit Price Unit Price
Descripti t Total Price t Total Pri
No. escription | Qty (One Trip) i Qty (One Trip) otal Frice
1 Location No. 1: 115 No Bid No Bid 115 $235.54 $27,087.10
Greensburg
) Location No. 2: 90 No Bid No Bid 90 $308.43 $27,758.70
Kaetzel
3 Location No. 3: 20 No Bid No Bid 20 $340.98 $6,819.60
Dargan
4 Location No. 4: 40 No Bid No Bid 40 $327.01 $13,080.40
Hancock
Location No. 5: . :
> Forty West Landfill 250 NoBid Mo Bud 2 oS ST
TOTAL SUM BID
(Hauling of Single No Bid $116,133.30

Stream Recyclables
Locations 1 thru 5)

OPTION NO. 2 - PROCESSING SINGLE STREAM RECYCLABLES

Item Unit Price Unit Price
D ipti t Total Price t Total Pri
No. eseription  { QY | One Trip) e 1 QY | OneTripy | Total Price
Ist Year:
1 [Processing Single 520 $85.00 $44,200.00 520 No Bid No Bid
Stream Recyclables
2nd Year:
2 |Processing Single 520 $97.75 $50,830.00 520 No Bid No Bid
Stream Recyclables
3rd Year:
3 [Processing Single 520 $107.52 $55,910.40 *] 520 No Bid No Bid
Stream Recyclables
TOTAL SUM BID
Three (3) Year Period $150,940.40 x No Bid

(Processing Single
Stream Recycleables)

Bids Opened: 8-3-22



PUR-1560

Recycling Drop-Off Center Services

Apple Valley Waste BFI Waste S?rwces, LLC DBA
. Republic Services of Hagerstown,
Kearneysville, WV
MD
ALTERNATE 1
Item Unit Price Unit Price
D ipti t Total Price t Total Pri
No. eseription QW | e Trip) ice 1 QY | (One Tripy | 1otal Price
FIRST YEAR: 8§
CY Minimum FEL
4 |Segregated 416 No Bid No Bid 416 $100.00 $41,600.00
Cardboard
Containers
SECOND YEAR:
8 CY Minimum FEL
5 |Segregated 416 No Bid No Bid 416 $105.00 $43,680.00
Cardboard
Containers
THIRD YEAR:
8 CY Minimum FEL
6 |Segregated 416 No Bid No Bid 416 $110.25 $45,864.00
Cardboard
Containers
TOTAL SUM BID
Three (3) Year Period No Bid $131,144.00
(Alternate No. 1)

*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing

Remarks/Exceptions

Apple Valley Waste
Bidding solely on the processing of material.

Republic Services of Hagerstown
The above rates for Option No. 1 - Hauling of Single Stream Recyclables are based on Hauling the
recclables to the Apple Valley Recycling Center located at 16608 Hunters Green Parkway,
Hagerstown, MD.

Bids Opened: 8-3-22
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