PUR-1543
Grounds Maintenance Chemicals
for Black Rock Golf Course

Genesis Turfgrass, Inc. Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC
Glen Rock, PA Knoxville, MD
Item " . Unit of o . o .
Item Description / Formulation Awarded Vendor Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
No. Measure
1 |Acclaim Extra Nutrien Ag Gallon $598.00 $1,196.00 $549.00 $1,098.00
2 |Aqua Shade Helena Agri Gallon $55.59 $1,111.80 $42.00 $840.00
3 |Propiconazole 14.3% Site One Gallon $215.00 $3,225.00 * $69.90 $1,048.50
4 ggozp;mocarb Hydrochloride Helena Agri Gallon $323.00 $5,168.00 $275.00 $4,400.00
5 Bensumec — 4LF Helena Agri Gallon $333.00 $8,325.00 * $128.00 $3,200.00
6 Ig';&honate Methyl Helena Agri Gallon $142.75 $28,550.00 *|  $40.00 $8,000.00
7 |Alumimum Tris WDG 80% Helena Agri Pound $16.42 $3,612.40 $15.00 $3,300.00
8 |Crossbow Genesis Gallon $43.20 $648.00 $52.00 $780.00
Chlorothanlonil i
9 54% 720 SET Nutrien Ag Gallon $33.59 $2,015.40 $34.80 $2,088.00
10 E;E;fy“fos 4E Genesis Gallon $57.72 $577.20 No Bid No Bid

Bids Opened: April 20, 2022




PUR-1543
Grounds Maintenance Chemicals
for Black Rock Golf Course

Genesis Turfgrass, Inc. Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC
Glen Rock, PA Knoxville, MD
Item " . Unit of o . o .
Item Description / Formulation Awarded Vendor Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

No. Measure
11 |Dylox 420 SL Nutrien Ag Pound $76.75 $1,535.00 $78.00 $1,560.00
12 |Fore WSP Helena Agri Pound $9.22 $3,983.04 $8.44 $3,646.08
13 |Head Way Genesis Gallon $496.00 $3,968.00 $496.00 $3,968.00
14 ggt’?‘izonazo'e Helena Agri Gallon $70.56 $1,764.00 $47.75 $1,193.75
15 [Imidacloprid 75% Nutrien Ag Case $593.41 $1,186.82 $638.00 $1,276.00
16 |PCNB 40% Helena Agri Gallon $65.42 $1,962.60 $53.08 $1,614.00
17  |Pendulum Aqua Cap Nutrien Ag Gallon $67.90 $2,037.00 $65.00 $1,950.00
18 E‘gﬁ/’;apac ~ Ethyl Nutrien Ag Gallon $109.84 $1,098.40 $117.00 $1,170.00
19 |Prograss Helena Agri Gallon $157.20 $7,074.00 $148.78 $6,695.10
20 [Provaunt WDG Nutrien Ag Case $1,612.80 $3,225.60 $1,612.80 $3,225.60
21 [Glyphosate 41% Helena Agri Gallon $36.40 $728.00 $36.00 $720.00

Bids Opened: April 20, 2022




PUR-1543
Grounds Maintenance Chemicals
for Black Rock Golf Course

Genesis Turfgrass, Inc. Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC
Glen Rock, PA Knoxville, MD

Item Item Description / Formulation Awarded Vendor unit of Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
No. Measure
22 gﬂze;izoxam Helena Agri Gallon $350.00 $1,750.00 $295.00 $1,475.00
23 [Talstar Nutrien Ag Gallon $57.62 $460.96 $54.00 $432.00
24 [Trimec Classic Nutrien Ag Gallon $45.80 $916.00 $43.00 $860.00

Paclobutrazol .

25 22 304 Helena Agri Gallon $185.37 $556.11 $134.00 $402.00
26 [Phosguard Nutrien Ag Gallon $36.80 $7,360.00 No Bid No Bid
27 |Bayleton FLO Nutrien Ag Gallon $554.00 $22,160.00 $554.00 $22,160.00
28 |Dismiss NXT Genesis Gallon $1,257.60 $7,074.00 $589.50 $7,074.00
29 [Fluazinam 40SC Nutrien Ag Gallon $320.00 $12,800.00 $284.00 $11,360.00
30 |Poa Constrictor Site One Gallon $133.33 $1,200.00 No Bid No Bid
31 |Signature XTRA Helena Agri Pound $31.81 $2,624.33 $31.81 $2,624.33 *
32 |Barricade Helena Agri Gallon $152.00 $1,520.00 $145.00 $1,450.00
33 |Mancozeb Nutrien Ag Pound $5.24 $2,358.00 $5.45 $2,452.50
34 |Fairway Select Genesis Gallon $198.00 $9,900.00 No Bid No Bid
35 [Emerald Genesis Case $1,141.70 $4,566.80 $1,141.17 $4,564.68 *
36 |Evade 4FL Helena Agri Gallon No Bid No Bid $71.00 $1,420.00
37 |lprodione 23.3% Nutrien Ag Gallon $59.98 $3,598.80 $58.00 $3,480.00

Corrected Calculations based on Unit Pricing

Bids Opened: April 20, 2022



PUR-1543
Grounds Maintenance Chemicals
for Black Rock Golf Course

Nutrien Ag Solutions, Inc. SiteOne Landscape Supply
Rosedale, MD Cleveland, OH
Item Item Description / Formulation Estimated Annual unit of Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
No. Usage / Case Type Measure
1 2-Gallons Gallon $524.99 $1,049.98 $675.00 $1,350.00
2 |Aqua Shade 5 Cases /4 x 1 Gallons Gallon $49.95 $999.00 $54.22 $1,084.40
4 Gallons per Case
3 |Propiconazole 14.3% 3 Cases /2 x 2.5 Gallons Gallon No Bid No Bid $64.64 $969.60
5 Gallons per Case
4 Propamocarb Hydrochloride 8 Cases / 2 x 1 Gallons Gallon $315.00 $5,040.00 $300.00 $4.,800.00
66.2% 2 Gallons per Case
5  |Bensumec — 4LF 5 Cases /2 x2.5 Gallons Gallon $158.67 $3,966.75 $172.30 $4,307.50
5 Gallons per Case
Thiophonate Methyl 40 Cases / 2 x 2.5 Gallons
6 46.2% 5 Gallons per Case Gallon $46.75 $9,350.00 $46.00 $9,200.00
7 |Alumimum Tris WDG 80% 10 Cases /4 x 5.5 Ibs. Pound No Bid No Bid $19.38 $4,263.60
22 Ibs. per Case
8 |Crossbow 15 Gallons /2 x 2.5 Gallons Gallon $54.40 $816.00 $45.85 $687.75
5 Gallons per Case
Chlorothanlonil 12 Cases / 2 x 2. 5 Gallons
9 54% 720 SET 5 Gallons per Case Gallon $31.59 $1,895.40 $34.00 $2,040.00
Chlorpyrifos 4E 2 Cases / 2 x 2.5 Gallons . .
10 42.5% 5 Gallons per Case Gallon No Bid No Bid $75.25 $752.50

Bids Opened: April 20, 2022




PUR-1543

Grounds Maintenance Chemicals

for Black Rock Golf Course

Nutrien Ag Solutions, Inc.

SiteOne Landscape Supply

Rosedale, MD Cleveland, OH
Item Item Description / Formulation Estimated Annual unit of Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
No. Usage / Case Type Measure
11 4 Cases /2 x 2.5 Gallons Pound $74.40 $1,488.00 $87.50 $1,750.00
5 Gallons per Case
12 |Fore wsp 9-Cases /8x4x 15 Ibs. Pound $8.95 $3,866.40 $11.43 $4,937.76
48 Ibs. per Case
13 |Head Way 4-Cases /2 x 1 Gallons Gallon $496.00 $3,968.00 $496.00 $3,968.00
2 Gallons per Case
Tebuconazole 25-Gallons / 4 x 1 Gallons / or
14 2 x 2.5 Gallons / Gallon $69.70 $1,742.50 $70.47 $1,761.75
38.7%
5 Gallons per Case
. . 2-Cases /
15 |Imidacloprid 75% Case $79.99 $879.89 $471.74 $943.48
88 x 1.6 oz per Case
16 |PCNB 40% 6-Cases/2x 2.5 Gallons / Gallon No Bid No Bid $62.31 $1,869.30
5 Gallon Case
6-Cases / 2 x 2.5 Gallons /
17  [Pendulum Aqua Cap 5 Gallon Case Gallon $47.99 $1,439.70 $52.29 $1,568.70
1g | Irinexapac - Ethyl 2-Cases/ 2 x 2.5 Gallons/ Gallon $10400 | $1,040.00 $112.80 $1,128.00
11.3% 5 Gallons per Case
19 |Prograss 9-Cases / 2 x 2.5 Gallons / Gallon No Bid No Bid $195.95 $8,817.75
5 Gallons per Case
2-Cases /
20 [Provaunt WDG 4% 72 0z Case $1,612.80 $3,225.60 $1,612.80 $3,225.60
21 |Glyphosate 41% 4-Cases | 2 x 2.5 Gallons / Gallon $57.89 $1,157.80 $70.61 $1,412.20
5 Gallons per Case

Bids Opened: April 20, 2022




PUR-1543

Grounds Maintenance Chemicals

for Black Rock Golf Course

Nutrien Ag Solutions, Inc.

SiteOne Landscape Supply

Rosedale, MD Cleveland, OH
Item Item Description / Formulation Estimated Annual unit of Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
No. Usage / Case Type Measure
Mefenoxam 2.5Cases/ 2 x 1 Case/
22 99 504 5 Gallon Cases Gallon $344.44 $1,722.20 $406.88 $2,034.40
23 |Talstar 2 Cases /8 Gallons / 4 x 1-Gallon Gallon $48.88 $391.04 $54.98 $439.84
4 Gallons per Case
24 |Trimec Classic 20-Gallons / 2 x 2.5 Gallons / Gallon $26.99 $539.80 $30.80 $616.00
5 Gallons per Case
Paclobutrazol 3-Gallons
25 99 306 2 x 1 Gallon Cases Gallon $159.88 $479.64 $214.36 $643.08
200-Gallons
26  [Phosguard 5 % 2.5 Gallon Cases Gallon $34.49 $6,898.00 $48.00 $9,600.00
27 |Bayleton FLO 40-Gallons / 2 x 2.5 Gallons / Gallon $340.00 $13,600.00 $554.00 $22,160.00
5 Gallons per case
.. 3-Cases /
28 |Dismiss NXT Gallon $2.358.00 $7,074.00 $2,358.00 $7,074.00
4 x 60 Ounce Case
29 |Fluazinam 40SC 40-Gallons /2 x 2.5 Gallons / Gallon $259.98 $10,399.20 $345.00 $13,800.00
5 Gallons per case
30 |Poa Constrictor 9-Gallons / Gallon $156.00 $1,404.00 $120.00 $1,080.00
96 Ounce Bottles
) 82.5 Ibs. /
31 [Signature XTRA 15 Bags Pound $175.00 $2,625.00 $175.00 $2,625.00
) 10-Gallons
32 |Barricade Gallon $152.00 $1,520.00 $152.00 $1,520.00
4 x 1 Gallon Case
450 Ibs.
33 [Mancozeb Pound $5.15 $2,317.50 $5.25 $2,362.50
12 Ib. bags
34  |Fairway Select 50 Gallon /2 x 2.5 Gallon/ Gallon No Bid No Bid $228.00 $11,400.00
5 Gallons per Case
4 Cases /
35 [Emerald 0.49 Ib. packet / Case $1,141.70 $4,566.80 $1,141.70 $4,566.80
10 packet Case
36  |Evade 4FL 5Cases/4x1Gal/ Gallon $71.99 $1,439.80 $106.83 $2,136.60
4 Gallon Case
37 |Iprodione 23.3% 12 Cases/2x 2.5 Gal / Gallon $57.90 $3,474.00 $60.00 $3,600.00
5 Gallon Case

Corrected Calculations based on Unit Pricing

Bids Opened

> April 20, 2022



Remarks / Exceptions:

Helena Agri Enterprises

Item No. 10 - Discontinued

Item No. 11 - Gallon

Item No. 28 - Bottle

Item No. 29 - changed price / no initials
Item No. 30 - Discontinued

Nutrien Ag Solutions, Inc.

Item No. 15 - (11 cases 16 x 1.60z)

Item No. 28 - Case

Item No. 31 - Bag

Item No. 33 - Changed price / no initials

SiteOne Landscape Supply

Item No. 3 - Lesco Spectator Ultra
Item No. 4 - Karma

Item No. 6 - Lesco T-Storm

Item No. 7 - Fosetyl-al

Item No. 9 - Lesco Manicure 6FI
Item No. 11 - Gallon

Item No. 13 - Agency

PUR-1543

Grounds Maintenance Chemicals
for Black Rock Golf Course

Remarks / Exceptions

SiteOne Landscape Supply

Item No.
Item No.
Item No.
Item No.

15 - Lesco Bandit

17 - Lesco Pre-M Aquacap
18 - T-Nex

20 - Agency

Remarks / Exceptions:

SiteOne Landscape Supply
Some UOM were adjusted in order to total correctly

Alternates are clearly marked. Labels / Specifications enclosed

*Item No. 21 - Lesco Prosecutor Pro / Upon Availability

Item No.
Item No.
Item No.
Item No.
Item No.
Item No.
Item No.
Item No.
Item No.
Item No.
Item No.
Item No.
Item No.
Item No.

22 - per 2 x 25 gal/cs
23 - Bifenthrin G&N 7.9F

24 - Lesco Three-Way Selective

25 - Pac-Low

26 - Liquid PHI 0-0-25

27 - Agency

28 - Agency / Case

29 - Lesco Drax (5 x 1 gal)
30 - Bottle

31 - Agency / 15 bags / Bag
32 - Agency

34 - Traction

35 - Agency

36 - changed 5 cases to 4 cases

PUR-1543 Grounds Maintenance Chemicals awarded to the following:

Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC - Items Nos. 2, 4, 5, 6, 7, 12, 14, 16, 19, 21, 22, 25, 31, 32, 36

Genesis Turfgrass, Inc. — Item Nos. 8, 10, 13, 28, 34, & 35

Nutrien Ag Solutions — Item Nos. 1, 9, 11, 15, 17, 18, 20, 23, 24, 26, 27, 29, 33, & 37

SiteOne Landscape Supply — Item Nos. 3 & 30

Bids Opened: April 20, 2022





