OPTION 1

PUR-1519
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel

AC&T Company, Inc.

East River Energy, Inc.

Hagerstown, MD Guilford, CT
A B C D E B C D E
OPIS Price OPIS Price
OPIS . + ] +
Item Newsletter Bidder Bidder Approx. Net Bidder Bidder Approx. '.\IEt
Price as of +/- Factor Gallon Delivered +/- Factor Gallon Delivered
CXD
09-16-20 Factor (A+B) Usage (CXD) Factor (A+B) Usage ( )
Per Gallon Per Gallon
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.3001 $0.2575 $2.5576 69,070 $176,653.43 No Bid No Bid 69,070 No Bid
Tank-wagon
Sec Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
| "|CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.4186 $0.2575 $2.6761 6,000 $16,056.60 No Bid No Bid 6,000 No Bid
Tank-wagon
Total Sum Gasoline Tank-wagon .
Deliveries as Described in Section | $192,710.03 NO Bid
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.3001 $0.0750 $2.3751 188,000 $446,518.80 $0.2146 $2.5147 188,000 $472,763.60 *
Transport
Sec Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
0 "|CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.4186 $0.0750 $2.4936 145,000 $361,572.00 $0.2340 $2.6526 145,000 $384,627.00 *
Transport
Total Sum FSaso_Ilne Tr.ansport as $808,090.80 $857.390.60 *
Described in Section 11
Total Sum Diesel Tank-wagon
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in $2.2428 | $0.2475 | $2.4903 | 64,292 $160,106.37 No Bid No Bid 64,292 No Bid
111 |Section 111 No. 2-D Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur
Total Sum Diesel Transport
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in $2.2428 | $0.0800 | $2.3228 | 566,000 | $1,314,704.80 $0.2260 | $2.4688 | 566,000 | $1,397,340.80 *
IV |Section IV No. 2-D Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur

Bids Opened: October 20, 2021




OPTION 1

PUR-1519
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel

AC&T Company, Inc.

East River Energy, Inc.

Hagerstown, MD Guilford, CT
Winter Chemical Additive Protection Tankwagon at Rack $.0300/gal. // Transport $.0500/gal. $0.0350
(cost per gallon):
Winter Chemical Additive Protection :CFI 1902 // 137ULSW Diesel Treat 2000 Innospec
Product Name:
Manufacturer’s Name: Innospec // :Schaeffer Manufacturing Innospec

Bids Opened: October 20, 2021




OPTION

2

PUR-1519
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel

AC&T Company, Inc.

East River Energy, Inc.

Hagerstown, MD Guilford, CT
A B C D E B C D E
OPIS Price OPIS Price
OPIS . + . +
. . Net
Item Newsletter Bidder Bidder Approx. Net Bidder Bidder Approx . €
Price as of +/- Factor Gallon Delivered +/- Factor Gallon Delivered
CXD
09-16-20 Factor (A+B) Usage (CXD) Factor (A +B) Usage ( )
Per Gallon Per Gallon
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.3001 $0.2550 $2.5551 69,070 $176,480.76 No Bid No Bid 69,070 No Bid
Tank-wagon
Sec Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
| "|CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.4186 $0.2550 $2.6736 6,000 $16,041.60 No Bid No Bid 6,000 No Bid
Tank-wagon
Total Sum Gasoline Tank-wagon .
Deliveries as Described in Section | $192,522.36 No Bid
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.3001 $0.0725 $2.3726 188,000 $446,048.80 No Bid No Bid 188,000 No Bid
Transport
Sec Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
. "|CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.4186 $0.0725 $2.4911 145,000 $361,209.50 No Bid No Bid 145,000 No Bid
Transport
Total Sum _Gaso_llne Tr_ansport as $807,258.30 No Bid
Described in Section 11
Total Sum Diesel Tank-wagon
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in $2.2428 | $0.2450 | $2.4878 | 64,292 $159,945.6376 *| No Bid No Bid 64,292 No Bid
11 |Section Il No. 2-D Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur
Total Sum Diesel Transport
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in . . .
IV |Section IV No. 2-D Diesel $2.2428 $0.0775 $2.3203 566,000 $1,313,289.8000 No Bid No Bid 566,000 No Bid
Ultra Low Sulfur
Total Sum Bid of All Section Totals 2 473.016.0946 N $2.254.716.11

(Sections 1-1V)

Bids Opened: October 20, 2021




OPTION 2

PUR-1519
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel

AC&T Company, Inc.

East River Energy, Inc.

Hagerstown, MD Guilford, CT
Winter Chemical Additive Protection Tankwagon at Rack: $.0300/gal. // Transport: $.0500/gal. N/A
(cost per gallon):
Winter Chemical Additive Protection :CFI 1902 //:137ULSW Diesel Treat 2000 N/A
Product Name:
Manufacturer’s Name: :Innospec // :Schaeffer Manufacturing N/A

*Corrected Calculations Based on Unit Pricing

NOTES:

NOTES:

Bids Opened: October 20, 2021




PUR-1519
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel

O P-I— I O N 1 Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, Inc. Petroleum Traders Corporation
Gainesville, GA Fort Wayne, IN
A B C D E B C D E
OPIS Price OPIS Price
OPIS . + ) +
Item Newsletter Bidder Bidder Approx. I_\Iet Bidder Bidder Approx. I_\Iet
Price as of +/- Factor Gallon Delivered +/- Factor Gallon Delivered
09-16-20 Factor (A+B) Usage (CXD) Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon
Sec Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
| "|CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.3001 No Bid No Bid 69,070 No Bid No Bid No Bid 69,070 No Bid
Tank-wagon
Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.4186 No Bid No Bid 6,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid 6,000 No Bid
Tank-wagon
Total Sum Gasoline Tank-wagon : .
Deliveries as Described in Section | No Bid No Bid
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.3001 $0.0691 $2.3692 188,000 $445,409.60 $0.0259 $2.3260 188,000 $437,288.00
Transport
Sec Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
" "|CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.4186 -$0.0085 $2.4101 145,000 $349,464.50 -$0.0268 $2.3918 145,000 $346,811.00
Transport
Total Sum -Gaso.llne Tr-ansport as $794,874.10 $784.099.00
Described in Section 11
Total Sum Diesel Tank-wagon
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in $22428 | NoBid | NoBid | 64292 No Bid NoBid | NoBid | 64,292 No Bid
111 |Section Il No. 2-D Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur
Total Sum Diesel Transport
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in $2.2428 | $0.0658 | $2.3086 | 566,000 | $1,306,667.60 | $0.0583 | $2.3011 | 566,000 | $1,302,422.60
IV [Section IV No. 2-D Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur

5 Bids Opened: October 20, 2021



OPTION 1

PUR-1519
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel

Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, Inc.

Gainesville, GA

Petroleum Traders Corporation
Fort Wayne, IN

Winter Chemical Additive Protection
(cost per gallon):

$0.0250

$0.0300

Winter Chemical Additive Protection
Product Name:

Cold Pro Winter Additive

Diesel Treat 2000 Ultra Low Sulfur Winter Premium
(#137ULSW)

Manufacturer’s Name:

Innospec

Schaeffer Manufacturing Company

Bids Opened: October 20, 2021



OPTION 2

PUR-1519

Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel

Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, Inc.

Petroleum Traders Corporation

Gainesville, GA Fort Wayne, IN
A B C D E B C D E
OPIS Price OPIS Price
OPIS . + . +
Item Newsletter Bidder Bidder ApproXx. I_\Iet Bidder Bidder Approx. I_\Iet
Price as of +/- Factor Gallon Delivered +/- Factor Gallon Delivered
09-16-20 Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD) Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.3001 No Bid No Bid 69,070 No Bid No Bid No Bid 69,070 No Bid
Tank-wagon
Sec Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
| "|CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.4186 No Bid No Bid 6,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid 6,000 No Bid
Tank-wagon
Total Sum Gasoline Tank-wagon . .
Deliveries as Described in Section | No Bid No Bid
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.3001 No Bid No Bid 188,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid 188,000 No Bid
Transport
Sec Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
I "|CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.4186 No Bid No Bid 145,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid 145,000 No Bid
Transport
Total Sum Gasoline Transport as . .
Described in Section 11 No Bid No Bid
Total Sum Diesel Tank-wagon
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in $2.2428 | NoBid | NoBid 64,292 No Bid NoBid | NoBid | 64,292 No Bid
111 |Section Il No. 2-D Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur
Total Sum Diesel Transport
Sec. | Deliveries as Described in . . . . . .
IV |section IV No. 2-D Diesel $2.2428 No Bid No Bid 566,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid 566,000 No Bid
Ultra Low Sulfur
Total Sum Bid of All Section Totals 2.101,541.7100 No Bid

(Sections 1-1V)

Bids Opened: October 20, 2021




OPTION 2

PUR-1519
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel

Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, Inc.

Gainesville, GA

Petroleum Traders Corporation
Fort Wayne, IN

Winter Chemical Additive Protection

$0.0250 No Bid
(cost per gallon):
Winter Chemical Additive Protection Cold Pro Winter Additive No Bid
Product Name:
Manufacturer’s Name: Innospec No Bid
NOTES:
8 Bids Opened: October 20, 2021



PUR-1519
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel

OPTION 1 P
Ft Washington, MD
A B C D E
OPIS Price
OPIS . +
Item Newsletter Bidder Bidder Approx. Net
. +/- Gallon Delivered
Price as of Factor Factor Usage (C X D)
09-16-20 (A +B) g
Per Gallon
Sec Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
| "|CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.3001 No Bid No Bid 69,070 No Bid
Tank-wagon
Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.4186 No Bid No Bid 6,000 No Bid
Tank-wagon
Total Sum Gasoline Tank-wagon No Bid
Deliveries as Described in Section |
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.3001 No Bid No Bid 188,000 No Bid
Transport
Sec Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
I " |CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.4186 No Bid No Bid 145,000 No Bid
Transport
Total Sum Gasoline Transport as No Bid
Described in Section |1
Total Sum Diesel Tank-wagon
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in $2.2428 No Bid No Bid 64.292 No Bid
111 |Section Il No. 2-D Diesel ' '
Ultra Low Sulfur
Total Sum Diesel Transport
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in $22428 | NoBid | NoBid | 566,000 No Bid
1V |Section IV No. 2-D Diesel ' '
Ultra Low Sulfur

Bids Opened: October 20, 2021



PUR-1519

Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel

OPTION 1

SteedPetro
Ft Washington, MD

Winter Chemical Additive Protection

No Bid
(cost per gallon): !
Winter Chemical Additive Protection .
No Bid
Product Name:
Manufacturer’s Name: No Bid

10

Bids Opened: October 20, 2021



PUR-1519

Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel

O PT I O N 2 SteeQPetro
Ft. Washington, MD
A B C D E
OPIS Price
OPIS . +
Item Newsletter Bidder Bidder Approx. I_\Iet
. +/- Gallon Delivered
Price as of Factor Factor Usage (C X D)
09-16-20 (A+B)
Per Gallon
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.3001 No Bid No Bid 69,070 No Bid
Sec. | Tank-wagon
I |Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.4186 No Bid No Bid 6,000 No Bid
Tank-wagon
Total Sum Gasoline Tank-wagon No Bid
Deliveries as Described in Section |
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.3001 No Bid No Bid 188,000 No Bid
Sec. | Transport
Il |Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $2.4186 No Bid No Bid 145,000 No Bid
Transport
Total Sum Gasoline Transport as No Bid
Described in Section 11
Total Sum Diesel Tank-wagon
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in $2.2428 No Bid No Bid 64.292 No Bid
111 [Section Il No. 2-D Diesel ' '
Ultra Low Sulfur
Total Sum Diesel Transport
Sec. | Deliveries as Described in $2.2428 | NoBid | NoBid | 566,000 No Bid
IV [Section IV No. 2-D Diesel ' '
Ultra Low Sulfur
Total Sum Bid of All Section Totals No Bid
(Sections 1-1V)
11

Bids Opened: October 20, 2021



PUR-1519
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel

d
OPT I O N 2 Ft. V\?zzgliinpgigr?, MD

Winter Chemical Additive Protection

No Bid
(cost per gallon): !
Winter Chemical Additive Protection .
No Bid
Product Name:
Manufacturer’s Name: No Bid

*Corrected Calculations Based on Unit Pricing

NOTES:

12 Bids Opened: October 20, 2021



