
PUR-1499

Grounds Maintenance Chemicals 

for Black Rock Golf Course

Item 

No.

Item Description / 

Formulation
Awarded Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price 

1 Acclaim Extra Nutrien Ag Solutions $515.00 $1,030.00 $499.99 $999.98 $613.19 $1,226.38

2 Aqua Shade Nutrien Ag Solutions $51.40 $1,028.00 $42.29 $845.80 $43.59 $871.80

3 Propiconazole 14.3% Nutrien Ag Solutions $45.00 $675.00 $42.99 $644.85 $61.20 $918.00 *

4
Propamocarb Hydrochloride

66.2%

Helena Agri Enterprises, 

LLC
$293.00 $4,688.00 $315.00 $5,040.00 $313.53 $5,016.48 *

5 Bensumec – 4LF
Helena Agri Enterprises, 

LLC
$116.00 $2,900.00 $134.50 $3,362.50 $146.51 $3,662.75

6
Thiophonate Methyl

46.2%

Helena Agri Enterprises, 

LLC
$38.40 $7,680.00 $39.60 $7,920.00 $39.60 $7,920.00 *

7 Alumimum Tris WDG 80%
Helena Agri Enterprises, 

LLC
$14.00 $3,080.00 No Bid No Bid $17.47 $3,843.40 *

8 Crossbow SiteOne Landscape Supply $50.00 $750.00 $52.50 $787.50 $44.48 $667.20 *

9
Chlorothanlonil

54% 720 SFT
Nutrien Ag Solutions $38.00 $2,280.00 $33.40 $2,004.00 $35.00 $2,100.00 *

10
Chlorpyrifos 4E

42.5%

Helena Agri Enterprises, 

LLC
$44.00 $440.00 $49.99 $499.90 $59.20 $592.00

11 Dylox 420 SL
Helena Agri Enterprises, 

LLC
$68.50 $1,370.00 $72.49 $1,449.80 $81.56 $1,631.20

12 Fore WSP Nutrien Ag Solutions $8.20 $3,542.40 $7.77 $3,356.64 $8.88 $3,836.16

13 Head Way SiteOne Landscape Supply $438.00 $3,504.00 $438.00 $3,504.00 $438.00 $3,504.00

14
Tebuconazole

38.7%

Helena Agri Enterprises, 

LLC
$49.55 $6,193.75 $59.88 $1,497.00 $61.25 $1,531.25

15 Imidacloprid 75%
Helena Agri Enterprises, 

LLC
$375.00 $750.00 $425.04 $850.08 $75.41 $150.82 *

16 PCNB 40% SiteOne Landscape Supply $58.75 $1,762.50 No Bid No Bid $57.06 $1,711.80 *

17 Pendulum Aqua Cap SiteOne Landscape Supply $58.00 $1,740.00 $49.99 $1,499.70 $43.05 $1,291.50 *

18
Trinexapac – Ethyl 

11.3%

Helena Agri Enterprises, 

LLC
$102.00 $1,020.00 $103.88 $1,038.80 $112.00 $1,120.00 *

19 Prograss
Helena Agri Enterprises, 

LLC
$138.10 $6,214.50 * $144.44 $6,499.80 $169.37 $7,621.65

20 Provaunt WDG SiteOne Landscape Supply $1,526.40 $3,052.80 $1,526.40 $3,052.80 $1,526.40 $3,052.80

Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC 

Knoxville, MD

Total Price

Nutrien Ag Solutions 

Rosedale, MD

Total Price

SiteOne Landscape Supply 

Cleveland, OH

Total Price

1 Bids Opened: 5/05/2021



PUR-1499

Grounds Maintenance Chemicals 

for Black Rock Golf Course

Item 

No.

Item Description / 

Formulation
Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

21 Glyphosate 41%
Helena Agri Enterprises, 

LLC
$14.00 $280.00 No Bid No Bid $24.00 $480.00 *

22
Mefenoxam 

22.5%

Helena Agri Enterprises, 

LLC
$335.00 $1,675.00 * $368.00 $1,840.00 $406.88 $2,034.40 *

23 Talstar Nutrien Ag Solutions $48.91 $391.28 $42.99 $343.92 $49.00 $392.00
*   

*

24 Trimec Classic Nutrien Ag Solutions $39.00 $780.00 $21.99 $439.80 $28.00 $560.00 *

25
Paclobutrazol

22.3%

Helena Agri Enterprises, 

LLC
$133.00 $399.00 $154.40 $463.20 $212.44 $637.32 *

26 Phosguard Nutrien Ag Solutions No Bid No Bid $16.17 $3,234.00 $20.00 $4,000.00 *

27 Bayleton FLO Nutrien Ag Solutions $554.00 $22,160.00 $554.00 $22,160.00 $554.00 $22,160.00

28 Dismiss NXT SiteOne Landscape Supply $2,300.00 $6,900.00 $2,300.00 $6,900.00 $2,300.00 $6,900.00

29 Fluazinam 40SC Nutrien Ag Solutions $335.00 $13,400.00 $299.99 $11,999.60 $356.25 $14,250.00 *

30 Poa Constrictor Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC $118.00 $1,416.00 * $140.25 $1,262.25 $140.25 $1,262.25

31 Signature XTRA
Helena Agri Enterprises, 

LLC
$31.81 $2,624.33 * $31.82 $2,625.15 * $175.00 $2,625.00 *

32 Barricade
Helena Agri Enterprises, 

LLC
$137.00 $1,370.00 $143.00 $1,430.00 $143.00 $1,430.00

33 Mancozeb
Helena Agri Enterprises, 

LLC
$4.15 $1,867.50 $4.54 $2,043.00 $5.00 $2,280.00 *

34 Fairway Select SiteOne Landscape Supply No Bid No Bid $212.80 $10,640.00 $212.00 $10,600.00
* 

*

35 Emerald Nutrien Ag Solutions $1,204.50 $4,818.00 $1,063.30 $4,253.20 $1,063.30 $4,253.20

36 Evade 4FL SiteOne Landscape Supply No Bid No Bid $78.99 $1,579.80 $75.00 $1,500.00 *

37 Iprodione 23.3% Nutrien Ag Solutions $55.00 $3,300.00 $54.40 $3,264.00 $59.00 $3,540.00
* 

*

SiteOne Landscape Supply 

Cleveland, OH

Total Price

Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC 

Knoxville, MD

Total Price

Nutrien Ag Solutions 

Rosedale, MD

Total Price

2 Bids Opened: 5/05/2021



PUR-1499

Grounds Maintenance Chemicals 

for Black Rock Golf Course

Remarks / Exceptions:

Genesis Turfgrass, Inc.

Helena Agri Enterprises, 

LLC
#30 12 Bottles

#3 Spectator Ultra

#4 Karma

#6 Lesco T-Storm

#7 Fosetyl-al

#9 Manicure 6Fl

#15

#16 Turfcide PCNB

#17 Lesco Pre-M AquaCap

#18 T-Nex

#21 Prosecutor Pro

#22 Case Type:  2.5 Gallon/Cont.

#23

#24 Three-Way Selective

#25 Pac-Low

#26

#29

#31

#33

#34

#36

#37

Bandit 75WSP; Case Type:  4/1.6 oz. pkts. x 4 boxes/Case; Total Price:  Per 2 cases per 4/1.6 oz. pkts. x 4 boxes

Non-Responsive - Did not submit Revised Proposal Form

SiteOne Landscape Supply

Bifenthrin 7.9F

Lesco Stonewall 4L

FlexGuard; Case Type:  5 x 1 Gallon

Case Type:  (Agency); Unit of Measure per Bag

Brandt Liqui-Phi 0-0-25

Nutrien Ag Solutions - Item Nos. 1, 2, 3, 9, 12, 23, 24, 26, 27, 29, 35, 37

SiteOne Landscape Supply - Item Nos. 8, 13, 16, 17, 20, 28, 34, 36

Lesco 18 Plus

Case Type:  456 lbs.

Traction

Ground Maintenance Chemicals awarded to:

Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC - Item Nos. 4, 5, 6, 7, 10, 11, 14, 15, 18, 19, 21, 22, 25, 30, 31, 32, 33

3 Bids Opened: 5/05/2021


