PUR-1464

Grounds Maintenance Chemicals
for Black Rock Golf Course

Nutrien Ag Solutions

Helena Agri Enterprises, LLC

SiteOne Landscape Supply

Genesis Turfgrass, Inc.

Synatek Solutions

Rosedale, MD Knoxville, MD Frederick, MD Glen Rock, PA Souderton, PA
Item Item Description / Formulation Estimated Annual unit of Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
No. Usage / Case Type Measure
1 |Acclaim Extra 2-Gallons Gallon $493.45 $505.00 $540.00 $526.00 $555.56
5 Cases /4 x 1 Gallon
2 |Aqua Shade 4 Gallons per Case Gallon $44.00 $49.00 $43.00 $45.85 $64.30
. 3 Cases /2 x 2.5 Gallons
0
3 |Propiconazole 14.3% 5 Gallons per Case Gallon $43.00 $49.75 $68.00 $49.80 $52.34
Propamocarb Hydrochloride 8 Cases / 2 x 1 Gallon
4 66.2% 2 Gallons per Case Gallon $296.94 $302.00 $350.00 $330.00 $300.00
5 Cases / 2 x 2.5 Gallons
5 Bensumec — 4LF 5 Gallons per Case Gallon $124.30 $115.00 $141.25 $120.00 $151.45
Thiophonate Methyl 40 Cases / 2 x 2.5 Gallons
6 46.2% 5 Gallons per Case Gallon $39.99 $41.50 $42.00 $43.60 $47.69
. . 10 Cases /4 x 5.5 Ibs.
0,
7 |Alumimum Tris WDG 80% 22 Ibs. per Case Pound NO BID $13.50 $13.25 $13.10 $16.60
15 Gallons / 2 x 2.5 Gallons
8 [Crosshow 5 Gallons per Case Gallon $45.90 $41.00 $41.70 $41.60 $51.34
Chlorothanlonil 12 Cases /2 x 2. 5 Gallons
9 549 720 SET 5 Gallons per Case Gallon $37.23 $40.80 $40.40 $39.50 $41.00
Chlorpyrifos 4E 2 Cases / 2 x 2.5 Gallons
10 42 50 5 Gallons per Case Gallon $48.49 $46.00 $64.00 $43.00 $55.82
4 Cases /2 x 2.5 Gallons
11 |Dylox 420 SL 5 Gallons per Case Pound $71.89 $64.00 $74.21 $69.60 $77.47
9-Cases /8 x4 x 1.5 Ibs.
12 [Fore WSP 48 Ibs. per Case Pound $7.42 $7.70 $34.65 $7.25 $9.87
4-Cases /2 x 1 Gallon
13 |Head Way 2 Gallons per Case Gallon $438.00 $438.00 $438.00 $438.00 $438.00
Tebuconazole 23-Gallons / 4 x 1 Gallon
14 38.704 5 3/4 Gallons per Case Gallon $61.73 $49.75 $74.38 $61.95 $65.70
. . 2-Cases /
0,
15 |Imidacloprid 75% 88 x 1.6 0z per Case Case $370.48 $385.00 $77.25 $347.00 $359.10
16 |PCNB 40% 6-Cases/2x2.5Gallons | ), NO BID $57.06 $55.45 $57.06 NO BID
5 Gallon Case
6-Cases / 2 x 2.5 Gallons
17 |Pendulum Aqua Cap 5 Gallon Case Gallon $48.88 $56.00 $68.92 $59.00 $68.92
Trinexapac — Ethyl 2-Cases / 2 x 2.5 Gallons
18 11.3% 5 Gallons per Case Gallon $101.00 $102.00 $132.88 $103.60 $110.00
9-Cases / 2 x 2.5 Gallons
19 |Prograss 5 Gallons per Case Gallon $132.00 $140.00 $157.28 $146.80 NO BID
20  |Provaunt Sz)ﬁzsii Case $1,526.40 $1,526.40 $2,556.00 $1,526.40 $1,526.40
4-Cases / 2 x 2.5 Gallons
0
21 |Glyphosate 41% 5 Gallons per Case Gallon $12.99 $14.00 $17.92 $12.60 $14.88
Mefenoxam 2.5 Cases/ 2 x 1 Case
22 99 504 5 Gallon Cases Gallon $354.15 $337.80 $414.88 $365.00 $350.00
23 |Talstar 4 x 1-Gallon Gallon $49.00 $51.00 $57.81 $50.00 $52.50
4 Gallons per Case
24 |Trimec Classic 20-Gallons /2 x 2.5 Gallons| . $20.88 $36.00 $46.00 $38.90 $42.10
/'5 Gallons per Case
Paclobutrazol 3-Gallons
25 99 304 2 x 1 Gallon Cases Gallon $148.77 $144.00 $220.00 $161.50 $181.23
26 |Phosguard 200-Gallons Gallon $13.77 NO BID $20.00 $18.00 NO BID
2 X 2.5 Gallon Cases
27 |Bayleton FLO 36-Gallons /2 x 2.5 Gallons| ., $554.00 $554.00 $554.00 $488.00 $488.00

/' 5 Gallons per case
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Item Item Description / Formulation Estimated Annual Unit of Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
No. Usage/Case Type Measure
_— 5-Gallons /
28 |Dismiss NXT 60 Ounce Bottles Gallon $2,596.00 $2,596.00 $649.00 $649.00 $1,384.53
29 |Fluazinam 40SC 40-Gallons /2x 2.5 Gallons| ), $335.45 $368.80 NO BID $359.00 $373.09
/'5 Gallons per case
30 |Poa Constrictor 7-Gallons / Gallon $129.40 $118.80 NO BID $149.00 NO BID
96 Ounce Bottles ' ' '
. 75 Ibs. /
31 |Signature XTRA 5.5 Pound Bags Pound $31.82 $31.81 $175.00 $31.82 $30.00
. 10-Gallons
32 [Barricade 4 % 1 Gallon Case Gallon $143.00 $143.00 $143.00 $143.00 $143.00
33 |Mancozeb 450 lbs. Pound $4.05 $3.95 $4.88 $4.58 $5.49
12 Ib. bags ' ' ' ' '
34 |Fairway Select S0Gallon/2x25Gallon |\ $212.80 NO BID NO BID $157.50 $167.06

/' 5 Gallons per Case

Remarks / Exceptions:
Helena Item 28 Case

Item No. 28 - Case

Remarks / Exceptions:
SiteOne Landscape Supply

Item No. 3 - Lesco Spectator Ultra

Item No. 4 - Proplant

Item No. 6 - Lesco T-Storm
Item No. 7 - Fosetyl-al

Item No. 8 - Candor

Item No. 9 - Manicure 6FL
Item No. 13 - Agency

Item No. 15 - Lesco Bandit 75WSP (4x4x1.60z/Case)

Item No. 16 - Turf Cide
Item No. 18 - T-Nex
Item No. 20 - (24x120z)

Item No. 21- Lesco Prosecutor Pro

Item No. 25 - Pac-Low

Item No. 26 - Brandt Liqui-Phi 0-0-25

Item No. 27 - (Agency)

Item No. 28 - (Agency) Container

Item No. 31 - (Agency) 5.5 Ib Container

Item No. 32 - (Agency)

Alternates are clearly written out. Labels / Specifications are enclosed.
Agency - Pricing strictly set by manufacturers.
#28 Dismiss NXT & #31 Signature XTRA - Unit of measure changed to

Container size due to Agency pricing not evenly broken down to units of measure.

Remarks / Exceptions:
Genesis Turfgrass, Inc.

Item No. 31 Signature XTRA - Cost per Ib is 31.818181 rounding up to 31.82 (Agency Price Cost)
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