
Bid

Item

No.

Description /

(Delivered Price per

Unit of Measure)

Delivered

Price

Per

Unit

of

Measure

Chem2o, LLC

Herndon, PA

JCI Jones 

Chemicals, Inc.

Milford, VA

1
Liquid Chlorine

(City of Hagerstown)
Cylinder

1-Ton

Cylinder 
N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $600.00

2
Aqueous Ammonia 19%

(City of Hagerstown)
Pound

Pound

Bulk
N/A $0.1639 * No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3
Ferric Chloride

(City of Hagerstown)

Dry

Ton

Dry

Ton
N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4
Sodium Hypochlorite

(City of Hagerstown) 
Gallon

Gallon

Bulk
$2.16 No Bid $1.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid

5
12.5% Sodium Hypochlorite

(City of Hagerstown)
Gallon

Gallon

Bulk
$2.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6
Powdered Activated Carbon

(City of Hagerstown) 
Ton

50-Pound

Bag
N/A No Bid No Bid $1,891.1290 * No Bid No Bid

7
Polyaluminum Chloride (PAC)

(City of Hagerstown) 

Wet

Ton

Wet

Ton
N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8
Cyanuric Acid

(City of Hagerstown) 
Pound Pound $2.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9

Caustic Soda

(Sodium Hydroxide)

(City of Hagerstown)

Gallon
Gallon

Bulk
N/A $0.898 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10
Sulfuric Acid 93% - 95%

(City of Hagerstown) 
Gallon

Gallon

Bulk
N/A $1.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11
Calcium Chloride

(City of Hagerstown)
Pound

50-Pound

Container
$1.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12
Sodium Hypochlorite

(Washington County DWQ)
Gallon

55-Gallon

Drum
$12.90 $2.89 * No Bid $4.4497 * No Bid No Bid

13
Potassium Permanganate

(City of Hagerstown) 
Pound

55-Pound

Pail
N/A $3.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

14

Caustic Soda

(Sodium Hydroxide)

(Washington County DWQ)

Gallon 
55-Gallon

Drum
N/A $3.17 * No Bid $1.8984 * No Bid No Bid

15
Ferrous Chloride Solution

(Washington County DWQ)
Gallon 

Gallon

Bulk
N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

16A
Hydrofluosilicic Acid (H2SiF6)

(Washington County DWQ)
Gallon 

15-Gallon

Pail
N/A No Bid No Bid $8.2171 * No Bid No Bid

16B
Hydrofluosilicic Acid (H2SiF6)

(Washington County DWQ)
Gallon

55-Gallon

Drum
N/A No Bid No Bid $4.3571 * No Bid No Bid

16C
Hydrofluosilicic Acid (H2SiF6)

(City of Hagerstown)
Gallon

Gallon

Mini Bulk
N/A No Bid No Bid $7.0764 No Bid No Bid

16D
Hydrofluosilicic Acid (H2SiF6)

(City of Hagerstown)
Gallon

15-Gallon 

Drum
N/A No Bid No Bid $3.3545 No Bid No Bid

PUR-1445

Swimming Pool / Water / WasteWater Treatment Chemicals

Amato Industries, 

Inc./Amchlor

Silver Spring, MD

George S. Coyne 

Chemical Company 

Inc.

Innovative Water 

Care

Alphoretta, GA

Brenntag 

Northeast, LLC

Reading, PA
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Bid

Item

No.

Description /

(Delivered Price per

Unit of Measure)

Delivered

Price

Per

Unit

of

Measure

Chem2o, LLC

Herndon, PA

JCI Jones 

Chemicals, Inc.

Milford, VA

PUR-1445

Swimming Pool / Water / WasteWater Treatment Chemicals

Amato Industries, 

Inc./Amchlor

Silver Spring, MD

George S. Coyne 

Chemical Company 

Inc.

Innovative Water 

Care

Alphoretta, GA

Brenntag 

Northeast, LLC

Reading, PA

17

DelPac 2000 (Polyaluminum 

Chloride Hydroxide Sulfate 

Solution)

(Washington County DWQ)

Pound
Pound

Bulk
N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

18

3” Tablet Chlorine 

(Calcium Hypochlorite)

(City of Hagerstown DWQ) 

Pound
50 - 100

Pound Drum
$2.50 * No Bid No Bid $2.3687 * $2.115 * No Bid

19
Sodium Hypochlorite

(Washington County Parks)
Gallon 

55-Gallon

Drum
$12.90 * No Bid $2.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid

20
Cyanuric Acid

(Washington County Parks)
Pound Pound $2.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

21
Calcium Chloride

(Washington County Parks)
Pound

50-Pound

Container
$1.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

22
Muriatic Acid

(Washington County Parks)
Pound

15-Gallon

Pail

Pound

$20.00 * No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

23

Sodium Bisulfite 

(38% - 40%)

(City of Hagerstown) 

Pound
600-Pound

Drum
N/A No Bid No Bid $0.2698 No Bid No Bid

24

DelPAC 2020 (Polyaluminum 

Hydroxychlorosulfate Solution)

(Washington County DWQ) 

Gallon
55-Gallon

Drum
N/A No Bid No Bid $5.4398 * No Bid No Bid

25
Sodium Fluorosilicate

(City of Hagerstown) 
Pound

50-Pound

Bag
N/A No Bid No Bid $0.6956 No Bid No Bid

26
Defoamer – Anti-Foam

(City of Hagerstown)
Gallon 55-Gallon N/A No Bid No Bid $9.0988 * No Bid No Bid

27

Thioguard (55% - 65% 

Magnesium Hydroxide)

(City of Hagerstown)

Gallon
Gallon

Bulk
N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

28
Methanol

(City of Hagerstown) 
Gallon

Gallon

Bulk
N/A $1.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

29
Bacterial Enzymatic Powder

(Washington County DWQ) 
Pound

50-Pound

Containers

(1/2 pound

packets)

N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

30

Poly-Orthophosphate Solution

(SLI-5250)

(City of Hagerstown)

Pound
Pound

Bulk
N/A No Bid No Bid $0.4321 * No Bid No Bid

31A

50% Caustic Soda

(Sodium Hydroxide)

(City of Hagerstown)

Gallon
Gallon

Bulk
N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

31B

25% Caustic Soda 

(Sodium Hydroxide)

(City of Hagerstown) 

Gallon
Gallon

Bulk
N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bid

Item

No.

Description /

(Delivered Price per

Unit of Measure)

Delivered

Price

Per

Unit

of

Measure

Chem2o, LLC

Herndon, PA

JCI Jones 

Chemicals, Inc.

Milford, VA

PUR-1445

Swimming Pool / Water / WasteWater Treatment Chemicals

Amato Industries, 

Inc./Amchlor

Silver Spring, MD

George S. Coyne 

Chemical Company 

Inc.

Innovative Water 

Care

Alphoretta, GA

Brenntag 

Northeast, LLC

Reading, PA

32

DelPac 2000 

(Aluminum Chloride Hydroxide 

Sulfate) 

(Washington County DWQ)

Gallon
55-Gallon

Drum
N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

33
Liquid Aluminum Sulfate

(Washington County DWQ)
Gallon

Gallon

Bulk
N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

34
MicroC 2000

(Washington County DWQ)
Gallon

240-Gallon

Totes
N/A No Bid No Bid $3.9745 * No Bid No Bid

35
Polymer (Zetag 8814)

(City of Hagerstown)
Gallon

Gallon

Bulk
N/A No Bid No Bid $11.9969 No Bid No Bid

36
Morton Salt

(City of Hagerstown)
Pound Pound Bulk N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

37
Magnetite

(Washington County DWQ)
Pound Pound Bulk N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Remarks / Exceptions:

George S. Coye Chemical Co. Inc.

Item No. 18 (50-lb) Item No. 6 (Minimum 8,000 lbs. per delivery)

Item No. 12 (4 drums minimum combined delivery)

Item No. 14 (Ten drums minimum per delivery)

Item No. 16A (5 drums minimum per delivery)

Brenntag Northeast LLC. Item No. 16B (3 drums minimum per delivery)

Item No. 18 (Minimum 2 pallets per delivery)

Item No. 24 (Minimum 4 drums per delivery)

Item No. 14 (Minimum delivery of 4 drums) Item No. 26 (Minimum 2 drums per delivery)

Item No. 30 (Bidding CP-722)

Item No. 34 (Minimum three totes per delivery)

Innovative Water Care

*Item No. 18 (50 lb pails delivered 24x units on a pallet net 1200 lbs.)

Item No. 12 (Minimum delivery 4 drums)

Remarks / Exceptions:

Item No. 22 ($3,000.00 / 15-Gal Drum No Deposit)

Item No. 2 (Solution Pound)

Amato

Item No. 19 ($2.41 Gallon Bulk Only)

Corrected calculations based on Unit Pricing
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Bid

Item

No.

Description /

(Delivered Price per

Unit of Measure)

Delivered

Price

Per

Unit

of

Measure

Kuehne Chemical 

Company, Inc.

Kearny, NJ

1
Liquid Chlorine

(City of Hagerstown)
Cylinder

1-Ton

Cylinder 
$1,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2
Aqueous Ammonia 19%

(City of Hagerstown)
Pound

Pound

Bulk
No Bid No Bid $0.155 * No Bid No Bid

3
Ferric Chloride

(City of Hagerstown)

Dry

Ton

Dry

Ton
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $653.00 *

4
Sodium Hypochlorite

(City of Hagerstown) 
Gallon

Gallon

Bulk
$5.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5
12.5% Sodium Hypochlorite

(City of Hagerstown)
Gallon

Gallon

Bulk
$5.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.98

6
Powdered Activated Carbon

(City of Hagerstown) 
Ton

50-Pound

Bag
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7
Polyaluminum Chloride (PAC)

(City of Hagerstown) 

Wet

Ton

Wet

Ton
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8
Cyanuric Acid

(City of Hagerstown) 
Pound Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9

Caustic Soda

(Sodium Hydroxide)

(City of Hagerstown)

Gallon
Gallon

Bulk
$1.3333 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10
Sulfuric Acid 93% - 95%

(City of Hagerstown) 
Gallon

Gallon

Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11
Calcium Chloride

(City of Hagerstown)
Pound

50-Pound

Container
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12
Sodium Hypochlorite

(Washington County DWQ)
Gallon

55-Gallon

Drum
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

13
Potassium Permanganate

(City of Hagerstown) 
Pound

55-Pound

Pail
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

14

Caustic Soda

(Sodium Hydroxide)

(Washington County DWQ)

Gallon 
55-Gallon

Drum
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

15
Ferrous Chloride Solution

(Washington County DWQ)
Gallon 

Gallon

Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

16A
Hydrofluosilicic Acid (H2SiF6)

(Washington County DWQ)
Gallon 

15-Gallon

Pail
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

16B
Hydrofluosilicic Acid (H2SiF6)

(Washington County DWQ)
Gallon

55-Gallon

Drum
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

16C
Hydrofluosilicic Acid (H2SiF6)

(City of Hagerstown)
Gallon

Gallon

Mini Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

16D
Hydrofluosilicic Acid (H2SiF6)

(City of Hagerstown)
Gallon

15-Gallon 

Drum
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Maryland Biochemical 

Company, Inc.

Bel Air, MD

Maryland Chemical 

Company, Inc.

Baltimore, MD

Premier Magnesia, LLC 

Waynesville, NC

PVS Minibulk, Inc.

Detroit, MI

PUR-1445

Swimming Pool / Water / WasteWater Treatment Chemicals
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Bid

Item

No.

Description /

(Delivered Price per

Unit of Measure)

Delivered

Price

Per

Unit

of

Measure

Kuehne Chemical 

Company, Inc.

Kearny, NJ

Maryland Biochemical 

Company, Inc.

Bel Air, MD

Maryland Chemical 

Company, Inc.

Baltimore, MD

Premier Magnesia, LLC 

Waynesville, NC

PVS Minibulk, Inc.

Detroit, MI

PUR-1445

Swimming Pool / Water / WasteWater Treatment Chemicals

17

DelPac 2000 (Polyaluminum 

Chloride Hydroxide Sulfate 

Solution)

(Washington County DWQ)

Pound
Pound

Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

18

3” Tablet Chlorine 

(Calcium Hypochlorite)

(City of Hagerstown DWQ) 

Pound
50 - 100

Pound Drum
No Bid No Bid $2.325 * No Bid No Bid

19
Sodium Hypochlorite

(Washington County Parks)
Gallon 

55-Gallon

Drum
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

20
Cyanuric Acid

(Washington County Parks)
Pound Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

21
Calcium Chloride

(Washington County Parks)
Pound

50-Pound

Container
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

22
Muriatic Acid

(Washington County Parks)
Pound

15-Gallon

Pail

Pound

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

23

Sodium Bisulfite 

(38% - 40%)

(City of Hagerstown) 

Pound
600-Pound

Drum
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

24

DelPAC 2020 (Polyaluminum 

Hydroxychlorosulfate Solution)

(Washington County DWQ) 

Gallon
55-Gallon

Drum
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

25
Sodium Fluorosilicate

(City of Hagerstown) 
Pound

50-Pound

Bag
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

26
Defoamer – Anti-Foam

(City of Hagerstown)
Gallon 55-Gallon No Bid $7.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid

27

Thioguard (55% - 65% 

Magnesium Hydroxide)

(City of Hagerstown)

Gallon
Gallon

Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.69 * No Bid

28
Methanol

(City of Hagerstown) 
Gallon

Gallon

Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

29
Bacterial Enzymatic Powder

(Washington County DWQ) 
Pound

50-Pound

Containers

(1/2 pound

packets)

No Bid $9.83 * $9.28 * No Bid No Bid

30

Poly-Orthophosphate Solution

(SLI-5250)

(City of Hagerstown)

Pound
Pound

Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

31A

50% Caustic Soda

(Sodium Hydroxide)

(City of Hagerstown)

Gallon
Gallon

Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

31B

25% Caustic Soda 

(Sodium Hydroxide)

(City of Hagerstown) 

Gallon
Gallon

Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.59
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Bid

Item

No.

Description /

(Delivered Price per

Unit of Measure)

Delivered

Price

Per

Unit

of

Measure

Kuehne Chemical 

Company, Inc.

Kearny, NJ

Maryland Biochemical 

Company, Inc.

Bel Air, MD

Maryland Chemical 

Company, Inc.

Baltimore, MD

Premier Magnesia, LLC 

Waynesville, NC

PVS Minibulk, Inc.

Detroit, MI

PUR-1445

Swimming Pool / Water / WasteWater Treatment Chemicals

32

DelPac 2000 

(Aluminum Chloride Hydroxide 

Sulfate) 

(Washington County DWQ)

Gallon
55-Gallon

Drum
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

33
Liquid Aluminum Sulfate

(Washington County DWQ)
Gallon

Gallon

Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

34
MicroC 2000

(Washington County DWQ)
Gallon

240-Gallon

Totes
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

35
Polymer (Zetag 8814)

(City of Hagerstown)
Gallon

Gallon

Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

36
Morton Salt

(City of Hagerstown)
Pound Pound No Bid No Bid $0.249 * No Bid No Bid

37
Magnetite

(Washington County DWQ)
Pound Pound Bulk No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Maryland Biochemical Co.

Item No. 29 (Shipped in 25 pound plastic bucket 50-8oz bags)

Maryland Chemical Co.

Item No. 2 (Minimum 45,000 # delivery specifications provided upon request)

Item No. 18 (55 lb pails Accutabs SI minimum order 36x55lb / pallet  1,980lbs)

Item No. 29 (packaged in 25lb containers MD Grease Buster incumbent product)

Item No. 36 (Minimum delivery 2 skids 49x50 lb/skid clean & protect)

Premier Magnesia, LLC

Item No. 27 (Equivalent wet lb pricing is $0.209/wet lb.)

PVS Minibulk, Inc.

Item No. 3 (Minibulk delivered, True minibulk Deliveries, with PVS Driver on each delivery)

Remarks / Exceptions:
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Bid

Item

No.

Description /

(Delivered Price per

Unit of Measure)

Deliverd 

Price 

Per

Unit of 

Measure

PVS Technologies, 

Inc.

Detroit, MI

Shannon Chemical 

Corporation

Malvern, PA

Pencco   

Felipe, Texas

1
Liquid Chlorine

(City of Hagerstown)
Cylinder

1-Ton

Cylinder 
No Bid No Bid $850.00 No Bid No Bid

2
Aqueous Ammonia 19%

(City of Hagerstown)
Pound

Pound

Bulk
No Bid No Bid $0.165 No Bid No Bid

3
Ferric Chloride

(City of Hagerstown)
Dry Ton

Dry

Ton
$567.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4
Sodium Hypochlorite

(City of Hagerstown) 
Gallon

Gallon

Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5
12.5% Sodium Hypochlorite

(City of Hagerstown)
Gallon

Gallon

Bulk
No Bid No Bid $2.25 No Bid No Bid

6
Powdered Activated Carbon

(City of Hagerstown) 
Ton

50-Pound

Bag
No Bid No Bid $2,900.00 * No Bid No Bid

7
Polyaluminum Chloride (PAC)

(City of Hagerstown) 
Wet Ton

Wet

Ton
No Bid No Bid No Bid $318.40 No Bid

8
Cyanuric Acid

(City of Hagerstown) 
Pound Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9

Caustic Soda

(Sodium Hydroxide)

(City of Hagerstown)

Gallon
Gallon

Bulk
No Bid No Bid $0.823 * No Bid No Bid

10
Sulfuric Acid 93% - 95%

(City of Hagerstown) 
Gallon

Gallon

Bulk
No Bid No Bid $1.91 * No Bid No Bid

11
Calcium Chloride

(City of Hagerstown)
Pound

50-Pound

Container
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12
Sodium Hypochlorite

(Washington County DWQ)
Gallon

55-Gallon

Drum
No Bid No Bid $2.39 * No Bid No Bid

13
Potassium Permanganate

(City of Hagerstown) 
Pound

55-Pound

Pail
No Bid No Bid $3.40 No Bid No Bid

14

Caustic Soda

(Sodium Hydroxide)

(Washington County DWQ)

Gallon 
55-Gallon

Drum
No Bid No Bid $2.96 * No Bid No Bid

15
Ferrous Chloride Solution

(Washington County DWQ)
Gallon 

Gallon

Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

16A
Hydrofluosilicic Acid (H2SiF6)

(Washington County DWQ)
Gallon 

15-Gallon

Pail
No Bid No Bid $9.980 * No Bid No Bid

16B
Hydrofluosilicic Acid (H2SiF6)

(Washington County DWQ)
Gallon

55-Gallon

Drum
No Bid No Bid $5.65 * No Bid No Bid

16C
Hydrofluosilicic Acid (H2SiF6)

(City of Hagerstown)
Gallon

Gallon

Mini Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

16D
Hydrofluosilicic Acid (H2SiF6)

(City of Hagerstown)
Gallon

15-Gallon 

Drum
No Bid No Bid $9.98 * No Bid No Bid

Univar Solutions USA, 

Inc. (FKA Univar USA 

Inc.)

USALCO Baltimore 

Plant, LLC

Baltimore, MD

PUR-1445

Swimming Pool / Water / WasteWater Treatment Chemicals
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Bid

Item

No.

Description /

(Delivered Price per

Unit of Measure)

Deliverd 

Price 

Per

Unit of 

Measure

PVS Technologies, 

Inc.

Detroit, MI

Shannon Chemical 

Corporation

Malvern, PA

Pencco   

Felipe, Texas

Univar Solutions USA, 

Inc. (FKA Univar USA 

Inc.)

USALCO Baltimore 

Plant, LLC

Baltimore, MD

PUR-1445

Swimming Pool / Water / WasteWater Treatment Chemicals

17

DelPac 2000 (Polyaluminum 

Chloride Hydroxide Sulfate 

Solution)

(Washington County DWQ)

Pound
Pound

Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1389 * No Bid

18

3” Tablet Chlorine 

(Calcium Hypochlorite)

(City of Hagerstown DWQ) 

Pound
50 - 100

Pound Drum
No Bid No Bid $2.12 * No Bid No Bid

19
Sodium Hypochlorite

(Washington County Parks)
Gallon 

55-Gallon

Drum
No Bid No Bid $2.39 * No Bid No Bid

20
Cyanuric Acid

(Washington County Parks)
Pound Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

21
Calcium Chloride

(Washington County Parks)
Pound

50-Pound

Container
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

22
Muriatic Acid

(Washington County Parks)
Pound

15-Gallon

Pail

Pound

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

23

Sodium Bisulfite 

(38% - 40%)

(City of Hagerstown) 

Pound
600-Pound

Drum
No Bid No Bid $0.2878 No Bid No Bid

24

DelPAC 2020 (Polyaluminum 

Hydroxychlorosulfate Solution)

(Washington County DWQ) 

Gallon
55-Gallon

Drum
No Bid No Bid $4.59 No Bid No Bid

25
Sodium Fluorosilicate

(City of Hagerstown) 
Pound

50-Pound

Bag
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

26
Defoamer – Anti-Foam

(City of Hagerstown)
Gallon 55-Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

27

Thioguard (55% - 65% 

Magnesium Hydroxide)

(City of Hagerstown)

Gallon
Gallon

Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

28
Methanol

(City of Hagerstown) 
Gallon

Gallon

Bulk
No Bid No Bid $1.65 No Bid No Bid

29
Bacterial Enzymatic Powder

(Washington County DWQ) 
Pound

50-Pound

Containers

(1/2 pound

packets)

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

30

Poly-Orthophosphate Solution

(SLI-5250)

(City of Hagerstown)

Pound
Pound

Bulk
No Bid $0.442 No Bid No Bid No Bid

31A

50% Caustic Soda

(Sodium Hydroxide)

(City of Hagerstown)

Gallon
Gallon

Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

31B

25% Caustic Soda 

(Sodium Hydroxide)

(City of Hagerstown) 

Gallon
Gallon

Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bid

Item

No.

Description /

(Delivered Price per

Unit of Measure)

Deliverd 

Price 

Per

Unit of 

Measure

PVS Technologies, 

Inc.

Detroit, MI

Shannon Chemical 

Corporation

Malvern, PA

Pencco   

Felipe, Texas

Univar Solutions USA, 

Inc. (FKA Univar USA 

Inc.)

USALCO Baltimore 

Plant, LLC

Baltimore, MD

PUR-1445

Swimming Pool / Water / WasteWater Treatment Chemicals

32

DelPac 2000 

(Aluminum Chloride Hydroxide 

Sulfate) 

(Washington County DWQ)

Gallon
55-Gallon

Drum
No Bid No Bid $5.92 No Bid No Bid

33
Liquid Aluminum Sulfate

(Washington County DWQ)
Gallon

Gallon

Bulk
No Bid No Bid $1.65 No Bid No Bid

34
MicroC 2000

(Washington County DWQ)
Gallon

240-Gallon

Totes
No Bid No Bid $3.81 * No Bid No Bid

35
Polymer (Zetag 8814)

(City of Hagerstown)
Gallon

Gallon

Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

36
Morton Salt

(City of Hagerstown)
Pound Pound Bulk No Bid No Bid $0.21 * No Bid No Bid

37
Magnetite

(Washington County DWQ)
Pound Pound Bulk No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item No. 6 (40lb Bag Hydrodarco B Minimum order 50 bags - 1 pallet) Item No. 17 (per wet pound)

Item No. 9 (Caustic Soda (Sodium Hydroxide 25%)

Item No. 10 (Sulfuric Acid 93% 66B)

Item No. 12 (Minimum order 4 drums)

Item No. 14 (Minimum order 4 drums 25% Caustic Soda)

Item No. 16A (Assay Basis 23-25%)

Item No. 16B (Assay Basis 23-25%)

Item No. 16D (Assay Basis 23-25%)

Item No. 18 (24 pail minimum One Pallet)

Item No. 19 (Minimum order 4 drums)

Item No. 34 (265 gallon non-returnable tote)

Item No. 36 (49 Bag Minimum One Pallet)

Pencco - Sent a letter of No Bid

Univar Solutions USA, Inc. USALCO Baltimore Plant, LLC

Remarks / Exceptions: Remarks / Exceptions:
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