
PUR-1440

Recycling Drop-Off Center Services

Item

No.
Description

No. 

Trips

One

Trip
Total

No. 

Trips

One

Trip
Total

No. 

Trips

One

Trip
Total

1
Location No. 1:

Greensburg
115 $201.55 $23,178.25 115 $215.00 $24,725.00* 115 $260.54 $29,962.10

2
Location No. 2:

Kaetzel
90 $263.92 $23,752.80 90 $215.00 $19,350.00 90 $334.27 $30,084.30

3
Location No. 3:

Dargan
20 $291.77 $5,835.40 20 $215.00 $4,300.00 20 $404.16 $8,083.20

4
Location No. 4:

Hancock
40 $279.82 $11,192.80 40 $215.00 $8,600.00 40 $263.20 $10,528.00

5
Location No. 5:

Forty West Landfill
250 $141.62* $35,405.00* 250 $215.00 $53,750.00 250 $168.25 $42,062.50

Item

No.
Description

No. 

Trips

One

Trip
Total

No. 

Trips

One

Trip
Total

No. 

Trips

One

Trip
Total

1

1st Year:

Processing Dual 

Stream Recyclables

520 520 $50.00 $26,000.00 520 $93.75 $48,750.00

2

2nd Year:

Processing Dual 

Stream Recyclables

520 520 $51.25 $26,650.00 520 $98.44 $51,188.80

3

3rd Year:

Processing Dual 

Stream Recyclables

520 520 $52.53 $27,315.60 520 $103.36 $53,747.20

TOTAL SUM BID

 (Hauling of Single 

Stream Recyclables 

Locations 1 thru 5)

$110,725.00*

No Bid

TOTAL SUM BID

Three (3) Year Period - 

(Processing Single 

Stream Recycleables)

No Bid

No Bid

BFI Waste Services dba 

Republic Services

Hagerstown, MD

Apple Valley Waste

Kearneysville, WV

No Bid

Waste Management of 

Pennsylvania, Inc.

Greencastle, PA

OPTION NO. 1 - HAULING OF SINGLE STREAM RECYCLABLES

$120,720.10

$79,965.60 $153,686.00

OPTION NO. 2 - PROCESSING SINGLE STREAM RECYCLABLES

$99,364.25*

Bids Opened: 8-30-19 



PUR-1440

Recycling Drop-Off Center Services

BFI Waste Services dba 

Republic Services

Hagerstown, MD

Apple Valley Waste

Kearneysville, WV

Waste Management of 

Pennsylvania, Inc.

Greencastle, PA

Item

No.
Description

No. 

Trips

One

Trip
Total

No. 

Trips

One

Trip
Total

No. 

Trips

One

Trip
Total

4

FIRST YEAR:  8 

CY Minimum FEL 

Segregated 

Cardboard 

Containers

416 $40.52 $16,856.32 416 $75.00 $31,200.00 416 $33.11 $13,773.76

5

SECOND YEAR:  

8 CY Minimum FEL 

Segregated 

Cardboard 

Containers

416 $42.55 $17,700.80 416 $76.88 $31,982.08 416 $34.77 $14,464.32

6

THIRD YEAR:  

8 CY Minimum FEL 

Segregated 

Cardboard 

Containers

416 $44.68 $18,586.88 416 $78.80 $32,780.80* 416 $36.50 $15,184.00

Option No. 1 Item No. 5 Location No. 5*

Option No. 1 Item No. 1 Location No. 1*

Alternate No. 1 Third Year Item No. 6*

Apple Valley Waste

BFI/Republic Services

Notes/Exceptions

*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing

Option No. 2 Processing Dual Stream Recyclables - First Year Item No. 1 One (1) Trip

Option No. q11 11 - Hauling of recyclables is based on hauling the recyclables to Apple 

ALTERNATE NO. 1

Notes/Exceptions

$43,422.08$95,962.88*$53,144.00

TOTAL SUM BID 

Three (3) Year Period

(Alternate No. 1)

Bids Opened: 8-30-19 


