PUR 1431

Fire Service Performance Testing / Inspection
of Fire Hoses, Fire Pumps, and Ground Ladders

FireOne, Inc. Waterways of Southwest PA, LLC.
. Drexel Hill, PA Bethel Park, PA
OPTION NO. 1 (Award for All Services):
Item Descrintion Unit of Quantit Unit Total Unit Total
No. P Measure y Price/Each Price Price/Each Price
1 Fire Pump Testing EA 55 $275.00 $15,125.00 NO BID NO BID
Hose Testing — Di ter 1-1/2
2 _g,s,e esting — Diameter 1-1/ LF 73,000 $0.20 $14,600.00 NO BID NO BID
Hose Testing — Di ter 2-1/2
3 _g,s,e esting — Diameter 2-1/ LF 41,000 $0.22 $9,020.00 NO BID NO BID
Hose Testing — Diameter 4 —
4 5 LF 77,000 $0.24 $18,480.00 NO BID NO BID
5 Hose Testin - Hard Suction Ea 100 $10.00 $1,000.00 NO BID NO BID
Ground Ladder Testing — 10’
6 Folding (Attic) EA 52 $20.00 $1,040.00 NO BID NO BID
7 ft;?)lfiht Ladders Testing (12 EA 68 $30.00 $2,040.00 NO BID NO BID
E ion L Testi
8 (l)g?isgj) adders Testing EA 57 $40.00 $2,280.00 NO BID NO BID
E ion L P45
9 xtension Ladders (30° —45) EA 24 $45.00 $1,080.00 NO BID NO BID
TOTAL SUM BID PRICE
(for Item Nos. 1 through 9) $64,665.00
FireOne, Inc. Waterways of Southwest PA, LLC.
.. . D I Hill, PA Bethel Park, PA
OPTION NO. 2 (Individual Awards for Each Service): rexet At etetrark,

Item Descrintion Unit of Quantit Unit Total Unit Total
No. P Measure y Price/Each Price Price/Each Price
Gro‘l’p Al Eire Pump Testing EA 55 $275.00 $15,125.00 $325.00 $17,875.00

TOTAL SUM BID PRICE FOR GROUP A $15,125.00 $17,875.00

Bids Opened: 06-01-2019




PUR 1431
Fire Service Performance Testing / Inspection
of Fire Hoses, Fire Pumps, and Ground Ladders

Gm;p B ?gse Testing — Diameter 1-1/2 LF 73,000 $0.20 $14,600.00 $0.21 $15,330.00
Grogp B ?c;’s,e Testing — Diameter 2-1/2 LF 41,000 $0.22 $9,020.00 $0.21 $8.610.00
Gm;‘p B ?,f’se Testing — Diameter 4 — LF 77.000 $0.24 $18.480.00 $0.21 $16.170.00
Group B . .

5 Hose Testing - Hard Suction EA 100 $10.00 $1,000.00 $30.00 $3,000.00

TOTAL SUM BID PRICE FOR GROUP B $43,100.00 $43,110.00
Group C| Ground Ladder Testing — 10’

: Folding (Ao EA 52 $20.00 $1,040.00 $15.00 $780.00
erow © ft;?;%ht Ladders Testing (12 EA 68 $30.00 $2,040.00 $24.00 $1,632.00
Group C | Extension Ladders Testing EA 57 $40.00 $2,280.00 $36.00 $2,052.00

8 (16” - 28°)

Group C | Extension Ladders EA 24 $45.00 $1,080.00 $52.50 $1,260.00

9 (30’ — 45

TOTAL SUM BID PRICE FOR GROUP C $6,440.00 $5.724.00

REMARKS:

FireOne, Inc

Ground Ladder testing includes heat sensor replacement and safety label replacement as needed at no additional cost. Halyards can be replaced for $25.00 per
extension ladder.

Waterway's of Southwest PA, LLC

If heat sensors need replaced cost is $1.00 per sensor. If warning labels need replaced or missing cost is $10.00 per set. If any repairs are needed cost will be
discussed with department.

Bids Opened: 06-01-2019



