PUR-1426
Grounds Maintenance Chemicals
for Black Rock Golf Course

Genesis Turfgrass, Inc. Helena Agri Enterprises SiteOne Landscape Supply
Glen Rock, PA New Market, MD Frederick, MD
Item Item Description / Formulation Estimated Annual Unit of Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
No. Usage / Case Type Measure
1 [Acclaim Extra 2-Gallons Gallon $509.17 $494.00 $540.00
2 |Aqua Shade 5 Cases /4 x 1 Gallon Gallon $45.35 $49.00 $44.55
4 Gallons / Case
3 |Propiconazole 14.3% 3 Cases /2 x 2.5 Gallons Gallon $50.24 $49.75 $59.49 *
5 Gallons / Case
Propamocarb Hydrochloride 8 Cases /2 x 1 Gallon «
4 66.2% » Gallons / Case Gallon $322.75 $293.00 $350.33
5  |Bensumec — 4LF 5 Cases/2x 2.5 Gallons Gallon $111.88 $110.00 $142.82
5 Gallons / Case
Thiophonate Methyl 40 Cases / 2 x 2.5 Gallons *
6 46.2% 5 Gallons / Case Gallon $43.20 $44.00 $44.00
7 | Alumimum Tris WDG 80% 10 Cases /4 x 5.5 [bs. Pound $13.27 $13.45 No bid
22 Ibs. / Case
8 |Crossbow 15 Gallons /2 x 2.5 Gallons Gallon $41.44 $45.00 $52.28 *
5 Gallons / Case
Chlorothanlonil 12 Cases / 2 x 2. 5 Gallons *
9 54% 720 SET 5 Gallons / Case Gallon $41.14 $41.00 $41.60
Chlorpyrifos 4E 2 Cases /2 x 2.5 Gallons
10 42 5% 5 Gallons / Case Gallon $44.50 $42.00 $64.00
11 |Dylox 420 SL 4 Cases /2 x 2.5 Gallons Gallon $65.70 $63.75 $81.68
5 Gallons / Case
12 |Fore wsp 9-Cases /8 x 4 x 1.5 Ibs. Pound $7.13 $7.70 $37.89
48 Ibs. / Case
4-Cases / 2 x 1 Gallon
13 |Head Way 5 Gallons / Case Gallon $438.00 $426.00 $438.00
Tebuconazole 23-Gallons / 4 x 1 Gallon
14 38.7% 5 3/4 Gallons / Case Gallon $55.95 $49.75 $65.00
15 |Imidacloprid 75% 2-Cases / 88 x 1.6 oz Case Case $337.00 $339.00 $426.36 *
6-Cases 2 x 2.5 Gallons
[ *
16 |PCNB 40% 5 Gallons / Case Gallon $55.45 $50.85 $53.80
17 |Pendulum Aqua Cap 6-Cases / 2 x 2.5 Gallons Gallon $57.20 $55.00 $70.65
5 Gallons / Case
Trinexapac — Ethyl 2-Cases / 2 x 2.5 Gallons -
18 11.3% 5 Gallons / Case Gallon $100.40 $102.00 $133.00
9-Cases / 2 x 2.5 Gallons
19 |Prograss 5 Gallons/Case Gallon $143.00 $138.10 $172.62
20  |Provaunt 2-Cases x| Case $709.50 $695.50 $852.00
8 x 12 oz.
21 |Glyphosate 41% 4-Cases / 2 x 2.5 Gallons Gallon No bid $12.00 $17.57 *
5 Gallons/Case
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PUR-1426

Grounds Maintenance Chemicals

for Black Rock Golf Course

Genesis Turfgrass, Inc. Helena Agri Enterprises SiteOne Landscape Supply
Glen Rock, PA New Market, MD Frederick, MD
Item Item Description / Formulation Estimated Annual Unit of Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
No. Usage/Case Type Measure
Mefenoxam 2.5 Cases/ 2 x 1 Case
22 99 504 5 Gallon Cases Gallon $340.50 $336.00 $399.99
23 |Talstar 4 x 1-Gallon Gallon $51.54 $51.00 $60.30
4 Gallons / Case
24 |Trimec Classic 20-Gallons /2x 2.5 Gallons | .\, $36.79 $35.90 $24.46
5 Gallons / Case
Paclobutrazol 3-Gallons
25 99 3% 2 x 1 Gallon Cases Gallon $160.95 $139.00 $201.25
200-Gallons .
26 |Phosguard 2 % 2.5 Gallon Cases Gallon $17.20 No bid $21.18
36-Gallons /
27 |Bayleton FLO 2 % 2.5 Gallons / 5 Gallons Gallon $554.00 $554.00 $546.00
28 |Dismiss NXT 5-Gallons / Gallon $580.00 $580.00 $580.00
60 Ounce Bottles
. 40-Gallons/ .
29 |Fluazinam 40SC 2 x 2.5 Gallons / 5 Gallons Gallon $374.94 $380.00 No bid
) 7-Gallons / ]
30 [Poa Constrictor 96 Ounce Bottles Gallon $140.50 $110.00 No bid
. 75 Ibs. /
31 |Signature XTRA 5.5 Pound Bags Pounds $30.00 $30.00 $30.00
) 10-Gallons
32 |Barricade 4 x 1 Gallon Case Gallon $143.00 $143.00 $143.00
33 |Mancozeb 450 Ibs. Gallon $3.88 $3.75 $5.08
12 Ib. bags

Remarks / Exceptions:

Genesis Turfgrass, Inc.

Item No. 28 - Dismiss NXT - 5 gallons of product = 640 o0zs. + 60 0zs. = 10.666 units. Can only sell 10 or 11 units - Rounded up to 11 units.
Item No. 30 - Poa Constrictor - 7 gallons of product = 896 0zs. + 96 0zs. = 9.3333 units. Can only sell 9 or 10 units. Rounded up to 10 units.

Helena Agri Enterprises

Item No. 28 - Dismiss NXT is per 60 oz. bottle not gallon.
Item No. 33 - Mancozeb 8 x 6 Ib. package

SiteOne Landscape Supply

Item No. 28 - Dismiss NXT - 11 bottles
Labels / Specifications enclosed for all alternates listed:

Item No. 3 - Lesco Spectator Ultra
Item No. 4 - Proplant

Item No. 6 - Lesco T-Storm

Item No. 8 - Candor

Item No. 9 - -Manicure 6FL

Item No. 15 - Lesco Bandit 75 WSP (5.5 x4 x4 x 1.6 0zs.)

Item No. 16 - Turfcide
Item No. 18 - T-Nex

Item No. 21 - Lesco Prosecutor Pro
Item No. 23 - Talstar Xtra GC (50 Ib / bag)

Item No. 24 - Three-Way Selective

Item No. 25 - Pac-Low

Item No. 26 - Brandt Gro-Phite 0-0-25

Agency - Price set by
manufacturers listed:

Item No. 27 - Bayleton FLO
Item No. 28 - Dismiss NXT
Item No. 31 - Signature XTRA
Item No. 32 - Barricade 4 FI
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