PUR 1411

Fire Service Performance Testing / Inspection

American Test Center, Inc.

OPTION NO. 1 (Single Award for All Services): River Falls, WI
Item o Unit of . Unit Total
No. Description Measure Quantity Price/Each Price

1 Fire Pump Testing EA 55 No Bid
5 ?(2),8,6 Testing — Diameter 1-1/2 LE 73,000 No Bid
3 ?g’s’e Testing — Diameter 2-1/2 LE 41,000 No Bid
4 Isi,?se Testing — Diameter 4 — LE 77,000 No Bid
5 Hose Testin - Hard Suction Ea 100 No Bid
Ground Ladder Testing — 10’ .
® | Folding (Attic) EA 52 No Bid
7 ft;z(l)l’%ht Ladders Testing (12 EA 68 No Bid
Extension Ladders Testing .
8 (16’ - 28" EA 57 No Bid
9 Extension Ladders (30° — 45”) EA 24 No Bid
10 Aerial Device Testing — 75 EA 5 No Bid
Ladders
11 Aerial Device Testing — 105 EA 1 No Bid
Skyarm
12 Aer}al Device Testing — 100 EA 5 No Bid
Aerial
Ladder truck / 5-Year Non- .
13 Destructive Test EA 2 No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID PRICE $0.00
(for Item Nos. 1 through 13) '

Bids Opened: 05-15-2019



PUR 1411

Fire Service Performance Testing / Inspection

American Test Center, Inc.

OPTION NO. 2 (Individual awards for Each Service): River Falls, WI
Item . Unit of . Unit Total
Group No. Description Measure Quantity Price/Each Price
2A 1 Fire Pump Testing EA 55 No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID PRICE FOR GROUP 2A $0.00
(Total of Item No. 1) '
9 ?(2)’5,63 Testing — Diameter 1-1/2 LE 73,000 No Bid
3 ?g’s’e Testing — Diameter 2-1/2 LF 41,000 No Bid
2B - .
4 Isi,?se Testing — Diameter 4 — LE 77,000 No Bid
5 Hose Testing - Hard Suction EA 100 No Bid
TOTAL SUM BID PRICE FOR GROUP 2B $0.00
(Total of Item Nos. 2 through 5) '
Ground Ladder Testing — 10’
® | Folding (Attic) EA 52 $30.00 $1,560.00
Straight Ladders Testing (12’
! —-20%) EA 68 $35.00 $2,380.00
2C - -
3 Extension Ladders Testing EA 57
(16> —28%) $40.00 $2,280.00
Extension Ladders
9 (30’ — 45”) EA 24 $45.00 $1,080.00
TOTAL SUM BID PRICE FOR GROUP 2C $7.300.00

(Total of Item Nos. 6 through 9)

Bids Opened: 05-15-2019



PUR 1411

Fire Service Performance Testing / Inspection

American Test Center, Inc.

OPTION NO. 2 (Individual awards for Each Service): River Falls, WI
Aerial Device Testing — 75’
10 Ladders EA 2 $555.00 $1,110.00
Aerial Device Testing — 100'
o |t | Actia EA 2 $555.00 $1,110.00
12 Aerial Device Testing - 105' EA 1
Skyarm $555.00 $555.00
13 Ladder truck / 5-Year Non- EA ’
Destructive Test $1,000.00 $2,000.00
TOTAL SUM BID PRICE FOR GROUP 2D $4.775.00

(Total of Item Nos. 10 through 13)

Remarks / Exceptions:

Option 2-Group C: Heat sensors can be replaced for $2.50 each. We will not be moving/driving units. We will coordinate a test site that works
well for all departments. Price is per ladder by specified length group.

Option 2-Group D: Our intention is to schedule aerial inspections at the departments location and will not be moving aerials offsite.

Provisions for other agencies: we have a minimum stop charge for anything under 10 ladders of $420.00. Anything over 10 ladders will be as b
in option 2 group C.

Bids Opened: 05-15-2019



