PUR-1386
Grounds Maintenance Chemicals

Helena Agri Enterprises, Genesis Turfgrass, Inc.
LLC Glen Rock, PA
New Market, MD ’
Item Item Description / Estimated Unit of Unit Note Unit Note
No. Formulation Annual Usage / Case Type |Measure Per Price Price
1 |Acclaim Extra 2-Gallons Gallon $484.00 $503.95
5 Cases/4 x 1 Gallons
2 |Aqua Shade 4 Gallons/Case Gallon $36.26 $45.35
Propiconazole 3 Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
3 14.3% 5 Gallons/Case Gallon $49.75 352.00
Propamocarb Hydrochloride 8 Cases/2 x 1 Gallons
4 66.2% » Gallons/Case Gallon $287.00 $317.58
5 |Bensumec — 4LF 5 Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons Gallon $108.00 $109.32
5 Gallons/Case
Thiophonate Methyl 40 Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
6 46.2% 5 Gallons/Case Gallon $45.00 $44.38
Alumimum Tris WDG 10 Cases/4 x 5.5 Ibs.
7 80% 22 Ib./Case Pound $13.59 $13.28
8 |Crossbow 15 Gallons/2 x 2.5 Gal. Gallon $57.56 $43.85
5 Gallons/Case
Chlorothanlonil 12 Cases/2 x 2. 5 Gallons
o 54% 720 SFT 5 Gallons/Case Gallon $41.00 346.76
Chlorpyrifos 4E 2 Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons .
10 42.5% 5 Gallons/Case Gallon No Bid $42.00
11 |Dylox 420 SL 4 Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons Pound $62.75 $65.34
5 Gallons/Case
9-Cases/8 x 4 x 1.5 Ib.
12 |Fore WSP 48 Ib /Case Pound $7.70 $7.16

Bids Opened: 05-02-18



PUR-1386
Grounds Maintenance Chemicals

Helena Agri Enterprises, Genesis Turfgrass, Inc.
LLC Glen Rock, PA
New Market, MD ’
Item Item Description / Estimated Unit of Unit Note Unit Note
No. Formulation Annual Usage / Case Type |Measure Per Price Price
13 |Head Way 4-Cases/2 x 1 Gallons Gallon $417.00 $417.00
2 Gallons/Case
Tebuconazole 23-Gallons/4 x 1 Gallons
14 13879 5 3/4 Gallons/Case Gallon $45.00 $44.25
15 ;rg(ﬁac'c’p”d 2-Cases/88x 1.6 0z Case Case $352.27 $329.50
PCNB 6-Cases/2x2.5 Gallons
16 40% 5 Gallons/Case Gallon $53.80 $52.22
6-Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
17 |Pendulum Agqua Cap 5 Gallons/Case Gallon $44.00 $56.28
Trinexapac — Ethyl 2-Cases/2 x 2.5Gallons
18 11.3% 5 Gallons/Case Gallon $102.00 $105.16
19 |Prograss 9-Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons Gallon $136.75 $142.00
5 Gallons/Case
20 |Provaunt 2-Cases Case $685.00 * $709.52 *
8 x 100z.
Glyphosate 4-Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
21 41% 5 Gallons/Case Gallon $12.00 $29.40
Mefenoxam 2.5 Cases/2x1 Case
22 22 5% 2 Gallon Cases Gallon $331.27 $354.00
4 x 1-Gallons
23 |Talstar 4 Gallons/Case Gallon $33.40 $32.29
24 |Trimec Classic 20-Gallons/2x 2.5 Gallons | - .\ - $34.00 $34.76
5 Gallons/Case

Bids Opened: 05-02-18



PUR-1386
Grounds Maintenance Chemicals

Helena Agri Enterprises, Genesis Turfgrass, Inc.
LLC Glen Rock, PA
New Market, MD ’
Item Item Description / Estimated Unit of Unit Note Unit Note
No. Formulation Annual Usage / Case Type |Measure Per Price Price
Paclobutrazol 3-Gallons
25 9 3% 2 x 1 Gallon Cases Gallon $135.00 $148.50
200-Gallons .
26 |Phosguard 2 % 2.5 Gallon Cases Gallon No Bid $16.88
36-Gallons/
27 |Bayleton FLO 2 x 2.5 Gallon/ 5 Gallons Gallon $546.00 $546.00
per case
- 5-Gallon/
28 |Dismiss NXT 60 Ounce Bottles Gallon $555.00 $1,183.99
40-Gallon/
29 [Fluazinam 40SC 2 x 2.5 Gallon /5 Gallons Gallon $380.00 $416.40
per case
. 7-Gallon /
30 [Poa Constrictor 96 Ounce Bottles Gallon $110.00 $187.33
. 75 1bs. /
31 [Signature XTRA 5.5 Pound Bags Pounds $29.09 $29.09
10-Gallon
32 |Barricade 2 x 2.5 Gallon / 5 Gallons Gallon $143.00 $143.00
per case

Bids Opened: 05-02-18



PUR-1386
Grounds Maintenance Chemicals

NOTES:

Helena Chemical Co. -

* #20 - Quoted 8 x 12 oz. Case
Spectator Ultra 1.3

* #31 - $160/5.5 Ib bottle

Genesis -
* #20 - Quoted 8 x 12 oz. Case
All pricing submitted in writing is per unit price; all pricing submitted in Figures is calculated cost based on estimated usage.

Bayleton Flo in 2.5 gal.units - Would suggest 35 gal. or 37.5 gal total 35 gals @ 19,110.00 / 37.5 gals @ 20,475.00

4 Bids Opened: 05-02-18



PUR-1386

Grounds Maintenance Chemicals

SiteOne Landscape Supply
Frederick, MD

Item Item Description / Estimated Unit of Unit Note
No. Formulation Annual Usage / Case Type [Measure Per Price
1 |Acclaim Extra 2-Gallons Gallon $525.00
5 Cases/4 x 1 Gallons
2 |Aqua Shade 4 Gallons/Case Gallon $39.00
Propiconazole 3 Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons *
3 14.3% 5 Gallons/Case Gallon $50.84
Propamocarb Hydrochloride 8 Cases/2 x 1 Gallons *
4 66.2% 2 Gallons/Case Gallon $315.00
5 |Bensumec — 4LF 5 Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons Gallon $121.78
5 Gallons/Case
Thiophonate Methyl 40 Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons «
6 46.2% 5 Gallons/Case Gallon $40.00
Alumimum Tris WDG 10 Cases/4 x 5.5 Ibs. «
" |go% 22 Ib./Case Pound $26.36
8 |Crosshbow 15 Gallons/2 x 2.5 Gal. Gallon $43.04 *
5 Gallons/Case
Chlorothanlonil 12 Cases/2 x 2. 5 Gallons «
o 54% 720 SFT 5 Gallons/Case Gallon $42.70
Chlorpyrifos 4E 2 Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
10 42.5% 5 Gallons/Case Gallon 369.16
4 Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
11 |[Dylox 420 SL & Gallons/Case Pound $71.46
9-Cases/8 x 4 x 1.5 Ib.
12 |Fore WSP 48 Ib./Case Pound $10.50
5

Bids Opened: 05-02-18



PUR-1386

Grounds Maintenance Chemicals

SiteOne Landscape Supply
Frederick, MD

Item Item Description / Estimated Unit of Unit Note
No. Formulation Annual Usage / Case Type [Measure Per Price
4-Cases/2 x 1 Gallons -
13 |Head Way 2 Gallons/Case Gallon $417.00
Tebuconazole 23-Gallons/4 x 1 Gallons
14 13379 5 3/4 Gallons/Case Gallon $75.00
15 ;rg(:/fi) acloprid 2-Cases/88x 1.6 oz Case Case $375.82 *
PCNB 6-Cases/2x2.5 Gallons
16 40% 5 Gallons/Case Gallon $48.95
6-Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
17 |Pendulum Agqua Cap 5 Gallons/Case Gallon $65.18
Trinexapac — Ethyl 2-Cases/2 x 2.5Gallons «
18 11.3% 5 Gallons/Case Gallon $151.52
9-Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons
19 |Prograss 5 Gallons/Case Gallon $155.74
20 |Provaunt 2-Cases Case $821.92 sk
8 x 100z.
Glyphosate 4-Cases/2 x 2.5 Gallons «
21 41% 5 Gallons/Case Gallon $23.60
Mefenoxam 2.5 Cases/2x1 Case
22 22.5% 2 Gallon Cases Gallon $397.29
4 x 1-Gallons
23 |Talstar 4 Gallons/Case Gallon $42.60
24 [Trimec Classic 20-Gallons/2 x 2.5 Gallons | $22.34 *

5 Gallons/Case

Bids Opened: 05-02-18



PUR-1386

Grounds Maintenance Chemicals

SiteOne Landscape Supply
Frederick, MD

Item Item Description / Estimated Unit of Unit Note
No. Formulation Annual Usage / Case Type [Measure Per Price
Paclobutrazol 3-Gallons *
25 22.3% 2 x 1 Gallon Cases Gallon $182.81
200-Gallons *
26 |Phosguard 2 % 2.5 Gallon Cases Gallon $31.76
36-Gallons/
27 |Bayleton FLO 2 x 2.5 Gallon/ 5 Gallons Gallon $546.00 **
per case
.. 5-Gallon/
28 [Dismiss NXT 60 Ounce Bottles Gallon $1,030.00
40-Gallon/
29 |Fluazinam 40SC 2 X 2.5 Gallon / 5 Gallons Gallon No Bid
per case
. 7-Gallon / .
30 |Poa Constrictor 96 Ounce Bottles Gallon No Bid
) 75 Ibs. / -
31 |Signature XTRA 5.5 Pound Bags Gallon $29.10
10-Gallon
32 |(Barricade 2 x 2.5 Gallon / 5 Gallons Gallon $143.00 *x
per case
7

Bids Opened: 05-02-18



PUR-1386
Grounds Maintenance Chemicals

SiteOne Landscape Supply -
*All alternate brands written under description

#3
#4
#6
#7
#8
#9
#15
#18
#21
#24
#25
#26

Spectator

Proplant

T-Storm

Prodigy Signature

Candor (alternate see attached label)
Manicure 6FL

Lesco Bandit

T-Nex

Prosecutor Pro

Lesco 3-Way (alternate label enclosed)
Pac-Low PRG

Brandt Gro-Phite 0-0-25 (alternate label enclosed)

**|tems Marked Agency have price set by manufacturer

#13
#27
#31
#32

#20

Agency

Agency 37.5 gal.
Agency 771bs.
Agency

120z x 7-CS

Bids Opened: 05-02-18



