Washington County |

T PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
DIVISION OF BUDGET & FINANCE

100 West Washington Street, Room 3200 | Hagerstown, MD 21740-4748 | P: 240.313.2330 | F: 240.313.2331
www.washco-md.net

PUR-1362
ADDENDUM NO. 1
INVITATION TO BID

BULK GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL DELIVERIES

DATE: Friday, September 22, 2017 BIDS DUE: Wednesday, October 4, 2017
2:00 P.M.

To Bidders:

This Addendum is hereby made a part of the Contract Documents on which all bids will be based
and is issued to correct and clarify the original documents.

Please acknowledge receipt of this Addendum at the appropriate space on the Proposal Form.
This Addendum consists of four (4) pages and two (2) attachments.

NOTE: All Bidders must enter the Washington County Administration Complex through
either the front door at the 100 West Washington Street entrance or through the rear entrance
(w/blue canopy roof) which is handicap accessible, and must use the elevator to access the
Purchasing Department to submit their proposal and/or to attend the Pre-Proposal Conference.
Alternate routes are controlled by a door access system. Washington County Government has
announced new security protocols being implemented at the Washington County Administration
Complex at 100 West Washington Street, Hagerstown. The new measures took effect Tuesday,
February 14, 2017. The general public will be subject to wand search and will be required to
remove any unauthorized items from the building prior to entry. Prohibited items include, but are
not limited to: Weapons of any type; Firearms, ammunition and explosive devices; Cutting
instruments of any type - including knives, scissors, box cutters, work tools, knitting needles, or
anything with a cutting edge, etc.; Pepper spray, mace or any other chemical defense sprays; and
Illegal substances.

ITEM NO. 1: Inquiry:  Does the above referenced Bid have a DBE/MBE Requirement?
Response: No, the bid does not have DBE or MBE requirements.
ITEM NO. 2: Inquiry:  Can you please provide the name of the incumbent supplier for this project?

Response: A. C. & T. Company, Inc. of Hagerstown MD.

(NOTE: The wording of all “Inquiries” submitted are displayed exactly as received.)
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ITEM NO.

ITEM NO.

ITEM NO.

ITEM NO.

ITEM NO.

ITEM NO.

ITEM NO.

ITEM NO.

ITEM NO.

ITEM NO.

10:

11:

12:

Inquiry:  Can you please clarify the duration of the contract to be awarded?

Response: The contract shall tentatively commence on December 1, 2017 and end
November 30, 2018.

Inquiry: s there a bid bond required for this contract? In the contract it speaks to a
bid bond of 5%, but on the cover page of the Invitation to Bid there is a box next to the
bid bond that is not checked. Any clarification would be great.

Response: A bid bond is not required. The bid bond referred to on Page 9, General
Terms and Conditions, Item No. 1 is part of the County’s Standard Terms and
Conditions (boiler plate language).

Inquiry:  Will you please provide us with a copy of the previous tabulation?
Response: Please see the attachment to this Addendum.

Inquiry:  Who is the current vendor?

Response: Please refer to ITEM NO. 2 of this Addendum.

Inquiry:  Will you please provide us with a copy of a current BOL & Invoice?
Response: Please see the attachments to this Addendum.

Inquiry:  How does the County pay, is ACH/EFT an option?

Response: ACH or EFT is not an option; all payments are issued via check.

Inquiry:  Did the County award the previous contract per option 1 or 2?

Response: The previous contract was awarded under Option 2.

Inquiry:  Have any addendums been released for this bid?

Response: No previous addenda have been issued; this is the first addendum.

Inquiry:  When is the award date?

Response: Bids are due Wednesday, October 4, 2017 with a subsequent potential
award date of October 24, 2017.

Inquiry:  When is the first board meeting after the opening?

Response: The first scheduled Board meeting after the bid opening is Tuesday,
October 10, 2017.

(NOTE: The wording of all “Inquiries” submitted are displayed exactly as received.)
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ITEM NO.

ITEM NO.

ITEM NO.

ITEM NO.

ITEM NO.

ITEM NO.

ITEM NO.

ITEM NO.

ITEM NO.

13:

14:

15:

16:

17:

18:

19:

20:

21:

Inquiry:  What is your current turnaround on payment of invoices?

Response: Payments are made upon receipt of invoice.

Inquiry:  Who is your current vendor?

Response: Please refer to ITEM NO. 2 of this Addendum.

Inquiry:  Please provide recent copies of invoices and bill of ladings for each product.
Response: Please see the attachments to this Addendum.

Inquiry:  Can winter additive be added at the time of delivery?

Response: Yes.

Inquiry:  Can additives equivalent to the additives described be delivered?

Response: Refer to the Bid document, page 19, Supplemental Terms & Conditions,
Item No. 18: The following chemical treatment (flow and cetane improvers) shall be
acceptable: #13ULSSW Diesel Treat 2000 Ultra Low Sulfur Winter Premium by
Schaffer Manufacturing Company, Innospec’s - Legal Diesel Fuel Additive 1400 LHF,
or Power Service Products, Inc. — Diesel Performance Improver+Cetane Boost.
Inquiry:  Who is your current supplier?

Response: Please refer to ITEM NO. 2 of this Addendum.

Inquiry:  Please confirm that No bid bond or performance bod is required for this bid.
Response: Please refer to ITEM NO. 4 of this Addendum.

Inquiry: If a performance bond is required, is a labor and material bond required as
well? Labor and Material Bonds are usually only used in construction bids and
contracts

Response: Please refer to ITEM NO. 4 of this Addendum.

Inquiry:  Will a computer generated bill of lading from the fuel terminal be suffice
for Transport deliveries?

Response: Yes.

(NOTE: The wording of all “Inquiries” submitted are displayed exactly as received.)
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ITEM NO. 22: Inquiry: Please confirm that vendor can charge non-exempt taxes as separate line
items on invoice.
Response: All applicable taxes are to be listed separately on invoices.

ITEM NO. 23: Inquiry: What is the treatment additive protection referring to on #15 on page 18? Is
that winter additive?

Response: Yes.

ITEM NO. 24: Inquiry: Can the winter additive be splash blended or does it have to be injected at
the rack?

Response: Splash blended is acceptable.

BY AUTHORITY OF:

Rick Curry, CPPO
Director of Purchasing

(NOTE: The wording of all “Inquiries” submitted are displayed exactly as received.)



PUR-1329
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

A.C.&T.Co, Inc. CATO, Inc.
O PT I O N 1 Hagerstowr?, Mr;: Salisbury,r:\(;lD

A B C D E B C D E
OPIS Price OPIS Price
OPIS Pri Bidd N A Net Bidder N Appr Net
Item rice ader Bidder pprox. e ade Bidder pprox. .
as of +/- Factor Gallon Delivered +/- Factor Gallon Delivered
09-08-16 Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD) Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 $0.1815 $1.5928 64,387 $102,555.61 N/A 64,387 N/A
Tank-wagon
Sec. |Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
| |CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 $0.1815 $1.6947 8,500 $14,404.95 N/A 8,500 N/A
Tank-wagon
Total Sum Gasoline Tank-wagon
Deliveries as Described in Section | $116,960.56
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 $0.0275 $1.4388 197,500 $284,163.00 $0.0187 $1.4300 197,500 $282,425.00
Transport
S Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
IeIC "|CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 $0.0275 $1.5407 194,926 $300,322.49 $0.0187 $1.5319 194,926 $298,607.14
Transport
Total Sum Gaso!lne 'I_'ranspgrt Deliveries $584,485.49 $581.032.14
as Described in Section 11
Total Sum Diesel Tank-wagon
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in $1.441 $0.1715 | $1.6125 | 60,875 $98,160.94 N/A 60,875 N/A
111 |Section Il No. 2-D Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur
Total Sum Diesel Transport
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in $1.441 $0.0300 | $1.4710 | 656,213 $965,289.32 $0.0100 | $1.4510 | 656,213 $952,165.06
IV |Section IV No. 2-D Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur

*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price. 1 Bids Opened: 10-12-16



PUR-1329
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

OPT I O N 1 A.C.&T.Co,, Inc. CATO, Inc.
Hagerstown, MD Salisbury, MD
Winter Chemical Additive Protection $0.0300 $0.0350
(cost per gallon):
Winter Chemical Additive Protection 1400 LHF Legal Diesel Fuel Additive 1400 LHF
Product Name:
Manufacturer’s Name: Innospec Innospec
*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price. 2 Bids Opened: 10-12-16



PUR-1329
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

OPT I O N 2 A.C.&T.Co, Inc. CATO, Inc.
Hagerstown, MD Salisbury, MD
A B C D E B C D E
OPIS Price OPIS Price
OPIS Pri Bidd N A Net Bidder N Appr Net
Item rice] BIAGer 1 Bidder Pprox. e ade Bidder pprox. _
as of +/- Factor Gallon Delivered +/- Factor Gallon Delivered
09-08-16 Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD) Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 $0.1800 $1.5913 64,387 $102,459.03 64,387
Sec, | Tank-wagon
' Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 $0.1800 $1.6932 8,500 $14,392.20 8,500
Tank-wagon
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 $0.0260 $1.4373 197,500 $283,866.75 230,000
Sec. | Transport
Il |Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 $0.0260 $1.5392 194,926 $300,030.10 194,926
Transport
Total Sum Diesel Tank-wagon
Sec. [Deliveries as Described in
11 lsection 111 No. 2-D Diesel $1.441 $0.1700 $1.6110 60,875 $98,069.63 60,875
Ultra Low Sulfur
Total Sum Diesel Transport
Sec. [Deliveries as Described in
IV |section IV No. 2-D Diesel $1.441 $0.0285 $1.4695 656,213 $964,305.00 704,213
Ultra Low Sulfur

OPTION 2

Total Sum Bid of All Section Totals

(Sections 1-4)

$1,763,122.71

*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price.

Bids Opened: 10-12-16



PUR-1329
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

OPT I O N 2 A.C.&T.Co,, Inc. CATO, Inc.
Hagerstown, MD Salisbury, MD
Winter Chemical Additive Protection $0.0300
(cost per gallon):
Winter Chemical Additive Protection 1400 LHE
Product Name:
Manufacturer’s Name: Innospec
*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price. 4

Bids Opened: 10-12-16



PUR-1329
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

O P-I— I O N 1 East River Energy Guttman Energy
Guilford, CT Belle Vernon, PA
A B C D E B C D E
OPIS Price OPIS Price
OPIS Price| Bidd * A Net Bidder N Appr Net
Item rice ader Bidder pprox. e ade Bidder pprox. .
as of +/- Factor Gallon Delivered +/- Factor Gallon Delivered
09-08-16 Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD) Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 64,387 No Bid 64,387 No Bid
Tank-wagon
Sec. |Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
| |CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 8,500 No Bid 8,500 No Bid
Tank-wagon
Total Sum Gasoline Tank-wagon . .
Deliveries as Described in Section | No Bid No Bid
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 197,500 No Bid + $0.0273 197,500 $5,391.75
Transport
S Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
flc CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 194,926 No Bid + $0.0273 | 194,926 $5,321.48
Transport
Total Sum Gaso!lne Transpgrt Deliveries No Bid $10,713.23*
as Described in Section 11
Total Sum Diesel Tank-wagon
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in $1.441 $1.240 | $2.6810 | 60,875 $163,205.88 60,875 No Bid
111 |Section Il No. 2-D Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur
i Pulled
s o e
ec. . . $1.441 $0.0423 $1.4833 656,213 $973,360.74 656,213
IV |Section IV No. 2-D Diesel Pulled
Ultra Low Sulfur Baltimore + $0.0418 $27,429.70
*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price. 5 Bids Opened: 10-12-16




OPTION 1

PUR-1329
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

East River Energy
Guilford, CT

Guttman Energy
Belle Vernon, PA

Winter Chemical Additive Protection
(cost per gallon):

$0.0330

$0.0300

Winter Chemical Additive Protection
Product Name:

Legal Diesel Fuel Additive

Winter Additive
(can provide test information upon request)

Manufacturer’s Name:

Innospec

Innospec

*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price. 6

Bids Opened: 10-12-16



PUR-1329
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

O P-I— I O N 2 East River Energy Guttman Energy
Guilford, CT Belle Vernon, PA
A B C D E B C D E
OPIS Price OPIS Price
OPIS Price| Bidd * A Net Bidder N Appr Net
Item rice] BIAGer 1 Bidder Pprox. e ade Bidder pprox. _
as of +/- Factor Gallon Delivered +/- Factor Gallon Delivered
09-08-16 Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD) Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon

Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 64,387 No Bid 64,387
Sec, | Tank-wagon

Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 8,500 No Bid 8,500
Tank-wagon

Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 197,500 No Bid 197,500
Sec. [Transport

Il |Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 194,926 No Bid 194,926
Transport

Total Sum Diesel Tank-wagon
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in

111 |Section Il No. 2-D Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur

$1.441 60,875 No Bid 60,875

Total Sum Diesel Transport
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in

IV [Section IV No. 2-D Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur

OPTION 2

Total Sum Bid of All Section Totals No Bid
(Sections 1-4)

$1.441 656,213 No Bid 656,213

*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price. 7 Bids Opened: 10-12-16



PUR-1329
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

O P-I— I O N 2 East River Energy Guttman Energy
Guilford, CT Belle Vernon, PA
Winter Chemical Additive Protection .
No Bid
(cost per gallon):
Winter Chemical Additive Protection .
No Bid
Product Name:
Manufacturer’s Name: No Bid
*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price. 8

Bids Opened: 10-12-16



PUR-1329
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

O PT I O N 1 IPC (USA), Inc. Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, Inc.
Columbia, MD Gainesville, GA
A B C D E B C D E
OPIS Price OPIS Price
OPIS Pri Bidd N A Net Bidder N Appr Net
Item rice ader Bidder pprox. e ade Bidder pprox. .
as of +/- Factor Gallon Delivered +/- Factor Gallon Delivered
09-08-16 Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD) Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 64,387 No Bid $0.3492 $1.7605 64,387 $113,353.31
Tank-wagon
Sec. |Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
| |CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 8,500 No Bid $0.4259 $1.9391 8,500 $16,482.35
Tank-wagon
Total Sum Gasoline Tank-wagon
Deliveries as Described in Section | $129,835.66
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 197,500 No Bid $0.0248 $1.4361 197,500 $283,629.75
Transport
S Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
Ielc. CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 194,926 No Bid $0.0091 $1.5223 194,926 $296,735.85
Transport
Total Sum Gasol_lne Transpgrt Deliveries $580,365.60
as Described in Section 11
Total Sum Diesel Tank-wagon
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in $1.441 60,875 No Bid $0.3240 | $1.7650 | 60,875 $107,444.38
111 |Section Il No. 2-D Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur
Total Sum Diesel Transport
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in $1.441 $0.0098 | 1.4508 | 656,213 $952,033.82 $0.0365 | $1.4775 | 656,213 $969,554.71
IV |Section IV No. 2-D Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur
*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price. 9 Bids Opened: 10-12-16




PUR-1329
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

O PT I O N 1 IPC (USA), Inc. Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, Inc.
Columbia, MD Gainesville, GA

Winter Chemical Additive Protection $0.0200 00225

(cost per gallon):

Winter Chemical Additive Protection
Product Name:

Diesel Treat 2000

Innospec LHF

Manufacturer’s Name:

Schaffer Manufacturing

Innospec

*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price. 10

Bids Opened: 10-12-16



PUR-1329
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

O PT I O N 2 IPC (USA), Inc. Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, Inc.
Columbia, MD Gainesville, GA
A B C D E B C D E
OPIS Price OPIS Price
OPIS Price| Bidd * A Net Bidder N Appr Net
Item rice] BIAGer 1 Bidder Pprox. e ade Bidder pprox. _
as of +/- Factor Gallon Delivered +/- Factor Gallon Delivered
09-08-16 Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD) Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 64,387 No Bid $0.3092 $1.7205 64,387 $110,777.83
Sec, | Tank-wagon
' Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 8,500 No Bid $0.3559 $1.8691 8,500 $15,887.35
Tank-wagon
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 197,500 No Bid $0.0248 $1.4361 197,500 $283,629.75
Sec. | Transport
Il |Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 194,926 No Bid $0.0091 $1.5223 194,926 $296,735.85
Transport
Total Sum Diesel Tank-wagon
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in $1.441 60,875 No Bid $0.2840 | $1.7250 | 60,875 $105,009.38
111 |Section Il No. 2-D Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur
Total Sum Diesel Transport
Sec. [Deliveries as Described in .
IV |Section IV No. 2-D Diesel $1.441 656,213 No Bid $0.0365 $1.4775 656,213 $969,554.71
Ultra Low Sulfur
OPTION 2
Total Sum Bid of All Section Totals No Bid $1,781,594.87
(Sections 1-4)
*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price. 11 Bids Opened: 10-12-16



Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

PUR-1329

O PT I O N 2 IPC (USA), Inc. Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, Inc.
Columbia, MD Gainesville, GA
Winter Chemlca_l Additive Protection $0.0225
(cost per gallon):
Winter Chemical Additive Protection
Innospec LHF
Product Name:
Manufacturer’s Name: Innospec
*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price. 12

Bids Opened: 10-12-16



PUR-1329
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

O PT I O N 1 PAPCO, Inc. Petroleum Marketing Group Inc.
Aston, PA Woodbridge, VA
A B C D E B C D E
OPIS Price OPIS Price
OPIS Price | Bidd N A Net Bidder N Appr Net
Item rice ader Bidder pprox. e ade Bidder pprox. .

as of +/- Factor Gallon Delivered +/- Factor Gallon Delivered

09-08-16 Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD) Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon

Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 64,387 No Bid 64,387 No Bid
Tank-wagon

Sec. |Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
| |CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 8,500 No Bid 8,500 No Bid
Tank-wagon

Total Sum Gasoline Tank-wagon

Deliveries as Described in Section | No Bid No Bid
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 $0.0164 $1.4277 197,500 $281,970.75 $0.0190 $1.4303 197,500 $282,484.25
Transport
S Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
Ielc " |CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 -$0.0198 $1.4934 194,926 $291,102.49* $0.0190 $1.5322* 194,926 $298,665.62*
Transport
Total Sum Gaso!lne Transpgrt Deliveries $573.073.24 $581,149.87*
as Described in Section 11
Total Sum Diesel Tank-wagon
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in $1.441 No Bid 60,875 No Bid No Bid 60,875 No Bid

111 |Section Il No. 2-D Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur

Total Sum Diesel Transport
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in
IV [Section IV No. 2-D Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur

$1.441 $0.0329 $1.4739 656,213 $967,192.34* $0.0175 $1.4585 656,213 $957,086.66

*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price. 13 Bids Opened: 10-12-16



PUR-1329
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

PAPCO, Inc. Petrol Marketing G Inc.
OPTION 1 N Pz\c etroleum Marketing Group Inc

Woodbridge, VA

Winter Chemlca_l Additive Protection $0.0260 per gallon of treated fuel. $0.0325
(cost per gallon):

Winter Chemical Additive Protection

HIGH PERFORMANCE ANTIGEL/DEICER W/VT-330 LEGAL DIESEL FUEL ADDITIVE CFI-1902
Product Name:
Manufacturer’s Name: VALVTECT INNOSPEC
*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price. 14 Bids Opened: 10-12-16



PUR-1329
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

O PT I O N 2 PAPCO, Inc. Petroleum Marketing Group Inc.
Aston, PA Woodbridge, VA
A B C D E B C D E
OPIS Price OPIS Price
OPIS Price | Bidd * A Net Bidder N Appr Net
Item rice] BIAGer 1 Bidder Pprox. e ade Bidder pprox. _

as of +/- Factor Gallon Delivered +/- Factor Gallon Delivered

09-08-16 Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD) Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon

Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 64,387 No Bid No Bid 64,387 No Bid
Sec, | Tank-wagon

Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 8,500 No Bid No Bid 8,500 No Bid
Tank-wagon

Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 197,500 No Bid $0.0190 $1.4303 197,500 $282,484.25
Sec. [Transport

Il |Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 194,926 No Bid $0.0190 $1.5322* 194,926 $298,665.62*
Transport

Total Sum Diesel Tank-wagon
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in

111 |Section Il No. 2-D Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur

$1.441 60,875 No Bid No Bid 60,875 No Bid

Total Sum Diesel Transport
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in
IV [Section IV No. 2-D Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur

OPTION 2

Total Sum Bid of All Section Totals No Bid $1,538,236.53*
(Sections 1-4)

$1.441 656,213 No Bid $0.0175 $1.4585 656,213 $957,086.66

*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price. 15 Bids Opened: 10-12-16



PUR-1329
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

PAPCO, Inc. Petrol Marketing G Inc.
OPTION 2 N, PRC etroleum Marketing Group Inc

Woodbridge, VA

Winter Chemical Additive Protection $0.0325
(cost per gallon):

Winter Chemical Additive Protection LEGAL DIESEL FUEL ADDITIVE CFI-1902
Product Name:

Manufacturer’s Name: INNOSPEC

*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price. 16 Bids Opened: 10-12-16



PUR-1329
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

O P-I— I O N 1 Petroleum Traders Corporation Shipley Energy Company
Fort Wayne, IN York, PA
A B C D E B C D E
OPIS Price OPIS Price
OPIS Pri Bidd N A Net Bidder N Appr Net
Item rice ader Bidder pprox. e ade Bidder pprox. .
as of +/- Factor Gallon Delivered +/- Factor Gallon Delivered
09-08-16 Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD) Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 No Bid No Bid 64,387 No Bid N/B N/B 64,387 N/B
Tank-wagon
Sec. |Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
| |CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 No Bid No Bid 8,500 No Bid N/B N/B 8,500 N/B
Tank-wagon
Total Sum Gasoline Tank-wagon No Bid
Deliveries as Described in Section |
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 $0.0248 $1.4361 197,500 $283,629.75 N/B N/B 197,500 N/B
Transport
S Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
IeIC " |CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 -$0.0072 $1.5060 194,926 $293,558.56 N/B N/B 194,926 N/B
Transport
Total Sum Gasol_lne Transpgrt Deliveries $577.188.31 N/B
as Described in Section 11
Total Sum Diesel Tank-wagon
Sec. [Deliveries as Described in $1.441 No Bid No Bid 60,875 No Bid $0.249 | $1.6900 | 60,875 $102,878.75
111 |Section Il No. 2-D Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur
Total Sum Diesel Transport
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in $1.441 $0.0353 | $1.4763 | 656,213 $968,767.25 $0.0425 | $1.4835 | 656,213 $973,491.99
IV |Section IV No. 2-D Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur
*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price. 17 Bids Opened: 10-12-16




PUR-1329
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

O P-I— I O N 1 Petroleum Traders Corporation Shipley Energy Company
Fort Wayne, IN York, PA
Winter Chemlcall Additive Protection $0.0250 $0.025
(cost per gallon):
Winter Chemical Additive Protection Diesel Treat 2000 Ultra Low Sulfur Winter Premium
Product Name: (#13ULSSW) DIESEL FUEL SUPPLEMENT W/CETANE BOOST
Manufacturer’s Name: Schaffer Manufacturing Company POWER SERVICES
*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price. 18 Bids Opened: 10-12-16



Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

PUR-1329

O P-I— I O N 2 Petroleum Traders Corporation Shipley Energy Company
Fort Wayne, IN York, PA
A B C D E B C D E
OPIS Price OPIS Price
OPIS Price| Bidd * A Net Bidder N Appr Net
Item rice] BIAGer 1 Bidder Pprox. e ade Bidder pprox. _
as of +/- Factor Gallon Delivered +/- Factor Gallon Delivered
09-08-16 Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD) Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 No Bid No Bid 64,387 No Bid N/B N/B 64,387 N/B
Sec, | Tank-wagon
' Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 No Bid No Bid 8,500 No Bid N/B N/B 8,500 N/B
Tank-wagon
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 No Bid No Bid 197,500 No Bid N/B N/B 197,500 N/B
Sec. | Transport
Il |Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 No Bid No Bid 194,926 No Bid N/B N/B 194,926 N/B
Transport
Total Sum Diesel Tank-wagon
Sec. [Deliveries as Described in . . .
1 |section 111 No. 2-D Diesel $1.441 No Bid No Bid 60,875 No Bid N/B N/B 60,875 N/B
Ultra Low Sulfur
Total Sum Diesel Transport
Sec. [Deliveries as Described in . . .
IV |Section IV No. 2-D Diesel $1.441 No Bid No Bid 656,213 No Bid N/B N/B 656,213 N/B
Ultra Low Sulfur
OPTION 2
Total Sum Bid of All Section Totals No Bid N/B
(Sections 1-4)
*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price. 19 Bids Opened: 10-12-16



PUR-1329
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

O P-I— I O N 2 Petroleum Traders Corporation Shipley Energy Company
Fort Wayne, IN York, PA

Winter Chemical Additive Protection No Bid N/B

(cost per gallon):

Winter Chemical Additive Protection Diesel Treat 2000 Ultra Low Sulfur Winter Premium N/B

Product Name: (#13ULSSW)

Manufacturer’s Name: Schaffer Manufacturing Company N/B

*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price. 20

Bids Opened: 10-12-16



PUR-1329
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

OPTION 1 DALLAS, TX

A B C D E
OPIS Price
OPIS Pri Bidd N A Net
ltemn rice idder Bidder PProx. ' e
as of +/- Factor Gallon Delivered
09-08-16 Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD)
Per Gallon
Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 64,387
Tank-wagon
Sec. |Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
| |CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 8,500
Tank-wagon

Total Sum Gasoline Tank-wagon
Deliveries as Described in Section |

Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 $0.0292 $1.4405 197,500 $284,498.75
Transport

Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 -$0.0101 $1.5031 194,926 $292,993.27
Transport

Sec.
I

Total Sum Gasoline Transport Deliveries

*
as Described in Section 11 $577,492.02

Total Sum Diesel Tank-wagon
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in

111 |Section Il No. 2-D Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur

$1.441 60,875

Total Sum Diesel Transport
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in
IV [Section IV No. 2-D Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur

$1.441 $0.0599 $1.5009 656,213 $984,910.09

*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price. 21 Bids Opened: 10-12-16



PUR-1329

Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

TAC ENERGY
OPTION 1 DALLAS, TX
Winter Chemical Additive Protection $0.0350

(cost per gallon):

Winter Chemical Additive Protection
Product Name:

Legal Diesel Fuel Additive 1400 LHF

Manufacturer’s Name:

Innospec

*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price.

22

Bids Opened: 10-12-16



PUR-1329
Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

OPTION 2 DALLAS, TX

A B C D E
OPIS Price
OPIS Pri Bidd N A Net
Item rice idder Bidder pprox. ' e
as of +/- Factor Gallon Delivered
09-08-16 Factor (A +B) Usage (CXD)
Per Gallon

Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 64,387
Sec, | Tank-wagon

' Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 8,500
Tank-wagon

Gasoline Unleaded 87 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.4113 197,500
Sec. | Transport

Il |Gasoline Unleaded 89 Octane
CBOB Ethanol (10%) $1.5132 194,926
Transport

Total Sum Diesel Tank-wagon
Sec. |Deliveries as Described in

11 [Section 111 No. 2-D Diesel $1.441 60,875
Ultra Low Sulfur
Total Sum Diesel Transport

Sec. [Deliveries as Described in $1.441 656,213

1V [Section IV No. 2-D Diesel
Ultra Low Sulfur

OPTION 2

Total Sum Bid of All Section Totals
(Sections 1-4)

*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price. 23 Bids Opened: 10-12-16



PUR-1329

Bulk Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Deliveries

OPTION 2

TAC ENERGY
DALLAS, TX

Winter Chemical Additive Protection
(cost per gallon):

Winter Chemical Additive Protection
Product Name:

Manufacturer’s Name:

*Corrected calculations based on bidder factors and 9/08/16 OPIS price.

24

Bids Opened: 10-12-16
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, HEATING FUEL p
PROPANE P.O. BOX 4217 TRANSPORT SERVICES
PORTABLE RESTROOMS ERSTOWN, MD 21741.4217 HEATING AND COOLING SERVICES
PETROLEUM PRODUCTS O\ 301-582-2700 CONVENIENCE STORES
LIQUID WASTE HANDLING \ WWW.ACANDT.COM MOBILE STORAGE
Miasy oo canp Pyge 171 Always At Your Service

401 BRRTHERE %0
24742 dl 1ot ,iﬁlgg

HOGEREZTONN Ab

TATE
) R 471672817
TERMS  ET 15 DAYS 8 ACCOUNTNO.  1-0i8-2771 20
REFERENCE DELIVERY ' pegcRripTiON QUANTITY RATE AMOUNT TOTAL

NUMBER DATE

heliveved to customer §  1-014-2271.0010 &1 EN AkE YABERSTIHY D
4 B/LALY CHNE R LEah &7 NGV u;h?ﬁ 44028 LOSTERAGL
Gonventionsl fhthaand #lad

Lyt ~ flay oot be used v auy
Refarnulated Sssoline fovered Aves
Rurchaze ordar po HASLHODOEHZ130Y
# Exenpt ¥ FEDEEAL EXCISE VAR $ G2-s0uanzy
HARYLARD KUAD T4 gal

[t

FED LOST 183 5
1D 3 V.16
FED ENU REC FEE LESS 102 1214

D i APPROVED BY : ;
:T VFNE&'@H # :]_M
- |RECEIVER # —
GG [ACCOUNT # e

IMPORTANT - SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR CONDITIONS OF SALE

A.C. & T CO., INC. CERTIFIES THAT ALL MOTOR VEHICLE FUEL TAX WILL PLEASE PAY LAST AMOUNT
BE PAID AS REQUIRED BY LAW. Return One Copy of the invoice with payment IN THIS COLUMN

KOQ7-1F4Fh



Aol mg o aan b

T A S SO i R D I

[ RN

Coapdel G Dy g Mg [+ foatend
I. L
IR &Il LR R T [ R LR A G S

-Pﬁjd'o 024
/mD 3_5’0 /44 S S RS ER T ii»:.‘-.-‘.fmﬂ.-:i-‘:l...lét’*."i».!I

R 3=

CEOE B

ORIGINAL/OFFICE



HEATING FUEL

PROPANE

PORTABLE RESTRQO.:3
PETROLEUM PROCUCTS
LIQUID WASTE HANDLING

P.O. BOX 4217
HAGERSTOWN, MD 217414217
301-582-2700
WWW.ACANDT.COM

INVDICE

m A.C.&T.Co, Inc?‘_g%& 22)56 LBE6lp

TRANSPORT SERVICES

HEATING AND COOLING SERVICES
CONVENIENCE STORES

MOBILE STORAGE

Cpass ©n COHNISSIDNERS
401 HDRTHERN auE
HAGERSTOUN 4D

Page 1|

21742 D,
?Jf?\% el

Always At Your Service

INVGICE NO,
414,814

DATE
L BAaL/20317
TERMS #ET 15 DAYE # ACCOUNT NO. 1-004-2222 081
REFERENCE DELIVERY :
Al e DESCRIPTION QUANTITY RATE ¥-5 AMOUNT TOTAL
Ve 2 _
L1715 PPE ORULFUR ULSD Tf 5,990 it Hirada . F&)
15-popn sulfur GLSD = % 53 O\b .
PFyrphase nrder po HASCHOBINDZL305
¥ Exenpt # FEDERAL EXDISE TAY & 52-4001037
¥ Exenplt ¥ NARYLAMD BDAL TAR 3 301324
FED LUET TaR AMLOARL & G0
FED FHY BEC FEF Cha21/60 40
palgsal 11,46

R EMU FEE

4 Exenpl ¥ HARYLAND SALES Tad

&S

§ 30001297

- Ruen| R LORSH o5 22150

VOUCHER #

_1GG
= APPROVEDBY | 3. Re n(” s
- VENDOR # =

RECEIVER # | 144

ACCOUNT #

IMPORTANT - SEE REVERSE SiDE FOR CONDITIONS OF SALE

<26 COOBS

A.C. & T CO,, INC. CERTIFIES THAT ALL MOTOR VEHICLE FUEL TAX WILL

BE PAID AS REQUIRED BY LAW.

Return One Copy of the invoice with payment

PLEASE PAY LAST AMOUNT
IN THIS COLUMN

P L N T T



(LIRS,

ool MR

{
{ B¢
{Temanf

PR

TN,
@

tHM f;

Iuﬁs
fi=
iﬁTWH

KA

éi*

)

T T

{

[Conading Mym ¢

LG AL

BT L&

BRSO TS

g

Cule COMELTEe

{eres

MU :5&5:21&%;2;&)

0. S

C.0decol

{ ROUND TETE MILEe

PR B S i by i et RO B e e i e e e S ey e g ey

(681G e

ROLTT

niwwwmmm

{0 reag s

v »o

[t s

E B

R R O A )

oo bk

[4X}

SpIIT (79187

MLt

ADU LT LML

(Ot aene

CHAE

Dieav
Lo Shne an
Fooal £

ORIGINAL/OFFICE

M Lh*fﬁ”'N(HFﬁ\E[uM vy L Sl - 1TE poawe sme iCer U0EJ

fap Liar

[EHTR A

it

Chig € fammn

SN

Lot

il
Byl i {
Butt {

Gl




HEATING FUEL
PROPANE

PORTABLE RESTROOMS
PETRCLEUM PRODUCTS

P.O. BOX 4217
HAGERSTOWN, MD 21741-4217
301-582-2700

’m A.C.&T.Co.,Inc.

RTD PO E 5D 6“5

TRANSPORT SERVICES
HEATING AND COOLING SERVICES
CONVENIENCE STORES

LIQUID WASTE HANDLING WWW.ACANDT.COM MOBILE STORAGE
THASH oo ooy E i \LWG Page 171 Always At Your Service
401 HORTHER® AUE
HAGERSTHONY 1D 21742 f; 150, 41%
20514 T
DATE
L N g/01/22017
HET 1% DRYS 1-805-1674. 001
TERMS ACCOUNT NO.
REFERENCE DELIVERY
NtiaaER At DESCRIPTION QUANTITY RATE AMOUNT TOTAL
Custoney P I aunber: HASCHOOBOGA2L305
130412 8701717 H/L BAT DLY 87 BT i1s6.8 5L TR 198,83
Detergent-ddditized
Gasoline
Efihave reflects 3 CBTTRAEL disceunt OR 102,433
130412 RARYLAED RRaD TaXd &A3 . 3380 19 48
fou:
138412 FED LUST TAR = 601D .1z
SEUEN D EMU FEE <1 L0019 s 22
132 FE} ERU REC FI??LEES 184 081y

Total thu‘.im iﬂe ~ 2E %&
= E

,,,,, oMY fh‘l”o"

§238.97

LORSI ¢,
= |VOUCHER # F—QEE:;—‘SO
APPROVED BY | 77 7% -
. VENDOR # B QV“
(RECEIVER# | |4y “
O [ACCOUNT # -

IMPORTANT - SEE REVERSE SiDE FOR CONDITIONS OF SALE

o

OV E P

A.C. & T CO., INC. CERTIFIES THAT ALL MOTOR VEHICLE FUEL TAX WILL
BE PAID AS REQUIRED BY LAW.

Raturn One Copy of the invoice with payment

PLEASE PAY LAST AMOUNT
IN THIS COLUMN



| HEATING FUEL
PROPANE
PORTABLE RESTROOMS
PETROLEUM PRODUCTS
LIQUID WASTE HANDLING

P.O. BOX 4217
HAGERSTOWN MD 21741-4217
301-582-2700
WWW.ACANDT.COM

o Y1 p——
P

INVOICE

T uass €0 HiGHMAY DERT

Fage 1 1 Always At Your Service
401 HHRTHERY auE RUSEERS:
HAGERSTHUN 7D 21742 =y b 129,734
an s 3 1 18 :
TATE
L ] PAOG/RIT
157 10 DAvS pRS I FAHENS SR
TERMS ACCOUNT NO.
REFERENCE DELIVERY J
NLMERR ATE: DESCRIPTION QUANTITY RATE AMOUNT TOTAL
L2egad TA0SS0F 1T FRM OSULTUR ULsh pT 350, 4 1. 818/60 6% 64
1-pon sulfur UL3D
LT FER LUST TaX Gala L35
Lg% 34 FED EHU REC FEE HED 24
MO LNy FEE RIS 67
Tatal this lavopiga =e--? SG67. 40

_ VOUCHER # /A

- APPROVED BY \; iy /A
' : VENDOR # |

RECEIVER #
S=iy

Re161N .y ot

ACCOUNT # SJ_ZLV g; “b—z—g zoo(od’

IMPORTANT - SEE REVERSE 3I1DE FOR CONDITIONS OF SALE
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A.C.& T CO,, INC. CERTIFIES THAT ALL MOTOR VEHICLE FUEL TAX WILL
BE PAID AS REQUIRED BY LAW. Return One Topy of the invoice with payment

PLEASE PAY LAST AMOUNT
IN THIS COLUMN

5311&50&1_

TRANSPORT SERVICES
HEATING AND COOLING SERVICES
CONVENIENCE STORES

MOBILE STORAGE
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