
Q-17-642

Examination Gloves

Item Description

Approx.

Usage

(Boxes)

Vendor

Item #

Vendor

Item #

Vendor

Item #

1
Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, Large 4 mil. or

County approved equal.
20 14381300 $4.30 * 105-8 $1.95 * GVEP-L $3.69 *

2
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, Small, 5 mil.
41 46451310 $6.40 * 109-6N $3.35 * ZGNEP-BL-S $5.75 *

3
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, Medium, 5 mil.
72 46651310 $6.40 * 109-7N $3.35 * GNEP-BL-M $5.75 *

4
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, Large, 5 mil.
110 46851310 $6.40 * 109-8N $3.35 * GNEP-BL-L $5.75 *

5
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, X-Large, 5 mil.
140 46061310 $13.25 * 109-9N $3.35 * GNEP-BL-XL

6
UL315M, Exam glove, Medium, Microflex

Ultra One #UL315, no substitutions
100 UL315M $15.85 * ZUL315-M

7
UL315L, Exam glove, Large, Microflex 

Ultra One #UL315, no substitutions
90 UL315L $15.85 * ZUL315-L

8

UL315XL, Exam glove, Extra Large, 

Microflex Ultra One #UL315, no 

substitutions

30 UL 315-L $15.85 * ZUL315-XL

Unit 

Price

$26.20

$26.20

No Bid

No Bid

$26.20

Amerisochi, Inc.

Mentor, OH.

AOSS Medical Supply, 

LLC

Monroe, VA

Bob Barker Company

Faquay-Varina, NC

Item 1 to AOSS Medical Supply (Pending Additional Information)

Items 2, 3, 4, 5 to Interboro (Pending Additional Information)

Items 6, 7, 8 to Daigger Scientific (Pending Additional Information)

Item 9 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.

Items 10, 11, 12, 13 awarded to Lamco Safety Products

Items 14, 15, 16, 17 awarded to BoundTree Medical

Item 18 awarded to The Glove Box

Unit

Price

Unit

Price

$5.75

No Bid

Quotes Opened: 8-16-2017



Q-17-642

Examination Gloves

Unit 

Price

Amerisochi, Inc.

Mentor, OH.

AOSS Medical Supply, 

LLC

Monroe, VA

Bob Barker Company

Faquay-Varina, NC

Item 1 to AOSS Medical Supply (Pending Additional Information)

Items 2, 3, 4, 5 to Interboro (Pending Additional Information)

Items 6, 7, 8 to Daigger Scientific (Pending Additional Information)

Item 9 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.

Items 10, 11, 12, 13 awarded to Lamco Safety Products

Items 14, 15, 16, 17 awarded to BoundTree Medical

Item 18 awarded to The Glove Box

Unit

Price

Unit

Price
9

Exam glove, 2 Extra Large, Comparable to 

Microflex Ultra One #UL315
100 ZHER-2XL

10

Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, 

Medium, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 

12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 

substitutions

202

11

Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, 

Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” 

Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 

substitutions

4

12

Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, X-

Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” 

Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 

substitutions

89

13

Exam glove, 2X-Large, Comparable to 

Thickster Latex 6604-20 Powder Free, 

Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 

beaded cuff, 

608

14

Microflex Midknight MK296S, Black, 

Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

Small, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 

4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 

no substitutions

102 MK296s $13.25 * ZMK296-S

15

Microflex Midknight MK296M, Black, 

Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

Medium, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 

4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 

no substitutions

142 MK296M $13.25 * MK296-M

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$26.20

$9.20

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid $9.20

Quotes Opened: 8-16-2017



Q-17-642

Examination Gloves

Unit 

Price

Amerisochi, Inc.

Mentor, OH.

AOSS Medical Supply, 

LLC

Monroe, VA

Bob Barker Company

Faquay-Varina, NC

Item 1 to AOSS Medical Supply (Pending Additional Information)

Items 2, 3, 4, 5 to Interboro (Pending Additional Information)

Items 6, 7, 8 to Daigger Scientific (Pending Additional Information)

Item 9 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.

Items 10, 11, 12, 13 awarded to Lamco Safety Products

Items 14, 15, 16, 17 awarded to BoundTree Medical

Item 18 awarded to The Glove Box

Unit

Price

Unit

Price16

Microflex Midknight MK296L, Black, 

Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 

4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 

no substitutions

10 MK296L $13.25 * MK296-L

17

Microflex Midknight MK296XL, Black, 

Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

X-Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 

4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 

no substitutions

10 MK@(¢XL $13.25 * MK296-XL

18

Black, Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam 

Glove, comparable to Microflex Midknight, 

MK296, 2X Large,  length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 

mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile 

strength 16, 

10 MK296XXL $13.25 * ZMK296-2XL

Notes: Notes:

Amerisochi, Inc. Bob Barker Company

Item: Notes: Item: Notes:

#1 #1

#2 #2 

#3

#4 #3

#5 #4 &#5 *Safety Zone 5.75/C100

#6 to #8 #6 to #8

#14 to #18 *100/Bx

*Minium order $500.00 per shipment #9

#14

AOSS Medical Supply, LLC

*Adenna 26.20 per 100 *Packaged as case of 500*-$131/C500-

*Microflex 9.20 Per 100 *Packaged as Case of 1000 * - 

$92.00/C1000

*McKesson Brand 100/Bx

*Microflex 26.20 Per 100 *Packaged as Case of 500 * - 

$131.00/C500

*Safety Zone 3.69 /C100

*Safety Zon 5.75/C100

*Safety Zone 5.75 Per 100 *Packaged as Case of 1000* - $57.50/C1000

*Microflex 50/Bx

*Powder Free McKesson Brand 150/Bx

*McKesson Brand 100/Bx

*McKesson Brand 100/Bx

*McKesson Brand 100/Bx

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid $9.20

$9.20

$9.20

Quotes Opened: 8-16-2017

mailto:MK@(¢XL


Q-17-642

Examination Gloves

Unit 

Price

Amerisochi, Inc.

Mentor, OH.

AOSS Medical Supply, 

LLC

Monroe, VA

Bob Barker Company

Faquay-Varina, NC

Item 1 to AOSS Medical Supply (Pending Additional Information)

Items 2, 3, 4, 5 to Interboro (Pending Additional Information)

Items 6, 7, 8 to Daigger Scientific (Pending Additional Information)

Item 9 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.

Items 10, 11, 12, 13 awarded to Lamco Safety Products

Items 14, 15, 16, 17 awarded to BoundTree Medical

Item 18 awarded to The Glove Box

Unit

Price

Unit

Price

Item: Notes: #15 to #17 *Microflex 9.20/C100

#1 *1.95/Bx of 100 #18

#2 to #5 *3.35/100 gloves *Microflex 9.20 Per 100 *Packaged as Case of 1000 * - $92.00-

Quotes Opened: 8-16-2017



Q-17-642

Examination Gloves

Item Description

Approx.

Usage

(Boxes)

Vendor

Item #

Vendor

Item #

Vendor

Item #

1
Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, Large 4 mil. or

County approved equal.
20 1015-11482 $3.99 EF110806C $4.00 1190377

2
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, Small, 5 mil.
41 1015-91601 $9.35 EF15624 $4.86 5650495

3
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, Medium, 5 mil.
72 1015-91602 $9.35 EF15625 $4.86 5658308

4
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, Large, 5 mil.
110 1015-91603 $9.35 EF15626 $4.86 5653972

5
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, X-Large, 5 mil.
140 1015-91604 $9.35 EF15627 5653009

6
UL315M, Exam glove, Medium, Microflex

Ultra One #UL315, no substitutions
100 290316 UL315M 5653125 $6.86 *

7
UL315L, Exam glove, Large, Microflex 

Ultra One #UL315, no substitutions
90 290317 UL315L 5653153 $6.86 *

8

UL315XL, Exam glove, Extra Large, 

Microflex Ultra One #UL315, no 

substitutions

30 290318 UL315XL 5653154 $6.86 *

$2.15

$11.82

$11.82

Henry Schein, Inc.

Irmo, SC

$4.86

Daigger Scientific

Vernon Hills, IL

Bound Tree Medical, LLC

Dublin, OH

Item 1 awarded to AOSS Medical Supply

Items 2, 3, 4, 5 awarded to Interboro

Items 6, 7, 8 awarded to Daigger Scientific

Item 9 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.

Items 10, 11, 12, 13 awarded to Lamco Safety Products

Items 14, 15, 16, 17 awarded to BoundTree Medical

Item 18 awarded to The Glove Box

Unit

Price

$11.82

$5.00

$5.00

$5.00

Unit

Price

Unit

Price

$5.00

$11.23

$11.23

$11.23

Quotes Opened: 8-16-2017



Q-17-642

Examination Gloves

Henry Schein, Inc.

Irmo, SC

Daigger Scientific

Vernon Hills, IL

Bound Tree Medical, LLC

Dublin, OH

Item 1 awarded to AOSS Medical Supply

Items 2, 3, 4, 5 awarded to Interboro

Items 6, 7, 8 awarded to Daigger Scientific

Item 9 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.

Items 10, 11, 12, 13 awarded to Lamco Safety Products

Items 14, 15, 16, 17 awarded to BoundTree Medical

Item 18 awarded to The Glove Box

Unit

Price

Unit

Price

Unit

Price
9

Exam glove, 2 Extra Large, Comparable to 

Microflex Ultra One #UL315
100 5659445 $11.58 *

10

Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, 

Medium, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 

12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 

substitutions

202 9990010 $9.98 *

11

Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, 

Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” 

Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 

substitutions

4 9990011 $9.98 *

12

Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, X-

Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” 

Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 

substitutions

89 9990012 $9.98 *

13

Exam glove, 2X-Large, Comparable to 

Thickster Latex 6604-20 Powder Free, 

Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 

beaded cuff, 

608 9990013 $9.98 *

14

Microflex Midknight MK296S, Black, 

Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

Small, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 

4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 

no substitutions

102 MK296S 5655752

15

Microflex Midknight MK296M, Black, 

Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

Medium, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 

4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 

no substitutions

142 MK296M 5657365$6.78

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$6.78

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$10.06 $6.86

No Bid

No Bid

$6.86$10.06

Quotes Opened: 8-16-2017



Q-17-642

Examination Gloves

Henry Schein, Inc.

Irmo, SC

Daigger Scientific

Vernon Hills, IL

Bound Tree Medical, LLC

Dublin, OH

Item 1 awarded to AOSS Medical Supply

Items 2, 3, 4, 5 awarded to Interboro

Items 6, 7, 8 awarded to Daigger Scientific

Item 9 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.

Items 10, 11, 12, 13 awarded to Lamco Safety Products

Items 14, 15, 16, 17 awarded to BoundTree Medical

Item 18 awarded to The Glove Box

Unit

Price

Unit

Price

Unit

Price16

Microflex Midknight MK296L, Black, 

Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 

4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 

no substitutions

10 MK296L 5651031

17

Microflex Midknight MK296XL, Black, 

Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

X-Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 

4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 

no substitutions

10 MK296XL 5650811

18

Black, Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam 

Glove, comparable to Microflex Midknight, 

MK296, 2X Large,  length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 

mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile 

strength 16, 

10 MK29XXL 5654216

Notes:

Henry Schein, Inc.

Item: Notes:

#6 to #8 *6.86  50/Bx

#9 *11.58  50/Bx

#10 to #13 *9.98  50/Bx

$10.06

$10.06

$10.06

$6.86

$6.86

$6.86

$6.78

$6.78

$6.78

Quotes Opened: 8-16-2017



Q-17-642

Examination Gloves

Henry Schein, Inc.

Irmo, SC

Daigger Scientific

Vernon Hills, IL

Bound Tree Medical, LLC

Dublin, OH

Item 1 awarded to AOSS Medical Supply

Items 2, 3, 4, 5 awarded to Interboro

Items 6, 7, 8 awarded to Daigger Scientific

Item 9 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.

Items 10, 11, 12, 13 awarded to Lamco Safety Products

Items 14, 15, 16, 17 awarded to BoundTree Medical

Item 18 awarded to The Glove Box

Unit

Price

Unit

Price

Unit

Price

Quotes Opened: 8-16-2017



Q-17-642

Examination Gloves

Item Description

Approx.

Usage

(Boxes)

Unit

Price

Vendor

Item #

Unit

Price

Vendor

Item #

Unit

Price

1
Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, Large 4 mil. or

County approved equal.
20 * $2.20 VN9708 $2.60 EMP5300L $2.56

2
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, Small, 5 mil.
41 * $2.90 EN501 $4.70 EMP5400S $4.13

3
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, Medium, 5 mil.
72 * $2.90 EN502 $4.70 EMP5400M $4.13

4
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, Large, 5 mil.
110 * $2.90 EN503 $4.70 EMP5400L $4.13

5
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, X-Large, 5 mil.
140 * $2.90 EN504 $4.70 EMP5400XL $4.13

6
UL315M, Exam glove, Medium, Microflex

Ultra One #UL315, no substitutions
100 No Bid UL-315-M $12.36 NB

7
UL315L, Exam glove, Large, Microflex 

Ultra One #UL315, no substitutions
90 No Bid UL-315-L $12.36 NB

8

UL315XL, Exam glove, Extra Large, 

Microflex Ultra One #UL315, no 

substitutions

30 No Bid UL-315-XL $12.36 NB

Lamco Safety Products

Hanover, PA

Midwest Medical Supply, Co. 

LLC

Earth City, MO

Item 1 awarded to AOSS Medical Supply

Items 2, 3, 4, 5 awarded to Interboro

Items 6, 7, 8 awarded to Daigger Scientific

Item 9 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.

Items 10, 11, 12, 13 awarded to Lamco Safety Products

Items 14, 15, 16, 17 awarded to BoundTree Medical

Item 18 awarded to The Glove Box

Interboro Packaging 

Corporation

Montgomery, NY

Vendor

Item #

Quotes Opened: 8-16-2017



Q-17-642

Examination Gloves

Lamco Safety Products

Hanover, PA

Midwest Medical Supply, Co. 

LLC

Earth City, MO

Item 1 awarded to AOSS Medical Supply

Items 2, 3, 4, 5 awarded to Interboro

Items 6, 7, 8 awarded to Daigger Scientific

Item 9 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.

Items 10, 11, 12, 13 awarded to Lamco Safety Products

Items 14, 15, 16, 17 awarded to BoundTree Medical

Item 18 awarded to The Glove Box

Interboro Packaging 

Corporation

Montgomery, NY

Vendor

Item #
9

Exam glove, 2 Extra Large, Comparable to 

Microflex Ultra One #UL315
100 No Bid No Bid NB

10

Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, 

Medium, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 

12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 

substitutions

202 No Bid 6602-20 $8.75 NB

11

Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, 

Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” 

Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 

substitutions

4 No Bid 6603-20 $8.75 NB

12

Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, X-

Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” 

Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 

substitutions

89 No Bid 6604-20 $8.75 NB

13

Exam glove, 2X-Large, Comparable to 

Thickster Latex 6604-20 Powder Free, 

Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 

beaded cuff, 

608 No Bid 6605-20 $8.75 NB

14

Microflex Midknight MK296S, Black, 

Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

Small, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 

4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 

no substitutions

102 No Bid MK-296-S $11.55 MICMK-296-S $9.46

15

Microflex Midknight MK296M, Black, 

Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

Medium, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 

4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 

no substitutions

142 No Bid MK-296-M $11.55 MICMK-296-M $9.46

Quotes Opened: 8-16-2017



Q-17-642

Examination Gloves

Lamco Safety Products

Hanover, PA

Midwest Medical Supply, Co. 

LLC

Earth City, MO

Item 1 awarded to AOSS Medical Supply

Items 2, 3, 4, 5 awarded to Interboro

Items 6, 7, 8 awarded to Daigger Scientific

Item 9 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.

Items 10, 11, 12, 13 awarded to Lamco Safety Products

Items 14, 15, 16, 17 awarded to BoundTree Medical

Item 18 awarded to The Glove Box

Interboro Packaging 

Corporation

Montgomery, NY

Vendor

Item #16

Microflex Midknight MK296L, Black, 

Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 

4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 

no substitutions

10 No Bid MK-296-L $11.55 MICMK-296-L $9.46

17

Microflex Midknight MK296XL, Black, 

Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

X-Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 

4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 

no substitutions

10 No Bid MK-296-XL $11.55 MICMK-296-XL $9.46

18

Black, Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam 

Glove, comparable to Microflex Midknight, 

MK296, 2X Large,  length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 

mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile 

strength 16, 

10 No Bid No Bid MICMK-296-XXL $9.46

Notes:

Interboro Packaging Corporation

Item: Notes:

#1 FirstCare/JobGuard-Large-VG-E, As per Sample #1

#2 FirstCare/JobGuard-Small-NPFG-E, As per Sample #2

#3 FirstCare/JobGuard-Medium-NPFG-E, As per Sample #3

#4 FirstCare/JobGuard-Large-NPFG-E, As per Sample #4

#5 FirstCare/JobGuard-XLarge-NPFG-E, As per Sample #5

Quotes Opened: 8-16-2017
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Examination Gloves

Lamco Safety Products

Hanover, PA

Midwest Medical Supply, Co. 

LLC

Earth City, MO

Item 1 awarded to AOSS Medical Supply

Items 2, 3, 4, 5 awarded to Interboro

Items 6, 7, 8 awarded to Daigger Scientific

Item 9 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.

Items 10, 11, 12, 13 awarded to Lamco Safety Products

Items 14, 15, 16, 17 awarded to BoundTree Medical

Item 18 awarded to The Glove Box

Interboro Packaging 

Corporation

Montgomery, NY

Vendor

Item #

Quotes Opened: 8-16-2017



Q-17-642

Examination Gloves

Item Description

Approx.

Usage

(Boxes)

Vendor

Item #

Unit

Price

Vendor

Item #

Unit

Price

Vendor

Item #

Unit

Price

1
Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, Large 4 mil. or

County approved equal.
20 No Bid VLG200 $2.91 2304 $2.93

2
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, Small, 5 mil.
41 106203 $3.25 NSM6201 $5.81 068-6 $3.53

3
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, Medium, 5 mil.
72 106024 $3.25 NSM6201 $5.81 068-7 $3.53

4
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, Large, 5 mil.
110 106025 $3.25 NSM6201 $5.81 068-8 $3.53

5
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, X-Large, 5 mil.
140 106206 $3.25 NSM6201 $5.81 068-9 $3.53

6
UL315M, Exam glove, Medium, Microflex

Ultra One #UL315, no substitutions
100 No Bid UL315 $12.80 No Bid

7
UL315L, Exam glove, Large, Microflex 

Ultra One #UL315, no substitutions
90 No Bid $12.80 No Bid

8

UL315XL, Exam glove, Extra Large, 

Microflex Ultra One #UL315, no 

substitutions

30 No Bid $13.90 No Bid

The Glove Box, Inc.

Charlotte, NC

Sterile Services

Woodbridge, VA

Item 1 awarded to AOSS Medical Supply

Items 2, 3, 4, 5 awarded to Interboro

Items 6, 7, 8 awarded to Daigger Scientific

Item 9 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.

Items 10, 11, 12, 13 awarded to Lamco Safety Products

Items 14, 15, 16, 17 awarded to BoundTree Medical

Item 18 awarded to The Glove Box

Precision

 Disposble Products Inc.

Rocklin, CA

Quotes Opened: 8-16-2017
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Examination Gloves

The Glove Box, Inc.

Charlotte, NC

Sterile Services

Woodbridge, VA

Item 1 awarded to AOSS Medical Supply

Items 2, 3, 4, 5 awarded to Interboro

Items 6, 7, 8 awarded to Daigger Scientific

Item 9 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.

Items 10, 11, 12, 13 awarded to Lamco Safety Products

Items 14, 15, 16, 17 awarded to BoundTree Medical

Item 18 awarded to The Glove Box

Precision

 Disposble Products Inc.

Rocklin, CA

9
Exam glove, 2 Extra Large, Comparable to 

Microflex Ultra One #UL315
100 No Bid $13.90 No Bid

10

Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, 

Medium, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 

12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 

substitutions

202 No Bid No Bid

11

Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, 

Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” 

Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 

substitutions

4 No Bid No Bid

12

Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, X-

Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” 

Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 

substitutions

89 No Bid No Bid

13

Exam glove, 2X-Large, Comparable to 

Thickster Latex 6604-20 Powder Free, 

Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 

beaded cuff, 

608 No Bid 015-0 $89.95

14

Microflex Midknight MK296S, Black, 

Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

Small, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 

4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 

no substitutions

102 No Bid MK296 $11.05 No Bid

15

Microflex Midknight MK296M, Black, 

Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

Medium, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 

4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 

no substitutions

142 No Bid MK296 $11.05 No Bid

Quotes Opened: 8-16-2017
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Examination Gloves

The Glove Box, Inc.

Charlotte, NC

Sterile Services

Woodbridge, VA

Item 1 awarded to AOSS Medical Supply

Items 2, 3, 4, 5 awarded to Interboro

Items 6, 7, 8 awarded to Daigger Scientific

Item 9 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.

Items 10, 11, 12, 13 awarded to Lamco Safety Products

Items 14, 15, 16, 17 awarded to BoundTree Medical

Item 18 awarded to The Glove Box

Precision

 Disposble Products Inc.

Rocklin, CA

16

Microflex Midknight MK296L, Black, 

Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 

4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 

no substitutions

10 No Bid MK296 $11.05 No Bid

17

Microflex Midknight MK296XL, Black, 

Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

X-Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 

4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 

no substitutions

10 No Bid MK296 $11.05 No Bid

18

Black, Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam 

Glove, comparable to Microflex Midknight, 

MK296, 2X Large,  length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 

mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile 

strength 16, 

10 No Bid MK296 $11.05 $6.39

Quotes Opened: 8-16-2017



Q-17-642

Examination Gloves

The Glove Box, Inc.

Charlotte, NC

Sterile Services

Woodbridge, VA

Item 1 awarded to AOSS Medical Supply

Items 2, 3, 4, 5 awarded to Interboro

Items 6, 7, 8 awarded to Daigger Scientific

Item 9 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.

Items 10, 11, 12, 13 awarded to Lamco Safety Products

Items 14, 15, 16, 17 awarded to BoundTree Medical

Item 18 awarded to The Glove Box

Precision

 Disposble Products Inc.

Rocklin, CA

Quotes Opened: 8-16-2017



Q-17-642

Examination Gloves

Item Description

Approx.

Usage

(Boxes)

Vendor

Item #

Unit

Price

1
Vinyl Glove, Non-Sterile, Large 4 mil. or

County approved equal.
20 VX1001 $5.50

2
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, Small, 5 mil.
41 VX1002 $6.49

3
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, Medium, 5 mil.
72 VX1003 $6.49

4
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, Large, 5 mil.
110 VX1004 $6.49

5
Nitrile Glove, Powder-Free,

Textured Grip, X-Large, 5 mil.
140 VX1005 $6.49

6
UL315M, Exam glove, Medium, Microflex

Ultra One #UL315, no substitutions
100 No Bid

7
UL315L, Exam glove, Large, Microflex 

Ultra One #UL315, no substitutions
90 No Bid

8

UL315XL, Exam glove, Extra Large, 

Microflex Ultra One #UL315, no 

substitutions

30 No Bid

Item 1 awarded to AOSS Medical Supply

Items 2, 3, 4, 5 awarded to Interboro

Items 6, 7, 8 awarded to Daigger Scientific

Item 9 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.

Items 10, 11, 12, 13 awarded to Lamco Safety Products

Items 14, 15, 16, 17 awarded to BoundTree Medical

Item 18 awarded to The Glove Box

Vision X

Onley, MD

Quotes Opened: 8-16-2017



Q-17-642

Examination Gloves

Item 1 awarded to AOSS Medical Supply

Items 2, 3, 4, 5 awarded to Interboro

Items 6, 7, 8 awarded to Daigger Scientific

Item 9 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.

Items 10, 11, 12, 13 awarded to Lamco Safety Products

Items 14, 15, 16, 17 awarded to BoundTree Medical

Item 18 awarded to The Glove Box

Vision X

Onley, MD

9
Exam glove, 2 Extra Large, Comparable to 

Microflex Ultra One #UL315
100 No Bid

10

Thickster Latex 6602-20 Exam glove, 

Medium, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 

12” Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 

substitutions

202

11

Thickster Latex 6603-20 Exam glove, 

Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” 

Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 

substitutions

4

12

Thickster Latex 6604-20 Exam glove, X-

Large, Powder Free, Textured Fingers, 12” 

Length, 14 mil., beaded cuff,  no 

substitutions

89

13

Exam glove, 2X-Large, Comparable to 

Thickster Latex 6604-20 Powder Free, 

Textured Fingers, 12” Length, 14 mil., 

beaded cuff, 

608

14

Microflex Midknight MK296S, Black, 

Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

Small, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 

4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 

no substitutions

102

15

Microflex Midknight MK296M, Black, 

Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

Medium, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 

4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 

no substitutions

142

Quotes Opened: 8-16-2017



Q-17-642

Examination Gloves

Item 1 awarded to AOSS Medical Supply

Items 2, 3, 4, 5 awarded to Interboro

Items 6, 7, 8 awarded to Daigger Scientific

Item 9 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.

Items 10, 11, 12, 13 awarded to Lamco Safety Products

Items 14, 15, 16, 17 awarded to BoundTree Medical

Item 18 awarded to The Glove Box

Vision X

Onley, MD

16

Microflex Midknight MK296L, Black, 

Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 

4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 

no substitutions

10

17

Microflex Midknight MK296XL, Black, 

Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam Glove, 

X-Large, length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 mil, palm 

4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile strength 16, 

no substitutions

10

18

Black, Powder-free Nitrile Standard Exam 

Glove, comparable to Microflex Midknight, 

MK296, 2X Large,  length 245 mm, cuff 3.1 

mil, palm 4.7 mil, finger 5.5 mil, tensile 

strength 16, 

10

Quotes Opened: 8-16-2017



Q-17-642

Examination Gloves

Item 1 awarded to AOSS Medical Supply

Items 2, 3, 4, 5 awarded to Interboro

Items 6, 7, 8 awarded to Daigger Scientific

Item 9 awarded to Henry Schein, Inc.

Items 10, 11, 12, 13 awarded to Lamco Safety Products

Items 14, 15, 16, 17 awarded to BoundTree Medical

Item 18 awarded to The Glove Box

Vision X

Onley, MD

Quotes Opened: 8-16-2017


