
Q-16-613
Custodial Paper and Hand Soap
for Various County Departments

1 Quotes Opened: June 8, 2016

Benjamin Office Supply & 
Services, Inc.

Rockville, MD

Central Poly-Bag Corp.
Linden, NJ

FPC Holdings, Inc.
Elkridge, MD

Toilet Tissue, minimum dimension of (WxL) 4.5”x 4.05” 
not to exceed 4.5”x 4.5” shall be acceptable, 2 Ply White, 
550 sheets per roll. Georgia-Pacific or County approved 
equal.   (80 rolls/case)

$56.14 $36.60 $27.09

Rolls per Case 80 80 80

Hand Towels, Multifold, natural, approximately 9.25”x 9.25”, 
250 towels/pkg, 16 pkgs/case.  Georgia-Pacific or County 
approved equal. (4,000 sheets per case)

$27.85 $12.79 $12.70

Sheets per Case 4,000 4,000 4,000

Roll Towels, Second Nature Hardwound, natural, 7.85” w x 
350 linear ft.  SCA or County approved equal.  (24 rolls/case) $29.24 $14.79 $14.13

Rolls per Case 12 12 12

4 Roll Towels, white, 800’ rolls. Enmotion/Georgia-
Pacific. No substitutions.   (6 rolls/case) $46.56 $41.99 $48.51

5
GOJO  Luxury Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills for 
FMX-12 Dispensing Systems -1250 ml/ea.  No 
substitutions.  (case pkg/3)

$48.89 $37.14

6
GOJO Premium Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills for 
TFX Touch-Free Dispensing Systems - 1200 ml/ea.  No 
Substitutions.  (case pkg/2)

$48.14 $39.40

Item No. / Description

1

2

3



Q-16-613
Custodial Paper and Hand Soap
for Various County Departments

2 Quotes Opened: June 8, 2016

Benjamin Office Supply & 
Services, Inc.

Rockville, MD

Central Poly-Bag Corp.
Linden, NJ

FPC Holdings, Inc.
Elkridge, MD

Item No. / Description

7 Antibacterial Hand Soap Refill - 1 gal/ea  Dial 
Professional or County Approved equal.  (case pkg/4) $46.07 $39.07

8
Ecosoft  Universal Tissue Roll (BW 10020) – two (2) ply, 
3 7/8” 9” diameter, core 3.32”.  No substitutions.  (12 
rolls/case)

$35.87 $22.50 No Bid

9 Waxed Paper Liner – 9” x 10” x 3.25”.  Hospeco 
(HS6141) or County approved equal. (250/case) $21.57 $10.72

Notes:
Central Poly Corp. Awarded Items:

1 4.5x4.5, 500 shts/roll, Atlas #A280 Item 1: FPC Holdings, Inc.
2 Putney #P200N Item 2: FPC Holdings, Inc.
3 Putney #P720N 12/cs Item 3: FPC Holdings, Inc.
4 VonDrehle #816B Item 4: Lott Knows Paper LLC
8 Atlas #A700 Item 5: Weiss Bros

Item 6: FPC Holdings, Inc.
FPC Holdings, Inc. Item 7: W. B. Mason Co. Inc.

1 Vondrehle #24480 Item 8: Weiss Bros
2 Vondrehle 548k Item 9: FPC Holdings, Inc.
3 Cascades 1757
4 Georgia Pacific 89460 enMotion
5 Gojo
6 Gojo
7 Dial
9 Hospeco



Q-16-613
Custodial Paper and Hand Soap
for Various County Departments

3 Quotes Opened: June 8, 2016

Lott Knows Paper LLC
Huntsville, AL

Pyramid School Products
Tampa, FL

Resource Marketing Group
DBA Community Depot

Hagerstown, MD

Toilet Tissue, minimum dimension of (WxL) 4.5”x 4.05” 
not to exceed 4.5”x 4.5” shall be acceptable, 2 Ply White, 
550 sheets per roll. Georgia-Pacific or County approved 
equal.   (80 rolls/case)

$43.00 No Bid $28.99

Rolls per Case 80 80

Hand Towels, Multifold, natural, approximately 9.25”x 9.25”, 
250 towels/pkg, 16 pkgs/case.  Georgia-Pacific or County 
approved equal. (4,000 sheets per case)

$32.00 No Bid

Sheets per Case 800

Roll Towels, Second Nature Hardwound, natural, 7.85” w x 
350 linear ft.  SCA or County approved equal.  (24 rolls/case) $35.00 No Bid $29.99

Rolls per Case 12 12

4 Roll Towels, white, 800’ rolls. Enmotion/Georgia-
Pacific. No substitutions.   (6 rolls/case) $43.00 No Bid

5
GOJO  Luxury Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills for 
FMX-12 Dispensing Systems -1250 ml/ea.  No 
substitutions.  (case pkg/3)

No Bid

6
GOJO Premium Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills for 
TFX Touch-Free Dispensing Systems - 1200 ml/ea.  No 
Substitutions.  (case pkg/2)

No Bid

Item No. / Description
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Q-16-613
Custodial Paper and Hand Soap
for Various County Departments

4 Quotes Opened: June 8, 2016

Lott Knows Paper LLC
Huntsville, AL

Pyramid School Products
Tampa, FL

Resource Marketing Group
DBA Community Depot

Hagerstown, MD
Item No. / Description

7 Antibacterial Hand Soap Refill - 1 gal/ea  Dial 
Professional or County Approved equal.  (case pkg/4) $64.98 $25.99

8
Ecosoft  Universal Tissue Roll (BW 10020) – two (2) ply, 
3 7/8” 9” diameter, core 3.32”.  No substitutions.  (12 
rolls/case)

No Bid

9 Waxed Paper Liner – 9” x 10” x 3.25”.  Hospeco 
(HS6141) or County approved equal. (250/case) $21.00 $11.98 $29.99

Notes:
Pyramid School Products Awarded Items:

7 Dial#DIA88047 Item 1: FPC Holdings, Inc.
Item 2: FPC Holdings, Inc.
Item 3: FPC Holdings, Inc.
Item 4: Lott Knows Paper LLC
Item 5: Weiss Bros
Item 6: FPC Holdings, Inc.
Item 7: W. B. Mason Co. Inc.
Item 8: Weiss Bros
Item 9: FPC Holdings, Inc.



Q-16-613
Custodial Paper and Hand Soap
for Various County Departments

5 Quotes Opened: June 8, 2016

W.B. Mason Co. Inc.
Columbia, MD

Weiss Bros
Hagerstown, MD

Toilet Tissue, minimum dimension of (WxL) 4.5”x 4.05” 
not to exceed 4.5”x 4.5” shall be acceptable, 2 Ply White, 
550 sheets per roll. Georgia-Pacific or County approved 
equal.   (80 rolls/case)

$35.99 $34.21

Rolls per Case 80 80

Hand Towels, Multifold, natural, approximately 9.25”x 9.25”, 
250 towels/pkg, 16 pkgs/case.  Georgia-Pacific or County 
approved equal. (4,000 sheets per case)

$13.25 $14.37

Sheets per Case 4,000 4,000

Roll Towels, Second Nature Hardwound, natural, 7.85” w x 
350 linear ft.  SCA or County approved equal.  (24 rolls/case) $15.35 $15.26

Rolls per Case 12

4 Roll Towels, white, 800’ rolls. Enmotion/Georgia-
Pacific. No substitutions.   (6 rolls/case) $47.65 $48.63

5
GOJO  Luxury Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills for 
FMX-12 Dispensing Systems -1250 ml/ea.  No 
substitutions.  (case pkg/3)

$36.37 $35.95

6
GOJO Premium Foam Antibacterial Handwash refills for 
TFX Touch-Free Dispensing Systems - 1200 ml/ea.  No 
Substitutions.  (case pkg/2)

$35.99 No Bid

Item No. / Description
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Q-16-613
Custodial Paper and Hand Soap
for Various County Departments

6 Quotes Opened: June 8, 2016

W.B. Mason Co. Inc.
Columbia, MD

Weiss Bros
Hagerstown, MD

Item No. / Description

7 Antibacterial Hand Soap Refill - 1 gal/ea  Dial 
Professional or County Approved equal.  (case pkg/4) $22.79 No Bid

8
Ecosoft  Universal Tissue Roll (BW 10020) – two (2) ply, 
3 7/8” 9” diameter, core 3.32”.  No substitutions.  (12 
rolls/case)

$33.99 $23.65

9 Waxed Paper Liner – 9” x 10” x 3.25”.  Hospeco 
(HS6141) or County approved equal. (250/case) $14.29 $13.79

Notes:
W.B. Mason Co. Inc. Awarded Items:

1 GPC1988001 Item 1: FPC Holdings, Inc.
2 CSWMFW33412 Item 2: FPC Holdings, Inc.
3 HVN410095 Item 3: FPC Holdings, Inc.
5 GOJ516203 Item 4: Lott Knows Paper LLC
6 GOJ536202 Item 5: Weiss Bros
7 BWK430CT Item 6: FPC Holdings, Inc.
8 WAU10020 Item 7: W. B. Mason Co. Inc.
9 HOS6141 Item 8: Weiss Bros

Item 9: FPC Holdings, Inc.
Weiss Bros

1 Georgia Pacific 19880/01
2 Georgia Pacific 23304
3 Wausau 46200
5 Gojo 5162-03
8 BW 10020
9 Hospeco 6141
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