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BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 
August 16, 2022 

OPEN SESSION AGENDA 

10:00 AM MOMENT OF SILENCE AND PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
CALL TO ORDER, President Jeffrey A. Cline 
APPROVAL OF MINUTES: August 9, 2022 

10:05 AM COMMISSIONERS’ REPORTS AND COMMENTS 

10:10 AM STAFF COMMENTS 

10:15 AM CITIZEN PARTICIPATION  

10:20 AM TOWN OF FUNKSTOWN – REQUESTING $200,000 ARTZ FARM LOAN 
FORGIVENESS 

  Mayor Paul Crampton, Jr., Funkstown  
 
10:30 AM  PUBLIC HEARING – PROGRAM OPEN SPACE PROPERTY ACQUISITION 

Todd Moser, Real Property Administrator, Engineering; Andrew Eshelman, Director, 
Public Works 
 

10:40 AM PRESENTATION OF PROCLAMATION FOR NATIONAL AVIATION DAY 
Andrew Eshleman, Director, Public Works; John Seburn, Executive Director, 
Hagerstown Aviation Museum; Karen Hemenway, Donor Engagement & Event 
Coordinator, Hagerstown Aviation Museum  
 

10:50 AM APPLICATION FOR ZONING MAP AMENDMENT RZ-22-003 
  Travis Allen, Comprehensive Planner, Planning and Zoning 
 
11:00 AM TWENTY-FOUR HOUR SHIFTS FOR THE EMERGENCY COMMUNICATIONS 

CENTER 
Brian Albert, Assistant Director, Emergency Communications; Kelly Fisher, 
Operations Manager, Emergency Communications   

 
11:05 AM BID AWARD (PUR-1559) – CONTRACT SERVICES AT TRANSFER STATIONS 

AND ON-SITE AT FORTY WEST LANDFILL 
  Brandi Naugle, Buyer, Purchasing; David Mason, Deputy Director, Solid Waste 
 
  BID AWARD (PUR-1560) – RECYCLING DROP-OFF SERVICES 

Brandi Naugle, Buyer, Purchasing; David Mason, Deputy Director, Solid Waste 
 

Wayne K. Keefer 
Randall E. Wagner 
Charles A. Burkett 

100 West Washington Street, Suite 1101 | Hagerstown, MD 21740-4735 | P: 240.313.2200 | F: 240.313.2201 
WWW.WASHCO-MD.NET 
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OPEN Session Agenda 
August 16,  2022 

 

 
Individuals requiring special accommodations are requested to contact the Office of the County Commissioners, 240.313.2200 
Voice/TDD, to make arrangements no later than ten (10) working days prior to the meeting.   
 

   
11:10 AM BID AWARD (PUR-1557) – ROOF MEMBRANE REPLACEMENT AT IKO WAY 
  Rick Curry, Director, Purchasing; Andrew Eshleman, Director, Public Works 
 
11:15 AM CONSTRUCTION BID AWARD – PROFESSIONAL BOULEVARD PHASE II 
  Scott Hobbs, Director, Engineering 
 
11:20 AM POSITION GRADE CHANGE REQUEST 

Andrew Eshleman, Director, Public Works; Mark Bradshaw, Director, Environmental 
Management 

   
11:25 AM TRANSIT DEPARTMENT REORGANIZATION 
  Andrew Eshleman, Director, Public Works; Kevin Cerrone, Director, Transit 
 
11:30 AM DISCUSSION – FY22 SURPLUS – INCOME TAX AND RECORDATION TAX 
  Kelcee Mace, Interim Chief Financial Officer, Budget and Finance  
 

11:40 AM CLOSED SESSION - (To discuss the appointment, employment, assignment, 
promotion, discipline, demotion, compensation, removal, resignation, or performance evaluation of 
appointees, employees, or officials over whom this public body has jurisdiction; or any other 
personnel matter that affects one or more specific individuals; To consider a matter that concerns the 
proposal for a business or industrial organization to locate, expand, or remain in the State; To consult 
with counsel to obtain legal advice on a legal matter; and To discuss public security, if the public body 
determines that public discussion would constitute a risk to the public or to public security, including: 
(i) the development of fire and police services and staff; and (ii) the development and implementation 
of emergency plans) 
 
12:30 PM RECONVENE IN OPEN SESSION 

ADJOURNMENT  



Open Session Item 

SUBJECT:  Town of Funkstown – Requesting $200,000 Artz Farm Loan Forgiveness 

PRESENTATION DATE:   August 16, 2022 

PRESENTATION BY:  Mayor Paul Crampton, Jr. 

RECOMMENDED MOTION: 

REPORT-IN-BRIEF:  In 2016, Mayor Paul Crampton, Jr. approached the Washington County 
Commissioners with an interest to borrow one million dollars for the acquisition of the Artz Farm and 
65 Old National Pike.  That ground is contiguous to the existing park land. The two parcels would then 
become part of the existing park land, and would be annexed into the Town of Funkstown.  Originally 
the Town was approved for the entire cost of the Artz Farm from POS over a ten year period, not 
knowing at the time that the Town was approved for the LWCF grant.  That made the cost less even 
with the additional inclusion of the 65 Old National Pike property. 
Letters were sent to Mr. Greg Murray, County Administrator; and to the Washington County 
Commissioners that breaks down in detail the complete project. At the Washington County 
Commissioners meeting dated November1, 2016, the project was unanimously approved for a loan of 
up to $1 million from the County’s general fund reserves to the Town of Funkstown for ten years at a 
1% interest rate to be used by the Town to purchase the Artz Farm property for $779,380 and the 65 Old 
National Pike property for $200,000. 
The POS Local funding acquisition application was intended to be an entire package, but the 2.11-acre 
parcel is not specifically referenced.  The Town was informed that Maryland law does not allow the 
department to amend existing POS Local grants.  A packet will be provided showing numerous 
documents where the Artz Farm project was to be a complete acquisition project.       

DISCUSSION: N/A 

FISCAL IMPACT:  N/A 

CONCURRENCES:  N/A 

ATTACHMENTS:  Map

Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland 

Agenda Report Form 

















 

Open Session Item 

SUBJECT:  National Aviation Day  

PRESENTATION DATE: August 16, 2022 

PRESENTATION BY: Andrew Eshleman, Director, Public Works; John Seburn, Executive 
Director, Hagerstown Aviation Museum; Karen Hemenway Donor Engagement & Event 
Coordinator 

RECOMMENDED MOTION: N/A 

REPORT-IN-BRIEF: August 19th is National Aviation Day, celebrated since 1939 on Orville 
Wright’s birthday. The Day celebrates aviation history and contributions.   

DISCUSSION: The Hagerstown Aviation Museum will share how they are preserving local 
aviation history, undertaking plans for a permanent museum, and engaging the community in 
aviation events.  

FISCAL IMPACT:  N/A 

CONCURRENCES: N/A 

ALTERNATIVES: N/A 

ATTACHMENTS: N/A 

AUDIO/VISUAL NEEDS: N/A 

 

 

Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland 
 

Agenda Report Form  



 

 
Open Session Item 

SUBJECT:  Application for Zoning Map Amendment RZ-22-003 

PRESENTATION DATE: August 16, 2022  

PRESENTATION BY: Travis Allen, Comprehensive Planner, Department of Planning and Zoning 

RECOMMENDED MOTION: Approval of the partial termination of the Rural Business Zoning 
District (RB) at the subject property. 

REPORT-IN-BRIEF: Application is being made to partially terminate an existing Rural Business 
floating zone through a rezoning map amendment.   

DISCUSSION: The applicant Dan and Sharon Blickenstaff seek a map amendment for a property 
located at 16333 Mount Tabor Road.  An existing RB floating zone was most recently established over 
the parcel in 2014.  The current proposal seeks to remove 2.64 acres of the RB floating zone thereby 
enabling the applicant to pursue single family residential uses on an intended three lot subdivision.  
Most residential uses are not permitted within the current RB Zoning.   

The factors to be considered in a request to partially terminate an existing RB zoning district are 
specified in Section 5E.8 of the Washington County Zoning Ordinance.  The applicant must provide a 
written request as well as a detailed drawing showing surveyed metes and bounds of the requested 
change so as to determine the remaining limits of the RB floating zone district.  The Board of County 
Commissioners may approve or deny the request without holding a public hearing.   

This item was presented to the Washington County Planning Commission at their regular meeting on 
August 1, 2022.  The members unanimously recommended approval of the proposed map amendment. 

FISCAL IMPACT: N/A 

CONCURRENCES: Washington County Planning Commission 

ALTERNATIVES: N/A 

ATTACHMENTS: Staff report, Zoning Exhibit, Request Letter, Planning Commission 
recommendation, approved Planning Commission minutes  

AUDIO/VISUAL NEEDS: none 

 

Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland 
 

Agenda Report Form  









 

Open Session Item 

SUBJECT:  Twenty-four hour shifts for the Emergency Communications Center (ECC) 

PRESENTATION DATE:   August 16, 2022 

PRESENTATION BY:  Brian Albert, Assistant Director, Emergency Communications; Kelly Fisher, 
Operations Manager, Emergency Communications 

RECOMMENDED MOTION: Motion to approve the use of twenty-four (24) hour work shifts for 
ECC, maintaining the ability for twelve hour (12) work shifts for employees who cannot, or do not want 
to work twenty-four (24) hour shifts. 

REPORT-IN-BRIEF:  The trial period for twenty-hour (24) work shifts began on April 2nd, 2022 and 
continues through present day.  All employees that desired to remain on a twelve (12) hour shift schedule 
were permitted to do so.  Positive feedback was received from thirty-two (32) employees in an 
anonymous survey that was sent out by Public Relations (PR). Seven (7) employees have expressed 
their desire to remain on twelve (12) hour work shifts and found the twenty-four hour work shifts 
undesirable. 

DISCUSSION: The ECC can continue with the twenty-four (24) hour work shifts and still 
accommodate those employees that want to remain on twelve-hour (12) hour work shifts.  This will 
allow Washington County ECC to advertise our open positions with a twenty-four (24) hour work shift.  
If approved by the BOCC the twenty-four (24) hour work shift option will require an amendment to the 
Union contract.  ECC administration has been in contact with Union leadership during the trial period. 
The Union Leadership agrees with the twenty-four (24) hour work shift option and is prepared to execute 
a contract addendum referencing the same. 

FISCAL IMPACT:  Less than $10,000.00 in Overtime.   The ECC is able to absorb this increase in the 
current Overtime budget allotment.   

CONCURRENCES:  Director of Emergency Services 

ATTACHMENTS: None 

  
 

Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland 
 

Agenda Report Form  



 

 

Open Session Item 

SUBJECT:  Bid Award (PUR-1559) – Contract Services at Transfer Stations and On-Site at Forty 
West Landfill 

PRESENTATION DATE:  August 16, 2022 
 
PRESENTATION BY:  Brandi Naugle, Buyer, Purchasing Department and David Mason, P.E., 
Deputy Director, Department of Solid Waste. 
    
RECOMMENDED MOTION:  Move to award the Contract Services at Transfer Stations and 
On-Site at the Forty West Landfill to responsive, responsible, bidder Panhandle Dumpsters LLC, 
of Martinsburg, WV based on the Total Sum Bid (Transfer Station Location Nos. 1 through 5) 
$586,150, plus Alternate No.1 (cardboard transports at Forty West) $8,800.00 for a Total Lump 
Sum of $594,950 and the procurement is contingent upon the company being registered and 
providing proof of being in “Good Standing” with the Department of Assessment and Taxation. 

REPORT-IN-BRIEF:   On June 29, 2022 the County advertised to solicit new pricing for these 
services and on July 27, 2022 accepted bids for the Contract Services at the Transfer Stations and 
On-Site at Forty West Landfill.  The Invitation to Bid (ITB) was advertised in the local newspaper, 
listed on the State’s Emma (eMaryland Marketplace Advantage) website and the County’s 
website. Sixteen (16) persons/companies registered and downloaded the bid document on-line.  
Three (3) bids were received as indicated on the attached bid tabulation matrix.   

The contract is for a two (2) year period, commencing October 1, 2022, with an option by the 
County to renew for up to one (1) additional one (1) year period. Subject to written notice given 
by the County at least sixty (60) calendar days in advance of its expiration. The County reserves 
the right to accept or reject any request for renewal. The County guarantees neither a 
maximum/minimum of transports from each location under this contract.  

DISCUSSION:  N/A 

FISCAL IMPACT Funds are budgeted in the department’s operating expense account (515190-
21-21100). 

CONCURRENCES:  N/A 

ALTERNATIVES:  N/A 
 
ATTACHMENTS:  Bid Matrix Tabulation. 
 
AUDIO/VISUAL NEEDS:  N/A 

Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland 
 

Agenda Report Form  



PUR-1559
Transfer Stations, On-Site at Forty-West Landfill and Alternate for Cardboard

Item 
No. Item Description Unit of 

Measure Qty Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

A. Location No. 1:  One 
(1) Trip - Greensburg Trips 650 $195.29 $126,938.50 $125.00 $81,250.00 $265.45 $172,542.50

B. Location No. 2:  One 
(1) Trip - Kaetzel Trips 300 $207.13 $62,139.00 $130.00 $39,000.00 $349.18 $104,754.00

C. Location No. 3:  One 
(1) Trip - Dargan Trips 180 $230.52 $41,493.60 $125.00 $22,500.00 $386.02 $69,483.60

D. Location No. 4:  One 
(1) Trip - Hancock Trips 180 $185.29 $33,352.20 $130.00 $23,400.00 $370.20 $66,636.00

E.
Location No. 5:  One 
(1) Trip - Forty West 
Landfill (On-Site) 

Trips 4,200 $78.28 $328,776.00 $100.00 $420,000.00 $92.00 $386,400.00

 

F.
Location No. 6: 
Cardboard Transports 
at Forty-West Landfill 

Trips 80 $174.52 $13,961.60 $110.00 $8,800.00 $100.00 $8,000.00

*Corrected Calculations based on unit pricing

Apple Valley Waste
Kearneysville, WV

$592,699.30

BFI Waste Services, LLC DBA 
Republic Services of Hagerstown                

Hagerstown, MD

$799,816.10

$8,000.00

$586,150.00TOTAL LUMP SUM  
(Item No's. A thru E above)

TOTAL LUMP SUM
(Item No. 6 above) $13,961.60 $8,800.00

Panhandle Dumpsters LLC                           
Martinsburg, WV

Bids Opened: 7-27-2022 



 

 

Open Session Item 

SUBJECT:  Bid Award (PUR-1560) – Recycling Drop-Off Services 
 
PRESENTATION DATE:  August 16, 2022 
 
PRESENTATION BY:  Brandi Naugle, Buyer - Purchasing Department and David Mason – 
Deputy Director, Department of Solid Waste. 
    
RECOMMENDED MOTION:  Move to award the contract for Recycling Drop-Off Services 
under Option No. 1 for the hauling of single stream recyclables to the responsive, responsible 
bidder BFI /dba Republic Services of Hagerstown, MD for the total sum bid amount of $116, 
133.30 and to award under Option No. 2 for the processing of single stream recyclables to Apple 
Valley Waste of Kearneysville, WV., year one $44,200,  year two $50,830 and year three 
$55,910.40 for the total sum bid amount  of $150,940.40  and to award under Alternate No. 1, to 
BFI/dba Republic Services of Hagerstown, MD., year one $41,600, year two $43,680 and year 
three $45,864, for the total sum bid amount  of $131,144.  

REPORT-IN-BRIEF:   On July 7, 2022 the County advertised to solicit pricing for these services 
and on August 3, 2022 accepted bids for Recycling Drop-Off Services. The Invitation to Bid was 
published in the local newspaper, listed on the State of Maryland’s eMMA (eMaryland Market 
Place Advantage) website and on the County’s website. Nine (9) persons/companies 
registered/downloaded the bid document on-line. Two (2) bids were received as indicated on the 
attached bid tabulation.   
 
The contract is for a one (1) year period, commencing November 1, 2022, with an option by the 
County to renew for up to two (2) additional one (1) year period.  The County shall only pay for 
trips as required; there is no annual guaranteed minimum or maximum number of trips. 

The services consist of the vendor supplying recycling and cardboard containers and the removal, 
processing, and marketing of recyclables for the manned (Transfer Stations) recycling drop-off 
sites.  If the Bidder wishes to renew the Contract, he/she shall submit a letter of intent to the 
Director of Purchasing at least ninety (90) calendar days prior to the expiration of each contract 
year.  The County reserves the right to accept or reject any request for renewal. 

DISCUSSION:  N/A 
 
FISCAL IMPACT:  Funds are budgeted in the FY’23 proposed budget 515150-21-21200.  

CONCURRENCES:  N/A 

ALTERNATIVES:  N/A 
 

Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland 
 

Agenda Report Form  



ATTACHMENTS:  Bid Matrix Tabulation. 
 
AUDIO/VISUAL NEEDS:  N/A 



PUR-1560
Recycling Drop-Off Center Services

Item
No. Description Qty Unit Price         

(One Trip) Qty Unit Price 
(One Trip) Total Price

1 Location No. 1:  
Greensburg 115 No Bid 115 $235.54 $27,087.10

2 Location No. 2:   
Kaetzel 90 No Bid 90 $308.43 $27,758.70

3 Location No. 3:  
Dargan 20 No Bid 20 $340.98 $6,819.60

4 Location No. 4:  
Hancock 40 No Bid 40 $327.01 $13,080.40

5 Location No. 5:  
Forty West Landfill 250 No Bid 250 $165.55 $41,387.50

Item
No. Description Qty Unit Price 

(One Trip) Qty Unit Price 
(One Trip) Total Price

1
1st Year:
Processing Single 
Stream Recyclables

520 $85.00 520 No Bid No Bid

2
2nd Year:
Processing Single 
Stream Recyclables

520 $97.75 520 No Bid No Bid

3
3rd Year:
Processing Single 
Stream Recyclables

520 $107.52 $55,910.40 * 520 No Bid No Bid

*

Total Price

$44,200.00

$50,830.00

OPTION NO. 2 - PROCESSING SINGLE STREAM RECYCLABLES

BFI Waste Services, LLC DBA 
Republic Services of Hagerstown, 

MD

OPTION NO. 1 - HAULING OF SINGLE STREAM RECYCLABLES

$116,133.30

$150,940.40 No Bid

TOTAL SUM BID
 (Hauling of Single 
Stream Recyclables 
Locations 1 thru 5)

TOTAL SUM BID
Three (3) Year Period

(Processing Single 
Stream Recycleables)

No Bid

Apple Valley Waste
Kearneysville, WV

Total Price

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Bids Opened: 8-3-22



PUR-1560
Recycling Drop-Off Center Services

Item
No. Description Qty Unit Price 

(OneTrip) Qty Unit Price 
(One Trip) Total Price

4

FIRST YEAR:  8 
CY Minimum FEL 
Segregated 
Cardboard 
Containers

416 No Bid 416 $100.00 $41,600.00

5

SECOND YEAR:  
8 CY Minimum FEL 
Segregated 
Cardboard 
Containers

416 No Bid 416 $105.00 $43,680.00

6

THIRD YEAR:  
8 CY Minimum FEL 
Segregated 
Cardboard 
Containers

416 No Bid 416 $110.25 $45,864.00

Bidding solely on the processing of material.

No Bid

Apple Valley Waste
Remarks/Exceptions

*Corrected calculations based on unit pricing

ALTERNATE 1

$131,144.00
TOTAL SUM BID 

Three (3) Year Period
(Alternate No. 1)

Republic Services of Hagerstown
The above rates for Option No. 1 - Hauling of Single Stream Recyclables are based on Hauling the 
recclables to the Apple Valley Recycling Center located at 16608 Hunters Green Parkway, 
Hagerstown, MD.

Apple Valley Waste
Kearneysville, WV

BFI Waste Services, LLC DBA 
Republic Services of Hagerstown, 

MD

Total Price

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Bids Opened: 8-3-22



 

 

 

 

Open Session Item 

SUBJECT:  Bid Award (PUR-1557) - Roof Membrane Replacement at IKO Way   
 
PRESENTATION DATE:  August 16, 2022 
 
PRESENTATION BY:  Rick Curry, CPPO, Director - Purchasing Department and Andrew 
Eshleman, Director – Public Works    
 
RECOMMENDED MOTION:  Move to award the bid for the Roof Membrane Replacement at 
145 IKO Way to the responsive, responsible, bidder Bonded Applicators, Inc. of Waynesboro, PA 
who submitted the lowest total lump sum amount of $1,094,544 and the procurement is contingent 
of final approval of the Agreement by the County Attorney’s Office. 

REPORT-IN-BRIEF:  On July 20, 2022, the County accepted bids for the roof replacement 
project.  The Invitation to Bid (ITB) was advertised locally in the newspaper and on the County’s 
web site, as well as on the State’s Emma “eMaryland Marketplace Advantage” web site.  Sixteen 
(16) vendors were represented at the Pre-Bid Conference/Teleconference. The project is to be 
substantially completed within forty-five (45) consecutive calendar days of the Notice to Proceed.  
Thirty (30) persons/companies registered/downloaded the bid document on-line.   

DISCUSSION:  The project consists of removing the existing membrane roof system and 
insulation down to the deck on the Public Facility Annex Building. Inspect the deck and replace 
any and all damaged sections, patch and repair openings and vapor barrier. Removal of existing 
skylights and roof penetration and specified and infill openings with roof decking. Install a new 
0.60” TPO roof system with replacement of wall cap. The original roof was installed on the 
building around 1990. The roof has exceeded its life expectancy and water is infiltrating through 
the roof. The Contractor will be replacing the existing membrane and installing new TPO roof 
system with a system that has a twenty-five (25) year warranty. The Bidder shall complete the 
project within one hundred fifty (150) calendar days. There are liquidated damages that will apply 
at the rate of two hundred-fifty ($250) dollars per consecutive calendar day each day the Contractor 
fails to complete the work as specified.  

FISCAL IMPACT:  Funds in the amount of $1,500,000 are budgeted in Capital Improvement Plan (CIP) 
account 30-11910-BLD100. 

CONCURRENCES:  N/A   
 
ALTERNATIVES:  N/A 
 

Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland 
 

Agenda Report Form  



 

 

ATTACHMENTS:  Bid Tabulation Matrix  
 
AUDIO/VISUAL NEEDS: N/A 
 



PUR-1557
Roof Membrane Replacement at 145 IKO Way Building

Item 
No. Item Description Unit Qty

 
Unit 
Price 

 
Total 
Price 

 
Unit 
Price 

 
Total 
Price 

 
Unit 
Price 

 
Total 
Price 

1 Roof Membrane Replacement -
Base Bid L.S. Lump 

Sum $1,832,000.00 $1,832,000.00 $1,090,144.00 $1,090,144.00 $25.13* $2,098,000.00

2 Repair Metal Deck - 
Unit Price Allowance No. 1 S.F. 100 $6.00 $600.00 $16.00 $1,600.00 $20.25 $2,025.00

3 Replace Metal Deck -
Unit Price Allowance No. 2 S.F. 100 $12.00 $1,200.00 $16.00 $1,600.00 $16.75 $1,675.00

4 Blocking -
Unit Price Allowance No. 3 L.F. 200 $4.00 $800.00 $6.00 $1,200.00 $8.50 $1,700.00

Bonded Applicators, Inc.
Waynesboro, PA

Cole Roofing Company, Inc.
Baltimore, MD

$1,094,544.00 $2,103,400.00

* Corrected calculations based on unit pricing 

$1,834,600.00

Alpha Omega Construction Group, Inc.
New Castle, DE

TOTAL LUMP SUM BASE BID AND
UNIT PRICE ALLOWANCES

Remarks / Exceptions:

1 Bids Opened: July 20, 2022



PUR-1557
Roof Membrane Replacement at 145 IKO Way Building

Item 
No. Item Description Unit Qty

 
Unit 
Price 

 
Total 
Price 

 
Unit 
Price 

 
Total 
Price 

 
Unit 
Price 

 
Total 
Price 

1 Roof Membrane Replacement -
Base Bid L.S. Lump 

Sum $1,550,000.00 $1,550,000.00 $1,670,000.00 $1,670,000.00 $1,509,870.00 $1,509,870.00

2 Repair Metal Deck - 
Unit Price Allowance No. 1 S.F. 100 $10.00 $1,000.00 $5.00 $500.00 $2.00 $200.00

3 Replace Metal Deck -
Unit Price Allowance No. 2 S.F. 100 $10.00 $1,000.00 $6.00 $600.00 $15.00 $1,500.00

4 Blocking -
Unit Price Allowance No. 3 L.F. 200 $5.00 $1,000.00 $4.00 $800.00 $3.50 $700.00

Dynamic General Contracting, LLC
Millersville, MD

Heidler Roofing Services
Hagerstown, MD

$1,671,900.00 $1,512,270.00TOTAL LUMP SUM BASE BID AND
UNIT PRICE ALLOWANCES

Detwiler Roofing, LLC
East Earl, PA

$1,553,000.00

2 Bids Opened: July 20, 2022



PUR-1557
Roof Membrane Replacement at 145 IKO Way Building

Item 
No. Item Description Unit Qty

 
Unit 
Price 

 
Total 
Price 

 
Unit 
Price 

 
Total 
Price 

 
Unit 
Price 

 
Total 
Price 

1 Roof Membrane Replacement -
Base Bid L.S. Lump 

Sum $1,484,400.00 $1,484,400.00 $1,780,000.00 $1,780,000.00 $1,448,336.00 $1,448,336.00

2 Repair Metal Deck - 
Unit Price Allowance No. 1 S.F. 100 $8.00 $800.00 $6.00 $600.00 $8.00 $800.00

3 Replace Metal Deck -
Unit Price Allowance No. 2 S.F. 100 $15.00 $1,500.00 $8.00 $800.00 $16.00 $1,600.00

4 Blocking -
Unit Price Allowance No. 3 L.F. 200 $6.50 $1,300.00 $7.00 $1,400.00 $9.00 $1,800.00

Island Contracting, Inc.
Beltsville, MD

Houck Services, Inc.
Harrisburg, PA

Patuxent Roofing & Contracting, Inc.
Laurel, MD

$1,488,000.00 $1,452,536.00TOTAL LUMP SUM BASE BID AND
UNIT PRICE ALLOWANCES $1,782,800.00

3 Bids Opened: July 20, 2022



PUR-1557
Roof Membrane Replacement at 145 IKO Way Building

Item 
No. Item Description Unit Qty

 
Unit 
Price 

 
Total 
Price 

 
Unit 
Price 

 
Total 
Price 

1 Roof Membrane Replacement -
Base Bid L.S. Lump 

Sum $3,026,823.00 $3,026,823.00 $1,990,000.00 $1,990,000.00

2 Repair Metal Deck - 
Unit Price Allowance No. 1 S.F. 100 $6.00 $600.00 $15.00 $1,500.00

3 Replace Metal Deck -
Unit Price Allowance No. 2 S.F. 100 $16.00 $1,600.00 $15.00 $1,500.00

4 Blocking -
Unit Price Allowance No. 3 L.F. 200 $12.50 $2,500.00 $8.00 $1,600.00

Ruff Roofing and Sheet Metal, Inc.
Baltimore, MD

SGK Contracting, Inc.
Baltimore, MD

TOTAL LUMP SUM BASE BID AND
UNIT PRICE ALLOWANCES $3,031,523.00 $1,994,600.00

4 Bids Opened: July 20, 2022













 

Open Session Item 

SUBJECT:  Position Grade Change Request  

PRESENTATION DATE:  August 16, 2022 

PRESENTATION BY:  Andrew Eshleman, Director of Public Works and Mark Bradshaw, 
Director of Environmental Management 

RECOMMENDED MOTION: To approve the recommended position grade changes for the 
Transit Maintenance Worker and the Utility Worker II positions from grade 6 to 7.  

REPORT-IN-BRIEF:  The Transit Department Maintenance Worker and the Environmental 
Management Utility Worker II positions are currently grade 6 positions with a starting annual 
salary of $30,722 and are recommended to change to grade 7 positions with a starting salary of 
$33,197. Similar full time maintenance worker positions that also require the possession of a 
Class B Commercial Driver’s license are grade 7 or higher. 

DISCUSSION:   

Attracting and keeping qualified transit maintenance and utility worker personnel has been 
challenging. Applicants either do not have a commercial driver’s license or if do leave for other 
similar, but higher grade and paying jobs. The possession of a Class B Commercial Driver’s 
license is necessary in the case of the Transit Maintenance Worker to shuttle buses and for the 
Utility Worker to drive a dump truck. 

Employees performing the job that do not have their Class B CDL would remain paid at a grade 
6 level, and upon obtaining their CDL would upgrade to the same step on a grade 7. There are 
two Utility Maintenance Worker II positions and one Transit Maintenance Worker position 
affected by the change, but no current employees’ pay will be immediately affected. 

 
FISCAL IMPACT:  Approximately $2,500 per employee in additional salary + associated 
fringe benefits able to be absorbed in the existing operating budgets. 

CONCURRENCES:  County Administrator, HR Director  

ALTERNATIVES:  N/A 

ATTACHMENTS:  Job Descriptions 

AUDIO/VISUAL NEEDS:  N/A 
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JOB TITLE: Utility Worker II GRADE: 7 

DEPARTMENT: Water Quality  FLSA STATUS: Non-Exempt 

REPORTS TO: Maintenance Superintendent   

 

GENERAL RESPONSIBILITIES:  

Responsible for general labor work in the installation, repair and maintenance of systems, equipment, structures, 
and grounds.   

ESSENTIAL TASKS:  

(These are intended only as illustrations of the various types of work performed. The omission of specific duties 
does not exclude them from the position if the work is similar, related, or a logical assignment to the position.)  

  
1. Perform general custodial work of facilities including floor care. 
2. Performs complete grounds maintenance of all facilities including mowing, pruning, landscaping, grading, top 

soiling, seeding and mulching, sediment control, pesticide application and weed control. 
3. Provide snow removal for all facilities including plowing, shoveling and application of ice melts and 

abrasives. 
4. Perform general maintenance and/or repair of permanent or temporary structures as required. 
5. Provide care, proper use and general maintenance of equipment and tools. 
6. Provide general labor for electricians, system mechanics and construction crew as required. 
7. Wash, clean and maintain department vehicles, equipment and pumps as required. 
8. Provide direction, tools, supplies and equipment for supplemental work force (correctional work crew). 
9. Assist in maintaining low pressure residential sewer systems. 
10. Performs related work as required. 

 
KNOWLEDGE, SKILLS AND ABILITIES: 

 
1. General knowledge of safety standards.  
2. General knowledge of building and grounds maintenance procedures.   
3. General knowledge of use and care of medium to small equipment and hand tools.   
4. Ability to complete assigned tasks in an efficient and acceptable manner without full-time supervision.   
5. Able to work flexible hours as required depending on circumstances.  
6. Ability to drive and operate dump truck and utility equipment trailers.  
7. Ability to drive and operate truck with snowplow.  
8. Ability to operate medium to small, powered mowing equipment.  

 
EDUCATION AND EXPERIENCE: 
 
1. High School Graduate. 
2. Two (2) years’ experiences in grounds maintenance and construction related field. 

 
A comparable amount of training and experience may be substituted for the minimum qualifications. 

 
 
PHYSICAL REQUIREMENTS:  

This is sometimes heavy work requiring the exertion of 100 pounds of force occasionally, up to 50 pounds of force 
frequently, and up to 20 pounds of force constantly to move objects.  Work requires climbing, balancing, stooping, 
kneeling, crouching, reaching, standing, walking, pushing, pulling, lifting, fingering, grasping, and repetitive 
motions.  Vocal communication is required for expressing or exchanging ideas by means of spoken word.  Hearing 
is required to perceive information at normal spoken word levels.  Visual acuity is required for color perception, 
visual inspection involving small defects and/or small parts, assembly or fabrication of parts at or within arm’s 
length, operation of machines, operation of motor vehicles or equipment, determining the accuracy and 
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thoroughness of work, and observing general surroundings and activities.  The worker is subject to inside and 
outside environmental conditions, extreme cold, extreme heat, noise, vibration, hazards, atmospheric conditions 
and oils. The worker may be exposed to blood borne pathogens and may be required to wear specialized personal 
protective equipment.  

  
SPECIAL REQUIREMENTS:  

 A valid Class “B” Commercial Driver’s License for air brake equipped vehicles. 
 Applicants who do not have a valid Class “B” Commercial Driver’s License at the time of hire: 

o Must obtain Class “B” learners permit within 90 calendar days from date of hire.  
o Must obtain and maintain a valid Class “B” Commercial License within the first 9 months from 

date of hire.  
o Applicants who do not have a valid Class “B” Commercial Driver’s License at the time of hiring will 

be paid at a Grade 6 rate until obtaining the required license.  
 

 
 Willingness to be on call 24 hours per day, 7 days a week. 

 
 

Revised 08/2015, 09/2016, 7/2018, 4/2020, 8/2022  
 
Reasonable accommodations may be made to enable individuals with disabilities to perform the essential tasks. 
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JOB TITLE:   TRANSIT MAINTENANCE WORKER GRADE: 7 

DEPARTMENT: DPW - TRANSIT FLSA STATUS: NON-EXEMPT 

REPORTS TO: TRANSIT FLEET & FACILITY MGR   

 

GENERAL DEFINITION OF WORK: 
Performs responsible semiskilled work making minor service and mechanical repairs to facilities and equipment, and 
general cleaning and maintenance of vehicles, buildings and grounds. Direction is provided by the Transit Fleet & Facility 
Manager and occasionally the general direction of other management personnel. 
 
ESSENTIAL FUNCTIONS/TYPICAL TASKS: 
(These are intended only as illustrations of the various types of work performed. The omission of specific duties does not 
exclude them from the position if the work is similar, related, or a logical assignment to the position.) 

1. Provides janitorial and general cleaning of office, shop and transfer center areas including but not limited to wet 
mops and waxes floors, vacuums and cleans carpet, empties trash and recyclables, etc. 

2. Performs general grounds keeping duties.  
3. Performs the duties of Transit Line Service Attendants as required. 
4. Assists with road calls for vehicle breakdowns. 
5. Performs routine maintenance of grounds, equipment and buildings as needed. 
6. Operates a County vehicle as needed.  
7. Performs seasonal labor duties as required such as shoveling and plowing snow, spreading de-icing/anti-skid 

chemicals, mowing/trimming of grass areas, and general landscape duties to maintain grounds  
8. Keeps simple records of fuel consumption, parts, supplies and inventory. 
9. Patrols transfer center for unauthorized vehicles or persons and contact law enforcement authorities if needed. 
10. Performs departmental related tasks and other duties as assigned. 

 
KNOWLEDGE, SKILLS AND ABILITIES: 
General knowledge of the common practices, tools and terminology of the mechanical or building trade to which assigned; 
general knowledge of the use and characteristics of common building materials; general knowledge of the hazards and 
safety precautions associated with the work; skill in the use of tools and equipment; ability to work from sketches, drawings, 
plans or specifications; ability to follow oral and written instructions; ability to estimate needed materials and time required 
for various jobs; ability to establish and maintain effective working relationships with associates; ability to perform duties 
under inclement and or extreme weather conditions. 
 
EDUCATION AND EXPERIENCE: 
Any combination of education and experience equivalent to graduation from high school and building maintenance and 
repair experience. 
 
PHYSICAL REQUIREMENTS: 
This is medium work requiring the exertion of 50 pounds of force occasionally, up to 20 pounds of force frequently, and up 
to 10 pounds of force constantly to move objects, and some heavy work requiring the exertion of 100 pounds of force 
occasionally, up to 50 pounds of force frequently, and up to 20 pounds of force constantly to move objects; work requires 
climbing, balancing, stooping, kneeling, crouching, reaching, standing, walking, pushing, pulling, lifting, fingering, grasping, 
and repetitive motions; vocal communication is required for conveying detailed or important instructions to others 
accurately, loudly, or quickly; hearing is required to perceive information at normal spoken word levels; visual acuity is 
required for depth perception, color perception, visual inspection involving small defects and/or small parts, use of 
measuring devices, assembly or fabrication of parts at or within arm’s length, operation of machines, operation of motor 
vehicles or equipment, determining the accuracy and thoroughness of work, and observing general surroundings and 
activities; the worker is subject to inside and outside environmental conditions, extreme cold, extreme heat, atmospheric 
conditions, and oils.   The worker may be exposed to bloodborne pathogens and may be required to wear specialized 
personal protective equipment. 
 
SPECIAL REQUIREMENTS: 

 A valid Class “B” Commercial Driver’s License for air brake equipped vehicles and passenger endorsements. 
 Applicants who do not have a valid Class “B” Commercial Driver’s License at the time of hire: 

o Must obtain Class “B” learners permit within 90 calendar days from date of hire.  
o Must obtain and maintain a valid Class “B” Commercial License within the first 9 months from date of hire. 
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o Applicants who do not have a valid Class “B” Commercial Driver’s License at the time of hiring will be 
paid at a Grade 6 rate until obtaining the required license. 

Reasonable accommodations may be made to enable individuals with disabilities to perform the essential tasks. 

Revised: 2/17; 1/19, 8/2022 
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Open Session Item 

SUBJECT:  Transit Department Reorganization   

PRESENTATION DATE:  August 16, 2022 

PRESENTATION BY:  Andrew Eshleman, Director of Public Works and Kevin Cerrone, 
Director of Transit 

RECOMMENDED MOTION: To approve the recommended Transit Department 
organizational changes. 

REPORT-IN-BRIEF:  The Transit Department operations have been evaluated. The vacant 
Deputy Director of Transit position affords the opportunity for a Transit Department 
reorganization to address existing and future needs in the most cost effective manner. 

DISCUSSION:   

The Deputy Director of Transit grade 14 position is proposed to be eliminated. The Deputy 
Director served directly under the Director supporting the entire operation, but effectively 
focused on daily transit operations. Those duties can be managed by dividing job responsibilities 
among several upgraded employee positions and consolidating transit supervision into transit 
operations and fleet/facility management.  

The previous model provided several layers of accountability/management on the driver’s side, 
but no clear structure to support the passenger and community needs. A new position 
“Communications and Outreach Manager” would be created to oversee dispatch of demand 
response (paratransit), ride assist (taxi voucher), and future microtransit programs and be the 
primary liaison for transit related issues and needs in the community. Washington County Transit 
(WCT) is an important community social service supporting a lower income demographic reliant 
on transportation services for employment, medical transport and personal errands, however, 
WCT property and buses also experience many of the community wide social and public health 
problems and should be part of the solution in addressing those issues.  

The two existing “Office Associate” positions would be upgraded to “Communication 
Specialist” to align more with their current duties and the need associated with route scheduling 
and responding to customer service issues rather than strictly office administrative 
responsibilities. Between the three communications focused employees a downtown community 
office presence can be established at the Bus Transfer Center on Franklin Street. 

The existing “Driver’s Supervisor” position will be upgraded to “Transit Operations Supervisor” 
and will manage the drivers, the communications staff, and report directly to the Transit 
Director. 

Board of County Commissioners of Washington County, Maryland 
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The proposed changes are anticipated to be near cost neutral and the best use of existing 
personnel that also accounts for supervisory coverage of a 17hr/6 day/week operation and future 
needs of the Department/community. 

This reorganization focused on transit management operations, however, there will continue to 
be challenges hiring full time and part time CDL drivers that will need to be revisited and 
addressed.  

Position Change Summary: 

Elimination of “Deputy Director of Transit” Grade 14 Position.  
-$66,000 salary - payroll taxes/benefits 
 
New “Communications and Outreach Manager”, Grade 11  
+~$45,136, (grade 1) + payroll taxes/benefits 
 
Upgrade “Driver’s Supervisor” Grade 11 to “Transit Operations Supervisor” Grade 13  
+ ~$8,000 + payroll taxes/benefits 
 
Upgrade two “Office Associates” Grade 6 to “Communication Specialists” Grade 8  
+ ~$4,500 each ($9,000 total) + payroll taxes/benefits 
 
FISCAL IMPACT:  Anticipated to be near cost neutral depending on starting grade and 
benefits of Communications and Outreach Manager hired.  

CONCURRENCES:  County Administrator, HR Director  

ALTERNATIVES:  N/A 

ATTACHMENTS:  Organizational Chart Exhibits, and job descriptions 

AUDIO/VISUAL NEEDS:  N/A 
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Transit Director
Kevin Cerrone

Grade 17

Driver's Supervisor & ADA Program
Grade 11

8 – FT Fixed Route Bus Operators 
(Grade 7)

25 – PT Bus Operators (Grade 6)
9 – PT Paratransit Drivers (Grade 5)
3 – PT Van/Shuttle Drivers (Grade 4)

Transit Fleet & Facility Manager
Grade 13

2 – Transit Mechanics (Grade 10)
1 – Transit Maintenance Worker 

(Grade 6)
6 – PT Line Service Attendants 

(Grade 5)

Fiscal Technician
Grade 10

2 - Office Associates 
(Grade 6)

Deputy Director of Transit
Vacant

Grade 14



Transit Department 

Proposed Organization Chart 

 

 

Transit Director
Kevin Cerrone

Grade 17

Transit Operations Supervisor
Grade 13

8 – FT Fixed Route Bus Operators 
(Grade 7)

25 – PT Bus Operators (Grade 6)
9 – PT Paratransit Drivers (Grade 5)
3 – PT Van/Shuttle Drivers (Grade 4)

Communication and Outreach 
Manager
Vacant

Grade 11

2 - Communication Specialists
Grade 8

Transit Fleet & Facility Manager
Grade 13

2 – Transit Mechanics (Grade 10)
1 – Transit Maintenance Worker 
6 – PT Line Service Attendants

(Grade 5)

Fiscal Technician
Grade 10



 
 

JOB TITLE: Transit Operations Supervisor GRADE 13 

DEPARTMET: Transit FLSA STATUS: Exempt 

REPORTS TO: Transit Director   

                           
GENERAL RESPONSIBILITIES: 
 
This professional position performs difficult technical and intermediate administrative work assisting with 
the day-to-day operations of the comprehensive public transit system and overseeing and participating in 
the training and certification of transit drivers. Direction is provided by the Transit Director.  Supervision is 
exercised over subordinate personnel. 

 
ESSENTIAL FUNCTIONS/TYPICAL TASKS: 
(These are intended only as illustrations of the various types of work performed.  The omission of specific 
duties does not exclude them from the position if the work is similar, related, or a logical assignment to the 
position.) 

 
1. Assists with department oversight including specific transit related programs.  Provides daily 

instruction and direction to transit drivers and office staff.   
2. Conducts training of transit drivers and office staff, including new driver training, emergency 

evacuation, passenger assistance, wheelchair securement, route training, defensive driving, etc... 
3. Prepares and administers current department policy and procedures. Keeps abreast of evolving Federal 

and State requirements and ensures departmental compliance.  Implements changes. 
4. Oversees bus fare collection and counting. Reports all related equipment malfunctions to the Fleet and 

Facility Manager for repairs.  
5. Assists with budget and grant application submissions. 
6. Prepares and submits a variety of reports and maintains appropriate records. 
7. Receives and responds to complaints from employees and the public. 
8. Analyzes farebox computer generated ridership and driver reports; designs and creates spreadsheets for 

tracking ridership data; recommends and designs route changes based on ridership analysis and changes 
in the community. 

9. Handles disciplinary action involving transit drivers and office staff. Interviews and recommends 
applicants for hire. Conducts transit driver and office staff performance evaluations.  

10. Investigates vehicle accidents and takes appropriate action.  Reviews accident/incident reports to 
recommend preventive measures and training. 

11. Administers mandated FTA/DOT Drug and Alcohol testing program. 
12. Represents the transit system at local, regional and statewide meetings and events.  Acts as liaison with 

other local and State transportation offices; attends regional and state-wide seminars and meetings. 
13. Promotes transportation services; encourages the use of public transit; conducts public outreach; 

coordinates the design and updates of transit department’s public outreach. 
14. Prepares and approves departmental payroll of transit drivers and office staff.   
15. Acts as Transit Director when assigned and required. Provides shift coverage of other transit 

supervisory personnel during absences. 
16. Performs related tasks as assigned. 

 
 



 
 
 
KNOWLEDGE, SKILLS AND ABILITIES: 
 
General knowledge of Federal Motor Carrier Safety Regulations (F. M. C. S. R.) and the Americans with 
Disabilities Act of 1990 (ADA) as related to public transportation; general knowledge of Federal and State 
Occupational Safety Health Administration (O.S.H.A./M.O.S.H.) Laws, Rules, Regulations and Standards; 
ability to establish and monitor bus routes and schedules; ability to plan and supervise the work of 
subordinate employees; ability to establish and maintain effective working relationships with associates and 
the general public. 

 
 
EDUCATION AND EXPERIENCE: 
 
Any combination of education and experience equivalent to graduation from an accredited college with 
major course work in business management, transportation program coordination and safety compliance.  
Minimum of 5 years of supervisory experience preferred. 

 
PHYSICAL REQUIREMENTS: 
 
This is light work requiring the exertion of up to 20 pounds of force occasionally, up to 10 pounds of force 
frequently, and a negligible amount of force constantly to move objects; work requires climbing, balancing, 
stooping, kneeling, crouching, reaching, standing, walking, pushing, pulling, lifting, fingering, grasping, 
and repetitive motions; vocal communication is required for expressing or exchanging ideas by means of 
the spoken word; hearing is required to perceive information at normal spoken word levels; visual acuity is 
required for depth perception, color perception, peripheral vision, preparing and analyzing written or 
computer data, visual inspection involving small defects and/or small parts, use of measuring devices, 
assembly or fabrication of parts at or within arm’s length, operation of machines, operation of motor 
vehicles or equipment, determining the accuracy and thoroughness of work, and observing general 
surroundings and activities; the worker is subject to inside and outside environmental conditions, noise, 
vibration, hazards, atmospheric conditions, and oils. 

 
 

SPECIAL REQUIREMENTS: 
 
Possession of or ability to obtain (within 9 months) and maintain a valid CDL Class B driver’s license with 
airbrake and passenger endorsements; (CDL and DOT physical required). This is a safety sensitive position 
and is subject to Federal Transit Administration substance abuse regulations.   
 
This position expects occasional weekend, evening, and holiday work for supervisory coverage. 
 
Reasonable accommodations may be made to enable individuals with disabilities to perform the essential 
tasks 
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JOB TITLE: Transit Communications Specialist GRADE 8 

DEPARTMENT: Transit FLSA STATUS: Non-Exempt 

REPORTS TO: Transit Communications and Outreach 
Manager 

  

                           
GENERAL DEFINITION OF WORK: 
 
Under general supervision of the Transit Communications and Outreach Manager, employee is responsible 
for providing efficient, timely and effective radio/telephone communications.  Utilizing both manual and 
computer resources, employee records, organizes, processes and coordinates reservations and assigns trips to 
drivers and/or outside transportation services. Employee works closely with the public and must be sensitive 
to their needs.  Additionally, employee performs intermediate clerical work providing administrative support 
which requires above average experience and/or training in typing, filing and operating various types of 
office equipment. Direction may be provided by the Transit Communications and Outreach Manager, Transit 
Operations Supervisor, or Transit Director.   
 
ESSENTIAL FUNCTIONS/TYPICAL TASKS: 
 
(These are intended only as illustrations of the various types of work performed. The omission of specific 
duties does not exclude them from the position if the work is similar, related, or a logical assignment to the 
position.) 
 

1. Receives requests for transportation; generates and distributes driver manifests; assigns demand-
response vehicles and drivers; maintains data base containing client and destination information. 

2. Makes on the spot judgements to assure clients are picked up and dropped off on time.  
3. Works with other agencies health care facilities, assisted-living centers, and the public to fulfill their 

transportation needs as best possible. 
4. Verifies eligibility of elderly and medical clients as necessary. 
5. Answers telephones, email communications, text messages, and social media inquiries. Receives, 

researches, and/or assists with information regarding inquiries and complaints. 
6. Maintains files of correspondence, forms, reports, etc. 
7. Types correspondence, reports, minutes, lists, forms, memoranda, etc. 
8. Sells bus tickets, passes, and vouchers to the public. 
9. Processes farebox receipts and creates bank deposits. 
10. Maintains postings and notifications to transit users. 
11. Orders and maintains departmental supplies as needed.  
12. Maintains various schedules; compiles, prepares and disseminates various statistical reports. 
13. Provides shift coverage of other transit personnel and their responsibilities during absences. 
14. Attend various meetings and seminars on and off site. 
15. Performs related tasks as required.  

 
KNOWLEDGE, SKILLS AND ABILITIES: 
 
General knowledge of proper business English and spelling; ability to answer inquiries and assist the public 
in a courteous manner; ability to understand and follow oral and written instructions; ability to operate 
personal computer quickly and accurately; excellent skills in Microsoft Word and Excel; ability to establish 



and maintain effective working relationships with associates and the public. 
 
 
EDUCATION AND EXPERIENCE: 
 
Any combination of education and experience equivalent to graduation from high school and considerable 
office and customer service experience. 
 
PHYSICAL REQUIREMENTS: 
 
This is sedentary work requiring the exertion of up to 10 pounds of force occasionally, and a negligible 
amount of force frequently or constantly to move objects; work requires reaching, fingering, and repetitive 
motions; vocal communication is required for expressing or exchanging ideas by means of the spoken word; 
hearing is required to perceive information at normal spoken word levels; visual acuity is required for 
preparing and analyzing written or computer data, operation of machines, determining the accuracy and 
thoroughness of work, and observing general surroundings and activities; the worker is not subject to adverse 
environmental conditions. 
 
SPECIAL REQUIREMENTS: 
 
Possession of and maintain a valid Class C driver’s license. Knowledge of public transportation programs. 
This is a safety sensitive position and is subject to Federal Transit Administration substance abuse 
regulations.   
 
This position expects occasional weekend, evening, and holiday work. This position is based at the Transit 
Office, but is expected to work some scheduled days/times at the Bus Transfer Center. 
 
 
Reasonable accommodations may be made to enable individuals with disabilities to perform the essential 
tasks. 
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JOB TITLE: Transit Communications and Outreach 
Manager  

GRADE 11 

DEPARTMENT: Transit FLSA STATUS:       Exempt 

REPORTS TO: Transit Operations Supervisor   

                                                                                                            
GENERAL DEFINITION OF WORK: 
 
Performs difficult skilled clerical work and intermediate semiskilled work scheduling and dispatching transit 
demand-response to transport patrons. Employee works closely with the public and must be sensitive to their 
needs. This classification is responsible for the direction and management of community outreach and public 
engagement. Direction is provided by the Transit Operations Supervisor. Supervision is exercised over 
Communications Specialist personnel. 
 
ESSENTIAL FUNCTIONS/TYPICAL TASKS: 
(These are intended only as illustrations of the various types of work performed. The omission of specific 
duties does not exclude them from the position if the work is similar, related, or a logical assignment to the 
position.) 
 

1. Assists the Transit Operations Supervisor with operation of system.  
2. Oversees function of Communication Specialists. Receives requests for transportation and schedules 

transit drivers.  
3. Responsible for developing relationships with community groups, businesses and public to fulfill 

their transportation needs to maintain and build ridership and resolve issues. 
4. Performs dispatching related duties. Dispatches buses, answers two-way radio calls, initiates bus 

exchanges, replaces fare box modules and responds to vehicle accident calls. 
5. Answers telephones, email communications, text messages, and social media inquiries. Receives, 

researches, and processes information regarding inquiries and complaints. 
6. Approves eligibility for demand-response/micro-transit programs. 
7. Ensures ADA Paratransit, JOBS and other micro-transit programs are sufficiently operating. 
8. Represents the transit system at local, regional, and statewide meetings and events.  Acts as liaison   

with other local and State transportation offices; attends regional and state-wide seminars and 
meetings. 

9. Promotes transportation services; encourages the use of public transit; conducts public outreach; 
coordinates the design and implementation of transit department’s public outreach and engagement 
tools/plans. 

10. Maintains union employee’s overtime log. 
11. Oversees processing of farebox receipts and bank deposits. Assists with implementing new bus 

service. Maintains rider schedules, route map and other modes of communication with transit riders. 
12. Responds to locations of in-service vehicle breakdowns, incidents, accidents, and other service issues 

and renders assistance as needed. 
13. Assists with driver and office staff training. 
14. Performs general duties in the absence of administrative personnel. Provides shift coverage of other 

supervisory personnel during absences. 
15. Composes and posts bus notices.  
16. Assists in the recruitment and selection of transit drivers. 
17. Performs related tasks as required. 

 
 



KNOWLEDGE, SKILLS AND ABILITIES: 
 
Strong interpersonal skills and the ability to interact and collaborate with and maintain relationships with 
community partners and the general public. The ability to effectively communicate written and verbal 
communication with knowledge and experience using personal computers as well as Microsoft Word, Excel 
and transit trip scheduling software.  Thorough knowledge of street systems and location of major buildings 
and facilities; thorough knowledge of transportation policies and procedures; general knowledge of the 
principles of operating and servicing passenger vehicles; thorough knowledge of the traffic laws and 
regulations governing passenger vehicles operations; ability to record information accurately and quickly; 
ability to speak distinctly; ability to plan and supervise the work of subordinates. Spanish bilingual skills 
preferred.   
 
EDUCATION AND EXPERIENCE: 
 
Any combination of education and experience equivalent to graduation from high school and extensive 
experience operating motorized equipment with some experience coordinating community outreach, customer 
service, community relations, or scheduling and routing drivers. 
 
PHYSICAL REQUIREMENTS: 
 
This is light work requiring the exertion of up to 20 pounds of force occasionally, up to 10 pounds of force 
frequently, and a negligible amount of force constantly to move objects, and some medium work requiring 
the exertion of 50 pounds of force occasionally, up to 20 pounds of force frequently, and up to 10 pounds of 
force constantly to move objects; work requires reaching, pushing, fingering, and repetitive motions; vocal 
communication is required for expressing or exchanging ideas by means of the spoken word; hearing is 
required to perceive information at normal spoken word levels; visual acuity is required for depth perception, 
color perception, night vision, peripheral vision, visual inspection involving small defects and/or small parts, 
operation of motor vehicles or equipment, determining the accuracy and thoroughness of work, and 
observing general surroundings and activities; the worker is subject to inside and outside environmental 
conditions, noise, vibration, and atmospheric conditions.  
 
 
SPECIAL REQUIREMENTS: 
 
Possession of or ability to obtain (within 9 months) and maintain a valid CDL Class B driver’s license with 
airbrake and passenger endorsements; (CDL and DOT physical required). This is a safety sensitive position 
and is subject to Federal Transit Administration substance abuse regulations.   
 

This position expects occasional weekend, evening, and holiday work for supervisory coverage. The position is 
based at the Transit Office, but is expected to have a regular presence at the Bus Transfer Center and in the 
community.   
 
Reasonable accommodations may be made to enable individuals with disabilities to perform the essential 
tasks. 
 
 
 
8/2022 
 
 
                         
 



 

Open Session Item 

SUBJECT:  Discussion - FY22 Surplus – Income Tax and Recordation Tax   

PRESENTATION DATE:  August 9, 2022 

PRESENTATION BY:  Kelcee Mace, Interim Chief Financial Officer 

RECOMMENDED MOTION:  For informational purposes. 

REPORT-IN-BRIEF:  Potential budget adjustment to utilize additional funding to one time 
County needs and capital projects. 

DISCUSSION:  Income and Recordation tax revenues have exceeded budgeted amounts for 
FY22.  Included below is a list of projects/recommendations from staff for the allocation of the 
FY22 surplus funds.  These recommendations are based on specific reductions made to the 
capital plan during the FY23 capital budget review process, rising costs due to inflation, and 
suggestions from previous discussions relating to the anticipated FY22 surplus. 
 

Project Amount  Project Amount 
Systemic Improvements 3,000,000  Northern Ave Bridge 150,000 
IT Replacement 850,000  School Construction 2,000,000 
General Vehicle 500,000  Wesel Blvd 2,000,000 
HWY Equipment 1,400,000  Pension 5,000,000 
Police Vehicles 1,000,000  Operating Reserve 5,000,000 
P25 Communications Upgrade 2,000,000  Capital Reserve 6,000,000 
Roof Replacements 1,500,000  Capital Contingency 2,600,000 
Pavement Maintenance 2,000,000  TOTAL $35,000,000 

 
 
FISCAL IMPACT:  $35,000,000 

CONCURRENCES:  County Administrator 

ALTERNATIVES:  N/A 

ATTACHMENTS:  N/A 

AUDIO/VISUAL NEEDS:  N/A 
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