
Q-18-654

Water Quality Assurance Program

Klenzoid, Inc. NuChem Corp. WaterPro, Inc.

1A Wash. Co. Admin Complex $805.25 $1,110.00 $1,320.00

1B

Wash. Co. Admin Bldg.

Equipment Cost
No Bid No Bid No Bid

2A Wash. Co. Office Bldg. $402.63 $522.00 $400.00

2B

Wash. Co. Office Bldg.

Equipment Cost
No Bid No Bid No Bid

3A Wash. Co. Ct. House Annex $805.25 $1,596.00 $1,680.00

3B

Wash. Co. Ct. House Annex

Equipment Cost
No Bid $400.00 No Bid

4A Wm. Dwyer Mem. Ctr. $402.63 $201.00 $220.00

4B

Wm. Dwyer Mem. Ctr.

Equipment Cost.
No Bid $400.00 No Bid

5A Martin Luther King Ctr. $805.25 $822.00 $720.00

5B

Martin Luther King Ctr.

Equipment Cost.
$600.00 No Bid No Bid

6A Agricultural Ed. Ctr. $402.63 $201.00 $220.00

6B

Agricultural Ed. Ctr.

Equipment Cost
No Bid $400.00 No Bid

7A Boonsboro Library $402.63 $201.00 $220.00

7B

Boonsboro Library

Equipment Cost
$450.00 $400.00 No Bid

8A Clear Spring Library $402.63 $201.00 $220.00

8B

Clear Spring Library

Equipment Cost
No Bid $400.00 No Bid

9A Smithsburg Library $402.63 $201.00 $220.00

9B

Smithsburg Library

Equipment Cost
No Bid No Bid No Bid

10A Wash. Co. Transportation Dept. $805.25 $822.00 $720.00

10B

Wash. Co. Transportation Dept.

Equipment Cost
No Bid No Bid No Bid

11A Wash. Co. Detention Ctr. $402.63 $201.00 $400.00

11B

Wash. Co. Detention Ctr.

Equipment Cost
No Bid $400.00 No Bid

12A

Wash. Co. Detention Ctr.

(Min. Sec. Wing)
$402.63 $201.00 $200.00

Quotes Opened:  5/9/2018 



Q-18-654

Water Quality Assurance Program

12B

Wash. Co. Detention Ctr.

(Min Sec. Wing) Equipment Cost
No Bid $400.00 No Bid

13A Wash. Co. Health Dept. $402.63 $201.00 $400.00

13B

Wash. Co. Health Dept.

Equipment Cost
No Bid No Bid No Bid

14A

Wash. Co. Health Dept.

Equipment Cost
$1,207.89 $3,192.00 $1,800.00

14B

Wash. Co. Health Dept.

Equipment Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total Quote $9,102.56 $12,472.00 $8,740.00

*** Q-18-654 Mechanical Systems Water Assurance Program For Washington County Awarded To WaterPro, Inc. *** 

Quotes Opened:  5/9/2018 


