PUR-1175

Guard Rail Corrugated Pipe

Chemung Supply Corp. Lane Enterprises, Inc. Ferguson Water Works, Inc.
Elmira, NY Bealeton, VA Winchester, VA
. . Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
Item Description unit | Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price
OPTION NO. 1 PART A
17” x 13” Corrugated Aluminized
1 |Pipe (16 gauge - Twenty Foot ea 70 $191.33 $13,393.10 $225.80 $15,806.00 $230.60 $16,142.00
Sections)
2 ;Zu;‘e)lg’ Aluminized Bands (16 |~ | o, $9.44 $490.88 $11.29 $587.08 $11.53 $599.56
g |17 13" Aluminized End Flares | = | g $83.92 $1,258.80 $98.82 $1,482.30 $100.89 $1,513.35
(16 gauge)
217 x 15” Corrugated Aluminized
4 |Pipe (16 gauge - Twenty Foot ea 32 $239.17 $7,653.44 $267.20 $8,550.40 $272.60 $8,723.20
Sections)
5 S:\u ;‘e)15 Aluminized Bands (16 |~ | »g $11.84 $307.84 $13.36 $347.36 $13.63 $354.38
g |21 X 15 Aluminized End Flares | 6 $99.64 $597.84 $115.87 $695.22 $118.30 $709.80
(16 gauge)
28” x 20” Corrugated Aluminized
7 Pipe (14 gauge - Twenty Foot ea 28 $382.64 $10,713.92 $424.40 $11,883.20 $433.20 $12,129.60
Sections)
8 Ziu;e)zo Aluminized Bands (14 | | o5 $18.94 $435.62 $21.22 $488.06 $21.66 $498.18
g [287x20" Aluminized End Flares | 4 $141.54 $566.16 $166.06 $664.24 $169.54 $678.16
(14 gauge)
24” x 18” Corrugated Aluminized
10 Pipe (16 gauge - Twenty Foot ea 6 $270.94 $1,625.64 $310.00 $1,860.00 $316.40 $1,898.40
11 Sgu;‘e;S Aluminized Bands (16 | 4 $13.43 $53.72 $15.50 $62.00 $15.82 $63.28
1p [P 18" Aluminized End Flares | . 2 $120.62 $241.24 $140.97 $281.94 $143.94 $287.88
(16 gauge)
42” x 29” Corrugated Aluminized
13 |Pipe (14 gauge - Twenty Foot ea 12 $462.38 $5,548.56 $625.60 $7,507.20 $638.60 $7,663.20
Sections)

Bids Opened: 01-19-12



PUR-1175
Guard Rail Corrugated Pipe

Chemung Supply Corp. Lane Enterprises, Inc. Ferguson Water Works, Inc.
Elmira, NY Bealeton, VA Winchester, VA
L. ) Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
Item Description unit | Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price
14 giu;‘e)zg Aluminized Bands (14 | 10 $22.88 $228.80 $31.28 $312.80 $31.93 $319.30
18” Round Corrugated
15 [Aluminized Pipe (16 gauge - ea 5 $239.14 $1,195.70 $250.20 $1,251.00 $255.20 $1,276.00
Twenty Foot Sections)
16 éiu gAe;“m'”'ZEd Bands (16 ea 4 $11.84 $47.36 $12.51 $50.04 $12.76 $51.04
OPTION NO. 1 PART A
TOTAL SUM PRICE FOR NEW CORRUGATED $44,358.62 $51,828.84 $52,907.33
PIPE/ACCESSORIES
OPTION NO. 1 PART B
1 éinslsGa'Va”'zed Straight Rail | | 309 $54.48 $16,344.00 $0.00 $0.00
o |WEx85x6" Galvanized Guard | | 40, $32.44 $9.732.00 $0.00 $0.00
Rail Post
3 |2® Galvanized Convex Radius ea 5 $68.44 $342.20 $0.00 $0.00
Guard Panels
4 |?0 Galvanized Convex Radius ea | 10 $68.44 $684.40 $0.00 $0.00
Guard Panels
5 |10 Galvanized Convex Radius ea | 10 $68.44 $684.40 $0.00 $0.00
Guard Panels
g |%° Galvanized Concave Radius | 2 $68.44 $136.88 $0.00 $0.00
Guard Panels
;|39 Galvanized Concave Radius | 4 $68.44 $273.76 $0.00 $0.00
Guard Panels
g |20 Galvanized Concave Radius | 5 $68.44 $342.20 $0.00 $0.00
Guard Panels
9 |Galvanized Wrap End Treatments | ea 50 $23.72 $1,186.00 $0.00 $0.00
7 _1 ” H
10 g’fl tSX 1-+2” Galvanized Panel ea 3 $165.00 $495.00 $0.00 $0.00
2 Bids Opened: 01-19-12




PUR-1175

Guard Rail Corrugated Pipe

Chemung Supply Corp. Lane Enterprises, Inc. Ferguson Water Works, Inc.
Elmira, NY Bealeton, VA Winchester, VA
. . Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
Item Description Unit | Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price
11 i’ﬁtSGa'Va”'zed Double Recessed | . 3 $90.00 $270.00 $0.00 $0.00
12 [5/8” x 2” Galvanized Post Bolts ea 3 $190.00 $570.00 $0.00 $0.00
13 [Plastic Bumper Blocks (HDPE) ea 200 $4.44 $888.00 $0.00 $0.00
OPTION NO. 1 PART B
TOTAL SUM PRICE FOR NEW GUARD $31,948.84 NO BID NO BID
RAIL/HARDWARE
OPTION No. 2
177 x 13” Corrugated Aluminized
1 [Pipe (16 gauge - Twenty Foot ea 70 $191.33 $13,393.10 $0.00 $0.00
Sections)
o |177x 13" Aluminized Bands (16 | | o, $9.44 $490.88 $0.00 $0.00
gauge)
g |17 x 13" Aluminized End Flares | -~ | ¢ $83.92 $1,258.80 $0.00 $0.00
(16 gauge)
21” x 15” Corrugated Aluminized
4 |Pipe (16 gauge - Twenty Foot ea 32 $239.17 $7,653.44 $0.00 $0.00
Sections)
5 |21 X157 Aluminized Bands (16 |~ | ¢ $11.84 $307.84 $0.00 $0.00
gauge)
g |21 X 15" Aluminized End Flares | 6 $99.64 $597.84 $0.00 $0.00
(16 gauge)
28" x 20” Corrugated Aluminized
7 |Pipe (14 gauge - Twenty Foot ea 28 $382.64 $10,713.92 $0.00 $0.00
Sections)
g |28 X207 Aluminized Bands (14 | = | 53 $18.94 $435.62 $0.00 $0.00
gauge)
g |287x 20" Aluminized End Flares | 4 $141.54 $566.16 $0.00 $0.00
(14 gauge)
3 Bids Opened: 01-19-12



PUR-1175

Guard Rail Corrugated Pipe

Chemung Supply Corp. Lane Enterprises, Inc. Ferguson Water Works, Inc.
Elmira, NY Bealeton, VA Winchester, VA
. . Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
Item Description unit | Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price
24” x 18” Corrugated Aluminized
10 |Pipe (16 gauge - Twenty Foot ea 6 $270.94 $1,625.64 $0.00 $0.00
Sections)
11 [P 18" Aluminized Bands (16 | . 4 $13.43 $53.72 $0.00 $0.00
gauge)
1p [P 18” Aluminized End Flares | 2 $120.62 $241.24 $0.00 $0.00
(16 gauge)
42” x 29” Corrugated Aluminized
13 [Pipe (14 gauge - Twenty Foot ea 12 $462.38 $5,548.56 $0.00 $0.00
Sections)
14 |27 %297 Aluminized Bands (14 | .| 44 $22.88 $228.80 $0.00 $0.00
gauge)
18” Round Corrugated
15 |Aluminized Pipe (16 gauge - ea 5 $239.14 $1,195.70 $0.00 $0.00
Twenty Foot Sections)
16 |18 Aluminized Bands (16 ea 4 $11.84 $47.36 $0.00 $0.00
gauge)
17 éﬁnglsGalva”'zed Straight Rail ea | 300 $54.48 $16,344.00 $0.00 $0.00
18 |WEx85x6’ Galvanized Guard | | 54, $32.44 $9,732.00 $0.00 $0.00
Rail Post
19 [?° Galvanized Convex Radius ea 5 $68.44 $342.20 $0.00 $0.00
Guard Panels
g |20 Galvanized Convex Radius ea | 10 $68.44 $684.40 $0.00 $0.00
Guard Panels
g1 |10 Galvanized Convex Radius ea | 10 $68.44 $684.40 $0.00 $0.00
Guard Panels
gy |2 Galvanized Concave Radius | 2 $68.44 $136.88 $0.00 $0.00
Guard Panels
g3 |30 Galvanized Concave Radius | 4 $68.44 $273.76 $0.00 $0.00
Guard Panels
4 Bids Opened: 01-19-12



PUR-1175
Guard Rail Corrugated Pipe

Chemung Supply Corp. Lane Enterprises, Inc. Ferguson Water Works, Inc.
Elmira, NY Bealeton, VA Winchester, VA
_— . Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
Item Description unit | Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price

g4 |90 Galvanized Concave Radius | 5 $68.44 $342.20 $0.00 $0.00
Guard Panels

25 |Galvanized Wrap End Treatments | ea 50 $23.72 $1,186.00 $0.00 $0.00
26 g’f;;sx 14" Galvanized Panel ea | 3 $165.00 $495.00 $0.00 $0.00
27 iﬁ;Ga'Vf"”ized Double Recessed| . | 3 $90.00 $270.00 $0.00 $0.00
28 |5/8” x 2” Galvanized Post Bolts ea 3 $190.00 $570.00 $0.00 $0.00
29 |Plastic Bumper Blocks (HDPE) ea 200 $4.44 $888.00 $0.00 $0.00

OPTION NO. 2: (Item Nos. 1 thru 29)
TOTAL SUM PRICE FOR ALL NEW
CORRUGATED METAL PIPE/ACCESSORIES AND
NEW GUARD RAIL/HARDWARE

$76,307.46 NO BID NO BID

5 Bids Opened: 01-19-12
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