
ITEM

NO.
DESCRIPTION UNIT

ESTIMATED

ANNUAL

USAGE

 Brenntag Northeast, 

Inc.

Reading, PA 

 Carmeuse Lime & 

Stone

Pittsburgh, PA 

 Chemrite, Inc.

Buford, GA 

 Delta Chemical 

Corporation

Baltimore, MD 

 F2 Industries LLC

Smyrna, TN 

 General Chemical 

Performance Products 

LLC

Parsippany, NJ 

1
50% Liquid Caustic Soda

(City of Hagerstown)

55-Gallon

Drum

(50)

55-Gal. Drums
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2
Liquid Chlorine

(City of Hagerstown)

1-Ton 

Cylinder

(60)

1-Ton Cylinders
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3
Hydrated Lime

(City of Hagerstown)

50-Pound

Bag

(100)

Tons
No Bid $245.31* No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4
Ferric Chloride

(City of Hagerstown)
Dry Ton

(50-60)

Dry Tons
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5A
Sodium Hypochlorite

(City of Hagerstown)

Gallon

Bulk

(6,000)

Gallons Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5B
12.5% Sodium Hypochlorite

(City of Hagerstown)

Gallon

Bulk

(12,000)

Gallons Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5C
12.5% Sodium Hypochlorite

(City of Hagerstown)

Gallon

Bulk

(5,000)

Gallons Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6
Powdered Activated Carbon

(City of Hagerstown)

50-Pound 

Bag

(16)

Tons
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7
Poly Aluminum Chloride (PAC)

(City of Hagerstown)
Dry Ton

(100)

Dry Tons
No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,704.00 No Bid No Bid

8
Sodium Hypochlorite

(Washington County)
Gallon Bulk

(12,000)

Gallons Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9
Cyanuric Acid

(City of Hagerstown)
Pound

(600)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10
Hydrated Lime

(Washington County)
Ton

(110)

Tons
No Bid $157.53* No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11
Calcium Chloride

(City of Hagerstown)

50-Pound 

Container

(1,000)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12
Sodium Hypochlorite

(Washington County)

55-Gallon 

Drum

(105)

55-Gal. Drums
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

13
Granular Activated Carbon

(Washington County)

50-Pound 

Bag

(5,600)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

14
Potassium Permanganate

(City of Hagerstown)

55-Pound 

Pail

(50,000)

Pounds
$3.045 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.24* $2.98*

15

48% Liquid Aluminum Sulfate 

Alum

(Washington County)

55-Gallon

Drum

(30)

55-Gal. Drums
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

16
Powdered Activated Carbon

(Washington County)

40-Pound 

Bag

1,000

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

17
Chlorine Gas

(Washington County)

150-Pound 

Cylinder

(33) 150-Pound 

Cylinders
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

PUR-1168

Swimming Pool / Water / WasteWater Treatment Chemicals

* See Exceptions

1 Bids Opened 10-19-11



ITEM

NO.
DESCRIPTION UNIT

ESTIMATED

ANNUAL

USAGE

 Brenntag Northeast, 

Inc.

Reading, PA 

 Carmeuse Lime & 

Stone

Pittsburgh, PA 

 Chemrite, Inc.

Buford, GA 

 Delta Chemical 

Corporation

Baltimore, MD 

 F2 Industries LLC

Smyrna, TN 

 General Chemical 

Performance Products 

LLC

Parsippany, NJ 

18A
55-Gallon

Drum

(325)

55-Gal. Drums
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

18B Gallon Bulk
(1,500)

Gallons Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

19
Ferrous Chloride Solution

(Washington County)
Gallon Bulk

(14,000)

Gallons
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

15-Gallon 

Pail

(15)

15-Gallon Pails
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

55-Gallon 

Drum

(4) 55-Gallon 

Drums
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

21
Granular Calcium Hypochlorite

(Washington County)

100-Pound 

Container

(60) 100-Pound 

Containers
No Bid No Bid $1.275 No Bid $1.32* No Bid

22
Sulfur Dioxide Gas

(Washington County)

150-Pound 

Cylinder

(25) 150-Pound 

Cylinders
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

23
DelPac2000

(Washington County)
Bulk Pound

(423,000)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

24
3" Tablet Chlorine

(City of Hagerstown)

50-100 

Pound Drum

(17,000)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid $1.94 No Bid $1.80* No Bid

25
Sodium Hypochlorite

(Washington County Parks)

55-Gallon 

Drum

(47)

55-Gal. Drums
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

26
Cyanuric Acid

(Washington County Parks)
Pound

(100-200)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

27
Calcium Chloride

(Washington County Parks)

50-Pound 

Container

(500-600)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

28
Muriatic Acid

(Washington County Parks)

15-Gallon 

Pail Pound

(15-30)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

29
Sodium Fluorosilicate

(City of Hagerstown)

50-Pound 

Bag

(44,000)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

50-Gallon

Drum
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

55-Gallon 

Drum
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

31
Sodium Bisulfite Solution

(City of Hagerstown)

55-Gallon 

Drum Pound
Emergency Basis No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

32
Defoamer - Anti-Foam

(City of Hagerstown)

55-Gallon 

Drum

(2000)

Gallons
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

33

Thioguard (55-65%)

Magnesium Hydroxide

(City of Hagerstown)

Gallon Bulk
(100,000-135,000)

Gallons
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

34
Polymer

(City of Hagerstown)

55-Pound 

Bag

(6,000-8,000)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Caustic Soda

(Sodium Hydroxide)

(Washington County)

(40)

Drums

20

Hydrofluosilicic Acid

(H2SiF6)

(Washington County)

30
DelPAC 2020

(Washington County)

* See Exceptions

2 Bids Opened 10-19-11



ITEM

NO.
DESCRIPTION UNIT

ESTIMATED

ANNUAL

USAGE

 Brenntag Northeast, 

Inc.

Reading, PA 

 Carmeuse Lime & 

Stone

Pittsburgh, PA 

 Chemrite, Inc.

Buford, GA 

 Delta Chemical 

Corporation

Baltimore, MD 

 F2 Industries LLC

Smyrna, TN 

 General Chemical 

Performance Products 

LLC

Parsippany, NJ 

35
Methanol

(City of Hagerstown)
Gallon Bulk

(65,000-80,000)

Gallons
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

36
Bacterial Enzymatic Powder

(Washington County)

50-Pound 

Container

(1,500)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Exceptions:

Carmeuse Lime & Stone

1 #3 - For a 22.5 ton minimum load

2 #10 - For a 22.5 ton minimum load

F2 Industries
1 #14 - K-OX

2 #21 - 100 lb pails, PimeClo 2

3 #24 - 50lb pails, PrimeClo2

General Chemical Performance Products LLC
1 #14 - Minimum Order 1 Pallet (36 drums)

* See Exceptions

3 Bids Opened 10-19-11



ITEM

NO.
DESCRIPTION UNIT

ESTIMATED

ANNUAL

USAGE

 George S. Coyne 

Chemical Co., Inc.

Croydon, PA 

 Greer Industries, Inc.

Morgantown, WV 

 Gulbrandsen 

Technologies, Inc.

Clinton, NJ 

 JCI Jones Chemicals, 

Inc.

Milford, VA 

 Kemira Water 

Solutions, Inc.

Lawrence, KS 

 Key Chemical, Inc.

Waxhaw, NC 

1
50% Liquid Caustic Soda

(City of Hagerstown)

55-Gallon

Drum

(50)

55-Gal. Drums
$4.86 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2
Liquid Chlorine

(City of Hagerstown)

1-Ton 

Cylinder

(60)

1-Ton Cylinders
No Bid No Bid No Bid $430.00 No Bid No Bid

3
Hydrated Lime

(City of Hagerstown)

50-Pound

Bag

(100)

Tons
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4
Ferric Chloride

(City of Hagerstown)
Dry Ton

(50-60)

Dry Tons
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5A
Sodium Hypochlorite

(City of Hagerstown)

Gallon

Bulk

(6,000)

Gallons Bulk
$2.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5B
12.5% Sodium Hypochlorite

(City of Hagerstown)

Gallon

Bulk

(12,000)

Gallons Bulk
$1.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5C
12.5% Sodium Hypochlorite

(City of Hagerstown)

Gallon

Bulk

(5,000)

Gallons Bulk
$1.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6
Powdered Activated Carbon

(City of Hagerstown)

50-Pound 

Bag

(16)

Tons
$2,125.60* No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7
Poly Aluminum Chloride (PAC)

(City of Hagerstown)
Dry Ton

(100)

Dry Tons
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,047.62* No Bid

8
Sodium Hypochlorite

(Washington County)
Gallon Bulk

(12,000)

Gallons Bulk
$1.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9
Cyanuric Acid

(City of Hagerstown)
Pound

(600)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10
Hydrated Lime

(Washington County)
Ton

(110)

Tons
No Bid $162.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11
Calcium Chloride

(City of Hagerstown)

50-Pound 

Container

(1,000)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12
Sodium Hypochlorite

(Washington County)

55-Gallon 

Drum

(105)

55-Gal. Drums
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

13
Granular Activated Carbon

(Washington County)

50-Pound 

Bag

(5,600)

Pounds
$2.85* No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

14
Potassium Permanganate

(City of Hagerstown)

55-Pound 

Pail

(50,000)

Pounds
$2.2489 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

15

48% Liquid Aluminum Sulfate 

Alum

(Washington County)

55-Gallon

Drum

(30)

55-Gal. Drums
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

16
Powdered Activated Carbon

(Washington County)

40-Pound 

Bag

1,000

Pounds
$1.29* No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

17
Chlorine Gas

(Washington County)

150-Pound 

Cylinder

(33) 150-Pound 

Cylinders
No Bid No Bid No Bid $95.00 No Bid No Bid

PUR-1168

Swimming Pool / Water / WasteWater Treatment Chemicals

* See Exceptions

4 Bids Opened 10-19-11



ITEM

NO.
DESCRIPTION UNIT

ESTIMATED

ANNUAL

USAGE

 George S. Coyne 

Chemical Co., Inc.

Croydon, PA 

 Greer Industries, Inc.

Morgantown, WV 

 Gulbrandsen 

Technologies, Inc.

Clinton, NJ 

 JCI Jones Chemicals, 

Inc.

Milford, VA 

 Kemira Water 

Solutions, Inc.

Lawrence, KS 

 Key Chemical, Inc.

Waxhaw, NC 

18A
55-Gallon

Drum

(325)

55-Gal. Drums
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

18B Gallon Bulk
(1,500)

Gallons Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

19
Ferrous Chloride Solution

(Washington County)
Gallon Bulk

(14,000)

Gallons
No Bid No Bid $0.641 No Bid $0.65 No Bid

15-Gallon 

Pail

(15)

15-Gallon Pails
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

55-Gallon 

Drum

(4) 55-Gallon 

Drums
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

21
Granular Calcium Hypochlorite

(Washington County)

100-Pound 

Container

(60) 100-Pound 

Containers
$1.5995 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

22
Sulfur Dioxide Gas

(Washington County)

150-Pound 

Cylinder

(25) 150-Pound 

Cylinders
No Bid No Bid No Bid $125.00 No Bid No Bid

23
DelPac2000

(Washington County)
Bulk Pound

(423,000)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid $0.18 No Bid $0.1475* No Bid

24
3" Tablet Chlorine

(City of Hagerstown)

50-100 

Pound Drum

(17,000)

Pounds
$2.373* No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

25
Sodium Hypochlorite

(Washington County Parks)

55-Gallon 

Drum

(47)

55-Gal. Drums
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

26
Cyanuric Acid

(Washington County Parks)
Pound

(100-200)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

27
Calcium Chloride

(Washington County Parks)

50-Pound 

Container

(500-600)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

28
Muriatic Acid

(Washington County Parks)

15-Gallon 

Pail Pound

(15-30)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

29
Sodium Fluorosilicate

(City of Hagerstown)

50-Pound 

Bag

(44,000)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

50-Gallon

Drum
$3.548* No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

55-Gallon 

Drum
$3.548* No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

31
Sodium Bisulfite Solution

(City of Hagerstown)

55-Gallon 

Drum Pound
Emergency Basis No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

32
Defoamer - Anti-Foam

(City of Hagerstown)

55-Gallon 

Drum

(2000)

Gallons
$9.97* No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.33* No Bid

33

Thioguard (55-65%)

Magnesium Hydroxide

(City of Hagerstown)

Gallon Bulk
(100,000-135,000)

Gallons
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

34
Polymer

(City of Hagerstown)

55-Pound 

Bag

(6,000-8,000)

Pounds
$2.404* No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Caustic Soda

(Sodium Hydroxide)

(Washington County)

(40)

Drums

20

Hydrofluosilicic Acid

(H2SiF6)

(Washington County)

30
DelPAC 2020

(Washington County)

* See Exceptions

5 Bids Opened 10-19-11



ITEM

NO.
DESCRIPTION UNIT

ESTIMATED

ANNUAL

USAGE

 George S. Coyne 

Chemical Co., Inc.

Croydon, PA 

 Greer Industries, Inc.

Morgantown, WV 

 Gulbrandsen 

Technologies, Inc.

Clinton, NJ 

 JCI Jones Chemicals, 

Inc.

Milford, VA 

 Kemira Water 

Solutions, Inc.

Lawrence, KS 

 Key Chemical, Inc.

Waxhaw, NC 

35
Methanol

(City of Hagerstown)
Gallon Bulk

(65,000-80,000)

Gallons
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.88*

36
Bacterial Enzymatic Powder

(Washington County)

50-Pound 

Container

(1,500)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Exceptions:

George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc.

1 #6 - Hydrodarco B

2 #13 - Hydrodarco 3000 or 4000

3 #16 - Hydrodarco B

4 #24 - Quoting on Accu-Tab Si in 55# drum

5 #30 - CES PAC1 900S

6 #32 - Foam Free 410

7 #34 - Zetag 7563

Kemira Water Solutions, Inc.

1 #7 - PAX-XL8, 46,000 lbs minimum/load

2 #23 - PAX-XL6

3 #32 - equal to $0.65/ lb. sol. Callaway 8860

Key Chemical, Inc.
1 #35 - based on min 7,000 gal del.

* See Exceptions

6 Bids Opened 10-19-11



ITEM

NO.
DESCRIPTION UNIT

ESTIMATED

ANNUAL

USAGE

 Maryland Chemical 

Co., Inc.

Baltimore, MD 

 MTEK, Inc.

Hershey, PA 

 Neo Solutions, Inc.

Beaver, PA 

 PVS Technologies, 

Inc.

Detroit, MI 

 Univar USA, Inc.

Middletown, PA 

 Company Name

City, State 

1
50% Liquid Caustic Soda

(City of Hagerstown)

55-Gallon

Drum

(50)

55-Gal. Drums
$2.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.54 

2
Liquid Chlorine

(City of Hagerstown)

1-Ton 

Cylinder

(60)

1-Ton Cylinders
No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid $427.90 

3
Hydrated Lime

(City of Hagerstown)

50-Pound

Bag

(100)

Tons
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4
Ferric Chloride

(City of Hagerstown)
Dry Ton

(50-60)

Dry Tons
No Bid No Bid No Bid $577.00 $659.00 

5A
Sodium Hypochlorite

(City of Hagerstown)

Gallon

Bulk

(6,000)

Gallons Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.911 

5B
12.5% Sodium Hypochlorite

(City of Hagerstown)

Gallon

Bulk

(12,000)

Gallons Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.511 

5C
12.5% Sodium Hypochlorite

(City of Hagerstown)

Gallon

Bulk

(5,000)

Gallons Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.711 

6
Powdered Activated Carbon

(City of Hagerstown)

50-Pound 

Bag

(16)

Tons
$2390.24* No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,188.00 

7
Poly Aluminum Chloride (PAC)

(City of Hagerstown)
Dry Ton

(100)

Dry Tons
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8
Sodium Hypochlorite

(Washington County)
Gallon Bulk

(12,000)

Gallons Bulk
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.22 

9
Cyanuric Acid

(City of Hagerstown)
Pound

(600)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10
Hydrated Lime

(Washington County)
Ton

(110)

Tons
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11
Calcium Chloride

(City of Hagerstown)

50-Pound 

Container

(1,000)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.53 

12
Sodium Hypochlorite

(Washington County)

55-Gallon 

Drum

(105)

55-Gal. Drums
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.94 

13
Granular Activated Carbon

(Washington County)

50-Pound 

Bag

(5,600)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

14
Potassium Permanganate

(City of Hagerstown)

55-Pound 

Pail

(50,000)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.10 

15

48% Liquid Aluminum Sulfate 

Alum

(Washington County)

55-Gallon

Drum

(30)

55-Gal. Drums
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.84 

16
Powdered Activated Carbon

(Washington County)

40-Pound 

Bag

1,000

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.26 

17
Chlorine Gas

(Washington County)

150-Pound 

Cylinder

(33) 150-Pound 

Cylinders
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.00 

PUR-1168

Swimming Pool / Water / WasteWater Treatment Chemicals

* See Exceptions

7 Bids Opened 10-19-11



ITEM

NO.
DESCRIPTION UNIT

ESTIMATED

ANNUAL

USAGE

 Maryland Chemical 

Co., Inc.

Baltimore, MD 

 MTEK, Inc.

Hershey, PA 

 Neo Solutions, Inc.

Beaver, PA 

 PVS Technologies, 

Inc.

Detroit, MI 

 Univar USA, Inc.

Middletown, PA 

 Company Name

City, State 

18A
55-Gallon

Drum

(325)

55-Gal. Drums
$2.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.39 

18B Gallon Bulk
(1,500)

Gallons Bulk
$2.93* No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.39 

19
Ferrous Chloride Solution

(Washington County)
Gallon Bulk

(14,000)

Gallons
No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.27 No Bid

15-Gallon 

Pail

(15)

15-Gallon Pails
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.99 

55-Gallon 

Drum

(4) 55-Gallon 

Drums
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.37 

21
Granular Calcium Hypochlorite

(Washington County)

100-Pound 

Container

(60) 100-Pound 

Containers
$1.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.634 

22
Sulfur Dioxide Gas

(Washington County)

150-Pound 

Cylinder

(25) 150-Pound 

Cylinders
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $117.00 

23
DelPac2000

(Washington County)
Bulk Pound

(423,000)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.144 

24
3" Tablet Chlorine

(City of Hagerstown)

50-100 

Pound Drum

(17,000)

Pounds
$1.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.99 

25
Sodium Hypochlorite

(Washington County Parks)

55-Gallon 

Drum

(47)

55-Gal. Drums
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.92 

26
Cyanuric Acid

(Washington County Parks)
Pound

(100-200)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

27
Calcium Chloride

(Washington County Parks)

50-Pound 

Container

(500-600)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.53 

28
Muriatic Acid

(Washington County Parks)

15-Gallon 

Pail Pound

(15-30)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

29
Sodium Fluorosilicate

(City of Hagerstown)

50-Pound 

Bag

(44,000)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.47 

50-Gallon

Drum
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.29*

55-Gallon 

Drum
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.29 

31
Sodium Bisulfite Solution

(City of Hagerstown)

55-Gallon 

Drum Pound
Emergency Basis $0.31 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.42 

32
Defoamer - Anti-Foam

(City of Hagerstown)

55-Gallon 

Drum

(2000)

Gallons
No Bid No Bid $8.50* No Bid No Bid

33

Thioguard (55-65%)

Magnesium Hydroxide

(City of Hagerstown)

Gallon Bulk
(100,000-135,000)

Gallons
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

34
Polymer

(City of Hagerstown)

55-Pound 

Bag

(6,000-8,000)

Pounds
No Bid No Bid $1.90* No Bid No Bid

20

Hydrofluosilicic Acid

(H2SiF6)

(Washington County)

30
DelPAC 2020

(Washington County)

(40)

Drums

Caustic Soda

(Sodium Hydroxide)

(Washington County)

* See Exceptions
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ITEM

NO.
DESCRIPTION UNIT

ESTIMATED

ANNUAL

USAGE

 Maryland Chemical 

Co., Inc.

Baltimore, MD 

 MTEK, Inc.

Hershey, PA 

 Neo Solutions, Inc.

Beaver, PA 

 PVS Technologies, 

Inc.

Detroit, MI 

 Univar USA, Inc.

Middletown, PA 

 Company Name

City, State 

35
Methanol

(City of Hagerstown)
Gallon Bulk

(65,000-80,000)

Gallons
$1.54* No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.99 

36
Bacterial Enzymatic Powder

(Washington County)

50-Pound 

Container

(1,500)

Pounds
No Bid $15.87* No Bid No Bid No Bid

Exceptions:

Maryland Chemical Co., Inc.
1 #6 - we offer in 40 pound bags

2 #18B - no delivery details provided

3 #35 - Oct. 2011 - we offer $.16 over the Methanex North American reference price published monthly.

MTEK, Inc.
1 #36 - minimum shipping quantity per order 300 lbs

T+ quantities under 300 lbs may be ordered

Subject to prevailing shipping charges added

Neo Solutions, Inc.
1 #32 - NS AF 110

2 #34 - NS 4710

Univar USA, Inc.
1 #30 - Univar only supplies 55 gal drum

* See Exceptions
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Basic Chemical Solutions, LLC

Brenntag Northeast, Inc.

Carmeuse North America

Chemical Lime Co.

Coyne Chemical

Delta Chemical Corp.

F2 Industries, LLC

Faesy & Bestoff, LLC

General Chemical

Greer Industries, Inc.

Gulbrandsen Technologies Inc.

JLM Industires, Inc.

Jones Chemicals, Inc.

Kemira Water Solutions, Inc.

Univar USA, Inc.

Watec Co.


