PUR-1164
Industrial Equipment

ITEMNO. 1
SIX (6) DIESEL ENGINE, BACKHOE/FRONT Soutﬁfg’i}] :c’i‘ecla . Alban g:ﬁ}frfof:r:fgny’ Inc.
END LOADERS ' '
1 Total Price of Straight Purchase .
(per Unit, No Annual Lease) $68,837.00 No Bid
2
Annual_ Lease/Purchase Payment $18.521.00
per Unit
a. Vendor shall state Lease Fixed Interest Rate 2.12%
3 ive-
Tot_al Annual I__ease/Purchase Cost Over a Five-Year $92.605.00
Period per Unit
4 Annual Lease/Purchase Payment
for Six (6) Units $111,126.00
S Total Annual Lease/Purchase Cost Over a Five-Year
Period for Six (6) Units $555,630.00
6 Guaranteed Total Cost of repairs
for 5,000 hours or five (5) years per unit at $1,000.00
7 Repurchase Price for which bidders will buy back,
for five (5) years the equipment offered,
per unit:
a. Within two (2) years from date $67.900.00
of acceptance
b. Within three (3) years from date of acceptance $62,900.00
c. Within four (4) years from date $60,000.00
of acceptance
d. Within five (5) years from date $58,000.00
of acceptance

1 Bids Opened: 11-09-11



PUR-1164
Industrial Equipment

ITEMNO. 1
SIX (6) DIESEL ENGINE, BACKHOE/FRONT Sout;e;f;h L?eﬁ'd . Alban Lr;imofeon%ny, Inc.
END LOADERS : ,
8 Adjusted Bids:
Bid per Unit $92.605.00
(Item No. 3 above)
Plus Total Cost of Repairs
i 1,000.00
(No. 6 above) per Unit $
Less Repurchase
(No. 7.d. above) per Unit $58,000.00
Total Adjust_ed Bid $35.605.00
per Unit
9 Adjusted Bids:
Total Bid for Six (6) Units $555.630.00
(Item No. 5 above)
Plus total cost of repairs
i i 6,000.00
(No. 6 above x Six (6) Units) $
Less Repurchase
i i 348,000.00
(No. 7.d. above x Six (6) Units) $
Total Adjusted Bid
i i 213,630.
for Six (6) Units $213,630.00
TRADE-INS -
1 Trade-In-- 771736¢, 2007,
John-Deere 310SJ, serial number $52,000.00
2 Trade-In -- 771737c, 2007,
John-Deere 310SJ, serial number $52,000.00
3 Trade-In -- 771738w, 2007,
John-Deere 310SJ, serial number $52,000.00
4 Trade-In - 771739w, 2007,
John-Deere 310SJ, serial number $52,000.00
5 Trade-In—771740e, 2007,
John-Deere 310SJ, serial number $52,000.00

Bids Opened: 11-09-11



PUR-1164

Industrial Equipment

ITEMNO. 1
SIX (6) DIESEL ENGINE, BACKHOE/FRONT
END LOADERS

Jesco, Inc.
South Plainfield, NJ

Alban Tractor Company, Inc.
Baltimore, MD

6 Trade-In—771741s, 2007,
John-Deere 310SJ, serial number

$52,000.00

TOTAL OF ABOVE SIX (6)
TRADE-INS

$312,000.00

Delivery Date

90 Days after receipt of order

State Warranty

5 year / 3,000 hours JD SECURE
Comprehensive Factory Warrenty

Remarks/Exceptions

None

Notes:

Actual Total Lease Payment to
Washington County with Trades, Six
units $46,079.00

Bids Opened: 11-09-11



PUR-1164

Industrial Equipment

ITEMNO. 2
SIX (6) DIESEL ENGINE, RUBBER TIRED

Jesco, Inc.

Alban Tractor Company, Inc.

WHEEL LOADERS South Plainfield, NJ Baltimore, MD
Total Price of Straight Purchase .
(per Unit, No Annual Lease) $151,277.00 No Bid
Annual_ Lease/Purchase Payment $31.539.00
per Unit
a. Vendor shall state Lease Fixed Interest Rate 2.12%
Tot_al Annual I__ease/Purchase Cost Over a Five-Year $157.695.00
Period per Unit
Annual Lease/Purchase Payment
for Six (6) Units $189,234.00
Total Annual Lease/Purchase Cost Over a Five-Year
Period for Six (6) Units $946,170.00
Guaranteed Total Cost of repairs
for 5,000 hours or five (5) years per unit at $1,000.00
Repurchase Price for which bidders will buy back,
for five (5) years the equipment offered,
per unit
a. Within two (2) years from date $102.150.00
of acceptance
b. Within three (3) years from date of acceptance $100,150.00
¢. Within four (4) years from date $98,150.00
of acceptance
d. Within five (5) years from date $96,150.00

of acceptance

Bids Opened: 11-09-11



PUR-1164
Industrial Equipment

ITEMNO. 2
SIX (6) DIESEL ENGINE, RUBBER TIRED
WHEEL LOADERS

Jesco, Inc.

South Plainfield, NJ

Alban Tractor Company, Inc.
Baltimore, MD

8 Adjusted Bids:
Bid per Unit (Item No. 3 above) $157,695.00
Plus Total Cost of Repairs
(No. 6 above) per Unit $1,000.00
Less Repurchase
(No. 7.d. above) per Unit $96,150.00
Total Adjust_ed Bid $62.545.00
per Unit
9 Adjusted Bids:
Total Bid for Six (6) Units $946,170.00
(Item No. 5 above)
Plus total cost of repairs
(No. 6 above x Six (6) Units) $6,000.00
Less Repurchase
(No. 7.d. above x Six (6) Units) $576,900.00
Total Adjusted Bid
. . 375,270.00
for Six (6) Units $
ALTERNATE NO. 1 $8,350.00
ALTERNATE NO. 2 $9,350.00
ALTERNATE NO. 3 $14,250.00
TRADE-INS -
1 Trade-In -- 761710w, 2007,
John-Deere 624J, serial number $102,000.00
DW624J2610688
2 Trade-In -- 761711w, 2007,
John-Deere 624J, serial number $102,000.00
DW624J2610691
3 Trade-In -- 761712e, 2007,
John-Deere 624J, serial number $102,000.00

DW624J7610696

Bids Opened: 11-09-11



PUR-1164
Industrial Equipment

ITEMNO. 2 J | Alban Tractor C |
SIX (6) DIESEL ENGINE, RUBBER TIRED . theslco.' ff‘cl'd U an Brali.or O”K/FI’S”V’ ne.
WHEEL LOADERS ou ainfield, altimore,
4 Trade-In -- 761713s, 2007,
John-Deere 624J, serial number $102,000.00
DW624J7610697
5 Trade-In -- 761714c, 2007,
John-Deere 624J, serial number $102,000.00
DW624J72610699
6 Trade-In -- 761715c, 2007,
John-Deere 624J, serial number $102,000.00
DW624J2610700
TOTAL OF ABOVE SIX (6)
TRADE-INS $612,000.00
Delivery Date 90 days after receipt of order
State W ; 5 year / 3,000 hour John Deere
ate Vvarranty SECURE Comprehensive Factory
Remarks/Exceptions None

Actual Total Annual Lease Payment
Notes: to Washington County with Trades,
Six Units $61,640.00

3 Bids Opened: 11-09-11



PUR-1164

Industrial Equipment

ITEM NO. 3
ONE (1) DIESEL ENGINE, SIX-WHEEL

Jesco, Inc.

Alban Tractor Company, Inc.

South Plainfield, NJ Baltimore, MD

DRIVE MOTOR GRADER
Total Price of Straight Purchase .
(per Unit, No Annual Lease) $213,672.00 No Bid
Annual_ Lease/Purchase Payment $44.547.00
per Unit
a. Vendor shall state Lease Fixed Interest Rate 2.12%
Tot_al Annual I__ease/Purchase Cost Over a Five-Year $222.735.00
Period per Unit
Guaranteed Total Cost of repairs
for 5,000 hours or five (5) years per unit at $1,000.00
Repurchase Price for which bidders will buy
back, for ten (10) years the equipment offered,
per unit:
a. Within two (2) years from date $152.503.00
of acceptance
b. Within four (3) years from date $137.745.00
of acceptance
¢. Within four (4) years from date $122.987.00
of acceptance
d. Within five (5) years from date $118.228.00
of acceptance
e. Within six (6) years from date $93.470.00
of acceptance
f. Within seven (7) years from date $63,953.00
of acceptance
g. Within eight (8) years from date $49 195.00
of acceptance T
h. Within nine (9) years from date $36.896.00
of acceptance T
i. Within ten (10) years from date $24 598,00

of acceptance

Bids Opened: 11-09-11



PUR-1164
Industrial Equipment

ITEM NO. 3
ONE (1) DIESEL ENGINE, SIX-WHEEL
DRIVE MOTOR GRADER

Jesco, Inc.
South Plainfield, NJ

Alban Tractor Company, Inc.
Baltimore, MD

Adjusted Bids:

222,735.00
Bid per Unit (Item No. 2 above) s
Plus Total Cost of Repairs
. 1,000.
(No. 4 above) per Unit $1,000.00
Less Repurchase
. 118,228.00
(No. 5.d. above) per Unit $
Total Adjust_ed Bid $105,507.00
per Unit
TRADE-INS -
1 Trade-In -- 740750w, 1980,
John-Deere 670A, serial number 670A10626T $15,000.00

Delivery Date

90 Days after receipt of order

State Warranty

5 year / 3,000 hour John Deere
SECURE Comprehensive Factory

Remarks/Exceptions

None

Notes:

Factory Total Annual Lease Payment
to Washington County with Trade
$41,419.00

Bids Opened: 11-09-11



PUR-1164
Industrial Equipment

ITEM NO. 4
ONE (1) DIESEL ENGINE,

Jesco, Inc.

Alban Tractor Company, Inc.

South Plainfield, NJ Baltimore, MD
BACKHOE/FRONT END LOADER
Total Price of Straight Purchase .
(per Unit, No Annual Lease) $88,977.00 No Bid
Annual_ Lease/Purchase Payment $18,134.00
per Unit
a. Vendor shall state Lease Fixed Interest Rate 2.12%
Tot_al Annual I__ease/Purchase Cost Over a Five-Year $90,670.00
Period per Unit
Annual Lease/Purchase Payment
for One (1) Unit $18,134.00
Total Annual Lease/Purchase Cost Over a Five-Year
Period for Six (6) Units $90,670.00
C_Buaranteed Total Cgst of repairs for 5,000 hours or $1.000.00
five (5) years per unit at
Repurchase Price for which bidders will buy back,
for five (5) years the equipment offered,
per unit
a. Within two (2) years from date $65,500.00
of acceptance
b. Within three (3) years from date $60,500.00
of acceptance
c. Within four (4) years from date $55.500.00
of acceptance
d. Within five (5) years from date $50,500.00
of acceptance
1

Bids Opened: 11-09-11



PUR-1164
Industrial Equipment

ITEM NO. 4 J | Alban Tractor C |
ONE (1) DIESEL ENGINE, sout e e
BACKHOE/FRONT END LOADER ’ ’
8 Adjusted Bids:
90,670.00
Bid per Unit $
Plus Total Cost of Repairs
_ 1,000.00
(No. 6 above) per Unit $
Less Repurchase
. 50,500.00
(No. 7.d. above) per Unit $
Total Adjust_ed Bid $41.170.00
per Unit
9 Adjusted Bids:
Total Bid for One (1) Unit $90,670.00
(Item No. 5 above)
Plus total cost of repairs
. 1,000.00
(No. 6 above One (1) Unit) $
Less Repurchase
. 50,500.00
(No. 7.d. above One (1) Unit) $
Total Adjusted Bid
. 41,170.00
for One (1) Unit ¥
TRADE-INS -
1 Trade-In -- 2007,
John-Deere 310SJ, serial number $53,000.00
T0310SJ138269
Delivery Date 90 Days after receipt of order
State W ‘ 5 year / 3,000 hour John Deere
ate Yvarranty SECURE Comprehensive Factory
Remarks/Exceptions None
2

Bids Opened: 11-09-11



PUR-1164
Industrial Equipment

BACKHOE/FRONT END LOADER

ITEM NO. 4
ONE (1) DIESEL ENGINE,

Jesco, Inc.
South Plainfield, NJ

Alban Tractor Company, Inc.
Baltimore, MD

Notes:

Actual Total Annual Lease Payment
to Washington County with Trade
$7,084.00

Bids Opened: 11-09-11
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