PUR-1162

Grounds Maintenance Chemicals

(Various County Departments)

Agrium Advanced Technologies

CWC Chemical, Inc.

Genesis Turfgrass

Unit Linthicum Heights, MD Cloverdale, VA York, PA
Item Description of
Measure Unit Price Note Unit Price Note Unit Price Note

1 |Acclaim Extra Gallon $522.00 $489.80

2 |Aqua Shade Gallon $38.86 $40.66

3 |Banner Maxx Il Gallon $211.00 $211.00

4  |Banol Gallon $406.00 $382.94

5 |Bensumec - 4LF Gallon $97.75 $95.84

6 [Chipco/26 GT Gallon $136.85 $120.69

7 |Chipco Signature Pound $28.24 $24.51

8 |Crossbow Gallon $51.40 $46.20

9  |Cutrine Plus Gallon $24.82 $21.26

10 |Daconil Ultrex/WDG Pound $7.75 $7.75

11  |Dursban 50 WSP Pound $17.11 $15.80

12 |Dylox 420 SL Pound $60.72 #12 $56.26

13  |Fore WSP Pound NO BID $7.26

14 |Head Way Gallon $405.00 $405.00

15 |Instrata Gallon $153.80 $153.80

16 [Meridian 25/WG (408 0z./Case) Case $2,350.00 $2,350.00

17  |Meridian 25/WG (2 Ib./case) Pound NO BID #17 $105.33

18 [Meridian 25/WG (4.25 Ib./case) Pound $96.00 $96.00

19 |PCNB10G Pound NO BID NO BID

20 |Pendulum Aqua Cap Gallon $53.50 $61.44

1 Bids Opened: 05-25-11




PUR-1162

Grounds Maintenance Chemicals
(Various County Departments)

Agrium Advanced Technologies

CWC Chemical, Inc.

Genesis Turfgrass

Unit Linthicum Heights, MD Cloverdale, VA York, PA
Item Description of
Measure Unit Price Note Unit Price Note Unit Price Note
21 |Primo Maxx Gallon $275.00 $275.00
22  |Prograss Gallon $152.55 $133.03
23 |Provaunt Case $433.88 $448.56
24 |Round Up Pro Maxx Gallon $29.90 $36.34
25 |Subdue Maxx Gallon $499.00 $499.00
26 |Talstar Gallon NO BID $35.24
27 |Teremec SP Pound $14.68 $13.89
28 |Trimec Classic Gallon $34.14 $31.83
29 |Trimmit 2SC Gallon $451.33 $436.69

Agrium Advanced Technologies
Linthicum Heights, MD

CWC Chemical, Inc.
Cloverdale, VA

Genesis Turfgrass
York, PA

Notes

Notes

Notes

NOTES:

NON- RESPONSIVE - BID

SUBMITTED ON BID FORM FROM
LAST YEAR'S CHEMICAL BID, PUR
1136

#12 - Unit of Measure: Gallon
#17 - Discontinued

Bids Opened: 05-25-11




PUR-1162
Grounds Maintenance Chemicals
(Various County Departments)

Helena Chemical Company John Deere Landscapes Pennington Seed, Inc.
Unit Pottstown, PA Frederick, MD Laurel, MD
Item Description of

Measure Unit Price Note Unit Price Note Unit Price Note
1 Acclaim Extra Gallon $465.00 $540.00 NO BID
2 Aqua Shade Gallon $28.31 NO BID NO BID
3 Banner Maxx I Gallon $211.00 #3 $211.00 #3 NO BID
4 Banol Gallon $363.50 $425.00 NO BID
5 Bensumec — 4LF Gallon $80.50 $105.00 NO BID
6 Chipco/26 GT Gallon $117.25 $136.00 NO BID
7 Chipco Signature Pound $24.20 $28.20 NO BID
8 Crossbow Gallon $52.78 $63.00 NO BID
9 Cutrine Plus Gallon $18.17 $24.00 NO BID
10 Daconil Ultrex/WDG Pound $7.75 #10 $7.75 #10 NO BID
11 Dursban 50 WSP Pound $15.33 NO BID NO BID
12 Dylox 420 SL Pound $51.75 #12 $64.00 #12 NO BID
13 Fore WSP Pound $7.10 $8.35 NO BID
14 Head Way Gallon $405.00 #14 $405.00 #14 NO BID
15 Instrata Gallon $153.80 #15 $153.80 #15 NO BID
16 Meridian 25/WG (408 0z./Case) Case $2,050.08 #16 $2,350.00 #16 NO BID
17 Meridian 25/WG (2 Ib./case) Pound $96.00 $120.00 NO BID
18 Meridian 25/WG (4.25 Ib./case) Pound $96.00 #18 $96.00 #18 NO BID
19 PCNB 10 G Pound N/A NO BID NO BID
20 Pendulum Aqua Cap Gallon $56.00 $70.00 NO BID

3 Bids Opened: 05-25-11




PUR-1162
Grounds Maintenance Chemicals
(Various County Departments)

Helena Chemical Company

John Deere Landscapes

Pennington Seed, Inc.

Unit Pottstown, PA Frederick, MD Laurel, MD
Item Description of
Measure Unit Price Note Unit Price Note Unit Price Note
21 Primo Maxx Gallon $275.00 #21 $275.00 #21 NO BID
22 Prograss Gallon $130.00 $146.00 NO BID
23 Provaunt Case $388.00 $440.00 NO BID
24 Round Up Pro Maxx Gallon $57.61 $36.00 NO BID
25 Subdue Maxx Gallon $499.00 #25 $499.00 #25 NO BID
26 Talstar Gallon $52.55 NO BID $68.24 #26
27 Teremec SP Pound $12.78 $17.60 NO BID
28 Trimec Classic Gallon $28.00 $34.75 NO BID
29 Trimmit 2SC Gallon $398.00 $398.00 #29 NO BID
Helena Chemical Company John Deere Landscapes Pennington Seed, Inc.
Pottstown, PA Frederick, MD Laurel, MD
Notes Notes Notes
#5310, 14, 15, 16, 18, 21 & 25 are #s 3,10, 14, 15, 16, 18, 21, 25 & 29 are |#26 - product substitution submitted
agency products where pricing is set by |Agency Priced Products.
the manufacturer. #12 - Unit of Measure: Gallon
#12 - Unit of Measure: Gallon
#16 - Pricing withdrawn due to
NOTES: submitted incorrectly

Bids Opened: 05-25-11




PUR-1162
Grounds Maintenance Chemicals
(Various County Departments)

VETCorp, Inc. Company Name Company Name
Unit Frederick, MD City, State City, State
Item Description of
Measure Unit Price Note Unit Price Note Unit Price Note
1 Acclaim Extra Gallon $452.55
2 Aqua Shade Gallon $38.85
3 Banner Maxx Il Gallon $215.22
4 Banol Gallon $345.45
5 Bensumec — 4LF Gallon $92.40
6 Chipco/26 GT Gallon $108.15
7 Chipco Signature Pound $22.05
8 Crossbow Gallon $33.60
9 Cutrine Plus Gallon $23.69
10 Daconil Ultrex/WDG Pound $7.50
1 Dursban 50 WSP Pound $14.44
12 Dylox 420 SL Pound $54.60
13 Fore WSP Pound $6.51
14 Head Way Gallon $400.00
15 Instrata Gallon $130.00
16 Meridian 25/WG (408 0z./Case) Case $2,300.00
17 Meridian 25/WG (2 Ib./case) Pound $100.80
18 Meridian 25/WG (4.25 Ib./case) Pound NO BID
19 PCNB 10 G Pound NO BID #19
20 Pendulum Aqua Cap Gallon $288.75

5 Bids Opened: 05-25-11




PUR-1162
Grounds Maintenance Chemicals
(Various County Departments)

VETCorp, Inc. Company Name Company Name
Unit Frederick, MD City, State City, State
Item Description of
Measure Unit Price Note Unit Price Note Unit Price Note
21 Primo Maxx Gallon $270.00
22 Prograss Gallon $123.64
23 Provaunt Case $551.25
24 Round Up Pro Maxx Gallon $28.35
25 Subdue Maxx Gallon $495.00
26 Talstar Gallon NO BID
27 Teremec SP Pound $14.15 #27
28 Trimec Classic Gallon $31.50
29 Trimmit 25C Gallon $435.75
VETCorp, Inc. Company Name Company Name
Frederick, MD City, State City, State
Notes Notes Notes
#19 - Outlawed
#27 - Written - Fourteen Dollars &
Fifteen Cents; Figures - $14.18
NOTES:

Bids Opened: 05-25-11




