
Citywide Sanitary Sewer Rehabilitation
PUR-1093

1 Bids Opened: 09-16-09

7.01 Quantity Unit Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total
1 Trenching and backfilling 350 CY $63.00 $22,050.00 $1,200.00 $420,000.00
2 Replace asphaltic concrete paving 420 SY $74.00 $31,080.00 $100.00 $42,000.00

3
Replace portland cement concrete 
paving

60 SY $132.00 $7,920.00 $125.00 $7,500.00

4 Replace curb 50 LF $53.00 $2,650.00 $100.00 $5,000.00
5 Replace curb and gutter 10 LF $69.00 $690.00 $125.00 $1,250.00
6 Replace sidewalk 490 SY $37.00 $18,130.00 $100.00 $49,000.00
7 8" diameter PVC open cut point repair 270 LF $800.00 $216,000.00 $50.00 $13,500.00

8 12" diameter PVC open cut point repair 20 LF $800.00 $16,000.00 $60.00 $1,200.00

9 18" diameter PVC open cut point repair 5 LF $1,550.00 $7,750.00 $100.00 $500.00

10 24" diameter PVC open cut point repair 5 LF $1,638.00 $8,190.00 $200.00 $1,000.00

11 27" diameter PVC open cut point repair 30 LF $1,670.00 $50,100.00 $1,000.00 $30,000.00

12 8" diameter cured-in-place pipe 5270 LF $126.00 $664,020.00 $60.00 $316,200.00
13 10" diameter cured-in-place pipe 1570 LF $70.00 $109,900.00 $61.00 $95,770.00
14 12" diameter cured-in-place pipe 190 LF $304.00 $57,760.00 $80.00 $15,200.00
15 15" diameter cured-in-place pipe 880 LF $88.00 $77,440.00 $125.00 $110,000.00
16 18" diameter cured-in-place pipe 570 LF $148.00 $84,360.00 $150.00 $85,500.00
17 21" diameter cured-in-place pipe 4330 LF $119.00 $515,270.00 $256.00 $1,108,480.00
18 22" diameter cured-in-place pipe 610 LF $216.00 $131,760.00 $400.00 $244,000.00
19 24" diameter cured-in-place pipe 370 LF $246.00 $91,020.00 $250.00 $92,500.00
20 Sanitary sewer cleanouts - open cut 20 EA $1,313.00 $26,260.00 $2,000.00 $40,000.00

21
Sanitary sewer cleanouts - vacuum 
excavation

340 EA $1,835.00 $623,900.00 $1,600.00 $544,000.00

22 Replace sanitary sewer laterals 170 LF $200.00 $34,000.00 $400.00 $68,000.00

23
Internal sanitary sewer lateral repair - 8" 
diameter sewer main

3090 LF $275.00 $849,750.00 $315.00 $973,350.00

Am-Liner East, Inc.Miller Pipeline Corp.
Indianapolis, IN Berryville, VA

Base Bid Items:



Citywide Sanitary Sewer Rehabilitation
PUR-1093

2 Bids Opened: 09-16-09

Am-Liner East, Inc.Miller Pipeline Corp.
Indianapolis, IN Berryville, VA

  7.01 Quantity Unit Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total

24
Internal sanitary sewer lateral repair - 
10" diameter sewer main

490 LF $294.00 $144,060.00 $336.00 $164,640.00

25
Internal sanitary sewer lateral repair - 
12" diameter sewer main

80 LF $294.00 $23,520.00 $336.00 $26,880.00

26
Internal sanitary sewer lateral repair - 
15" diameter sewer main

90 LF $319.00 $28,710.00 $365.00 $32,850.00

27
Internal sanitary sewer lateral repair - 
18" diameter sewer main

520 LF $344.00 $178,880.00 $392.00 $203,840.00

28
Internal sanitary sewer lateral repair - 
21" diameter sewer main

170 LF $353.00 $60,010.00 $400.00 $68,000.00

29
Internal sanitary sewer lateral repair - 
22" diameter sewer main

210 LF $355.00 $74,550.00 $404.00 $84,840.00

30
Internal sanitary sewer lateral repair - 
24" diameter sewer main

170 LF $357.00 $60,690.00 $408.00 $69,360.00

31 Provide manholes 30 VLF $1,320.00 $39,600.00 $900.00 $27,000.00
32 Grout manholes 1200 VLF $76.00 $91,200.00 $120.00 $144,000.00
33 Replace manhole invert and bench 30 EA $2,760.00 $82,800.00 $1,500.00 $45,000.00
34 Provide manhole invert and bench 1 EA $1,735.00 $1,735.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00
35 Inside drop diverter pipe 2 VLF $420.00 $840.00 $800.00 $1,600.00
36 Sodding 50 SY $11.00 $550.00 $5.00 $250.00

7.02 Quantity Unit Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total
1 Rock excavation unit price adjustment 50 CY $300.00 $15,000.00 $1,900.00 $95,000.00
2 Tree replacement 5 EA $2,500.00 $12,500.00 $3,000.00 $15,000.00
3 8" diameter DIP open cut point repair 18 LF $800.00 $14,400.00 $100.00 $1,800.00
4 10" diameter DIP open cut point repair 18 LF $820.00 $14,760.00 $110.00 $1,980.00
5 12" diameter DIP open cut point repair 18 LF $830.00 $14,940.00 $120.00 $2,160.00
6 16" diameter DIP open cut point repair 18 LF $900.00 $16,200.00 $130.00 $2,340.00
7 18" diameter DIP open cut point repair 18 LF $1,500.00 $27,000.00 $160.00 $2,880.00
8 24" diameter DIP open cut point repair 18 LF $1,600.00 $28,800.00 $180.00 $3,240.00
9 30" diameter DIP open cut point repair 18 LF $1,900.00 $34,200.00 $200.00 $3,600.00

7.03 Quantity Unit Unit Price Item Total Unit Price Item Total

$128,000.00

$4,433,145.00

$177,800.00

Base Bid Items continued:

Total Base Bid

Contingent Bid Items:

Deductive Alternate Items:

Total Contingent Bid

$5,133,710.00



Citywide Sanitary Sewer Rehabilitation
PUR-1093

3 Bids Opened: 09-16-09

Am-Liner East, Inc.Miller Pipeline Corp.
Indianapolis, IN Berryville, VA

  
1

Internal sanitary sewer lateral repair - 
18" diameter sewer main:     
•   07011 - 07012
•   07012 - 07011
•   07012 - 07013
•   07020 - 07014
Internal sanitary sewer lateral repair - 
21" diameter sewer main:     
•   12001 - 12002
•   12022 - 12021
•   12030 - 12022

2
Sanitary sewer cleanouts - vacuum 
excavation

-11 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3
Internal sanitary sewer lateral repair - 
alternative method - 18" diameter sewer 
main:
•   07011 - 07012
•   07012 - 07011
•   07012 - 07013
•   07020 - 07014
Internal sanitary sewer lateral repair - 
alternative method - 21" diameter sewer 
main:
•   12001 - 12002
•   12022 - 12021
•   12030 - 12022
Sanitary sewer cleanouts - open cut 11 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7.04

No Bid

$4,610,945.00 $5,261,710.00

$0.00$0.00

LF No Bid No Bid No Bid

5

-150

No Bid No Bid No BidNo Bid

Total Deductive Alternate Bid

LF-80

EA6

Total Bid Amount = 
Sum [(7.01) + (7.02)]

No Bid No BidNo Bid 

No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid

EA
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