
Q-18-656

Fertilizer for Black Rock Golf Course

ATL Consolidated 

Services, LLC

Springdale, MD

Genesis Turfgrass, 

Inc.    Glen Rock, 

PA

Nutrien Solutions

Rosedale, MD

SiteOne Landscape 

Supply

Cleveland, OH

Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton 

1.  Ten (10) Tons - 30-0-15, Nitrogen Source - 50% Sulfer Coated

     Urea, Potassium Source - Potassium Sulfate K2SO4

$1,600.00 $669.00 $719.20 $613.60 *

2.  Two (2) Tons - 0-0-50 Fairway size, Sulfate of Potash K2SO4 $1,280.00 $895.00 $790.00 $948.00 *

3.  Ton of Fertilizer of the following:

    a)  One (1) Ton - Verde - Cal G by Aqua Aid, 50 lb. bag, 0-0-50 

          17% Sulfer $1,240.00 $768.00 No bid No bid

    b)  One (1) Ton - Sulfate of Potash, Greens Grade, 50 lb. bag 0-0-50

          17% Sulfur
$1,300.00 $914.39 $880.00 $1,165.60 *

    c)  One (1) Ton - Nature Safe 8-3-5, Fine Grade, 50 lb. bag

          0.2% Ammoniacal Nitrogen

          7.2% Water Insoluble Nitrogen

          0.6% Water Soluble Nitrogen

$1,900.00 $1,485.00 No bid No bid

    d)  One (1) Ton - Prilled Urea, 50 lb. Bag 46-0-0 $1,500.00 $547.60 $510.00 $511.60 *

    e) One (1) Ton - Contec DG, 40 lb. bag 12-24-8 SGN75

         6.0% Ammoniacal Nitrogen

         0.9% Urea Nitrogen

         2.1% Water Soluble Nitrogen

$2,400.00 $2,380.00 $2,405.00 No bid

Quotes Opened: 07-11-18
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Total $11,220.00 $7,658.99 $5,304.20 $3,238.80

NOTES

SiteOne Landscape Supply

* 1. Custom blend - 10 to 15 day lead time

* 2. #001586 0-0-50 SOP

* 3. b) #009842 Lesco 0-0-50 E SOP HTP

* 3. d) #098525 46-0-0 Urea Granular Spreadable SGN 250

Fertilizer for Black Rock Golf Course awarded to:  Item #1 - Site One

Item #2, #3b & #3d - Nutrien Solutions

Item#3a, 3c & 3e - Genesis Turfgrass Inc.
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